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Chapter 1

Introduction: 
Themes and Choices

Katherine Fierlbeck and Peter Berman

1.1 � Stepping Back

COVID-19 focused public attention on public health as never before. 
Ordinary people began to think about how public health was organized, 
funded, and executed; how it connected both to clinical pathways and to 
broader social practices; and how the evidence it was based on (or not) 
was collected, interpreted, applied, and explained. People also became 
aware of the political, ethical, and economic costs and tradeoffs public 
health responses required during the pandemic. Throughout the pandemic, 
“public health” was proposed and used to frame our approaches to 
COVID-19. But COVID-19 also gives us a better opportunity to examine 
the nature of “public health” itself. The post-pandemic forensic evalua-
tions of each jurisdiction’s handling of COVID-19 are useful in addressing 
identifiable gaps, conflicts, or errors in pandemic management, and the 
contributions in this volume cover the intricacies of pandemic 

This is an open access book chapter published by World Scientific Publishing. It is 
distributed under the terms of the Creative Commons Attribution-NonCommercial 4.0  
(CC BY-NC) License. https://creativecommons.org/licenses/by-nc/4.0/

https://doi.org/10.1142/9789811296307_0001
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management in some detail. However, the larger question is what COVID-
19 has brought to light regarding the nature of “public health” itself.

The objectives of this volume are twofold. First, it provides a series of 
jurisdictional evaluations assessing how well each unit was able to manage 
the challenges posed by the pandemic, and it identifies the variables that 
either facilitated or obstructed good public health management in each 
jurisdiction. More profoundly, and perhaps more importantly, it leads us 
to examine how (and whether) the lessons learned throughout the pan-
demic are shaping the practice of public health across these jurisdictions. 
If clinical or organizational insights were gained from the experience of 
COVID-19, to what extent do the institutional, political, and organiza-
tional contexts within which public health actions are embedded provide 
a sufficiently malleable environment to incorporate these insights?

The starting point for this volume, then, is the observation that “public 
health” is an entity that must be viewed from multiple vantage points. 
Facilitated by the Jean Monnet Network for Health Law and Policy (2017–
2020), we have drawn together not only public health experts but also 
health lawyers, health economists, and health policy analysts to provide a 
robust and nuanced understanding of why disparate jurisdictions undertook 
particular measures, the degree to which they can be considered successful, 
and the extent to which COVID-19 has shaped the nature of public health.

The enormous breadth and diversity of policy responses to COVID-19 
cannot be overstated. Despite the consistently articulated claim that public 
health directives were “science-based,” the range of policy measures 
diverged considerably. This is why it is so critical to understand the wider 
sociopolitical context within which public health systems operate. The 
pandemic put enormous political pressure on administrations to “do 
something,” but the choices they made were determined not only by the 
pathogen itself but also by the legal institutions within which they oper-
ated, their economic and clinical capacity, their organizational structures, 
the evidence they chose to use, the social support for specific measures, 
and the tradeoffs they were willing to make. Given the potential rigidity 
of some of these variables, it is not inconceivable that disadvantageous 
measures taken in response to COVID-19 could be repeated yet again in a 
future crisis. Our confidence in the aspirational assertions that “we must 
do better next time” would be greater if we could develop a more lucid 
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understanding of why desirable health policy strategies so often fail to 
materialize.

Nonetheless, broader and more focused insights can be gleaned from 
these chapters. There are four overarching themes that emerge from this 
volume. Those looking for quick solutions that can be applied to public 
health systems, such as new laboratories or new training programs, will 
be  disappointed in the complexity conveyed here. Each theme involves 
a tension between a set of competing choices, each with its own narrative 
of justification. Each of these themes is discussed in more detail in 
Section 1.3, with reference to the contributors’ case studies.

The first theme addresses the temporal aspect of pandemic manage-
ment. One of the most pervasive difficulties that states had was the ten-
dency to conceptualize the pandemic (and pandemic management) as a 
single coherent event, rather than as a complex, sustained phenomenon 
where the contours were continually shifting. Traditional responses to 
pandemic management, based on models of infectious disease outbreaks, 
are generally undertaken in a command-and-control mode with its roots in 
military conflict. Where time is of the essence, messaging must be clear, 
and lines of accountability must be apparent: in such cases, a linear, top-
down form of management is highly useful to achieve timely and effective 
control. Over time, however, this rigid vertical system of decision-making 
tends to get in the way of the nimbleness and responsiveness needed to 
address the shifting nature of this pandemic, with its rapidly evolving 
infectious agent, and public responses to it.

The second theme focuses on the extent to which jurisdictions chose 
to see the pandemic exclusively as a medical event rather than as a socio-
political one. The immediate response of most states was to “flatten the 
curve” and to implement immediate strategies to dampen demand on 
clinical facilities to free up capacity to treat the sick. The focus was mainly 
on masking, testing, vaccination, and the strict regulation of public spaces. 
For many states, containing the spread of the COVID-19 pathogen was the 
only important public health objective. For others (and, over time, almost 
everywhere), the wider effects of the consequences of COVID-19 man-
agement demanded to be taken more into account, including social isola-
tion, economic consequences, educational outcomes, the consequences of 
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limiting or postponing clinical interventions, and potentially even the iat-
rogenic effects of treatments themselves.

The third, and related, theme was the narrative of health equity and the 
place of more vulnerable populations in pandemic management. The issue 
of health equity is a familiar one within public health discourse. It empha-
sizes a focus on equal health provision, as in current calls for universal 
health coverage (https://www.uhc2030.org/un-hlm-2023/). Is this suffi-
cient for effective pandemic control, or should we be targeting policies 
and strategies toward more vulnerable groups in society whose needs are 
more pronounced? This tension within public health is of course highly 
political, as it involves the distribution of critical but limited resources, 
and it incorporates the wider non-medical determinants of health (includ-
ing income, education, employment, race, and geography) into the discus-
sion. That societies are only as safe as their most vulnerable populations 
are healthy pushed health equity more forcefully onto the table, and the 
highly contagious nature of COVID-19 confronted the invisible tendency 
to ghettoize some marginalized groups, as decision-makers became aware 
that the spread of disease in some sub-communities could have a very real 
impact upon the overall well-being of the larger population.

The fourth theme addresses the way in which data underlying 
pandemic policy responses were gathered, selected, defended, and made 
transparent (or not). Each state was adamant that it was “following the 
science,” yet these “science-driven” strategies seemed to diverge enor-
mously even when based on the same evidence resources. Since scientific 
discourse legitimized policy directives, the question of what “scientific” 
really means, and how it is understood by citizens, is worth pursuing. 
Given that “science” connotes an objective set of processes and principles, 
it is ironic that this was perhaps the most politically contentious aspect of 
pandemic management. While some states had formal provisions requir-
ing the state to justify its public health activity, or to ensure that it was 
“based on science and proven experience,” the scientific discourse in other 
jurisdictions was deliberately curtailed. Again, decision-making within 
the context of a pandemic is informed by an uncomfortable tension 
between open scientific debate and the desire to keep the public calm and 
on-side with official public health strategies regardless of data that may be 
incomplete, ambiguous, or conflicting.

https://www.uhc2030.org/un-hlm-2023/
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1.2 � Framing the Discussion: About “Comparative 
Public Health”

What concepts and methods are useful and appropriate for comparing 
“public health systems” and their responses to COVID-19? The rich litera-
ture on health systems more broadly includes a robust discussion of how 
to categorize and understand healthcare systems across states. Is it possi-
ble to develop a similar kind of analytical system for public health, 
encompassing the entities involved in public health response and how they 
may or may not be “systems”?

Health systems writ large, at the most basic level, have often been 
classified according to the way in which they are funded: thus, the most 
simple schema will categorize a system according to whether its health-
care funding is largely based on private market-based funding (US), gen-
eral taxation (UK), or social insurance (Germany). But the focus on 
funding ignores the way in which services are delivered; by combining the 
two variables, we now have a conceptual quadrant where healthcare can 
be funded and provided in any combination of “public” and “private.” 
A major confounder here is that the imposition of different specific regu-
latory frameworks can importantly make public funding models behave 
more like private ones (e.g. managed competition) or privately funded 
models act more like public ones (e.g. sickness funds). And, as Wendt 
et al. (2008) argue, we must not only consider these three dimensions of 
healthcare — funding, service provision, and regulation — but also iden-
tify which actor is responsible for each task. Thus, “when connecting 
state, non-governmental and market influences with the dimensions of 
financing, service provision and regulation, 27 combinations emerge (3 × 
3 × 3)” (p. 71).

However, Böhm et al. (2013) have argued that one of these dimensions — 
regulation — must be considered more a fundamental organizing princi-
ple, and that when it is given priority of consideration, “the superior 
dimension restricts the nature of the subordinate dimensions” (p.  258) 
such that the number of “theoretically plausible types” is limited to ten 
(only five of which exist in practice). This framework is interesting insofar 
as states that are normally considered within the same category are, under 
this new typography, placed in different ones. So, for example, while both 
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Canada and the UK have universal coverage financed through general 
revenue tax-based sources, Canada (like Australia and New Zealand) sig-
nificantly utilizes a system of provider payment where payment is made 
to physicians as private contractors largely on a fee-for-service basis; the 
UK, in contrast, makes greater use of capitated payment methods to pri-
mary care physicians, who are also private contractors but with funding 
other than insurance reimbursement. Similarly, while both France and 
Germany ground healthcare provision on a model of social insurance, 
Böhm et al. classify France (along with Belgium) as an “etatist” social 
health insurance system because the state plays a greater role in regulating 
the sickness funds. In Germany (as with Austria and Luxembourg), in 
contrast, private actors have more autonomous authority in implement-
ing  the scope and nature of the social insurance model; they are thus 
considered “social health insurance systems” more properly in their 
classification.

Yet there is no clear reason why the categorization of health systems 
must be limited to only these three defining characteristics (funding, 
delivery, and regulation). Marchildon (2022), for example, argues that 
many healthcare systems exist within a federal structure and that the dis-
tribution of taxation capacity and regulatory functions between federal 
jurisdictions also have a considerable effect on the way in which their 
respective health systems function. He notes, in addition, that the scope 
and depth of coverage of healthcare services (which services are covered, 
which individuals are covered, and the percentage of costs of each service 
provided by the state) is yet another important metric providing a vantage 
point from which to compare and assess healthcare systems and that this 
can vary between jurisdictions in the same country as is the case in 
Canada and others.

What seemed like a straightforward classification rubric for health-
care systems begins to appear, on deeper examination, to be a more arbi-
trary exercise depending upon the variables one presumes to be most 
important. Yet even focusing upon three basic criteria — funding, provi-
sion, and regulation — is much more problematic when one delves into a 
more detailed analysis of national healthcare systems. In practice, those 
states paying private healthcare contractors through social insurance also 
tend to have some healthcare workers employed directly by the state, 
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while others may be remunerated privately. Models of healthcare classifi-
cation tend to focus on whether the preponderance of funding, delivery, or 
regulation manifests in a particular way, but as each state in the hard light 
of reality is a complicated combination of numerous elements of these 
“pure” models, the utility of placing them into one discrete category 
diminishes as one begins to see how each healthcare system becomes, in 
effect, its own idiosyncratic “model.”

It is important to set out the conceptual issues and limitations underly-
ing the discussion over how to go about comparing healthcare systems 
because these same kinds of intellectual problems could inform the com-
parative analysis of public health systems. From what vantage point, and 
using which metrics, should we evaluate the performance of public health 
systems in pandemic management, and the way in which public health 
systems have been reorganized or reconceptualized (if at all) in the wake of 
COVID-19? The insight gleaned from the attempt to categorize healthcare 
systems is that, from a birds-eye view, we can privilege certain features in 
order to provide a certain intellectual order. Yet there may not be consensus 
on which characteristics of a system are the relevant ones and, as one rec-
ognizes the complex interplay of components comprising each state’s 
healthcare system, each must, at a certain point, simply become sui generis.

This insight could also inform the comparative analysis of public 
health systems. But there is a deeper problem in pursuing this goal that 
demands more urgent attention. The domain of action for “healthcare” 
may be more easily understood and, as such, can be applied to help us 
focus on the dimension of the healthcare system. In contrast, the domain 
of action of “public health,” and consequently, the actors and the scope of 
their actions, is much less clear and often contested.

Some would like to categorize “public health” as a specialized branch 
within diverse healthcare systems, treating it as a less complex and more 
functionally homogeneous body, and thus more amendable to comparative 
evaluation. As Greer and Mätzke argue in the following chapter, however, 
this assumes a “misplaced concreteness” that effectively distorts our 
understanding of its nature and function. This needs consideration if we 
are to attempt an analysis of public health systems.

They suggest a number of possible conceptual lenses (or “frames”) 
from which to view public health. The literature on classification schemes 
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for healthcare systems writ large generally focuses less on the “what” 
(as in what is the health system) and more on the question of which factors 
affect its actions and performance. For public health, the “what” (is public 
health) is still an important question. The vantage point one chooses to 
answer that question will influence the way in which one chooses to ana-
lyze public health systems.

The most obvious way of conceptualizing public health, as Greer and 
Mätzke note, is by listing its expected activities. As they illustrate, there is 
no consensus on these activities; each complex grouping of public health 
bodies may provide its own account of what is (and is not) properly under 
its ambit. A second approach is to identify the actors involved in the public 
health arena. Again, the categories become blurred the more sharply one 
examines them. Public health, when organized as a branch of medicine, is 
to a large extent consultative and advisory: public health officials do not 
“do” medicine as much as they recommend particular courses of action to 
key decision-makers (Litvak et  al., 2020). Moreover, as above, there is 
little consistency in who does public health: to the extent to which public 
health functions are ambiguous, as noted earlier, so too will public health 
actors vary across states. For example, monitoring and addressing safe 
water supply may be performed by actors located in departments of envi-
ronment, while the safety of the beef supply may rest in departments of 
agriculture.

A third way of conceptualizing “public health,” as Greer and Mätzke 
astutely recognize, involves applying a more normative lens. A “public 
health approach” is generally understood to look beyond acute clinical 
conditions and to incorporate non-medical determinants of health. This is 
a distinct and unique perspective within the traditional field of medicine. 
As a discipline, medicine is generally premised on the specific needs and 
well-being of each individual; in public health, individual need is eclipsed 
by a focus on populations — public welfare writ large. This tension 
between individual and collective well-being, which became very appar-
ent throughout COVID-19, contributes to the highly political nature which 
arises in applying these different framings.

Greer and Mätzke suggest that a fourth approach to understanding 
public health is through an institutional and organizational lens. This 
frame, they note, has the advantage of being the easiest to grapple with 
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from an empirical perspective, as the legal framework and the organiza-
tional structure for public health systems, though subject to change, can 
generally be identified and described quite clearly. That is why it is the 
starting point for each of the case studies in this volume. Each chapter 
provides a description of the legal and organizational basis of public 
health in each respective jurisdiction and includes an organogram setting 
out the flow of function and responsibility to complement this discussion. 
But, as Greer and Mätzke warn, the disadvantage of the institutional-
organizational approach is that it risks “nominative determinism” insofar 
as the formal institutional titles or flowcharts may or may not represent the 
way in which public health systems actually operated during COVID-19. 
For this reason, the contributors to this volume go beyond the formal 
articulation of what institutions were expected to do and also provide a 
qualitative and interpretive analysis of how and why public health strate-
gies took the shape they did.

Finally, argue Greer and Mätzke, public health can be understood 
conceptually from a functionalist perspective as “the field that addresses 
collective causes of avoidable morbidity and mortality.” This creates con-
siderable epistemological difficulty in circumscribing the field — the list 
of what influences avoidable morbidity and mortality is extensive — but, 
as this volume describes in detail, the proper scope of public health was 
exceptionally relevant during COVID-19 as it was a highly political issue 
that dominated public discourse across jurisdictions.

“Comparative public health” is a subdiscipline in its infancy; it does 
not have the depth or breadth of literature enjoyed by comparative health 
systems. The COVID-19 pandemic has brought the question of “how 
ought we to compare public health systems” to the fore. Unsurprisingly, 
the nascent field of “comparative public health” has been largely informed 
by the intellectual context of public health rather than by comparative 
health policy (see, e.g. Wang and Mao, 2021). There is certainly a utility 
in comparing public health systems within a vernacular with which par-
ticipants are familiar and comfortable, one that discusses policies, metrics, 
and outcomes.

Initially, this volume was not specifically directed to these larger 
questions of “comparative public health,” but the work of its contributors 
led us to these questions. The chapters collected here provide new insights 
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into these topics, while accommodating the epidemiological focus (what 
strategies were undertaken? On what basis? What were the outcomes?) 
within a wider health policy perspective (why were some choices made 
rather than others? Whose voices prevailed? What is the relationship 
between policy and power?). The contributors begin with a description of 
the formal legal/institutional context and then engage in a more qualitative 
analysis of why particular policy choices were made, whose interests they 
represented, what the political and organizational difficulties were, and, 
ultimately, whether the disruption of pandemic governance resulted in 
significant rethinking of public health in each jurisdiction, or whether the 
entrenched institutional and political variables within each country have 
neutralized substantive reform.

1.3 � What Do Comparative COVID-19 Case Studies Tell 
Us About the State and Nature of Public Health?

How does the global experience with COVID-19 help us to think more 
clearly about the policy challenges we need to face to improve public 
health? Many jurisdictions have already engaged in forensic analyses of 
pandemic management. In these cases, the attempt has mostly been to 
examine in a more technical sense where the problems arose, and how to 
“fix” them, especially with an eye to the possibility that another pandemic 
event may arise in the foreseeable future. This volume takes a slightly dif-
ferent approach. Rather than assuming that what is needed are specific 
additional material investments — “staff, stuff, and space” in a formula 
made well-known by Dr. Paul Farmer — that can be applied to fix public 
health systems, the contributors look more closely at the underlying social 
and institutional context of public health to understand what happened 
during COVID-19 — Farmer’s fourth “s” systems — and whether a sim-
ple fix to the problems that arose is even tenable.

Rather, this volume begins with the assumption that there is often a 
clear reason why undesirable outcomes arose and that this reason is not 
simply grounded in a lack of attention, or foresight, or the technical 
aspects of “preparedness” (as the poor correlation between COVID 
outcomes and the 2019 Global Health Security Index demonstrated). 
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Doing public health differently often comes with a cost attached  
(economic, but more often political), and the cost involved in rethinking 
public health may simply be unpalatable. As many of the chapters here 
explain, there are distinct institutional, political, and organizational 
structures within which public health is embedded which significantly 
determine the parameters of policy response. And reforming these 
structures — laws, organizations, and the power relations ensconced in 
them — can require an immense degree of political capital and economic 
investment. As is often the case after significant public health crises in 
federal states, for example, a window of opportunity exists to rethink and 
rebuild the way that public health is structured. In response to COVID-19, 
both Australia and Russia declared a commitment to establish a federal 
public health body that could coordinate pandemic management. This is 
similar to Canada’s establishment of the Public Health Agency of Canada 
(PHAC) after a brief but frightening experience with Sudden Acute 
Respiratory Syndrome (SARS) in 2003. But the simple construction of a 
new organization simply relocates power relations to a different sphere 
rather than solving organizational problems altogether. While the exis-
tence of PHAC in Canada when COVID-19 arose mitigated the worst 
problems experienced in 2003, it was subsequently weakened through 
federal politics and did not prevent the same kind of problem that Canada 
had experienced from other public health crises from occurring yet again.

Public policy change, in this account, is a more complex sphere of 
winners and losers, where aspirational declarations that “we must do  
better” are rarely executed into substantive policy outcomes. But it would 
be wrong to imply that clear improvements are simply stymied by oppor-
tunistic political players. Rather, the key issues arose during COVID-19 
because there was tension between competing but defensible choices. 
Committing to one beneficial outcome can involve costs that others (not 
unjustly) will censure. Thus, rather than thinking about public health 
reform as a set of “patches” or “fixes” that improve the entire system, our 
analyses see the public policy challenges in rethinking public health as 
tensions or competing choices that lead to negative externalities as well as 
improvements and galvanize interests to condemn or resist policy 
directions.
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As described in the previous section, the tricky aspect of comparing 
causal outcomes across political regimes is in determining whether they 
are similar enough to merit comparison. Are we comparing apples to 
apples, or apples to refrigerators — and, if the former, why do similar 
regimes exhibit different outcomes? The starting point for this volume 
is that COVID-19 produced the same kinds of policy tensions in each 
jurisdiction but because of the specific institutional and organizational 
architecture (or “scaffolding”), sociopolitical context, and level of eco-
nomic or technological capacity, different (and sometimes contradic-
tory) policy choices were made. Conceptually, we situate comparative 
public health policy within a similar set of competing tensions and then 
try to understand how each regime addressed these tensions through a 
more granular analysis. We have selected a diverse group of states in 
order to provide a wide range of political and institutional contexts, 
including various regions within the European Union (EU) (Sweden, 
France, and Croatia/Slovenia), directly outside the EU (the UK and 
Russia), and the EU itself (which, as a political player, both coordinated 
a response to the pandemic but also benefitted from the role which it 
played). Complementing the focus on Europe are case studies from 
Australia and Canada, two seemingly comparable states that nonetheless 
exist a world apart and that face quite distinct structural and contextual 
realities.

The following are the key tensions that structured public policy chal-
lenges during COVID-19 identified in this volume. How have they 
informed states’ attempts to restructure their public health systems?

1.3.1 � Temporal tensions

The first of these tensions, as noted earlier, was between the need to pres-
ent a coherent, rapid, and accountable response to COVID-19 that, over 
time, obstructed the flexibility and nimbleness needed to adapt to shifting 
epidemiological realities and social responses. This tension is also 
ingrained more deeply within public health itself, where infectious dis-
ease  management, once a pathogen arrives, can be addressed more 
effectively within an outbreak-focused command-and-control structure. 
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Nonetheless, the day-to-day work of keeping communities healthy outside 
pandemic conditions can require an extensive fascia of public health offi-
cials working with local populations, doing public health from the ground 
up rather than the top down. It may benefit from a “health in all policies” 
approach built on a horizontal model of governance rather than a vertical 
one. More decentralized systems can also have a greater challenge in 
responding to pandemic-level crises; the experiences of both Australia and 
Canada here are illustrative of that point. The devolved structure of the 
UK’s health system is also indicative of this organizational challenge: as 
Bartlett explains, some public health measures were determined centrally 
across the UK, while others were the responsibility of devolved public 
health bodies in Scotland, Wales, and Northern Ireland. But, because 
England’s public health strategy was governed only by the central UK 
public health authorities, confusion arose regarding what public health 
measures were meant only for England, and which applied across the UK. 
(The Hallett inquiry has also cast light on these structural issues, includ-
ing the fact that Northern Ireland’s public health office only had observer 
status at the UK public health table.).

At the same time, an underlying command-and-control structure in 
and of itself can be problematic insofar as it limits the voices involved in 
public health management and poses a barrier to transparency in decision-
making. This is most glaringly the case of Russia, as Paul describes, but 
also applies to France, where formal public health bodies found them-
selves relegated to observer status only.

Yet the issue is not simply one of whether vertical or horizontal man-
agement models are superior; a more difficult tension is that a model that 
is well-suited to one stage of pandemic management may not work well in 
subsequent stages or such a long-term and all-of-society event. A major 
public health crisis cannot be understood as a single point in time; it is an 
evolving situation where a rigid structure that cannot respond nimbly to 
change can become a liability. Very few pandemic plans conceptualize the 
temporality of pandemic management well (to the extent that it can be 
done well at all). What works effectively at the outset can become an 
obstacle when circumstances change, yet decision-makers are loath to 
relinquish strategies that have worked well for them.
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1.3.2 � The tension between narrow clinical outcomes and 
wider sociopolitical outcomes

One of the most fascinating aspects of comparative public health manage-
ment during COVID-19 was the way in which states framed the nature of 
the problem. Many jurisdictions formally saw the pandemic primarily in 
terms of clinical outcomes, where the only important variable was the 
prevalence and severity of the pathogen. As the Australian authors note, a 
pandemic management report published only three months before 
COVID-19 did not foresee “larger social disruptions” as a policy problem 
to be addressed even in a worst-case scenario. As in other states (including 
Canada and the UK), the conceptualization of the severity of the pandemic 
was measured only in clinical data focusing largely on hospitalization and 
mortality due to COVID-19.

The most remarkable contrast to this is the pandemic strategy taken 
by Sweden where, as the Swedish authors note, there was no mandatory 
quarantine and little employment of contact tracing. While classroom size 
was reduced, schools were not closed, and remote work was not manda-
tory. Rather than demanding that people stay indoors, outdoor activity was 
strongly encouraged. Domestic travel was not restricted, international 
travelers were not quarantined, and mask mandates were limited only to 
public transport. And yet, as the authors point out, the mortality indicators 
for Sweden were moderate and certainly lower than those for countries 
that had imposed more rigorous measures, including the UK, Spain, 
Austria, and Italy. The perplexing issue of excess non-COVID mortality is 
also relatively low in Sweden in comparison to many other countries.

Why did Sweden choose an independent path, despite considerable 
international opprobrium? From the very beginning, Sweden had decided 
to make a considered attempt to balance clinical outcomes with wider 
sociopolitical ones. Institutionally, its Communicable Disease Act even 
stipulates that any containment measures must be both proportionate and 
“based on science and proven experience.” This required public health 
authorities publicly to acknowledge the costs and disadvantages of excep-
tional public health measures. It also expected them to justify these mea-
sures with reference to high-quality scientific studies — which, when 
COVID-19 began, were quite limited in scope and depth. The reason that 
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masking was so limited was because the clinical evidence for widely 
encompassing mask mandates was negligible (and those that existed were 
of poor quality). Given the poor quality of the available data, such large-
scale intrusive public health strategies simply could not be coherently 
justified.

Sweden’s willingness to understand pandemic management from a 
much wider perspective is also comprehendible as an aspect of Sweden’s 
well-documented practice of viewing “health” within the parameters of 
the larger social determinants of health. But this was not the only variable 
that influenced countries’ unwillingness to impose protracted public 
health restrictions. Smaller countries heavily dependent on tourist dollars, 
for example, (such as Croatia), were quite cognizant that strict public 
health measures, especially as widespread immunity grew, had to be bal-
anced against the pressing economic need to reestablish tourism, a critical 
economic industry for the region.

1.3.3 � Tensions between equity and universality

A related, but even more inherently political, tension is the question of 
how marginalized populations should be addressed in systems that already 
pride themselves in offering universal healthcare. The question of how 
widely to distribute limited healthcare resources — a perennially political 
issue — became exacerbated during the pandemic when the well-being of 
the better-off became more closely dependent on the well-being of the 
most marginalized. Vulnerable groups, by definition, are more susceptible 
to highly contagious diseases. Yet political resistance to measures focus-
ing on these groups arises not only because resources are limited but also 
because of a worry that engaging these groups may institutionalize their 
political influence over the longer term. One might also be concerned that 
well-intentioned efforts to protect vulnerable groups from discrimination 
perversely led to insufficient attention to their higher risks.

One key focus resulting from COVID-19 was on long-term care facili-
ties, many of which had inadequate ventilation and poor infection control. 
That these facilities were sub-optimal was not unknown; they simply were 
not a priority. The conditions within long-term care facilities were exacer-
bated by labor force policies that utilized casual and part-time employees 
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to keep costs down, resulting in a cadre of support workers who regularly 
worked across multiple institutions, providing an efficient vector of infec-
tion. Industries such as meat processing were also disproportionately 
affected by COVID-19 morbidity due to close proximity in the workspace, 
especially in countries such as Canada (which depends on temporary for-
eign workers in this area), and the close living quarters workers were given 
compounded this susceptibility to transmission. Communities of discrete 
ethnic communities, often wary of public authority, were also more sus-
ceptible to the spread of COVID-19, especially if inhabitants were highly 
engaged in public-facing service jobs that increased their exposure to 
the virus.

Pandemic reports in many countries have identified these vulnerable 
areas, although few seem committed to invest the funds and political capi-
tal to make any real change. Australia has formally noted the importance 
of equity concerns in addressing pandemic management, although there is 
no clear evidence of how these aspirations will be operationalized. The 
UK, likewise, has recognized the increased vulnerability of marginalized 
populations but focuses on a strategy of changing individual behavior 
rather than on a strategy of structural reform. Unsurprisingly, the jurisdic-
tion most articulate in the need to better focus on equity as a public health 
strategy — Sweden — is already one of the leaders in that area. Perhaps 
the most intriguing post-pandemic equity challenge will be the EU itself. 
Despite substantial regulatory powers, the EU has little capacity to redis-
tribute economic resources from wealthier to poorer regions on a scale 
similar to any of its member states. Notwithstanding an initial haphazard 
response of sauve qui peut, the EU has, as Greer describes, taken advan-
tage of the pandemic to become a more forceful player in the public health 
arena. Whether the EU is able to capitalize on this shift to achieve a more 
emphatic redistribution of funds — possibly through a strategy of debt 
mutualization — is now a question worth considering.

1.3.4 � Crisis management and open scientific discourse

Finally, political choices must be understood within the context of larger 
epistemological issues surrounding the nature of science and scientific 
discourse. Regardless of the highly disparate selection of public health 
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and related policy instruments employed by the jurisdictions in this 
volume, they were always taken with reference to “following the science.” 
Exactly what “science” was, and who would be the arbiter of that, was left 
unsaid. The tension here is quite clear: especially at the outset, pandemic 
management may involve invasive social actions that must be performed 
immediately and comprehensively. The public health messaging must be 
clear and convincing. Those subject to restrictions must understand 
exactly what is expected of them and why. They must be given reassurance 
that the policy-making process is in good hands. The problem, of course, 
is that (especially at the outset of a major event) solid and reliable data are 
limited. There is a strong political imperative for governments to be seen 
to be “doing something,” and judgment calls must be made.

Yet “science” in its truest form is an iterative process of challenge and 
debate. As the Australian chapter notes, in many cases, there was a percep-
tion that “the battle was more important than the evidence” and that the 
evidence could be chosen selectively to support a particular policy strat-
egy. Few jurisdictions were completely transparent about how the “scien-
tific evidence” on which policy choices were made was selected. Was 
there a scientific council? Who chose the council? Was any such council 
limited to responding to specific questions put to it by decision-makers, 
or did it have the ability to articulate best practices independently? 
If  there  was no clear scientific council, who gave advice to the chief 
public health officer? And to what extent was this advice taken or rejected 
by policy-makers?

As the pandemic lengthened, and the evidence base kept increasing, 
scientific voices themselves became more fractured as they disagreed over 
the relevance or integrity of studies and statistics. The disagreement 
between public health officials, and the influence this had on formal pub-
lic health advisory groups, is a recurring theme in these case studies. In 
Slovenia, for example, the government-appointed expert group was dis-
solved in 2022, and its function was taken over by the National Institute 
of Public Health, led by an epidemiologist who had left the former advi-
sory group (twice) due to his lack of confidence in its advice. The French 
government bypassed formal public health bodies and instead set up selec-
tive ad hoc groups of clinical practitioners to provide advice. In the UK, 
the Scientific Advisory Group for Emergencies (SAGE) was expected to 
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communicate advice to government “within the political frame in which it 
was requested,” leading to an “independent SAGE” that declared itself 
free of the political whip and financial conflicts of interest. And, in 
Canada, where public health policy-making was significantly decentral-
ized, 13 jurisdictions pursued quite different (and sometimes conflicting) 
pandemic management strategies over the course of COVID-19 — all 
based, of course, on science.

Another aspect of this tension was the level of tolerance (or intoler-
ance) for medical and scientific voices which were uneasy with the quality 
of scientific evidence underlying public health policies (such as the main 
mode of disease transmission, the lack of data and rapid authorization 
mechanisms for novel vaccines and antivirals, the incidence of severe 
adverse events resulting from them, or the utility of masking school-age 
children during the Omicron phase). The need to keep formal public 
health messaging “clear” by censoring scientific opinion that challenged 
it, in the long run, only served to deepen public distrust in “scientific” 
messaging across the board.

But there were notable exceptions. In December 2021, Croatia’s 
Constitutional Court declared that public health decisions delivered by the 
government’s Civil Protection Headquarters had to contain reasoning that 
would justify the measures undertaken (including clear metrics and refer-
ence to public health measures taken in other jurisdictions). In Sweden, as 
noted earlier, the Communicable Disease Act requires disease contain-
ment to be based on measures that are both proportionate and “based on 
science and proven experience.” Tellingly, as the Swedish analysis 
describes, public support for the country’s public health strategy remained 
high, in sharp contrast to the high level of public disillusionment and dis-
trust in other states as the pandemic continued.

1.4 � Conclusion

The COVID-19 pandemic was not an unanticipated event. WHO had in 
place a clear set of obligations on its member states through the International 
Health Regulations and a formal process of review and planning for 
improvement (Kandel et al., 2020). All jurisdictions included in this vol-
ume had some form of public health crisis plan in place: the pandemic 
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planning document in Russia was produced six months before COVID-19 
appeared, while Australia’s report was published a mere three months prior 
to COVID-19. And yet, as the authors in this volume observe, Australia’s 
report spent little time discussing the interventions that ultimately played 
the greatest role in pandemic management, including lockdown, better 
ventilation, and masking policies. No doubt more reports will be produced 
across countries asking why so many gaps and failures occurred despite all 
the pandemic readiness plans that had been dutifully compiled.

This volume suggests that any forensic analyses that do not thought-
fully consider the wider structural and contextual factors within which 
public health is embedded will be no more useful than the fix-it reports 
that get filed away after every public health crisis each state encounters. 
The legal frameworks, the organizational structure of public health, the 
political culture of a state, and even the nature of the broader healthcare 
system will influence not only the explanation of what went wrong but 
also the possibility that things will ever be otherwise.

The overarching political structure of a state is the most obvious hard 
constraint. Federal or decentralized states do have a more difficult time 
during public health crises, as the requirement to establish clear channels 
of communication and to have a precise delineation of roles and responsi-
bilities under heightened governance conditions can be daunting. The case 
studies of both Australia and Canada illustrate the difficulty of imple-
menting an effective national pandemic management strategy when the 
political authority for so many public health functions rests with discrete 
regional units, and exhortations that federal states must simply try harder 
to coordinate at a national level show a poor understanding of the political 
dynamics involved. Even Sweden has reflected on whether its more 
decentralized governance structure in relation to other Nordic states might 
have contributed to its poorer pandemic metrics. The effect of COVID-19, 
like earlier public health crises, will lead more federal states to establish 
national institutions that can help coordinate public health measures, espe-
cially in emergency conditions, but even this (as Canada illustrates) is not 
a sufficient solution to the challenge of developing effective multilevel 
response relationships.

At the same time, however, devolved authority certainly has its advan-
tages for public health. Especially with larger geographical states, the 
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ability of disparate regions to be able to tailor public health responses 
more specifically to discrete populations can be effective not only from a 
public health perspective but also in terms of local populations accepting 
or “owning” the measures imposed on them.

But multilevel governance is not the only structural limitation shaping 
effective public health reform. As Sokal observes in his study of Croatia 
and Slovenia, a more fragmented political system — one that is built on a 
shifting coalition of several political parties — rarely has the ability to 
push through sweeping policy reform, especially compared to majoritar-
ian parliamentary governments.

Another structural variable that will have an effect on a state’s public 
health response during a crisis, as well as its willingness to rethink public 
health management in the wake of the crisis, is its relationship to political 
entities beyond its borders. The role of the EU is particularly evident in 
these case studies. As the Hallett inquiry has shown, “Brexit distraction” 
played a role in poor pandemic preparedness in the UK. The drive by the 
EU to provide various forms of public health assistance for its member 
states — facilitated by key players such as France — not only mitigated 
the worst effects of the pandemic for some of these states, but it also 
served to reinforce the relevance of the EU itself. And the lure of EU fund-
ing is especially influential for smaller member states in their willingness 
to rethink public health and public healthcare structures in light of vulner-
abilities exposed by the pandemic. The current debates around a new 
“pandemic treaty” being formulated through the United Nations is another 
example of these challenges of public health policy-making within an 
international context.

Beyond the intractable realities of the way in which states are politi-
cally structured, and the wider political context within which they are 
embedded, it is important to acknowledge the role that national institu-
tions play not only in considering what kinds of solutions are possible but 
also the roles that they played in impeding or facilitating pandemic man-
agement. In Croatia, for example, where most primary care is performed 
by private physicians, there was considerable resistance by general practi-
tioners in shouldering public health functions, such as the administration 
of testing. This tension was not evident in Slovenia, where primary care is 
largely provided publicly.
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The pairing of Croatia and Slovenia also provides an excellent lesson 
in the role that courts played throughout the pandemic. In contrast to 
Croatia, where the Constitutional Court’s interpretation of emergency 
public health measures undertaken by the government was generally sup-
portive, the Constitutional Court of Slovenia refused to sanction a blanket 
emergency authorization law, requiring any emergency measures to be 
clearly and strictly circumscribed with reference to their specific 
function.

Finally, the pairing of Russia and Sweden also brings into sharp con-
trast the more inchoate but still potent role of political culture in attempt-
ing to establish an effective public health system. Notwithstanding the 
structural challenges confronting such a large and variegated country as 
Russia, there is also, as Paul describes, a general sense that a strong cen-
tral authority is necessary for effective public administration and that 
“without this top-down pressure, the lower layers of the governance hier-
archy do not invest enough effort for the effective implementation of state 
policies.” This wide acceptance of a strong vertical hierarchy can, he 
notes, severely constrain the ability of policy entrepreneurs to make 
thoughtful improvements to public health systems. In Sweden, too, it is 
arguable that the underlying political culture played an important role in 
the country’s pandemic response. As Forsberg and colleagues explain, the 
unique path undertaken by Sweden during the pandemic was perhaps 
influenced by a widespread sociocultural view that “a functioning econ-
omy is a prerequisite for people’s well-being and health.” The unwilling-
ness of Sweden to impose restrictive public health measures was also 
supported by the knowledge that Swedes have a considerable level of 
social trust — even compared to other Nordic states — and would be more 
willing to follow advice suggested by public health authorities.

One legacy of COVID-19 has been an interest in comparing public 
health systems across jurisdictions. This volume suggests that such a task 
should be undertaken carefully with explicit attention to the perspectives 
of different disciplines and explicit and thoughtful examination of how 
their theories and concepts intersect (Wu et al., 2022). The plasticity of the 
concept “public health” makes it quite difficult to cleanly categorize these 
systems on organizational or functional grounds. The purpose of this vol-
ume is to dig more deeply into the nature of public health systems and to 
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understand them as products of distinct and diverse contexts. These 
embedded contexts can, frustratingly, mean that many policy solutions 
cannot simply be expected to produce effective results and that initiatives 
that work well in one state may not work well in others. Yet a deeper 
understanding of what can work in any particular jurisdiction (and what 
probably won’t) is a useful starting point in attempting to rethink public 
health systems. A more systematic approach to thinking about public 
health systems is offered by Berman and Ruck in this volume. By having 
a better appreciation of the upstream factors that shape public health sys-
tems, they argue, we are better placed to understand why certain kinds of 
policies work, and others do not. Aspirational exhortations about how 
public health systems ought to work are useful as ideal models, but a 
richer understanding of the constraints on policy change may, in the longer 
run, produce more substantive results.
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Chapter 2

What is Public Health? 
Problems of Definition and 

Conceptualization

Scott L. Greer and Margitta Mätzke

2.1 � Introduction: The Swear Jar

It does not take long in and around public health discussions to hear the 
use of “public health” as if it were a unitary body: “Public health should” 
or “Public health does.” It is easy to nod along with it, as if there were a 
single body with agency named “public health.” But to do so is to contrib-
ute to the conceptual confusion that surrounds debates about the topic of 
public health and its politics, and thereby make it still harder to develop a 
political science in or of public health (Fafard et al., 2023).

We propose the creation of a “swear jar” in all discussions of public 
health. A “swear jar” is a physical jar into which anybody who uses a 
forbidden word must put some money. In our proposal, anybody who uses 
the phrase “public health” without either scare quotes or a noun attached 
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(e.g. public health advocates, agencies, researchers, approach, politics, 
policymakers, and discussions) should be obligated to put a unit of the 
local currency such as a dollar, euro, or pound into the jar.

This chapter makes the case for a swear jar, explains the problems 
revealed by speaking of “public health” as a person or unitary actor, and 
proposes some conceptualizations of the phenomena that make up “public 
health.” It does not propose a final conclusion to the debate or even argue 
that there should be a conclusive conceptualization. Nor does it propose a 
use for the money accumulated in the swear jar, which (if implemented 
correctly) might be quite substantial.

2.2 � Misplaced Concreteness in Public Health

“Misplaced concreteness” occurs when an abstract category or concept, 
such as “markets,” “medicine,” or “public health,” is given too much con-
creteness in policy discussion, as in “markets decided,” “public health is 
committed to equity,” or “medicine treats the individual” (Brown, 1983). 
In each of these common phrases, there is an analytically problematic 
carelessness. In each case, misplaced concreteness naturalizes the phe-
nomenon (e.g. hiding the ways in which markets are socially and politi-
cally constructed), implies intentional agency (as if public health were a 
single person with one mind and code of ethics), and disguises the internal 
diversity and fuzzy borders of the field (e.g. hiding the people in and near 
medicine who do not think in purely individualistic terms).

The reason for objecting to misplaced concreteness in general is that 
specifying the nature of variables — independent or dependent — is nec-
essary for advancing a research agenda. In broader welfare state literature, 
for example, there is a long history of debate and work by political scien-
tists and sociologists who specified the broad categories of welfare state 
programs (such as pensions, healthcare insurance, and disability insur-
ance), basic functions of welfare states (such as insuring against old age 
and disability or investing in human capital), and a variety of indicators 
for outcomes and trajectories (such as replacement rates, catastrophic 
healthcare costs, or health indicators). While scholars constantly debate 
all of these issues, they are doing so within a framework crowded with 
existing variables and with a well-known set of basic ideas available.

Public health scholarship has many well-established technical 
concepts, especially in epidemiology, but none of that tacit agreement 
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on  what it is or does, and definitional debates (such as reviewed in 
(ASPHER, 2018)) are often abstract. Different concepts of public health 
will almost necessarily drive different kinds of analysis. It is also problem-
atic and difficult because imprecision around the nature of the variable 
“public health” is in some sense unavoidable.

In this chapter, we present several different concepts, or perhaps better 
frames, for the phenomena of “public health,” in order to illustrate differ-
ent approaches. Our hope is to perhaps refine the conceptualizations 
and  to show the stakes and possible advantages of different research 
approaches to different concepts. The study of public health might be 
impaired by the lack of an agreed-upon conceptual vocabulary with clear 
empirical utility, but a clean slate is by no means bad, and some debate 
about what “public health” actually should be seen as is a useful opportu-
nity to clarify the purpose of studying public health and its politics.

2.3 � Conceptualizations of Public Health

2.3.1 � Activities

Important public health agencies, including the World Health Organization 
(WHO) and the US Centers for Disease Control and Prevention (CDC), 
have definitions of public health and what it does, and accreditors of pub-
lic health education programs tend to mandate that students be taught 
these frameworks (Box 1).

Box 1. Defining public health by functions.

WHO Essential Public Health Functions (WHO, 2022)

  (1)	 Monitoring and evaluating the population’s health status, health 
service utilization and surveillance of risk factors and threats to health.

  (2)	 Public health emergency management.
  (3)	 Assuring effective public health governance, regulation and legislation.
  (4)	 Supporting efficient and effective health systems and multisectoral 

planning, financing and management for population health.

(Continued )
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  (5)	 Protecting populations against health threats, including environment 
and occupational hazards, communicable disease threats, food safety, 
chemical and radiation hazards.

  (6)	 Promoting prevention and early detection of diseases, including 
noncommunicable and communicable diseases.

  (7)	 Promoting health and well-being and actions to address the wider 
determinants of health and inequity.

  (8)	 Ensuring community engagement, participation and social 
mobilization for health and well-being.

  (9)	 Ensuring adequate quantity and quality of public health workforce.
(10)	 Assuring quality of and access to health services.
(11)	 Advancing public health research.
(12)	 Ensuring equitable access to and rational use of essential medicines 

and other health technologies.

US CDC Essential Public Health Operations (Centers for Disease Control 
and Prevention, 2020)

  (1)	 Assess and monitor population health status, factors that influence 
health, and community needs and assets.

  (2)	 Investigate, diagnose, and address health problems and hazards 
affecting the population.

  (3)	 Communicate effectively to inform and educate people about health, 
factors that influence it, and how to improve it.

  (4)	 Strengthen, support, and mobilize communities and partnerships to 
improve health.

  (5)	 Create, champion, and implement policies, plans, and laws that 
impact health.

  (6)	 Utilize legal and regulatory actions designed to improve and protect 
the public’s health.

  (7)	 Assure an effective system that enables equitable access to the 
individual services and care needed to be healthy.

  (8)	 Build and support a diverse and skilled public health workforce.
  (9)	 Improve and innovate public health functions through ongoing 

evaluation, research, and continuous quality improvement.
(10)	 Build and maintain a strong organizational infrastructure for public 

health.

(Continued )
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The status of these frameworks, regardless of their practical useful-
ness, is oddly ambiguous. It is not clear whether they mean that public 
health, to be public health, should have all these activities, or whether 
anybody performing those activities is somehow in public health whether 
they know and intend it or not, or whether it is simply a set of things that 
public health agencies really ought to do. In practice, they give students a 
rough sense of what is done, and they open up opportunities to conduct 
gap analyses and lobby for more responsibilities or resources in order to 
better fulfill these functions. Public health agencies advocating for new 
roles or additional resources need not be too concerned with the nature of 
public health or its explanation, and students who will find their own ways 
in the field of public health need landmarks more than a definition.

What can scholars empirically do to understand public health through 
this lens? Perhaps it would be possible to study its social construction and 
evolution since these lists were formulated in concrete meetings with min-
utes and known participants. Their evolution might be interesting, from 
the first time the need for such a list was perceived to the inclusion or 
removal of particular activities. Comparing and contrasting the two influ-
ential examples in Box 1 is already interesting. Such a study would teach 
us what key public health agencies and scholars worldwide regard as the 
key activities of public health and how such determinations are made, but 
it is an open question how much that explains or changes public health on 
the ground. As a guide to studying the broader politics and position of 
public health agencies or activities, it seems limited.

2.3.2 � Actors

The second conceptualization of “public health” is as an actor — probably 
the most common source of violations of the rule that public health should 
be an adjectival phrase that comes with a noun. In this concept of public 
health, there are broadly two types of thoughts. One is that public health 
is a profession with education, credentials, and a measure of professional 
self-governance that allows it to act on its members and in broader politi-
cal environments. The problem with this perspective is that it is at best a 
“minor profession,” in Glazer’s terminology (Glazer, 1974). Viewed as a 
profession, public health has very limited control over an intellectual 
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domain, a strong tendency to lose out in contests with other professions 
(especially its near neighbor and perhaps landlord, clinical medicine), 
limited closure, and very weak self-government (since a public health 
qualification usually does not entitle its bearers to do restricted activities 
in the same way as a social work or medical qualification) (Abbott, 1994). 
The COVID-19 pandemic, in particular, showed that public health profes-
sionals’ control over even a restricted domain such as infectious disease 
prevention, surveillance, and control is very limited. Government after 
government around the world sidelined public health agencies and man-
aged the pandemic through ad hoc committees with representation from 
all sorts of experts and actors, such as modelers, virologists, and doctors, 
who had no professional public health affiliations (Greer et al., 2022c).

The second approach is more explicitly political and normative and 
portrays public health as an activist cause, with an obligation for true pub-
lic health practitioners to speak out against and work to change causes of 
avoidable mortality and morbidity, in particular unjust ones such as the 
consequences of class inequality or environmental racism. This approach 
is most often articulated precisely within internal conversations among 
self-identified public health practitioners between those whose aspiration 
is a profession and those whose aspiration looks more like a political 
actor. It is not necessarily common among working public health profes-
sionals, most of whom are, after all, government employees.

There are possibly syntheses. In particular, to claim that public health 
is a profession with a moral obligation to campaign is a longstanding 
move since at least Rudolf Virchow’s work at the dawn of both microbiol-
ogy and public health (Mackenbach, 2009; Taylor & Rieger, 1985). It is 
one with echoes across public health and medical history. Professional 
organizations and individual professions can and do campaign, and the 
resources and visibility of an organized profession are an excellent plat-
form for advocates. There is nonetheless a tension here since it presumes 
something that cannot be presumed, which is that the normative commit-
ments of the advocates and the findings of scientific inquiry will always 
be aligned. Nobody is capable of purely apolitical scientific inquiry, but 
there will always be a temptation to focus on results and studies that agree 
with authors’ preferences about the world. In “normal science,” there are 
a great many mechanisms that allow scientists to arbitrate findings 
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regardless of the personalities and politics [reviewed in (Strevens, 2020)]. 
A field committed to advocacy risks losing that self-regulation.

Furthermore, professions’ political activity always tends to come with 
tensions. The resources and visibility of an organized profession such as 
medicine tend to come about because of a deeply entrenched position in 
society, one with an agreed-upon function and many sources of support 
(a strong profession combines reputational uniqueness and political mul-
tiplicity to adapt Carpenter’s formulation) (Carpenter, 2001). That posi-
tion can be eroded to the extent that political actors, citizens, or their own 
members view its political campaigns as divisive or unhelpful. Picking 
sides in — or starting — political debates might not be helpful for a pro-
fession that depends on the state for other functions it performs (such as 
credentialling members, advocating for larger budgets, or providing 
advice). Interest groups of any kind that become part of a partisan coali-
tion can gain when their party is in power but can lose credibility, auton-
omy, and policy influence if they are seen to be part of a political 
coalition.

Finally, the ability to define the public health field as a profession is 
limited and made problematic by the sheer diversity of things done in 
public health organizations. In particular, there is something of a tension 
between elite public health, made up of often well-funded and high-status 
researchers, and public health organizations on the ground, which are 
often concerned with low-status activities (restaurant inspection, water 
quality monitoring, or pest control) or target populations that are low-
status, minoritized, and vulnerable (sex workers, poor people, or undocu-
mented migrants). To the extent that public health as a profession means 
sexual health outreach or food service inspection, it loses status since 
professions get their status from their clients. To the extent that it is rede-
fined as an elite activity based in universities and the top of government, 
it starts to look less and less like a profession, loses even more policy 
tools, and starts to resemble an academic discipline comparable to eco-
nomics or criminology.

Much of the effort put into presenting public health as a profession or 
activist cause takes the form of institution-building or exhortation. The 
impact of such activities can be studied empirically. A more sophisticated 
research approach that takes these claims seriously, albeit one with 
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measurement and data-gathering problems, would be to model public 
health as a network, presumably with professional organizations, universi-
ties, civil society organizations, and government agencies as major nodes. 
Pursued a bit further, the advocacy coalition framework for public policy 
or similar might be a good way to document and conceptualize public 
health as an actor.

2.3.3 � Perspectives

The third approach to public health fundamentally views it as a perspec-
tive, worldview, or approach. In this perspective, there is a distinctive 
“public health approach” to understanding and addressing problems. The 
public health approach, in this definition, has a number of clearly repeated 
attributes: epidemiological reasoning, population-based thinking, preven-
tion, harm reduction, and in many cases, community engagement and 
empowerment or an equity focus (just search on “public health approach” 
in any scholarly database). In particular contexts, this perspective-based 
approach has quite clear implications. For example, defining illegal drug 
use or illegal sex work as a public health problem rather than a moral 
problem or a criminal problem forecloses some approaches (police sweeps 
or shaming communication strategies) and opens up others (needle 
exchanges or demarcated safe places for sex workers). Whether that is the 
right approach is obviously a highly political question, but the choice of a 
public health approach to these questions brings along a clear set of com-
mitments and policy tools.

By the same token, a public health approach to COVID-19 meant 
prevention, first non-pharmaceutical interventions and then vaccinations, 
in contrast to defeatism (e.g. herd immunity or denialist approaches), mis-
placed individualism (e.g. viewing masks as personal protection rather 
than source control of infection), or the common one of viewing the pan-
demic as a problem for the healthcare sector (seen in the logic of “flatten-
ing the curve” or the focus of so many politicians on hospital occupancy 
rather than infections) (Jarman, 2021).

The advantage of seeing public health as a perspective is that it can 
identify people who think in a similar way and might form advocacy coali-
tions across institutions to promote their views (Jenkins-Smith & Sabatier, 
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1994), as well as a style of reasoning that can be adopted by policymakers 
who have no formal affiliation with public health, in the same way that 
Popp Berman traced the “economic style of reasoning” across people and 
institutions with limited roles for formally trained economists (and the 
way that the spread of that style of reasoning, encouraged by trained 
economists, led to the hiring and empowering of economists in govern-
ment) (Berman, 2022; Helgadóttir, 2016).

2.3.4 � Institutions

The fourth approach is to focus on the instructional and organizational 
structures of public health, particularly in the context of government and 
law. In this approach, public health is essentially what governments and 
related large institutions say it is, with some modifications to local politi-
cal language and laws. Thus, in most rich countries, public health would 
mean the public health departments in the local and regional government, 
the central public health agency, the academic research and teaching 
enterprise called public health, some NGOs with clear public health mis-
sions as accepted by the named parts of government, and a few parts of 
central government that are named as and clearly involved in the same 
activities. That would be the field of public health.

This approach is perhaps the easiest target for empirical research and 
has some important advantages. It creates some comparability and gener-
ally does produce cross-national agreement on the core components of a 
public health body (such as surveillance, field epidemiology, advice, com-
munications, and health education campaigns). It does not require that 
investigators specify a priori what public health should mean, which 
removes a major possible source of bias. Thus, for example, nominalism 
allows us, in the European Union (EU), to watch the public health policy 
space slowly incorporate (or at least start to overlay) other policy areas by 
watching the increasing use of the public health treaty article (168 TFEU) 
as a treaty base or the functions of the relevant Directorate-General (Greer 
& Jarman, 2021; Greer et al., 2022b).

Bodies such as the EU and WHO define public health agencies 
(including the functions listed in Box 1) and oblige member states to 
nominate agencies and people as representatives, which creates more 
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isomorphism: the notifying bodies of the European Centre for Disease 
Prevention and Control (ECDC) network are, in the EU, the presumptive 
center of each member states’ public health undertakings, and they have 
indeed been getting more organizationally homogeneous since the cre-
ation of the ECDC. Compare the situation today with the far more diverse 
situation recorded in (Elliott et al., 2012).

That increased European organizational homogeneity reflects a 
broader argument that is enabled by this approach. It takes advantage of, 
and allows us to study, the social construction of a transnational field and 
category (Meyer & Rowan, 1991; Scott & Meyer, 1991). There is clear 
institutional isomorphism in the tendency of agencies around the world to 
include the initials “CDC” in their English-language names. For those 
who find isomorphism arguments too disembodied, there are also a host 
of funding schemes, associations, and how-to books for the creation and 
extension of specific kinds of public health agencies (consult IANPHI, 
the  International Association of National Public Health Institutes, for 
example).

This approach risks nominative determinism, in which names rather 
than substance determine activities and formal competence becomes con-
fused with real competence (Mätzke, 2012). Is restaurant inspection part 
of public health? Not in England after 1974, where it is part of environ-
mental health because “public health” was split off and integrated into the 
National Health Service (NHS), leaving former areas of public health 
jurisdiction such as environmental health and social work in local govern-
ment (the public health function was “returned” to local government in 
2014, but it remains a separate funding stream to local governments).

In short, institutionalist approaches have many advantages but they 
probably must be used pragmatically to avoid nominative determinism, 
and too much pragmatism can simply reopen all the debates about the 
nature of public health.

2.3.5 � Functions

Fifth and finally, there is functionalist reasoning: by its manifest and latent 
activities in society shall you know it. Functionalist reasoning is hardly 
popular in the contemporary social sciences, (and for good reasons) but 
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there is functionalism to be found in any kind of social argument. In par-
ticular, there is a sensible enough argument that public health should be 
understood as “addressing a problem” and evaluated as such. In public 
health classrooms, this can often be stated in a definition of public health 
as the field that addresses collective causes of avoidable morbidity and 
mortality. If it collectively reduces avoidable mortality, it is “public 
health” regardless of whether it is a vaccination mandate, parental leave, 
a needle exchange, or a drainage ditch that stops mosquitos breeding.

By that standard, the field of public health, and the standing to inter-
vene in the policy of those who claim to speak for public health, is 
immense: not just inserting “health in all policies” into education or trans-
port debates but potentially viewing nuclear war as a public health problem 
because it would undeniably be a major source of avoidable mortality. This 
view, at the extreme, is obviously nonsense. A public health degree does 
not confirm expertise or power in education or transport or grand strategy, 
and somebody who claims it does is likely to be laughed out of politics 
(Fox, 2003) (Greer et al., 2018). Hence, the focus of the “Health in All 
Policies” or “Health for All Policies” literature is on politics, coalition-
building, and advocacy with other sectors (Greer et al., 2022a). Notably, 
the role of public health agencies and the topics of public health research-
ers in the 2022 Russian invasion of Ukraine, one of the biggest land wars 
since World War II, did not address the justice or strategy of Russia and 
Ukraine. Agencies’ behavior and scholars’ response alike focused on target 
populations and problems well known to them, such as sex work and 
human trafficking, refugee health, and communicable diseases. Those 
were far from the biggest sources of avoidable mortality associated with 
the invasion of Ukraine, but there was a tacit acceptance that the generals 
did not need to hear about strategy from the epidemiologists.

While Russia’s invasion of Ukraine showed the limits of public health 
claims in the face of vast and needless suffering, the COVID-19 pandemic 
showed how common it is to adopt a rough and ready functionalist defini-
tion of public health that evaluates its success by its ability to control 
infectious disease. This is what is happening whenever the success or fail-
ure of a country’s “public health” is evaluated by reference to COVID-19 
cases, COVID-19-attributed mortality, or excess mortality. The equation is 
problematic on both sides. On the outcome side, measures of the damage 
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of COVID-19 are variable, subject to vast and political measurement 
error, and in many countries, unavailable. But on the other side, it is 
unclear that COVID-19 outcomes tested public health as an actor, institu-
tion, or approach since nowhere did public health agencies or scholars 
make up the whole response and, in most cases, they did not lead it in any 
meaningful sense.

2.4 � Conclusion: From Lamentation and Misplaced 
Concreteness to Political Science

If misplaced concreteness often starts a public health conversation, then 
the end is frequently lamentation. Conversations in public health scholar-
ship, conventions, and agencies often focus on the weakness, poor 
resourcing, and low status of their field relative to rivals (notably health-
care), the problems public health faces, or the scale of government enter-
prise. Cost-effective and equitable public health policies, practitioners, 
and academics lament are pushed aside in favor of other political priori-
ties, while “health” is widely regarded as the activity of doctors, not those 
with a Masters of Public Health or public health nursing qualifications. 
Special interests, lack of political will, the short time horizons of politi-
cians, and other stock concepts of political discussion in public health all 
play their role. Sometimes the target is the superiority of medicine; some-
times the target is health inequalities; sometimes the target is more politi-
cal, but the scale of group grievance is hard to miss.

People with many points of view might agree that societies should 
invest more energy and resources in public health activities, or public 
health professionals and advocates, or preventative, collective health 
measures, or policies focused on the reduction of avoidable morbidity 
and mortality. But as social scientists, there are serious limitations to 
analysis that starts by asking why one particular interest, however nebu-
lously defined, is not pursued with more vigor. Asking what public health 
comes to mean and explaining that is a far more productive approach. In 
the same way, breaking down the welfare state into variables connected 
with stratification and risks made it easier to understand and measure 
without cutting off theoretical debate about its nature and explanations.
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We provided conceptions of public health found in the literature, with 
greater or lesser degrees of novelty, articulation, and acceptance. Each 
of  these approaches has advantages and disadvantages, ranging from 
concordance with public health textbooks to concordance with law to 
concordance with what we might like to see in society. It might be that 
advancing on all fronts is the best approach, e.g. try a comparison with a 
country or pair and see how different they actually are.

Each perspective at least has the advantage of forcing the question: 
public health what? Public health tasks, actors, perspectives, institutions, 
or functions? Research focused on the dissemination of public health per-
spectives or the growth of public health institutions might produce differ-
ent explanations, but they will be explanations of defined variables rather 
than phenomena. The explanations might be less likely to adopt teleolo-
gies of autonomous professionalism, a Center for Disease Control, the 
transformation of capitalism, or something else. In doing so, they would 
also create new ways to understand public health and public health poli-
tics, even at the price of a lighter swear jar over time.
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Chapter 3

Sweden

Birger C Forsberg, Miriam Mosesson, My Fridell, 
and Göran Tomson

3.1 � Introduction

Sweden is a country on the Scandinavian peninsula in Northern Europe 
with a population of 10.5 million (SCB, 2022). The average life span is 84 
years for women and 81 years for men. Sweden has proportionally one of 
Europe’s largest elderly populations. About 20% of the Swedish popula-
tion were 65 years or older in 2019. Most of them (96%) lived at home, of 
which about 40% lived alone.

The current population growth rate is approximately 1% per year, 
with immigration contributing around 75% of that growth. Around 20% 
of the population is “immigrant” in the sense that they were born outside 
Sweden. Syria has generally been the most common country of origin 
among immigrants. Other prominent countries of origin are Iraq, Poland, 
Iran, Somalia, and Afghanistan. However, in total the four Nordic coun-
tries other than Sweden are still the most common place of birth for immi-
grants (SCB Statistikdatabasen, 2023).

This is an open access book chapter published by World Scientific Publishing. It is 
distributed under the terms of the Creative Commons Attribution-NonCommercial 4.0  
(CC BY-NC) License. https://creativecommons.org/licenses/by-nc/4.0/
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The government system in Sweden is characterized by multilevel gov-
ernance with three levels of vital decision-making: national, regional, and 
municipal. Each level is ruled by a parliament or a council to which politi-
cians are elected every fourth year. All levels raise taxes to carry out their 
duties and responsibilities. The politicians are responsible to the electorate 
in their constituency and not to the other levels. Hence, the Swedish gov-
ernment system is not hierarchical but formed of three levels that have the 
power and mandate to rule within their jurisdiction.

3.1.1 � Public health organization

Public health functions in Sweden are distributed among many agen-
cies and actors. The Public Health Agency Folkhälsomyndigheten 
(FoHM) has the responsibility to provide advice on public health 
developments and interventions based on available evidence. The 
agency produces guidelines and advice available to all actors, includ-
ing the public. The Public Health Agency is responsible for monitoring 
health developments in the population and regularly reporting on those 
developments.

The agency does not implement preventive programs; rather, it pro-
vides financial support to non-governmental organizations that are active 
in health promotion and prevention when commissioned to do so by the 
government. FoHM is the national agency with the authority for commu-
nicable disease control.

Regions in Sweden are responsible for financing healthcare ser-
vices, and they also provide the bulk of those health services. The 
regions can choose their level of engagement in broader public health 
prevention. Regions finance antenatal care and child health check-ups. 
They are also responsible for the implementation of national child vac-
cination programs. These programs are decided upon by the govern-
ment at the recommendation of the Public Health Agency and financed 
by the national government. The regions are legally responsible for 
communicable disease control within their constituencies.

Municipalities in Sweden have the main responsibility for essential 
public health functions, such as water, sanitation, and food control. Many 
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municipalities are also, to a varying degree, active in promotion of healthy 
lifestyles and health-supportive environments (such as safe bicycle routes 
to school). Preschools and schools are financed by municipalities. Most 
are also operated by the municipalities, but private schools exist. They 
operate under agreements with the municipalities and abide by the same 
rules and regulations as the public actors. Pre-schools and schools have 
the responsibility for all matters related to teaching children up to the age 
of 18, and matters related to health are part of that instruction. School 
health services have the responsibility for national vaccination programs 
for school-aged children.

Public responsibility for broader societal determinants of health of the 
population, such as transport systems, housing, food production and mar-
kets, and socio-economy, falls under different government agencies and 
ministries. There is no formal coordination of the work of these agencies 
with regard to public health. However, the Swedish government has 
made a strong commitment to the Sustainable Development Goals (SDG) 
and Agenda 2030. Within that framework, action has been taken to 
facilitate communication and collaboration between different government 
agencies.

An organogram summarizing the Swedish government structure for 
public health is given in Figure 3.1.

Many different laws have implications for the way society acts in 
relation to public health determinants, but none of them are specific to 
public health. The Swedish Parliament has adopted a National Public 
Health Policy which defines eight target areas that are key to public 
health  developments. Qualitative goals are set within each target area 
(Prop., 2017/18:249). The Public Health Agency has the task to monitor 
the National Public Health Policy.

Many Swedish non-governmental organizations are active in health 
promotion. There are organizations addressing the use of drugs, alcohol, 
tobacco, nicotine, etc. while others are promoting physical activity or sup-
porting mental health. Some NGOs actively provide individual support to 
people and families who have been hit by mental illness or various life-
crisis events. Most of the NGOs receive financial support from the 
national, regional, or municipality level for their work.
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Monitor service delivery and its compliance with national regulations and 
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Figure 3.1.    Essential public health functions in the government system in Sweden.
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3.1.2 � National-level organization

Sweden is a constitutional monarchy built on parliamentarianism, mean-
ing that the government is responsible to the Parliament (Riksdagen). The 
Prime Minister is approved by the Parliament. The Riksdagen sets all laws 
in the Swedish system. The Parliament also approves the government bud-
get. Traditionally, the national government’s main steering tools are 
decrees or laws. The national level has limited financial power over the 
operations in the regions and municipalities as their main sources of 
income are regional or municipal taxes.

The Ministry of Health and Social Affairs is responsible in the  
country for overall healthcare and social care, including elderly care. 
However, the Ministry does not have direct power over the regions and 
municipalities.

Several government agencies and general directorates are responsible 
for regulating, analyzing, and evaluating health and social services. 
Foremost among them are

·	 The National Board of Health and Welfare (Socialstyrelsen — SoS).
·	 The Medical Products Agency (Läkemedelsverket — LMV).
·	 The Dental and Pharmaceutical Benefits Agency (Tandvårds-och 

läkemedelsförmånsverket — TLV).
·	 The Public Health Agency (Folkhälsomyndigheten — FoHM).
·	 The Health Care and Social Care Inspectorate (Inspektionen för vård 

och omsorg — IVO).

The agencies work within their terms of reference as given by the 
regulations for each respective agency. The government agencies and gen-
eral directorates provide guidelines for operations. They are in most cases 
not legally binding. The government agencies monitor and follow up how 
well services are provided. They also work on investigations given to them 
by the Ministry of Health and Social Affairs. Such tasks are often linked 
to on-going needs for the development of services or to service issues 
brought up in the public debate.

There is little formal coordination between the agencies. Such coordi-
nation must go through the ministry.
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All five agencies listed earlier became actively involved in the corona 
pandemic control in various ways. In addition, the Swedish Civil 
Contingencies Agency (Myndigheten för samhällsskydd och beredskap — 
MSB) had an important role in actions required in other sectors than the 
health and social sectors during the pandemic control.

Universities are under the responsibility of the national government. 
Health professionals are trained at universities. Specialist training is done 
while working in health services that fall under the authority of the 
regions. Auxiliary staff, such as assistant nurses and social care assistants, 
receive their degrees from high schools. High schools fall under the 
responsibility of municipalities.

3.1.3 � Regional organization

Sweden is divided into 21 regions. The main responsibility of a region is 
healthcare. Regions mostly act as purchasers and regulate provision of 
care through agreements and contracts. Around 12% of public expendi-
tures on healthcare are spent on buying services from private providers. 
The rest goes to provider units that are owned and operated by the regions. 
About 46% of visits in primary healthcare, 13% of visits in specialist 
outpatient care, and 18% of visits in psychiatric ambulatory take place 
through private services (Vårdföretagarna, 2019).

In general, private providers did not differ from public providers in 
relation to given tasks or behavior during the COVID-19 pandemic. All 
providers that had agreements with the regions were compensated for loss 
of income that followed from heavy reduction of patients coming to the 
services. This resulted from the recommendation from the authorities to 
the public not to seek care during the lockdown of the country, other than 
for emergencies.

There are 7 university hospitals and about 70 smaller hospitals in 
Sweden. Primary care is organized in approximately 1,200 healthcare 
centers. Primary care is responsible for basic medical treatment, preven-
tive work, and rehabilitation.

Since 2015, there has been quite a significant growth in digital health 
services, driven by private investors and new private providers of these 
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services. Digital advice and services are now also provided by public pro-
viders. Digital health accelerated during the pandemic. Use of the public 
sector advisory function on health and healthcare, named 1177, also 
increased significantly during that period.

3.1.4 � Municipal organization

There are 290 municipalities in Sweden. In addition to the functions men-
tioned under 1, they provide basic healthcare below physician’s level to 
patients in ordinary housing and in nursing homes under the leadership of 
a qualified nurse. They also provide rehabilitation by occupational thera-
pists and physiotherapists. Municipalities do not employ doctors so any 
matters that require input from a doctor need to be covered by regionally 
financed health services. Often, there will be agreements between a 
municipality and a region to arrange for doctor visits on a regular basis to 
nursing homes.

3.2 � The Legal Framework for Health and Social 
Care Provision

3.2.1 � Healthcare

The Health and Medical Service Act (HSL) (SFS, 2017:30) regulates all 
healthcare in Sweden. Under the HSL, healthcare of high quality should 
be available to all citizens on equal terms (SFS, 2017:30). Municipal 
responsibility for home healthcare assumes an agreement between the 
municipality and the region to take over such responsibility (SFS, 
2017:30).

In addition to the HSL (SFS, 2017:30), there are several laws that per-
tain to health services. The Patient Act (SFS, 2014:821) aims to strengthen 
and clarify the patient’s position and to promote patient integrity, self-
determination, and participation. A patient discharged from inpatient care 
has the right to receive summary information on the care and treatment 
provided during the period of care. The Patient Safety in Health Care Act 
(SFS, 2010:659) defines the professional responsibility of healthcare 
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professionals to provide good and safe care. For care providers, there are 
supplementary provisions on their obligations to conduct systematic 
patient safety work (HSLF-FS, 2017:40, n.d.).

3.2.2  �Social elderly care in Sweden

The Social Services Act (SFS, 2001:453) gives all citizens the right to 
claim public services and assistance to support themselves in their day-to-
day existence if their needs cannot be met in any other way. The support 
includes social service, short-term housing, and social care in special 
housing and in the home (SFS, 2001:453). Special accommodation 
(Särskilt boende — SÄBO) is defined as an institution providing care 
around-the-clock, including care from a registered nurse, and resembles 
what is internationally called nursing homes. To get a place in a special 
accommodation, a person must have major medical and social needs. The 
needs are assessed by a qualified social care worker at the municipality 
level who accordingly decides what support the person can receive from 
the municipality. Some 12% of people over 65 years of age received 
healthcare and/or social care from the municipalities in 2019, 8% at home, 
and 4% in special accommodation (Socialstyrelsen, 2021).

Social care is mostly provided by professional staff, such as assistant 
nurses, but due to shortage of such staff, about 30–40% of the staff are not 
formally qualified for their tasks (IVO, 2019). Some of them may however 
have gained significant experience over the years working in the social 
care services, while others come and go. Additionally, 25% of staff in 
nursing homes are hourly employees who often work in several resi-
dences. This increases the risk of infections spreading from household to 
household (SOU, 2020:80). The turnover of staff in elderly care services 
became a much-discussed issue during the pandemic. So was the number 
of staff involved in visits to a particular person. Home care recipients met 
an average of 16 different staff during a 14-day period in 2021 (15 staff in 
2020) with a variation from 7 to 24 staff among the country’s municipali-
ties (Socialstyrelsen, 2022a).

In 2009, a new act enacted by Parliament (the Act on System of Choice 
in the Public Sector, (SFS, 2008:962) gave the municipalities the 
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opportunity to contract out services to private providers. The degree to 
which the municipalities apply the system of choice varies. In 2018, 19% 
of the special accommodation for older people and social care at home 
were privately operated (Vårdföretagarna, 2019).

3.2.3  �Coordination between healthcare and social care

In 1992, a major reform, known as the Ädelreformen, took place. This 
changed responsibility for long-term inpatient healthcare and care for the 
elderly from county councils to municipalities (Anell et al., 2012). As a 
result of this shift in responsibility, a municipality chief nurse (Medicinskt 
ansvarig sjuksköterska) was instated in the municipalities with responsi-
bility for maintaining patient safety and quality of care in all the municipal 
healthcare services (SFS, 2017:30).

As the regions and municipalities enjoy a high degree of self-gover-
nance, they may apply different practices depending on the political and 
service leadership, on the healthcare needs of the residents, and on the 
healthcare infrastructure in the area (Rechel et al., 2018). This fact was 
much discussed during the pandemic as there were challenges in making 
both health services and social care services comply with what was con-
sidered the most efficient way to contain the virus, contain its spread, and 
manage cases.

Better coordination of services from the municipality and the region 
has been called for, especially for the elderly who suffer from chronic and 
multiple diseases (SOU, 2020:80). An Act on Coordinated Discharge was 
implemented in 2017 to clarify the responsibilities (SFS, 2017:612). The 
act aims to promote good quality of healthcare and social service for indi-
viduals who, after discharge from inpatient care, need assistance from 
both regional and municipal services. One obstacle to coordination is the 
lack of a joint information system.

In 2017, the Health and Social Care Inspectorate (IVO) conducted a 
national oversight of 38 operations focusing on collaboration between 
inpatient care, primary care, rehabilitation, and home healthcare, regard-
ing care of older people with comorbidities who were cared for in ordinary 
living (IVO, 2017). The report pointed to the need for improving staffing 
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and staff continuity. The level of education of the nursing staff in elderly 
care varied not only in the country but also in the same municipalities. The 
need for continuous training of staff to adapt to new developments and 
methods was also called for. The inspection found that there were defi-
ciencies in information transfer and lack of drug handling related to del-
egation of responsibilities to social care personnel. Overall, it was 
concluded that care transitions from regional to municipal providers could 
create unclear responsibilities for involved care professionals.

The challenges arising from inadequate coordination between regions 
and municipalities were issues raised as a possible reason for the pan-
demic hitting the elderly particularly hard. IVO made a review of how 
people in nursing homes were treated during the pandemic. IVO’s review 
of medical records for 847 people diagnosed with COVID-19 in 98 special 
accommodation facilities showed that in as many as around 20% of those 
cases, no medical assessment took place at all. In 40% of these cases, 
there was no individual assessment by a nurse. Furthermore, IVO’s review 
showed that less than 10% of the patients/care recipients received an 
assessment on-site in the accommodation (SOU, 2020:80).

3.2.4 � Communicable disease control and emergency 
preparedness

Communicable disease control in Sweden is regulated by the Communi­
cable Disease Protection Act (SFS, 2004:168). It gives the Public Health 
Agency (FoHM) the responsibility to provide regulations, guidelines, 
and information on communicable disease control and epidemic control. 
The agency is also given the task to coordinate communicable disease 
control at the national level among the government agencies. Furthermore, 
the Public Health Agency oversees communicable disease surveillance 
in the country.

The national act stipulates that the national government has the 
authority to decide on all matters related to which diseases shall be notifi-
able and the regulations around reporting cases from these diseases. As of 
February 2023, 27 diseases were classified as notifiable. Furthermore, 
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diseases can be classified as threats to society (samhällsfarlig sjukdom). 
This allows more urgent measures to be taken to control the spread of the 
disease. Only three diseases are currently listed as “samhällsfarliga” 
(ebola, smallpox, and SARS). COVID-19 was classified as such a disease 
on February 1, 2020 through a government decree (Krisinformation, 
2020a) and later through a temporary act adopted on January 10, 2021, the 
so-called “Pandemilagen” (SFS, 2021:4). A new act declassified COVID-
19 as being a “samhällsfarlig sjukdom” from April 1, 2022 (Prop., 
2021/22:137).

The decision-making of the government can be delegated to a relevant 
government agency. In communicable disease control, this is the Public 
Health Agency. The work at FoHM on epidemic control is coordinated by 
a State Epidemiologist. As mentioned, municipalities are in charge of food 
control and control of water sources and sanitation. During the pandemic, 
all matters related to control of restaurants and public spaces were 
entrusted to them.

Each region must have an emergency preparedness plan to be updated 
after each election period (SFS, 2006:544). A new structure for civil 
defense and emergency preparedness in Sweden was established on 
October 1, 2022 (SFS, 2022:524). The new regulation defines the pre-
paredness sectors, civilian areas, and sector-responsible authorities. The 
National Board of Health and Welfare is the sector-responsible authority 
for preparedness within health and social care. The regions are responsible 
for provision of care during crises and for implementing their emergency 
preparedness plans.

3.3 � Epidemiology and Control Measures

3.3.1 � Epidemiology of the disease

The first case of COVID-19 in Sweden was confirmed on January 31, 
2020 by the Public Health Agency. The person in question had visited 
Wuhan in China. The second case was reported on February 26 and five 
new cases on February 27. After that, the virus spread like wildfire in the 
population and, within very little time, many got ill and hospitals began to 
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fill up with patients. Later it was proved that viral strains had arrived from 
many countries, mostly by Swedes going abroad on vacation. Mortality 
from the disease started to increase in March. There were reports of per-
sons in the productive ages contracting the disease and developing serious 
symptoms. Soon, attention was directed toward nursing homes, in which 
many elderly expired. This pushed mortality rates in Sweden high in com-
parison with other countries, not least the other Scandinavian countries, 
during the first three months of the pandemic. Researchers debated this at 
length (King et al., 2020) and public persons criticized the Public Health 
Agency for being too slow and too relaxed on the urgency of the situation 
created by the pandemic.

At the time of this writing in early June 2023, Sweden had had 
2,710,457 cases (54% women) (Coronavirus Resource Center, 2023), 
126,213 hospitalized cases, 10,344 persons treated in intensive care units 
(ICU) and 24,389 deaths (Table 3.1).

The age distribution of persons hospitalized and the age distribution 
of deaths are given in Figure 3.2.

As illustrated, deaths were skewed toward higher age groups. Most of 
the verified cases occurred in the age groups up to 60 years, while most 
ICU cases were in age groups 50–80 years. Most of the deaths occurred 
in the age group 70 and around 60% of total deaths were in persons 
80 years and older. Hence, the mortality rate from COVID-19 increased 
considerably with age. Staying in a nursing home was associated with 
increased mortality risk as compared to living at home. Many of the 

Table  3.1.    Number of cases, hospitalized, patients 
treated in ICU, and deaths due to COVID-19 in 
Sweden from February 24, 2020–May 28, 2023 
(Folkhälsomyndigheten, 2023a).

Variable Number

Cases 2,710,457

Hospitalized 126,213

ICU treated 10,344

Deaths 24,389



	 b5349    Public Policy Challenges in Rethinking Public Health6"×9"�

	 Sweden	   53

deaths occurred in nursing homes (44.7% of all) and only 4.1% in private 
housing. The rest (48.9%) died in hospital (Folkhälsomyndigheten, 
2023a).

In addition to age, it was found that being born abroad meant a 20% 
increased risk of dying from COVID-19 (Socialstyrelsen, 2022b).

Figure 3.3 shows the number of ICU cases per day in Sweden as an 
illustration of the epidemic. The number of ICU cases peaked in April 
2020, in December 2020, and in April 2021. An outbreak in early 2022 did 
not have as serious consequences in terms of ICU cases and deaths as 
earlier peaks, most probably reflecting an increased immunity against 
COVID-19 in the population and possibly less virulent virus strains 
as  a  result of vaccinations and natural development of the virus 
(Folkhälsomyndigheten, 2023a).

In 2020, the lack of testing facilities was reflected in the low number 
of cases registered that year (Figure  3.4). Also, on April 17, 2020 a 
national strategy for testing was presented by the Public Health Agency. 
The strategy aimed at establishing a sustainable capacity for testing. 
Highest priority was given to staff in health services, elderly care, and 
institutions for physical and cognitive impairment and to hospitalized 
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Figure 3.2.    Distribution of hospitalized cases and deaths due to COVID-19 in Sweden 
from February 24, 2020 to May 28, 2023 (Folkhälsomyndigheten, 2023b).
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patients who were suspected of having COVID-19 infection (SOU, 
2021:89).

The reported cases in the population were many and the disease was 
then widespread. This was also reflected in the heavy workload on health 
services from cases with COVID-19 as documented in the ICU chart. In 
contrast to this initial period of the pandemic, there was a high number of 
laboratory-confirmed cases in 2022 when testing facilities were well 
established in health services and rapid test kits were sold at reasonable 
prices (USD 5–10) in pharmacies and groceries.

Figure 3.3.    New Intensive Care Unit (ICU) cases per day in Sweden from February 24, 
2020 to May 28, 2023 (Folkhälsomyndigheten, 2023b).

Figure 3.4.    Confirmed cases of COVID-19 in Sweden from February 24, 2020 to May 
28, 2023 (Folkhälsomyndigheten, 2023b).
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While testing was low, the mortality was high, in the first half of 2020 
(Figure 3.5).

Sweden had high mortality rates in the second quarter of 2020 in 
comparison with many other countries. The situation has changed. The 
overall mortality rate in Sweden in international statistics was set by the 
Johns Hopkins Coronavirus Resource Center to 202.37 per 100,000 
population in March 2023 (Coronavirus Resource Center, 2023). This 
placed Sweden at place 46 among 193 countries for whom data are shown. 
Though the international comparison of COVID-19 mortality rates has 
shortcomings and potential sources of error, Sweden does not stand out as 
having suffered more than many others from the pandemic. Countries with 
higher mortality rates are, for instance, Czechia, the USA, Brazil, Poland, 
Italy, the UK, Belgium, Portugal, Spain, and Austria. The other 
Scandinavian countries have however had proportionally fewer cases. 
Norway had in the latest data report a mortality rate of 76.61/100,000 
population, Denmark 123.72, Iceland 62.42, and Finland 112.66.

3.3.2  �Control measures

The first case of COVID-19 in Sweden was reported on January 31. A 
press release from the Public Health Agency stated that one case did not 
imply that there was spread of the virus in Sweden. The agency said that 

Figure 3.5.    Deceased with COVID-19 in Sweden from February 24, 2020 to May 28, 
2023 (Folkhälsomyndigheten, 2023b).
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they considered the risk of such spread very small based on the experience 
of other countries (Krisinformation, 2020b). The agency also said that 
health services had good procedures for taking care of cases like the first 
one in a proper and safe way. In fact, no spread from that case was ever 
documented.

Already on February 1 the government had taken a decision to classify 
coronavirus as an emergency infectious threat to society. This decision 
was taken to allow the disease control authorities to take extraordinary 
measures to control the disease. Five days later, FoHM announced that 
travelers from areas in China from which cases of corona disease had been 
reported should be watchful for symptoms. However, they were not 
required to quarantine. On February 11, the Ministry of Foreign Affairs 
(Utrikesdepartementet — UD) advised people not to visit Hubei and 
Zhejiang provinces in China. On February 17, all travels to China were 
discouraged by UD. Soon the travel recommendations were extended to 
several other Asian countries.

On February 25, the FoHM changed its assessment of the risk of a 
general spread of the coronavirus in the Swedish population from “very 
low” to “low” (on a scale with very low, low, modest, high, and very high 
as grades). On February 26, a new case of COVID-19 disease was reported 
by the agency. This was a person who had visited northern Italy. Still, the 
agency, through the State Epidemiologist, stated that healthcare services 
were well equipped to deal with the case and prevent the spread of the 
virus. The State Epidemiologist said that it is important to distinguish 
isolated cases from a community spread of the virus which “we do not 
have in Sweden” (Krisinformation, 2020c). The day after, the agency 
reported five new confirmed cases, now from three different regions. The 
agency said that all cases were related to visits abroad and that there were 
no signs of transmission of the virus in the population.

After that, developments were quick. On March 2, the agency elevated 
the risk of community spread to “modest.” On the same day, flights from 
Iran were stopped at the advice of the FoHM and, on March 6, travelers 
were advised not to visit Italy and South Korea. On March 9, the agency 
advised people to test themselves for COVID-19. The advice was directed 
at persons who had visited Tyrol in Northern Italy and who showed symp-
toms of COVID-19 disease. On March 10, the agency declared for the first 
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time that there were signs of domestic transmission of the virus, meaning 
that there were cases in Sweden that were not connected to travel abroad. 
This was 38 days after the first case had been diagnosed in Sweden. The 
risk assessment of community transmission was changed to “very high.” 
Persons with symptoms were advised to limit their contact with others. 
This was particularly targeted to persons working in elderly care and rela-
tives of persons living in nursing homes. Only a few days later the govern-
ment took several measures to limit community spread of the virus and, 
on March 14, people were advised not to travel abroad. Strong recommen-
dations were also given to keep physical distance of at least 2 meters from 
other persons. This message and messages on personal hygiene, such as 
regular hand washing, were from then on communicated intensely through 
public media campaigns.

A full list of all major measures taken at the national level to control 
the COVID-19 pandemic is given in Table 3.2. The measures are listed in 
the order in which they were introduced. The duration of the measure is 
also given in Table 3.2.

Table  3.2.    Measures taken, date of introduction, date of cancellation, and duration of 
measurement in months. Sorted by start date (European Centre for Disease Prevention and 
Control and the Joint Research Centre of the European Commission, 2023).

Measures taken Start date End date
Duration 
in months

Quarantine, domestic (General Public, 
recommendation)

2020-01-27 2022-02-08 24

Contact tracing 2020-01-27 2022-03-31 26

Isolation of cases, persons with confirmed 
covid should stay at home

2020-02-27 2022-03-31 25

Public gathering restriction for indoor event of 
over 500 persons

2020-03-12 2021-09-29 6.5

International travel advice, dissuasion from 
unnecessary travel

2020-03-14 2022-03-31 24.5

Teleworking (work from home) 2020-03-16 2022-03-31 24.5

Higher education (university), closure 2020-03-17 2021-05-31 14.5

Upper secondary school, closure 2020-03-17 2020-06-15 3

(Continued )
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Table 3.2.    (Continued )

Measures taken Start date End date
Duration 
in months

Total border closure, entry ban for individuals 
other than citizens of the EU, EEA, and 
United Kingdom

2020-03-17 2022-03-31 12

Visitors to serving establishments must be 
seated

2020-03-25 2020-07-07 3.5

No events with over 50 people are allowed 2020-03-29 2021-05-31 14

Risk groups (elderly) recommended to stay at 
home

2020-04-01 2020-10-22 6.5

Travel advice, avoid unnecessary travels within 
Sweden

2020-04-01 2020-06-12 2

Other (regulates number of customers in 
shops, payment queues, etc.)

2020-04-01 2020-12-31 9

Temporary legislation giving the  
municipalities the authority to reduce 
congestion in restaurants

2020-07-01 2020-12-31 6

Public spaces, restrictions in restaurants 2020-07-01 2021-09-28 4

Possibility to introduce local general  
restrictions in regions

2020-10-19 2022-03-31 17

Upper secondary school closure 2020-11-13 2020-12-06 1

Visiting restrictions (home for the elderly) 2020-11-19 2022-02-09 15

Private gathering restrictions (max. 8 persons) 2020-11-30 2021-09-29 10

Quarantine, domestic a Asymptomatic children 
and students living with someone with 
COVID should stay at home)

2020-12-01 2022-03-31 16

Upper secondary school, closure 2020-12-07 2021-01-06 1

Protective masks voluntary closed space 
(public transport)

2021-01-07 2021-07-01 6

Public spaces: Restrictions on visiting shops, 
shopping malls, and gym centers

2021-01-10 2021-05-17 4

Gym sports centers, partial (min. space per 
person)

2021-01-10 2021-06-01 5

Non-essential shops: Partial (visitors should 
enter alone)

2021-01-10 2021-05-17 4
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All special measures against COVID-19 were abolished from April 1, 
2022 (Läkartidningen, 2022).

The table provides useful information on the implementation of the 
pandemic control in Sweden and gives a broad view of control history. 
Still, there are details in the interventions that are not covered in the table. 
For instance, quarantine, introduced January 27, 2020, never went beyond 

Table 3.2.    (Continued )

Measures taken Start date End date
Duration 
in months

Upper secondary school, partial distance 
learning to avoid too many students in 
schools

2021-01-11 2021-04-01 3

Quarantine for international travelers 2021-01-22 2022-03-31 14

Border screening 2021-02-06 2022-03-31 14

Travel advice, internal 2021-03-01 2022-03-31 13

Public spaces: Restrictions on entertainment 
venues (amusement parks, zoos, museums, 
art galleries, etc.)

2021-03-25 2021-05-31 2

Vaccinated are exempted to NPIs 2021-04-16 2021-11-30 7.5

Public transport restrictions, limited number of 
passengers on long-distance public transport

2021-06-01 2021-07-15 1.5

Public gathering restriction indoor over 500 2021-12-01 2022-02-09 2

Vaccination certificates for public gatherings 2021-12-01 2022-02-09 2

Indoor over 50 2021-12-23 2022-01-18 1

Protective masks voluntary closed space 
(public transport)

2021-12-23 2022-02-08 1.5

At public gatherings indoors, seated  
participants required more than  
20 participants, vaccination certificate  
if more than 500

2021-12-23 2022-01-18 1

Higher education (university, high school), 
partial closure

2022-01-12 2022-02-08 1

Public spaces: Restrictions on restaurants, 
bars, etc. (close by 23 H, max 8 persons/
table)

2022-01-12 2022-02-09 1

Private gathering restrictions (max. 20) 2022-01-19 2022-02-09 1
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a recommendation to people to stay at home and not see other people than 
the closest family when they had been abroad or fell ill. There was never 
any mandatory quarantine. Contract tracing was formally established on 
January 27, 2020 but was never realized much in practice. A major reason, 
brought up earlier in the paper, was that the regions did not have the 
capacity to speed up contract tracing with the relatively limited staff they 
had at hand in their communicable disease control units. The system sim-
ply got overwhelmed with COVID-19 cases.

The mandatory measures taken were restrictions on indoor gatherings 
of more than 500 persons (which hit the sports industry hard), the move 
to teleworking (working from home), the imposition of border closure, 
and the closure of high schools and universities, all imposed in March 
2020. Teleworking was not compulsory but almost all public organizations 
followed the recommendation, while compliance varied in private compa-
nies. Overall, around 40% of the workforce has been estimated by the 
Public Health Agency to have worked from home during the pandemic. 
Pre-school and primary and secondary schools (up to age 16) were never 
closed, but it was recommended that schools should seek to limit the num-
ber of students in the classroom (by, for instance, having half the students 
work from home every second day).

Domestic travel was strongly discouraged by FoHM, and through 
agreements with mobile phone operators, the weekly movement of people 
was monitored and reported. The recommended restrictions on domestic 
travel were lifted from June 13, 2020. The eight first measures adopted 
were also the ones to be kept in place the longest. As can be seen from the 
table, other measures were repeated as the pandemic resurged at the end 
of 2020 and the beginning of 2021 and for a short period at the end of 
2021 into 2022. Only 1 out of 12 measures listed as having been taken 
from December 1, 2021 was kept for more than 2 months.

As interesting as the information in the list is, what is not on the list 
is perhaps even more interesting. There are few mask recommendations in 
the list. The only one is for masks to be worn on public transport (which 
was introduced as late as July 1, 2021). A reason given for the restrained 
position of the FoHM with regard to face masks was that the agency did 
not find sufficient scientific evidence of their effectiveness in reducing 
viral spread.
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Another control measure missing from the list is that schools below 
the level of high school were never closed. A third is that there were no 
restrictions on movement outdoor. Everybody was strongly advised to 
keep a two meters distance, but they were never asked to stay inside or not 
to meet outside in low numbers. In fact, physical activity was encouraged 
by the Public Health Agency (Krisinformation, 2020d). There was never 
any compulsory quarantine on international travelers. Those who arrived 
from abroad were advised to stay at home in their accommodation of 
choice for at least five days. If they had no symptoms after that, they were 
free to move.

Personal protective equipment (PPE) was quickly introduced by the 
regions for staff in hospital services. In elderly care, the intensity of provi-
sion varied significantly with the service providers. This was one of the 
issues raised when mortality started to increase in nursing homes (SOU, 
2020:80). A problem was, as in many other European countries, that there 
was a shortage of supply of such protective gear (SOU, 2022:10).

Further characteristics of the Swedish pandemic control were the rela-
tively limited testing (Frediksson & Hallberg, 2021) and little contract 
tracing in Sweden. The more forceful measures were the restrictions on 
eating places (restaurants, bars, etc.) and on public gatherings, both sup-
ported by parliamentary acts. These two measures were criticized by rep-
resentatives of the restaurant owners and sports clubs. Still, they also 
expressed understanding for the need to limit the spread of the virus 
through restricting their activities.

Health services were active in testing patients from early on. This was 
part of diagnostics and primarily intended to make sure that patients with 
symptom-free COVID-19 were not placed in wards with other patients. 
Also, the FoHM recommended on April 17, 2020 that all health staff and 
staff in elderly care facilities test themselves regularly. On November 17, 
2021, the agency recommended that the regions test all persons who were 
6 years or older with symptoms of the disease. This was in reaction to the 
reports that the incidence of COVID-19 disease on the rise in other coun-
tries and in Sweden. Testing was recommended for all patients except 
those who had had confirmed COVID-19 infection in the preceding 6 
months.
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A complete description of how the Swedish community at large 
reacted to the pandemic would be exhaustive. Most government and non-
governmental organizations took action to adjust their daily operations to 
the fluctuating situation that the pandemic and control measures created. 
Many also provided resources and expertise needed to reduce the impact 
of the pandemic. In the following box, this is illustrated with a description 
of the comprehensive program that was put in place at the Karolinska 
Institute to this end. Measures were taken on ad hoc basis for short-term 
support to anything from lab testing to clinical research, but important 
decisions were also taken on long-term support to a sustainable health 
crisis management system in Sweden.

Fact Box

A Swedish university’s response to the pandemic.

This box is meant to illustrate with an example how the Swedish academic 
community reacted to the pandemic and its development.

As a university, Karolinska Institutet (KI) is Sweden’s single largest 
center of medical academic research and offers the country’s widest range of 
medical courses and programs. There are some 6,500 students at bachelor’s 
and master’s levels at the institute and around 2,100 PhD students. The 
institute has around 5,400 full-time employees. In addition, a larger number 
of researchers are affiliated to KI, often with another organization as their 
main employer. Research at Karolinska Institutet spans the entire medical 
field, from basic experimental research to patient-oriented and nursing 
research.

During the pandemic, KI took many structural actions that were 
influenced by the government’s decisions as well as independent scientific 
and rational thinking within the academic community. Many on-going 
research activities were kept on hold to allow for resources to focus on 
research related to the virus and the pandemic. Much effort was put 
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3.3.3 � Vaccinations

The Swedish strategy on vaccinations was characterized by a gradual, 
step-by-step introduction of the vaccines to priority groups, eventually 
offered to the whole population above 18. This was very much dependent 
on the speed with which the vaccines could be delivered by the manufac-
turers. It has been argued that Sweden, in comparison with other Nordic 
countries, was relatively quick in immunizing the elderly once the vac-
cines became available (Yarmol-Matusiak et al., 2021).

All matters related to the administration of the vaccines were with the 
regions. In some instances, regions would choose slightly different strate-
gies, which was quickly picked up in public debate as unfair and inequi-
table (SVT, 2020). All in all, such contentious issues faded away within a 
short time as vaccines increasingly became available.

The number of vaccinations given in total is shown in Figure  3.6. 
Vaccinations started at the very end of 2020 and increased rapidly up to 
the second quarter of 2021, after which the rate of vaccination leveled off. 
On March 14, 85% of the population above 12 had received at least one 
dose and 83.7% at least two doses (Folkhälsomyndigheten, 2023c).

into various aspects on the public health aspects of the pandemic. Other 
prominent research areas were clinical studies of symptoms and case 
development, including post-COVID, and essential studies of the virus and 
immunology studies, including vaccine development. Up to March 2023, 
an estimated 1,400 articles on COVID-19 and related matters have been 
published with participation by KI researchers.

At KI, eight groups were quickly formed in February and March 
2020 to facilitate coordination and collaboration within the institute and 
to provide advice and make resources available to the community at large, 
including the Public Health Agency and the media and health services. After 
much work on this during the pandemic, a Centre for Health Crises was 
established to permanently ensure capacity to catalyze research, training, 
and action and to provide expertise and drive policy, all to contribute to a 
society better prepared for future national and international health crises.

(Continued )
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On February 25, 2021, the Public Health Agency lifted restrictions on 
elderly in nursing homes who had had two doses of vaccine. Two weeks 
after the second dose, these seniors were allowed to see symptom-free 
family members.

The Public Health Agency issued a series of recommendations on vac-
cinations to the population as vaccines became available, gradually 
expanding the eligible target groups. Priority was usually applied so that 
those in the highest need would get the vaccines first. All vaccinations 
were voluntary, but overall compliance was high. Some resistance to vac-
cination was seen but not to the point that it affected the vaccine coverage 
to any larger degree (Folkhälsomyndigheten, 2021b). Lindvall and 
Rönnerstrand found that the largest group of vaccine-hesitant individuals 
said they were reluctant to take the vaccine for the simple reason that they 
were young and felt they ran a low risk of developing serious illness from 
the COVID-19 virus (Lindvall & Rönnerstrand, 2022). Still, an anti-vax 
movement was also active in Sweden. On at least three occasions in 2021, 
demonstrations against the pandemic control measures and the COVID-19 

Figure  3.6.    Cumulative number of vaccinations per week in thousands, Sweden. 
December 24, 2020–March 14, 2023 (Folkhälsomyndigheten, 2023b).
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vaccination were arranged in Stockholm with up to around a thousand 
participants, thereby violating the special pandemic law according to 
which public gatherings of more than 500 persons were prohibited (SVT, 
2023). The most recent recommendations from the Public Health Agency 
on vaccinations against COVID-19 are given in Table 3.3.

Table  3.3.    Recommendations from the Public Health Agency on vaccinations against 
COVID-19 as of March 23, 2023.

Target group Recommendations Comments

Persons >80 years and 
persons living in 
nursing homes 
(SÄBO)

Two doses with at least 6 
months interval during 
the period March 1, 
2023–February 29, 2024.

This is for those persons who 
have already received basic 
vaccination with three doses. 
Those who have not should be 
given these vaccinations first. 
Two doses + booster at earliest 
4 months after the first.

Persons 65–79 years 
and persons in risk 
groups from 18–64 
years

One dose during the period 
March 1, 2023–February 
29, 2024, by preference 
before the autumn/winter 
2023/24.

One more dose will be 
available to be given 
after at least 6 months.

Recommended irrespective of 
earlier doses.

Base vaccination recommended to 
this group: Two doses + booster 
at earliest 4 months after the 
first.

Persons 50–64 years One dose, by preference 
before the autumn/winter 
2023/24.

Recommendation irrespective of 
earlier doses. Vaccine to be 
given after an interval of at least 
9 months since previous dose.

Persons 18–49 years No recommendation on 
booster. However, people 
who live close to an 
elderly or a person in a 
risk group can get a 
dose.

The recommendation on base 
vaccination with three doses 
came to an end on March 1, 
2023.

Persons with 
immunodeficiencies

A vaccination program 
specially developed by 
the FoHM for this group 
should be followed.
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The Swedish Agency for Health and Care Services Analysis (Vård-
och omsorgsanalys) published a report in October 2022 on how well the 
Swedish regions had managed to reach those groups in society that were 
deemed to be of highest risk to be neglected in a general vaccination cam-
paign with COVID-19 vaccinations. The study used interviews, a survey, 
and statistics in its work. The tool Tailoring Immunization Programmes 
(TIP) developed by WHO’s Regional Office in Europe formed the basis 
for the assessment (Vård-och omsorgsanalys, 2022).

The report concluded that the work in the regions regarding reaching 
out with vaccinations could have been more evidence-based and targeted. 
After consultations with the regions, the Public Health Agency published 
a guideline, based on TIP, in July 2022 on how to reach people with vac-
cinations. Some regional staff expressed in interviews that they would 
have liked to have seen more of such guidance from the national level 
earlier. On the other hand, FoHM representatives expressed in their inter-
views that advice given by them was not always followed by the regions. 
Furthermore, regions and municipalities did not carry out surveys of their 
populations in the early phases of the pandemic to identify risk groups 
regarding vaccination coverage. The position was rather one of “expecta-
tion” until it became clear that vaccines would become available and, later, 
that there would be sufficient supplies to cover the larger part of the popu-
lation in Sweden. In the review from the agency, it is said that already 
early in the pandemic, it was clear that COVID-19 hit significantly harder 
those born abroad as well as socio-economically vulnerable groups, and 
that it was known that those factors were also linked to lower coverage of 
vaccinations in general. The authors of the report suggested that the 
regions therefore could have prepared targeted vaccination efforts in these 
groups earlier in the pandemic than what they did.

A key recommendation in the review was that the government should 
clarify the division of responsibilities and roles between authorities and 
between the national and regional levels to create better conditions for 
future vaccination work. The same conclusion was drawn by the Corona 
Commission, a commission appointed by the government to review how 
the pandemic control was managed in Sweden (SOU, 2022:10). It criti-
cized the government for not taking clear national leadership and larger 
responsibility in communicating with the public. It was also stated that the 
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government was too dependent on assessments from the Public Health 
Agency.

With that said, a recent study concluded that Sweden was one of few 
countries that could return to its pre-pandemic life expectancy in 2021 
after having experienced a decline in 2020. The study identified a rapid 
roll-out of vaccinations of those above 80 years or older as one of the pos-
sible reasons for this positive change in 2021 (Schöley et al., 2022).

It can be concluded that Sweden acted swiftly to reach the high-risk 
group of elderly with vaccinations, while others that were also hit more 
than proportionally by the disease could have been identified and reached 
earlier.

3.3.4 � Consensus and critique

The pandemic control measures that were enacted as laws were taken in 
broad political agreement within Parliament. Generally, the actions taken 
by the government and its agencies were supported by most of the parties 
in the political opposition and led to little criticism in Parliament. The 
party most critical was the Swedish Democrats, a populist and 
anti-immigrant party, that claimed that the government exceeded the 
temporary mandate given to it by the parliament (SFS, 2021:4) to act 
swiftly in the early phase of the pandemic (TT, 2022). Formal criticism 
was also given by entrepreneurs who were against a law that gave the 
government the legal right to close restaurants and other public places 
without supporting evidence to show that the measures taken were 
sufficiently effective in the control of the pandemic in relation to the 
significant costs to society linked to closures. Also, the gains from the 
restrictions on the constitutional rights of freedom of movement, and of 
conducting business freely, should be weighed against their costs to 
society (Krassén, 2022).

Criticism against the pandemic control strategies was also raised by 
some academics who felt that the approach taken was too lenient, that 
more active and legally binding control measures should be imposed, and 
that the government gave the Public Health Agency too extensive a man-
date (King et al., 2020; Hanson et al., 2021; Lindström, 2020). Meanwhile, 
other researchers acted in support of the approaches taken or at least did 
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not argue against them. This was not least true for those who appeared in 
public service media channels.

In the media, there was also a very active debate about the pandemic. 
On March 17, 2020, a count showed that articles on the coronavirus and 
outbreak had been shared about 7 million times on Swedish social media 
(Wikstrand, 2020). Leading editorials criticized the government for the 
absence of control measures like more active border controls and isolation 
of cases (Wolodarski, 2020). These critics were met by researchers who 
feared that scientific evidence was not given due respect in the debate 
(von Schreeb, 2020). In international media, Sweden was quickly put in 
bad light with Time magazine saying that “The Swedish COVID-19 
response is a disaster. It shouldn’t be a model for the rest of the world” 
(Björklund & Ewing, 2020), the New York Times warning that “Sweden 
has become the world’s cautionary tale” (Goodman, 2020), and the 
Guardian calling the strategy “a deadly folly” (Cohen, 2020). Later, inter-
national media returned to the “Swedish experience” and gave more bal-
anced reports on it (Pearson, 2023).

3.4 � Impact of the Pandemic and the Control Measures

The impact of pandemic control in Sweden can be measured in many 
ways. The primary purpose of actions taken was to control the disease. 
However, considerations also had to be given to other effects of the pan-
demic and control measures, such as effect on other health issues, not least 
mental health, social life, and the economy. Much has been written about 
this in traditional and social media. The government-appointed Corona 
Commission (SOU, 2022:10) also went through the effects in great depth, 
mostly during 2021.

Many articles have already been published on the impact of the pan-
demic control measures on the containment of the virus and society at 
large. Public media also continues to take an interest in what measures 
were successful and which were not. The development of findings and 
positions calls for caution in drawing early conclusions on the pandemic 
and its effects. There is a continuous need to study the corona pandemic 
and its short- and long-term consequences on many variables. Not least is 
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it too early to fully understand the consequences of post-COVID syn-
drome and, on a wider societal scale, the effects of lockdowns on learning 
and mental health, especially among the young.

3.4.1 � Mortality impact

The effects on health were initially dramatic with high mortality, in rela-
tion to other OECD countries, in elderly and some other risk groups, like 
persons with immigrant background in socio-economically deprived 
areas. However, over time the mortality gradually stabilized and decreased 
as many other countries saw the mortality increase. Today, we find that 
Sweden did not fare much worse regarding overall COVID-19 mortality 
than many other countries.

In Sweden, much consideration was also given to healthcare that had 
to be postponed due to the pressure that COVID-19 put on health services. 
So far, there are no indications that overall mortality due to other reasons 
than COVID-19 has increased since the pandemic started. Overall mortal-
ity due to other reasons decreased slightly in 2020 which is in line with a 
declining mortality trend seen since 2001 (Folkhälsomyndigheten, 2021c).

It is somewhat complicated to categorize causes of death since only one 
cause can be documented per death. This means that in documented data 
those who have died from COVID-19 could not have died of other causes 
in 2020. However, we know that COVID-19-related deaths were concen-
trated in older ages, as is general mortality. As previously mentioned, nurs-
ing homes and special accommodations providing care for elderly with 
medical needs were particularly affected by the pandemic. Patients in these 
homes are already fragile. Around 20% of the clients in nursing homes in 
Sweden expire within 6 months of admission to these institutions. The aver-
age length of stay for all clients is around 24 months. Similarly, the seasonal 
influenza was mild in 2019 and therefore expected to be worse in 2020 than 
the previous year. However, since the flu season did not occur (as with other 
viruses, such as Respiratory Syncytial Virus (RSV)), there was no flu-
related mortality. It can be assumed that some of those who died from 
COVID-19 would have passed away in 2020 due to other diseases.

At the beginning of the pandemic, much attention was brought to the 
high mortality rate in Sweden. More recently, there has been a debate 
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around the fact that Sweden does not stand out in the EU in regard to 
excess mortality (Bergstedt, 2023), shown in Figure 3.7. On the contrary, 
Sweden has one of the lowest excess mortality rates in Europe.

3.4.2 � Life and mental health impact

A report from FoHM on how public health was affected by the pandemic 
in 2020 in Sweden showed that people’s lifestyles were affected in differ-
ent ways and to a varying extent.

People were less physically active and increased unhealthy eating 
habits. This was especially the case for young people aged 16–29. 
However, there was no increase in the number of regular smokers, 
and  people actually tended to reduce their intake of alcohol 
(Folkhälsomyndigheten, 2021a).

No dramatic changes were found in the first year of the pandemic on 
the mental health of the Swedish population. Mild emotions of distress 
and sleep problems increased during the autumn of 2020 but not severe 
psychological problems. The emergency operators reported having more 
calls linked to suicidal thoughts during the pandemic. Yet in 2020, there 
was no increase in suicide rates or in the number of people admitted to 

Figure 3.7.    Monthly excess mortality in EU, Denmark, Sweden, and Norway (Eurostat, 
2023).
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hospitals due to suicide attempts. The Public Health Agency reported 
growing symptoms of anxiety, worry, and depression among groups that 
were vulnerable before the pandemic, such as migrants, LGBTQI people, 
and children in families with mental health problems, addiction, or vio-
lence (Folkhälsomyndigheten, 2021a).

Among young people aged 16–29, the percentage with problems of 
anxiety, worry, or anxiety increased from 41% to 57% during the period 
2015–2021. The rise in 2021 followed the same trend as in previous years 
and thus did not deviate from that trend during the pandemic. Analyses of 
the age group 16–19 showed similar results. In the group aged 16–29, in 
2021, 30% stated that they had quite a lot or a lot of trouble with loneli-
ness and isolation during the pandemic (Folkhälsomyndigheten, 2022). 
For children, the pandemic may have affected their daily life less as regu-
lar routines with school and social contacts continued.

Some persons who contract COVID-19 infection and disease will 
develop post-COVID syndrome. This is defined as a condition that occurs 
more than four weeks after a primary COVID-19 infection. As many as  
62 different symptoms and conditions have been associated with post-
COVID. Many of the conditions are serious and potentially life-threatening, 
such as pulmonary embolism and cerebrovascular disease. The prevalence 
of any post-COVID-19 condition symptom estimates vary widely, from 
12.7% to 50.6% in community groups (European Centre for Disease 
Prevention and Control, 2022).

The incidence of post-COVID syndrome in Sweden has not been stud-
ied in a systematic way, but the condition has been so apparent that facili-
ties for providing care to post-COVID patients were established in several 
regions. In August 2022, 12 regions out of 21 had such specialist centers. 
However, several of them have subsequently decided to close the centers 
and refer patients to primary care. Swedish media has given considerable 
publicity to post-COVID syndrome (European Centre for Disease 
Prevention and Control, 2022).

3.4.3 � Impact on the economy

The Swedish economy was negatively affected by the pandemic and the 
subsequent lockdowns in Sweden and elsewhere. The Gross Domestic 
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Product (GDP) decreased by 2.4% in 2002. The GDP growth in 2019 was 
2.0% and in 2021, 4.9%. Hence, there was a clear dip in the economy in 
2020 followed by a considerable recovery in 2021. GDP per capita 
decreased from SEK 516,600 in 2019 to SEK 500,600 in 2020. However, 
in 2021, it was SEK 522,200 (Ekonomifakta, 2022b).

The number of persons in employment was 5,034,700 in February 
2020 but then started to fall to reach its lowest in January 2021 with 
4,853,800 in employment. After that, employment increased continuously 
and reached its highest ever in September 2022 with 5,224,490 in the 
work force. Furthermore, salaries in real terms increased by 1.6% in 2020 
(Ekonomifakta, 2022a).

The rather remarkable development of the economy was facilitated by 
government interventions to support companies which experienced a dip 
in activities and demand. This allowed companies to keep much of their 
workforce during the short recession in the first half of 2020. All in all, 
the national government estimated in February 2021 that it had spent SEK 
389 billion to keep up the economy during the COVID-19 pandemic. This 
corresponds to approximately 15% of the total national expenditures in a 
year. The support was made possible by a strong financial government 
balance at the beginning of 2020 (Ekonomifakta, 2022c).

3.5 � Lessons Learned

The Swedish experience with the pandemic control had many interesting 
characteristics from which lessons can be learned. Some of them are as 
follows:

(1)	 A slow start in pandemic control can hit hard, but its repercussions 
can be balanced by more active action once the alert signals have 
become strong enough to mobilize the community at all levels. This 
may provide time to anchor decision-making in stakeholder groups 
and prepare the public for required control measures, factors that are 
likely to increase efficiency in implementation.

(2)	 A balance between actions to contain the spread of a virus causing an 
epidemic and the consequences on broader public health outcomes as 
well as on society at large from these actions should be sought.
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(3)	 In a decentralized government system, significant decision-making 
power can be given to specialized expert agencies, such as the Public 
Health Agency in Sweden. The effort to base decision-making on 
evidence and accumulated knowledge is laudable but may also 
become a hindrance to effective decision-making at national govern-
ment level.

(4)	 Legal frameworks and coordination of actors are setting the scene for 
pandemic control and are therefore essential to design and prepare for 
any system challenges that future pandemics may pose.

(5)	 Measures to contain an epidemic should be carefully reviewed and 
their potential gains should be weighed against their risks. Caution 
and discretion may at times be a defendable strategy given that quick 
action may miss its purpose and be met with resistance from the 
community.

(6)	 Academia can respond swiftly to the challenges posed by a pandemic 
and can make positive contributions to pandemic control.

Here we elaborate further on these and additional lessons learned during 
the pandemic.

The Swedish corona pandemic was characterized by a relatively 
slow start in public health actions once the pandemic reached Europe 
and Sweden. The first early cases were imported and isolated in hospi-
tals. No community spread was documented from them. Within 5–6 
weeks, when more cases occurred at great speed in Europe and cases 
were reported from different regions in Sweden, the government started 
to take action.

From early on, the Public Health Agency was given a prominent role 
in epidemic control. The agency acted as an advisor to the government 
throughout the pandemic and also took many actions within its jurisdic-
tion. As the Public Health Agency originally was set up to integrate health 
promotion and prevention of both communicable and non-communicable 
diseases, it gave due attention to all aspects of the pandemic control, 
including effects on mental health and well-being from various actions to 
reduce the transmission of the virus, such as restricting movements in the 
community and closing public spaces. The government took the larger 
responsibility for the overall impact on society from potential and actual 
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public health measures. For these reasons, the Swedish approach to the 
pandemic balanced the urgency to control the spread of the virus 
against the potential negative impact on society in general, and specifi-
cally in terms of mental health, especially from strict measures to 
reduce contact between people, restrict free movements, and isolate 
infected persons.

The Swedish approach, as illustrated earlier, received much attention 
in the early stages of the pandemic when many countries imposed very 
strong restrictions on people’s right to move freely in the community. 
Among the more contentious elements in Sweden was that people contin-
ued to move around freely at their own will, while being advised to keep 
a distance from others, and that schools below the level of high school 
were kept open. Sweden was among the few countries that decided to 
keep schools open. Later research has suggested that school closing was 
not an essential intervention in the pandemic control package (Shapiro 
et al., 2021). In some countries, such as Norway, there was criticism of 
the lack of consideration given to children’s needs from leading authori-
ties (Jakobsen, 2023). It remains an open question whether school closing 
should be applied in pandemic control in order to contain viral spread in 
the community. Also, much discussed nationally and internationally was 
that specific measures to protect people in homes for the elderly, nursing 
homes, were said not to be swift enough, especially in the early stages of 
the pandemic. This became particularly highlighted when Sweden 
showed considerably higher mortality from COVID-19 than most 
European countries, including the Nordic countries, during the first 6 
months of the pandemic (European Centre for Disease Prevention and 
Control and the Joint Research Centre of the European Commission, 
2023).

As the pandemic continued, Swedish mortality rates went down, and 
34 months after the pandemic started, the country does not stand out as 
worse hit by the pandemic than many other countries. However, as 
described on page 55 Sweden was worse hit than its Scandinavian neigh-
bors, countries that Sweden has much in common with. 
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Why did Sweden choose a somewhat different strategy than other 
countries, including the neighboring Scandinavian countries? This is a 
question that cannot be easily answered. Initially, it seemed that the differ-
ence was mainly due to slow reaction from the Swedish side when the first 
cases occurred. The other countries were quicker and more decisive at 
taking decisions to isolate cases and initiate testing as soon as testing 
became available (Yarmol-Matusiak et al., 2021). It has been argued that 
one reason for the difference is that the governing system in Sweden is 
more decentralized with respect to the government expert agencies, 
while in Denmark and Norway, there is more direct rule by the political 
government of the administrative structures at national level (Askin & 
Bergström, 2022). The difference in governance allowed the national gov-
ernments in Denmark and Norway to act swiftly when the pandemic threat 
became apparent, while the Swedish way was to rely more on the general 
directorates, such as the Public Health Agency, and the regions and 
municipalities.

Strang argues that there is a strong tradition in Sweden of thinking 
that a functioning economy is a prerequisite for people’s well-being and 
health and that the economic aspects of the pandemic control measures 
were much more central in the Swedish discussion, and at a much earlier 
stage, than in the other Scandinavian countries (Strang, 2020). This would 
have made the government more cautious in locking down society and 
introducing strict border controls and travel regulations. Decision-making 
in Sweden sought to balance pros and cons in an overall assessment of the 
total effect on society from potential interventions to contain the 
pandemic.

Another possible reason for the difference in action taken in the 
Scandinavian countries is the proposed difference in trust in the state in 
these countries, insofar as Swedes in particular tend to follow advice from 
authorities and the national government (Raffetti et  al., 2022). Hence, 
there would be less need for mandatory rules in Sweden as compared to 
Norway and Denmark (Moodie, 2021).

It has been pointed out by Baum and colleagues that efforts to find 
systematic country or system patterns in the management and outcome of 
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the pandemic have generally been less than rewarding. The authors argue 
that cross-country comparisons often overlook important differences, 
such as dynamic political, economic, and social structures and systems 
(Baum et al., 2021). Other researchers have argued that the unscientific 
use of international comparisons of case and mortality data in public dis-
course, media reporting, and policymaking on intervention effectiveness 
should be subject to greater scrutiny (Thomson et al., 2022).

What can be concluded from the “Scandinavian comparison” is that 
Sweden chose a somewhat different strategy to control the pandemic than 
Norway and Denmark and that Sweden ended up with a higher overall 
mortality from COVID-19 than these countries. The exact reasons for the 
differences in outcome need further exploration, including more in-depth 
studies of transmission patterns, reporting routines, and actual compliance 
with advice, rules, and regulations to control transmission in the popula-
tion. Still, a full assessment of the pandemic experience in the countries 
should be comprehensive and include all effects on society. A study 
showed, for instance, that in Norway, 69% lived a more sedentary life dur-
ing the pandemic versus 50% in Sweden, and 44% in Norway ate more 
versus 33% in Sweden. More people were depressed and sad in Norway 
than in Sweden (21% and 41% in Norway and 15% and 18% in Sweden, 
respectively) (Helsingen et  al., 2020). Furthermore, differences in the 
relative importance of foreign-born persons in the pandemic in the coun-
tries as well as any difference in the conditions for the elderly, in particular 
those with chronic diseases, should be studied.

Policies regarding disease control in Sweden are guided by the 
Communicable Diseases Act. It stipulates that containment measures must 
be proportionate and based on science and proven experience. In Sweden, 
there were few dramatic lockdowns and, to the extent possible, there was 
a policy to keep an open society with restrictions on factors, such as open-
ing hours, number of customers allowed, and placement of clients in res-
taurants and bars. The authority of the public health actors in the 
communicable disease system remained and was not changed from the 
national level. The restrictions imposed at the national level were mainly 
focused on the public. For instance, private visits to nursing homes were 
prohibited under the “Pandemilagen” (SFS, 2021:4). Furthermore, signifi-
cant energy was put into communication to the public on the importance 
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of keeping a physical distance of two meters, handwashing, working from 
home, and, in particular, staying at home when signs of illness occurred.

The legal framework played a role in the Swedish pandemic control as 
Swedish politicians and officials are prevented by the constitution from 
restricting people’s freedom of movement. As previously mentioned, tem-
porary acts first had to be taken by the parliament before certain restric-
tions to contain the COVID-19 virus could be introduced by the 
government.

Interestingly, the dominant perspective on the pandemic and the 
Swedish pandemic control actions have changed from one of being much 
discussed and questioned to one in which there is now more overall relief 
and satisfaction with the way the pandemic was handled. For instance, a 
population-based survey in 2021 showed that the respondents rated 
the  Public Health Agency higher than any other government agency 
(Statskontoret, 2022).

A reason for the positive assessment of the Swedish handling of the 
pandemic may well be that Sweden does not stand out anymore as an 
international “loser” in pandemic control, given the current mortality 
rates, compared to how it was portrayed at the beginning of the pandemic. 
Another reason for the assessment is that there have been many reports 
from other countries on the negative consequences for people from the 
drastic lockdowns imposed on them by their governments. Prolongation of 
restricting measures must be endured by the population. In many parts of 
the world, including countries close to Sweden, there were protests, some 
violent, as reactions to lockdowns and more so those that lasted for long. 
Sweden saw little of that, possibly because of the relative open pandemic 
control policy.

Many Swedes were pleased that they could continue to live a life that 
did not restrict their outdoor activities and allowed them to continue to 
interact in small numbers with relatives and friends. The restriction on 
visits to elderly relatives, especially in nursing homes, was a bad enough 
experience to make many Swedes feel gratitude that they were not sub-
jected to complete lockdown and disruption of their daily lives.

The Swedish experience from the corona pandemic is much less dis-
cussed in Sweden today than in the years 2020–2021. It was not an issue 
in the election campaign in September 2022. After the elections, a new 
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government was formed by the parties that were in opposition during the 
pandemic, but no political analysis has identified the management of the 
pandemic as a reason for why the previous government lost the election. 
In fact, the main party in the then-government, the Social Democrats, 
received increased support from the voters in the election.

The Director General of the Public Health Agency, who was appointed 
in 2022, has identified five areas that need to be strengthened in view of 
the experiences with the COVID-19 pandemic. They are (1) a revision of 
the Communicable Disease Protection Act, (2) a central body in each 
region for accelerating all necessary functions in case of need for rapid 
communicable disease control, (3) improved generation of, access to, and 
active use of health data, (4) strengthened capacity to store equipment and 
medical consumables required in an epidemic at regional and municipal 
levels; strengthen medical competence, in particular at the municipal 
level, and (5) scale-up efforts to reach quality care on equal terms for the 
entire population (Tegmark Wisell, 2023).

Several government commissions are now reviewing how the legal 
and administrative systems can be improved to ensure better preparedness 
for the next pandemic. The cross-sectoral interaction at the national level 
must be strengthened. Further, the roles and responsibilities of regions and 
municipalities in overlapping tasks must become clear and collaboration 
should be institutionalized. A call for strengthened intersectoral collabora-
tion is also needed (Buse et al., 2022). As pointed out by Kriegner and 
colleagues, public health interventions may be more effective if the strate-
gies chosen are deployed so that they reinforce each other, value outcomes 
beyond health, and are tailored to maximize political priority for the inter-
vention across sectors (Kriegner et  al., 2021). This approach should 
appeal to Swedish decision-makers as it fits well into the policy and legal 
framework for public health that has been described in this chapter.

Many lessons were learnt during the COVID-19 outbreak in Sweden. 
Operations must be carried out within existing structures, even in times of 
a pandemic crisis. Drastic measures must be supported by special legal 
action by the Parliament, something that may challenge the constitutional 
basis of the political and legal system. The extent to which such action can 
be taken may be restricted by cultural and constitutional traditions. The 
pandemic made it clear that the governance system at large must be 
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prepared for any unforeseen large-scale emergency before, and not during, 
the emergency and that action must be carried out within the established 
system. The current post-pandemic development in Sweden suggests that 
focus will be on such preparation, rather than on any major reforms of the 
current system, including the system for public health protection. If major 
reforms of the governance system will come, they will do so for other 
reasons than the experience from the COVID-19 pandemic.

The Swedish case illustrates the challenge of when and how to evalu-
ate public health interventions to draw stable and reliable conclusions 
from actions taken. It also serves as a case for comparing Sweden’s experi-
ence with other countries’ experiences to assess the impact of pandemic-
driven complex, large-scale disruptions of society. Such actions have been 
linked to increased inequalities in access to resources and were deemed 
to  diminish the rights to healthcare, education, and social protection 
(Tomson et al., 2021). Such impact should be considered from the start of 
an epidemic to strike an appropriate balance between measures that are 
effective in containing an epidemic and those that are potentially harmful 
to society and people. Being prepared also means investing in people 
requiring stronger and more accountable health systems as well as fair and 
effective governance that engages multiple stakeholders.

The lessons learned in this study are supportive of the recommenda-
tions given by the Director General as described earlier. The review of 
these lessons is not exhaustive and the pandemic experience should be 
further studied in Sweden. Special attention should be drawn to the emer-
gency preparedness in the regions to enhance the overall resilience of the 
Swedish health system to be better prepared for future pandemics and 
crises.
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Chapter 4

Canada

Peter Berman and Candice Ruck

4.1 � Introduction: Upstream Factors Shaping Authority 
and Decision-Making in a Public Health Crisis

Although Canada has a long, and not entirely glorious, history of govern-
ment action to control threats of imported epidemic disease (Humphries, 
2012), the impact of perceived failures to address the Sudden Acute 
Respiratory Syndrome (SARS) pandemic of 2003 awoke a renewed com-
mitment to pandemic preparedness in Canada. As a result of the post-SARS 
reforms, the Global Health Security Index (Centre for Health Security, 
2019) of 2019 ranked Canada number five globally in its readiness to 
handle a new pandemic threat. However, not uniquely among high-income 
countries (Goldschmidt, 2022), this did not prove to be an accurate predic-
tion of Canada’s real-world response to the COVID-19 pandemic.

Although Canada’s collective performance in responding to the 
COVID-19 pandemic was considered moderately successful by the stan-
dards of global comparisons, within Canada large variations were 
observed in what was done, when it was done, and how well it was done, 
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despite the guidance of national organizations that were established post-
SARS to assure a more coherent national response. A study assessing the 
consistency of the pandemic response across Canada found that, of 
24 public health interventions analyzed, only 57% were implemented by 
all provinces and territories (Cyr et al., 2021). The authors also reported 
that there was a wide range in the timing of implementation for many of 
these interventions. Further, implementation was not found to be consis-
tent with the number of positive cases, suggesting that other factors were 
also influencing decision-making (Cyr et al., 2021). Policies that deter-
mined when and how restrictions were relaxed also tended to vary consid-
erably between provinces. At the provincial level, a report by the Auditor 
General in Ontario identified a number of deficiencies in that province’s 
response, including not being guided by scientific expertise and not being 
led by public health officials (Auditor General of Ontario, 2020).

Canadian provinces differ with respect to their demographics, density, 
and the structure and funding of their public health systems, which 
explains some of the diversity in pandemic response. However, we posit 
that much of the difference observed between provinces during COVID-19  
can be more adequately explained by the influence of key upstream fac-
tors, namely Institutions, Politics, the Organization of Public Health 
Systems, and Governance (IPOG). In previous work, we have expanded 
on IPOG as a conceptual framework for analysis of the COVID-19 
response in different jurisdictions and provided some definitions of the 
terms represented by IPOG (Brubacher et al., 2022).

The Institutional context in Canada involves a federated system com-
posed of the national government and 10 provincial governments. 
Additionally, there are three territories that do not have constitutional pow-
ers in their own right but rather exercise powers delegated by Parliament, 
although authority has been gradually devolving from the federal to the 
territorial level (Government of Canada, 2022). It is particularly notewor-
thy that the federal structure in Canada protects provincial autonomy from 
a wide range of specific types of action by the national government.

This represents one important dimension of many Canadians’ percep-
tion of the “rules of the game” in terms of proper scope of action accorded 
to different levels of government. In situations where stronger collective 
action may be merited, such as when facing a rapidly moving infectious 
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disease threat with significant unknowns, as was the case in the first half 
of 2020, this has posed a challenge for the country. Provinces also differ 
substantially in terms of values widely held about individual autonomy 
and collective action and social solidarity.

Understanding the influence of the Canadian Political context should 
involve considering the ideologies and policies of the various political 
parties and their elected or competing leaders across both the provincial 
and national scenes. In particular, it must be recognized that policies and 
strategies promoted by political parties in national elections and office are 
only partially aligned with the policies and strategies of the same parties 
at the provincial level. Similarly, the roles and authorities of legislators 
differ across provinces as does the degree to which political leadership is 
realized in the administrative organs of government.

The Organizations that encompass the public health services of 
Canada are for the most part subordinate structures situated within what 
may best be characterized as a medical care system since Canada’s single-
payer Medicare structure emphasizes guaranteed access to medically 
necessary treatments. At the provincial level, public health organizations 
within the medical care system are established under provincial laws and 
regulations and differ considerably across provinces in their legal author-
ity, organization, and financing, especially in relation to deemed public 
health emergencies (Marchildon, 2008).

These variations in institutions, politics, and public health organiza-
tions intersect in the decision-making processes that shape the response  
to a public health emergency, such as the COVID-19 pandemic. 
Incorporating the role of Governance examines decision-making and 
implementation processes which are the locus of this intersection. For 
example, when assessing a particular key decision such as the decision to 
enable emergency powers in response to an emerging pandemic, it is nec-
essary to consider what exchanges took place between political and public 
health organizational actors, how these exchanges were shaped by wider 
institutional factors, and how the decisions emerging from these processes 
reflected the influence of these different factors.

To provide insights into the importance of these upstream factors, we 
examine here the Canadian response to COVID-19 from the perspective 
of how Canadian institutions, politics, organization of public health 
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systems, and governance processes contributed to specific national and 
provincial responses to COVID-19.

4.2 � Structure of the Canadian Medical Care and 
Public Health Systems

Medical care in Canada is an amalgam of federal, provincial, and regional 
responsibility. Under the publicly funded medical care system, the federal 
government provides funding and, through the Canada Health Act estab-
lished in 1984, sets out the criteria for medical care that must be available 
to all individuals (Urrutia et al., 2021), organized around the five govern-
ing criteria of (1) Public Administration, (2) Comprehensiveness, (3) 
Universality, (4) Portability, and (5) Accessibility (Health Canada, 2015). 
These criteria must be adhered to in relation to all “medically necessary 
care” in order for provinces to receive the substantial “Canada health 
transfer” — an annual financial subvention.

The Canada Health Act establishes the baseline that all provinces 
must meet. Beyond this, provinces do not follow a singular model in the 
structuring of their medical care systems so there is considerable diversity 
between provincial systems. Within the organizational structure of each 
province’s medical care system, key public health functions are embedded 
in different organizational structures with differing levels of authority, 
scope, and empowerment (see Figure 4.1).

4.2.1 � Public health changes prompted by SARS

Many aspects of the Canadian response to COVID-19 were informed and 
shaped by the outbreak of SARS in 2003, during which Canada was the 
worst affected region outside Asia. Intergovernmental collaboration 
between federal and provincial governments was identified as a major fac-
tor in the failed response to SARS, and as such efforts have been made 
toward improvement. Yet in many aspects of pandemic response, intergov-
ernmental collaboration remains voluntary, except for certain authorities 
given to the federal government, such as the management of international 
borders or the regulation of medical goods. Collaboration is facilitated by 
the Conference of Federal-Provincial-Territorial Ministers of Health, as 



	 b5349    Public Policy Challenges in Rethinking Public Health6"×9"�

	 Canada	   91

well as by a similar mirror committee of the Deputy Ministers of Health 
(Marchildon, 2008; O’Reilly, 2001).

The aftermath of SARS also saw the development of the Pan-Canadian 
Public Health Network (PHN), which was created to further facilitate 
intergovernmental coordination and cooperation across jurisdictions. The 
PHN, which includes the lead health officer (Provincial Health Officer or 
PHO) from each of the provinces/territories as well as Canada’s Chief 
Public Health Officer (CPHO), reports to the Conference of the Federal/
Provincial/Territorial Deputy Ministers of Health. In response to a public 
health emergency, the PHN may establish a Special Advisory Committee 
(SAC) for the purpose of establishing a time-limited governance structure 
to lead a pan-Canadian response to the crisis. It is worth noting that within 
their respective provinces, the PHOs may hold different authorities which 
in some cases exceed those of the deputy ministers.

4.2.2  �Public Health Agency of Canada (PHAC)

At the time that SARS emerged in 2003, Canada did not have a National 
Public Health Institute (NPHI). The Canadian response to SARS was 

Conference of F/P/T 
Ministers of Health

Pan-Canadian Public Health 
Network

Public Health 
Agency of Canada 

Department of Health 

Federal Government 

Provincial Departments of Health 

Provincial Governments 

Figure 4.1.    Public health governance in Canada.
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beset by difficulties and failures, which were summed up in the Learning 
from SARS report produced by the National Advisory Committee on 
SARS and Public Health, chaired by Dr. David Naylor, and commissioned 
by the federal government (Naylor et al., 2003). In the years that followed, 
approximately 80% of the recommendations made in that report were 
addressed (Webster, 2020), the most significant of which was the estab-
lishment of the PHAC. The operational structure and authority of PHAC 
has evolved since its inception, influenced by a range of IPOG factors. In 
turn, this has impacted how the agency has functioned in the response to 
COVID-19.

A Working Group was set up after the Naylor report was released to 
establish the structure of the future public health agency. Influenced by the 
findings of the Learning from SARS report, which envisioned that a future 
NPHI be granted considerable autonomy and be legislatively empowered 
to set priorities and steer the public health agenda, PHAC was established 
as a stand-alone agency that was partnered with, rather than subordinate 
to, Health Canada, the department of the federal government that serves as 
an umbrella agency under which numerous aspects of federal health policy 
are encompassed (Fafard & Forest, 2016). As part of the overall federal 
Health Portfolio, PHAC was to be reportable to the Minister of Health.

The Naylor report also recommended the establishment of the position 
of CPHO, a federal counterpart to the provincial-level PHOs. Such a role 
exists across numerous federations and is often designated as simultane-
ously being an advisor to the government and an independent watchdog 
for the public (MacAuley et al., 2022). However, it has been suggested that 
encompassing both of these functions within a single role is untenable 
(Fafard et al., 2018).

To imbue the CPHO role with both autonomy and authority, the report 
further recommended that the CPHO position should also be responsible 
for leading the new NPHI (Naylor et al., 2003). Thus, when the PHAC was 
established by the then-Liberal government in 2004, the CPHO was des-
ignated at the rank of a Deputy Minister, and positioned as the deputy head 
of PHAC, with the Minister of Health as the head (Marchildon, 2008).

Under the Conservative government that took over in 2006, a shift 
began to emerge in the relationship between the federal government and 
PHAC. Critics claimed that the organization was skewed too heavily 
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toward public health experts with few civil service managers, although the 
involvement of experts at the most senior levels was emphasized by the 
Working Group when the agency was established (Fafard & Forest, 2016). 
In 2010, the role of Executive Vice-President was appointed to effectively 
manage the operations side of the agency, unofficially splitting the public 
health and operational roles for the first time.

Following the retirement in 2013 of the first head of PHAC, Dr. David 
Butler-Jones, the role of CPHO was left vacant for 16 months amidst criti-
cisms that the government was increasingly attempting to assert influence 
over what was supposed to be an apolitical appointment, making it diffi-
cult to attract suitable candidates (Robertson, 2014). The ideological clash 
between politics and public health came to a head in 2014, when the gov-
ernment formally separated the roles of CPHO and PHAC head by creat-
ing the position of President to lead PHAC. Under this new structure, the 
CPHO no longer had control over the PHAC budgets or staff and the role 
became more advisory than authoritative (Grant, 2014). This move was 
met with criticism among many in the public health community, who 
expressed concern that it would hamper the autonomy and authority of the 
agency, particularly as the position of President is not required to have a 
medical or scientific background. The Health Minister at the time coun-
tered these concerns by stating that the move was meant to free the CPHO 
from the administrative burden of leading the PHAC, supported by then-
CPHO Dr. Gregory Taylor’s testimony before a Senate committee support-
ing the creation of the position of President to lead the day-to-day running 
of the agency (Fafard & Forest, 2016).

Although the declared intent of these changes was to provide a more 
balanced structure to the agency, there have since been concerns that the 
balance has shifted too far to the other end of the spectrum. In the ensuing 
years since the agency was restructured, management roles at the PHAC 
have increasingly been filled by civil servants, regardless of medical or 
scientific training, prompting the departure of many senior-level experts 
(Robertson, 2020). The effect of these changes was to weaken the influence 
of experts in the operation of the agency. Not surprisingly, PHAC has been 
criticized for not having medical or scientific experts at the highest 
decision-making levels during the response to COVID-19 (Tumilty, 2021). 
However, it is also worth noting that the Working Group that originally 
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established the structure of PHAC also explicitly rejected the notion that the 
CPHO be authorized to act autonomously during a public health emergency, 
where far-reaching actions would be required (Fafard & Forest, 2016).

4.3 � Canada’s Medical Care and Public Health Systems 
at the Outset of the Pandemic

Although the generally accepted view is that Canada’s COVID-19 
response has been moderately successful, in a country as large and diverse 
as Canada, a consolidated view obscures some of the more dire effects of 
the pandemic. Case counts and mortality varied widely between prov-
inces. In the early phases of the pandemic, the Atlantic provinces com-
pared favorably with the COVID-19 success story in New Zealand, while 
Quebec more closely resembled France (Poirier and Michelin, 2021). 
Further, the response throughout the first phase was not without blind 
spots. COVID-19 swept through long-term care (LTC) facilities seemingly 
at will, with LTC fatalities accounting for approximately 67% of COVID 
deaths in Canada up to February 15, 2021 (Betini et al., 2021).

Some of this variation was simply due to chance; the higher rates of 
infection experienced by Quebec at the start of the pandemic were attrib-
uted in part to that province having an earlier spring break than other 
provinces, and thus a higher volume of returning travelers from other 
affected areas, such as Western Europe and Iran, before border restrictions 
were implemented (Allin et  al., 2022). However, there were also larger 
institutional and organizational factors that contributed to the variances in 
interprovincial response. These include Canada’s federal structure, provin-
cial variations in public health system organization, and how these were 
situated within the overall structure of medical care delivery. A closer 
consideration of these factors is necessary to fully reveal the upstream 
determinants of the observed variation in responses and outcomes.

4.3.1 � Initial response (Spring–Summer 2020)

In accordance with the decentralized structure of the Canadian healthcare 
system, the responsibilities of the federal government in responding to 
COVID-19 were largely limited to implementing restrictions on travel and 
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control of the borders, economic measures, and vaccine procurement. The 
implementation of non-pharmaceutical interventions as well as the poli-
cies determining the distribution of the vaccines were under provincial 
jurisdiction, with the federal government serving in an advisory role via 
the PHAC as well other advisory bodies such as the National Advisory 
Committee on Immunization (NACI).

The first COVID-19 case in Canada was confirmed on January 25, 
2020. In January 2020, PHAC activated the Emergency Operations Centre 
and initiated the F/P/T Public Health Response Plan for Biological Events 
(Urrutia et al., 2021). Actions taken at the governance level to facilitate 
intergovernmental and interagency coordination, an issue identified after 
the failed response to SARS, included the creation of a federal cabinet 
committee for the purpose of facilitating a whole-of-government response 
(Urrutia et al., 2021) and activation of a SAC for COVID-19 (Piper et al., 
2022).

Beyond these measures, Canada took no substantive action at the fed-
eral level until after the WHO declared COVID-19 to be a pandemic on 
March 11, 2020. Calls for border restrictions were resisted in accordance 
with the guidance of the WHO and the IHR to which Canada is a signatory 
(Piper et  al., 2022). In Canada, as elsewhere, the imposition of travel 
restrictions was also complicated by a lack of clear scientific direction 
combined with competing economic interests. Particularly early in the 
pandemic, it remained unclear to what extent travel restrictions actually 
inhibited the spread of the virus. Despite this uncertainty, public support 
for travel restrictions was high, with only 19% supporting a total absence 
of restrictions on both international and interprovincial travel (Angus Reid 
Institute, 2020).

Following the WHO’s declaration, a succession of measures were 
introduced that were aimed at reducing international travel and restricting 
the borders as well as addressing the economic burden of the burgeoning 
pandemic (Canadian Public Health Association, 2021). These included 
banning entry to foreign nationals and imposing a mandatory 14-day iso-
lation on international arrivals (PHAC, 2020). Points of entry for interna-
tional travelers was reduced to only four airports across the country. 
Constitutional rights prevented the federal government instituting a ban 
on  Canadians traveling internationally; instead, an advisory against 
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international travel was issued (Global Affairs Canada, 2020). Travel that 
was deemed essential was exempted from these policies, and categories of 
exempted travelers grew over time. With the exceptions of the Atlantic 
provinces, the territories, and the province of Quebec, domestic travel 
between provinces remained largely unrestricted at this stage, although 
both federal and provincial governments strongly recommended that 
people avoid non-essential travel of any kind (MacGregor, 2020).

The restrictions on international travel were also weakened by a lack 
of institutional capacity to monitor quarantines (Auditor General of 
Canada, 2021). Although the federal government has jurisdiction over 
air travel, and could therefore impose restrictions on incoming passen-
gers, the provincial governments have civil jurisdiction over the land 
that the airports are on, and were thus largely responsible for the imple-
mentation of the regulations, including monitoring of quarantines. 
However, this frequently meant diverting resources that the provinces 
were devoting to other aspects of pandemic response. Further, provincial 
capacity was not equivalent across the board nor were the provinces 
equally affected from an economic standpoint by these travel restric-
tions. The federal travel measures and the manner in which they were 
enforced reveal the presence of political, economic, and institutional 
pressures on decision-making.

Concurrently with these actions, the provinces took responsibility for 
instituting a range of public health measures aimed at reducing the spread 
of the virus. These included restrictions on social gatherings, closures of 
schools and businesses, policies regarding the wearing of masks, testing, 
and case management. The provincial responses were broadly aligned due 
partly to pre-existing mechanisms for fostering intergovernmental coordi-
nation but were not entirely consistent in timing or stringency (Cassola 
et al., 2021). Although all provinces had declared a state of emergency by 
the end of March 2020, there was considerable variation across provinces 
in the stringency of policies related to measures, such as testing and social 
distancing.

Although some of this disparity can also be traced to issues of capac-
ity, as larger provinces tended to fare worse than smaller ones, the effect 
of pre-existing institutions was also a factor. British Columbia, which has 
a provincial Centre for Disease Control (BCCDC), had procedures and 
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expertise that were more established than other provinces. By utilizing 
these capabilities to take a more aggressive approach early on, British 
Columbia became the exception to the trend of larger provinces having 
worse outcomes (Migone, 2020).

The different interpretations of the role of provincial Chief Medical 
Officers of Health (CMOH), titled in some provinces as the PHO to dis-
tinguish from regional-level CMOH positions, were also on display 
through the response to COVID-19. The position of CMOH is complex 
and multifaceted, encompassing advisory, managerial, and communica-
tions roles, particularly in the context of a pandemic. Similar to their 
federal counterpart, provincial CMOHs are expected both to act as a 
politically neutral scientific advisor to the government as well as to com-
municate government policy to the public, a duality that is not without 
friction (Fafard, 2018). Further, each province is distinct in how the role is 
structured both legislatively and within the larger public health system, 
and in how much emphasis is placed on each of these functions (Cassola 
et al., 2022; Fafard, 2018).

The degree to which the response was centralized or decentralized 
also differed between provinces, reflecting the pre-existing institutional 
structures that were in place prior to the pandemic. Provinces such as 
British Columbia and Nova Scotia demonstrated a more centralized lead-
ership strategy, with the CMOH as the main decision-makers while politi-
cal leaders were engaged in less visible roles. It is worth noting that the 
provinces that employed this more centralized approach experienced 
lower rates of transmission and mortality in the early phases of the pan-
demic (Snowdon, 2021).

Initially, the emergency nature of the situation sparked considerable 
cooperation between the provincial and federal governments, all of whom 
were seemingly aligned on the potential seriousness of the burgeoning 
pandemic. This was not a foregone conclusion, as conflicts between the 
federal and provincial governments are part of the established pattern of 
intergovernmental relations in Canada and have less to do with political 
ideology than with division of authority. With some notable recent excep-
tions, successive federal governments have long adopted a strategy of not 
angering the provinces, a path that they also opted for in the early days of 
COVID-19 by, for example, not invoking the Emergencies Act.
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As COVID-19 spread, the provinces largely expressed support for the 
policy decisions of the federal government (Migone, 2020). For their part, 
the federal government upheld provincial jurisdiction over healthcare and 
did not invoke the federal Emergencies Act, which would have temporarily 
given them increased dominion over the pandemic response. It is worth 
noting that the Emergencies Act had never been used since it was first 
tabled in 1987, indicative of the extent to which the federal government has 
historically avoided inflaming tensions with the provinces (Attaran, 2020).

In response to the emerging crisis that was COVID-19, the govern-
ment briefly considered invoking the act during the early months of the 
pandemic. However, provincial leaders opposed ceding their jurisdiction 
over healthcare and argued that they could act more effectively if their 
autonomy was preserved (The Globe and Mail, 2020). The Council of the 
Federation, comprised of the provincial and territorial Premiers, informed 
the federal government that they considered it “neither necessary nor 
advisable to invoke the Act at this time” (Public Safety Canada, 2020). In 
the face of such opposition, the federal government assessed that any 
potential benefits of a more centralized response would be undermined  
by provincial resistance and the ensuing intergovernmental conflict 
(Cassola et al., 2021).

Other options for a more centralized response exist within section 91 
of the Constitution, which gives the federal government an option to pass 
legislation if the failure of one province would affect other provinces. 
However, it has not previously been established whether this power can be 
exerted without the consent of the provinces who, in rejecting the use of 
the Emergencies Act, had already tacitly rejected an increased federal 
presence (Canada, Parliament, Senate, Standing Senate Committee on 
Social Affairs, Science and Technology, 2010). Thus, both by design and 
default, the response Canadian institutions adopted to COVID-19 was 
cooperative rather than co-opted.

4.4 � Responses During Subsequent Waves of Infection: 
Fall/Winter 2020–Fall 2021

The initial measures taken to “flatten the curve” in Canada yielded results, 
and from a peak near the end of April, cases fell throughout the month of 
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May 2020 (Our World in Data, 2022). In response, provinces began to 
relax their restrictions throughout the summer of 2020. As new variants of 
concern, including the highly transmissible Delta variant, began to circu-
late widely in late 2020, new measures were introduced at both federal and 
provincial levels to curb the spread of infection and avoid overwhelming 
the healthcare systems.

The ruling Liberal party called an election in the fall of 2021, just 2 
years after being reduced from a majority to a minority government in the 
2019 election. It was widely supposed that the timing was meant to take 
advantage of the generally favorable opinion the electorate had of the 
government’s handling of the pandemic to restore the Liberals to a major-
ity. However, the timing and cost of the election proved to be widely 
unpopular and became one of the major themes of the campaign. Polls 
showed that 69% of voters felt that the election should not have been 
called (Bricker, 2021). Voters expressed their displeasure at the polls, 
returning the Liberals to power with another minority government. In 
contrast, BC had called an election in October 2020 and the NDP party 
then in power was elevated from a minority to a majority government, 
largely influenced by public approval of how the provincial government 
had handled the pandemic response to that point. The difference in these 
respective outcomes reflects not only the different contexts (at the time of 
the provincial election, BC had the best pandemic response of the six large 
provinces) but also the decline in public support and positive perception 
of the pandemic response between the autumn of 2020 and 2021.

As the pandemic continued and the virus evolved, considerable het-
erogeneity developed between jurisdictions in the implementation of vari-
ous interventions. Some of this was due to geographic and demographic 
variations, which saw the effect of the pandemic differentially distributed 
across jurisdictions. However, social, political, and institutional contexts 
also factored into the difference in responses.

Additionally, there were numerous competing interests beyond the 
scientific that necessarily influenced decision-making, including eco-
nomic effects on businesses and households, the mental health impact of 
social distancing restrictions, and the institutional and political contexts in 
which policy decisions were made. These and other factors combined to 
produce increasingly distinct responses among the provinces throughout 



	 b5349    Public Policy Challenges in Rethinking Public Health� 6"×9"

100 	  P. Berman & C. Ruck

late 2020/early 2021 (Inverardi-Ferri & Brown, 2020). Further, policy 
responses seemed to be increasingly removed from the advice of experts, 
despite repeated assertions by governments at all levels that their policies 
were driven by science (Inverardi-Ferri & Brown, 2020; Yang & Allen, 
2020; McEwan, 2020).

Communication was also key to establishing public trust and buy-in. 
The function and role of the CMOHs provide some insight into how com-
munication strategies differ across the country. As previously mentioned, 
the provinces vary in how the role of the CMHO is structured with respect 
to their advisory, management, and communication functions (Fafard 
et al., 2020). These differences were often reflected in the tone and con-
tent of the messaging relayed by the CMHO to the public. The extent to 
which the CMHO was the primary conveyor of information to the public 
was also influenced by these distinctions. In provinces such as BC, where 
the response had a more centralized structure, the CMHO was the primary 
spokesperson, with political figures taking a background role, while in 
provinces such as Alberta and Nova Scotia, the CMHO was more typically 
accompanied by an elected official (Fafard et al., 2020). These different 
approaches fed into public perceptions of transparency, autonomy, and the 
role of experts in decision-making.

As the pandemic entered its second year, public confidence was also 
undermined by numerous instances in which government figures either 
denied responsibility for surges in case numbers or avoided being ques-
tioned by the public altogether (Inverardi-Ferri & Brown, 2022; Yang & 
Allen, 2020). Together, the lack of transparency, real or perceived, as to 
how the evidence actually informed decisions (Piper et al., 2022) com-
bined with a lack of accountability, growing disparities between provincial 
policies and the frequency with which policies changed all contributed to 
increasing skepticism among the public.

4.4.1 � Federal travel restrictions

Starting in early 2021, a series of new travel measures was introduced. 
These included requirements that international travelers show a negative 
PCR test within 72 hours of traveling, as well as testing upon arrival. 
Air  travelers were additionally required to quarantine for 3 days at a 
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government-designated hotel (PHAC, 2021), a restriction that was not 
imposed on those crossing the border by land. Again, essential travelers 
were exempted from these restrictions.

Compared to previous restrictions, the implementation of these new 
measures was met with much more resistance. Some of this was driven 
by skepticism over government claims that the measures were based on 
scientific evidence. The extent to which data drove policies was not 
always transparent. The 3-day quarantine imposed on air travelers, an 
attempt to find a middle ground between tougher restrictions and the 
strict 14-day quarantine imposed by countries such as Australia, was criti-
cized for lacking scientific legitimacy and for allowing travelers a loop-
hole at land crossings. Researchers reviewing the available data found 
that there was insufficient evidence to support these policy decisions (Lee 
& Nicol, 2021). Much of the resistance was based on concerns that the 
new rules didn’t go far enough to be sufficiently effective, with the vast 
majority of Canadians supporting restrictions on international travel 
(Canseco, 2020). As debates over the new restrictions intensified, the 
political cohesion that had marked the earlier phase of the pandemic 
disintegrated.

4.4.2 � Provincial travel restrictions

The gradual erosion of social solidarity and cohesion was also visible at 
the provincial level. Up to this point, restrictions on travel between prov-
inces had varied throughout most of 2020 with most provinces opting to 
advise against non-essential travel but not going as far as enforceable 
restrictions. The exception was the four Atlantic provinces, which jointly 
formed the so-called “Atlantic Bubble.” This agreement allowed unre-
stricted travel between those four provinces but restricted the entry of resi-
dents from other Canadian provinces. The three territories also displayed 
regional unity, acting with similar timing and stringency (Cameron-Blake 
et al., 2021). Although the Atlantic and Territorial regions no doubt ben-
efitted from their relative geographic isolation, the unity of their responses 
undoubtedly contributed to their success in controlling COVID-19, with 
the Atlantic provinces recording the lowest case numbers throughout the 
first year of the pandemic (VOCM, 2020).
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Despite the potential benefits, there were questions regarding the con-
stitutionality of these restrictions under Section 6 of the Charter, which 
guarantees Canadians freedom of movement between provinces. This was 
cited by some provinces as justification for why they did not pursue simi-
lar measures. The Canadian Civil Liberties Association filed a charter 
challenge against the restrictions in Newfoundland. The Supreme Court 
there upheld the restrictions and ruled that they were allowed under 
Section 1 of the Charter, which permits justifiable exemptions to the char-
ter (Cooke, 2020).

As the Delta wave drove infection numbers and stretched healthcare 
capacities, provinces such as British Columbia that had previously relied 
on recommendations rather than restrictions finally began to restrict both 
interprovincial as well as intraprovincial travel (BC Public Safety and 
Solicitor General, 2021). Public pressure also played a role in these deci-
sions, as public support was high for both interprovincial (82%) and inter-
provincial (75%) travel restrictions by December 2020 (Canseco, 2020). 
The timing and extent of the new restrictions varied from province to 
province. Apart from the Atlantic and Territorial regions, there was little 
coordination, cooperation, or communication between provinces on limit-
ing the interprovincial movement of people (Cameron-Blake et al., 2021). 
These disparities between provinces in the type, timing, and stringency of 
travel restrictions, not to mention in the scientific evidence upon which 
they were supposedly based, fueled increasing levels of anger and frustra-
tion among the public.

4.4.3  �Vaccinations: Procurement, distribution, 
and mandates

Canadians showed strong support for COVID-19 vaccination (Statistics 
Canada, 2021), with approximately 84% of the country having received at 
least two doses of vaccine as of October 2022 (Holder, 2022). There is 
some regional variation in public enthusiasm for the vaccine, as reflected 
in differing rates of vaccination across the country. Newfoundland has the 
highest rate at >91%, while the remote territory of Nunavut has 73% fully 
vaccinated (Little, 2022).
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The vaccination campaign was not without some early difficulties. 
Vaccine procurement, licensing, and production are the responsibility of 
the federal government, and lack of vaccine production facilities within 
Canada meant that domestic production was not available. Canada ini-
tially signed procurement deals with seven manufacturers in both the US 
and Europe and had committed to agreements to procure enough doses to 
vaccinate 400% of the population (Cameron-Blake et al., 2021). Despite 
this, the initial rollout was beset by delays. Due to export bans in the US, 
the first doses from those suppliers were not shipped until mid-March 
2021. There were early criticisms that Canada was not receiving doses as 
quickly as other countries (Ling, 2021).

Delays caused by federal procurement difficulties were also exacer-
bated by the fact that there did not appear to be adequate preparedness 
plans to support mass vaccination campaigns at either federal or provin-
cial levels (Snowdon et al., 2021). Vaccine distribution and administration 
strategies were determined at the provincial/territorial level. Effectively, 
this meant that there was no central distribution policy, although the fed-
eral government provided advice through a variety of federal agencies and 
committees, including Health Canada, PHAC, the Council of Chief 
Medical Officers of Health, and the expert advisory NACI. In the early 
stages, this decentralization imposed an additional delay in administering 
doses (Marchildon, 2021). The provinces leveled heavy criticism at the 
federal government, but this was at least partly intended to deflect criti-
cism away from their own inadequacies in implementing effective distri-
bution strategies.

The vaccine distribution process has also been criticized for a lack of 
transparency (Ling, 2021). As an independent advisory committee, NACI 
is committed to transparency in their process (Ismail et  al., 2021); 
however, as NACI is only empowered to advise, the vaccination policies 
developed by each province were not always consistent with their recom-
mendations. Due to an early shortage of doses, BC opted to extend the 
interval between doses beyond that recommended by the manufacturers 
and the federal government to ensure that more first doses could be 
administered (Tauh et al., 2021). At the time, there was scant scientific 
evidence to support this capacity-driven policy, although upon further 
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review it was subsequently adopted by NACI as the recommended dosing 
strategy (NACI, 2021).

In the fall of 2021 as cases again began to rise, the provinces began to 
implement policies restricting access to specific venues based on vaccina-
tion status (Han & Breton, 2022). These policies and their implementation 
varied by province, but most instituted some form of “vaccine passport” 
(Durrani, 2021). Vaccine-related controversies began to escalate in 
response, not only among those opposed to vaccination but also among 
those confused about the inconsistency between provinces as well as the 
businesses that bore the brunt of enforcing these policies.

4.5 � Early 2022

Public unrest reached new highs in the early months of 2022, sparked by 
an announcement in late 2021, shortly after the election, that from January 
15 truckers would be required to adhere to vaccine mandates and manda-
tory quarantine when crossing the border (Reuters, 2022). As an essential 
service, trucking had previously been exempt from COVID-related border 
restrictions. This exemption, motivated by a desire to minimize disruption 
to the supply chain, was not without controversy, as essential service pro-
viders had comprised the vast majority of border crossings following 
federal restrictions on non-essential travel.

In response to the new restrictions, convoys consisting mostly of 
trucks made their way to Ottawa in late January 2022, where large protests 
were staged. Although initially peaceful, the protests devolved into an 
occupation-style movement that became highly disruptive while also 
sparking protests in cities across the country. As the protest devolved into 
disorderly and illegal conduct, protesters blocked a number of border 
crossings between Canada and the US, including the Ambassador Bridge 
in Windsor Ontario, (Reuters, 2022). On February 15, the federal govern-
ment invoked the Emergencies Act to deal with the protests, a move that 
enabled the government to impose bans on public assembly in certain 
regions of Ottawa and gave banks the power to freeze the accounts of 
individuals linked to the protests (BBC News, 2022). It is notable that 
this  was the first time during the course of the pandemic that the 
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Emergencies Act was used, having previously been rejected by the prov-
inces in the initial phase of the COVID-19 response.

From their origins as a reaction to vaccine mandates, the protests 
evolved to include all COVID-19 restrictions, despite many of these being 
under provincial, rather than federal, control. They also become a mega-
phone for anti-government sentiment and a rallying cry for the far-right, 
not only in Canada and the United States but also around the world (Scott, 
2022). Hacked records of the crowdsourcing site GiveSendGo revealed 
that nearly half of the donations to fund these protests originated in the US 
(Cardoso, 2022). The leader of the Opposition Conservative Party was 
removed as the head of his party. While this was largely the result both of 
his failure to win the recent election and his reversal of opposition to fed-
eral carbon tax and assault weapons policies, a reluctance to voice support 
for the movement was also seen to be a contributing factor. Notably, a 
member of the Conservative Party that vocally supported the protests 
became the next elected leader of the party.

The extent to which the so-called “freedom convoy” arose as a 
response to frustrations around the cross-border vaccine mandate is debat-
able. While the restrictions imposed on truckers acted as the spark, the 
anger that fueled these protests pre-dated the new restrictions and even the 
pandemic. Anger still simmered from what many perceived as an ill-timed 
and pointless election in the fall of 2021. Provinces were becoming less 
cohesive in the imposition of restrictions and poor communication com-
bined with a perceived lack of transparency, particularly regarding the 
imposition of vaccine mandates, exacerbated these disparities and drove 
confusion and frustration among the public (Fafard et  al., 2020). 
Combined with pandemic fatigue and economic hardships, this set the 
stage for increased resistance and defiance.

Anti-government sentiment, much of which pre-dated the pandemic, 
also fueled the protests (Cardoso, 2022). The convoy, which originated in 
Western Canada, also tapped into long-standing feelings of alienation 
between the western provinces and the federal government. Organizers of 
the movement had previously been involved with the yellow vest move-
ment of 2018/2019 that protested against the impact of federal carbon tax 
policies (Crawford, 2022). This sense of alienation among the western 
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provinces is also driven by longstanding feelings of disconnect resulting 
from political, institutional, economic, and cultural influence being con-
centrated in the two most populous provinces of Ontario and Quebec.

4.6 � How Could Understanding IPOG Factors Improve 
Canada’s Future Crisis Response?

Overall, our case study research and observations support the observation 
that the interactions among institutions, politics, and the organization of 
public health systems, as evidenced and expressed through decision-
making processes (our “governance”), are important explanatory 
factors  under-pinning a wide diversity of responses in Canada to the 
COVID-19 pandemic. The following are some suggestions of how greater 
attention to these “upstream” determinants could strengthen preparedness 
and response to future public health crises.

At the level of “institutions,” the evolution of the pandemic exposed 
profound differences in values and expectations for the role of the state in 
the lives of Canadians. During the first wave of the pandemic, the advice 
of health experts was given primacy reflecting a general sense of social 
solidarity in response to an urgent crisis of unknown severity. However, as 
the pandemic extended in time, there was growing dissatisfaction with the 
imposition of restrictions on individuals’ freedoms, reflecting a different 
set of institutional norms, those questioning the legitimacy of government 
interference in people’s lives, even when justified by the common good. 
This also became entwined with many Canadians’ distrust of federal 
authority. The leanings of Canadian law and governance institutions 
toward provincial autonomy justified resistance to increasing federal 
powers.

These experiences suggest that both health and other leaders need to 
consider a wider framing than just health outcomes to sustain popular sup-
port for control measures. And more generally it is challenging to sustain 
a solely health-focused emergency posture for longer periods when need-
ing to balance health threats with other social consequences.

We observed in several places and at several times the strong  
influence of political actors on the substance and timing of emergency 
response decision-making. The timing of several provincial elections and 
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the national election suggested politicians sought to take advantage of 
their perception that the public perceived their leadership positively. Some 
of these elections were associated with delays or modifications in short-
term decision-making in response to the changing pandemic which may 
have had negative health consequences.

There were significant differences across Canada’s provinces in lead-
ership roles taken by elected figures relative to those given to scientists 
and public health experts. At the federal level, the role and authorities 
observed in PHAC and various advisory councils could be seen as unduly 
weakened by authority imposed by political actors over the recommenda-
tions initially adopted to establish these agencies.

In several instances, we felt that pandemic responses could be 
improved through decision-making processes that better integrate both 
federal and provincial agencies in making decisions. The mixed experi-
ences in vaccine procurement, distribution, and roll-out across the prov-
inces were good examples of where greater integration might have 
improved trust and compliance.

Overall, this would suggest that enabling legislation for public health 
authorities should provide clearer roles and functions in such crises that 
are protected from modification during a crisis. Also, public health leaders 
may need to be better prepared for public leadership roles often filled by 
politicians, including communication skills relating to both traditional and 
new media.

The organization of public health services and systems is another 
important dimension associated with the diversity of responses in Canada. 
The structure and placement of public health services in Canada’s prov-
inces are determined by laws and regulations in each province. The main 
role of provincial health ministries is financing and provision of medical 
services. Public health functions are embedded in these systems in a vari-
ety of ways with implications for their voice in decision-making and their 
capacity to execute decisions at population and community levels. 
Federal-level organizations have specific authorities over things that affect 
provinces’ ability to act, such as procurement and regulation of vaccines 
and medicines and control over international borders. But they have lim-
ited abilities beyond advice to influence provincial actors. Overall, further 
analysis and evaluation of how difference in organizational structure and 
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function influenced decision-making and implementation is needed, with 
guidance provided to how provinces might improve their legislation and 
structures to be more effective. One might consider whether some public 
health functions might be better served by having distinct vertical organi-
zations rather than being embedded in organizations mainly charged with 
clinical services.

4.7 � Conclusion

COVID-19 exposed weaknesses within the structure of the 2020s 
Canadian public health system, as SARS did 20 years ago. Responses to 
the crisis were not dependent upon technical capacity alone but were 
influenced by institutional, political, and organizational factors which 
resulted in significant differences in decisions taken and implemented 
despite many common features of social, economic, and informational 
context. Our studies suggest that improving understanding of the role 
these factors played in the pandemic response is essential to better prepare 
for future responses to the public health crises that will certainly recur in 
the coming years and decades.
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Chapter 5

Australia

Evelyne de Leeuw, Glen Ramos, and Patrick Harris

5.1 � Introduction

The Commonwealth of Australia is a federated nation comprised of 
six  states (Tasmania, Victoria, South Australia, New South Wales, 
Queensland, and Western Australia) and two self-governing territories (the 
Northern Territory and the Australian Capital Territory, largely equivalent 
to the agglomeration of Canberra and its connected — technically inde-
pendent but not self-governing — Jervis Bay Territory which provides 
Commonwealth access to the Pacific Ocean). In addition to these “main-
land” entities, there are seven external dependent territories (Ashmore and 
Cartier Islands, Christmas Island, the Cocos (Keeling) Islands, Coral Sea 
Islands, Heard Island and McDonald Islands, Norfolk Island, and the 
Australian Antarctic Territory) (Geoscience Australia, 2023) (Figure 5.1). 
As a result of cartographic projection distortions, there is a belief that 
Australia is a relatively small island toward the bottom of our planet. It is, 
however, Earth’s sixth-largest country at 7,692,024 km2.

This is an open access book chapter published by World Scientific Publishing. It is 
distributed under the terms of the Creative Commons Attribution-NonCommercial 4.0  
(CC BY-NC) License. https://creativecommons.org/licenses/by-nc/4.0/
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Australia has three tiers of government — federal (also known as 
the Commonwealth or Australian government), state and territory, and 
local — utilizing a mixed system comprising elements of representative 
liberal democracy, constitutional monarchy, and a federation of states 
(Parliamentary Education Office, 2022) which operate under the 
Westminster system at the federal, state, and territory levels (NSW 
Public Service Commission (NPSC), 2023). The Australian Constitution 
(there is no Bill of Rights) delineates the roles and responsibilities 
between the federal and state governments. Importantly, it also outlines 

Figure 5.1.    Australia and its territories.

Note: From Lasunncty — Own work, CC BY-SA 4.0, https://commons.wikimedia.org/w/index.
php?curid=49837804.

https://commons.wikimedia.org/w/index.php?curid=49837804
https://commons.wikimedia.org/w/index.php?curid=49837804
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the separation of powers between the three branches of government 
(Legislature — makes the laws; Executive — implements the laws; and 
Judiciary — interprets and upholds the laws) (NPSC, 2023).

States also have their own constitutions which, among other things, 
allow them to incorporate and legalize local governments. Across states 
and territories, these “Local Government Areas” differ vastly in size, 
population density and other demographic parameters, and natural envi-
ronments and opportunities. The Australian Bureau of Statistics currently 
counts 566 of such “gazetted local government boundaries as defined by 
each state and territory” (Australian Bureau of Statistics, 2023).

This complexity and overlap can lead to governance and financial oddi-
ties. For Australia, specifically in health policy, the responsibility of pri-
mary care finance and regulation falls under federal authority, but primary 
care facilities are considered small business enterprises. General practitio-
ners are rarely public sector employees. Their clinical work is subsidized 
(through patient rebates) on the basis of strictly priced engagements detailed 
in the Medicare Benefits Schedule (MBS) which lists the medical services 
subsidized by the Australian Government (Department of Health and Aged 
Care (DHAC), 2023b). There is general agreement that the current levels of 
subsidy are wholly insufficient to maintain an effective primary care system 
(Faux et al., 2022; Langmaid, 2022) and that this necessarily has profound 
impacts on levels of equity and poverty in Australian society (Butler et al., 
2023). The other federal health scheme  of note is the Pharmaceutical 
Benefits Scheme (PBS) which subsidizes — or, for example, in the case of 
approved essential vaccinations, provides for free — a very large collection 
of pharmaceuticals to Australian citizens and residents (DHAC, 2023c). 
The out-of-pocket pharmaceutical costs to these groups are considered 
modest (Lofgren, 2009), although still relatively significant if one is on or 
under the poverty line or in need of much medication.

On the other hand, tertiary care public hospitals are typically a state and 
territory responsibility and budgeted at that level. In the public sector at 
state level, staff in public hospitals are paid by the state government. 
However, these public hospitals are co-funded by the federal government 
and also receive funds from private health insurance and private patients 
(Hewett, 2022). There is a broad social and political consensus that Australia 
delivers universal health coverage, but in fact, the inequities and distributive 
injustices in the current system challenge this rhetoric (Fisher et al., 2022).
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Funding mechanisms between primary, secondary, and tertiary care 
are different and disjointed. This means coordination and continuity of 
care are a perennial Australian challenge. It also allows for clinicians and 
health services to perversely exploit the state–federal and public–private 
chasms. It is quite possible to be discharged in the morning from a public 
hospital by a surgeon and then be referred to their private consulting 
rooms (sometimes even in the same building) for profit-driven follow-up 
treatment in the afternoon. Conversely, a visit to the private rooms of a 
specialist can lead to a referral to “free” publicly funded diagnostics or 
radiology (via bulk-billed Medicare subsidy). The level of care, atmo-
sphere, and quality of staffing and services may be radically different 
between the crowded public facilities and the well-appointed private ones.

To this complexity must be added the fact that — again because of its 
largely unresolved colonial past — Australia is generally classified as a 
liberal welfare state (in the classic Esping-Andersen typology), together 
with the United Kingdom and the United States. This dictates the primacy 
of entrepreneurship and market-driven healthcare delivery, although, 
nominally, Australians believe they can avail themselves of universal 
health coverage through its Medicare reimbursement system (Tikkanen 
et al., 2020).

5.2 � Trifle, Custard, and COVID-19

According to the Commonwealth Fund, Australia’s formal responsibilities 
for the delivery of health and healthcare are organized in the following 
structure:

The federal government provides funding and indirect support for inpa-
tient and outpatient care through the Medicare Benefits Scheme (MBS) and 
for outpatient prescription medicine through the PBS. The federal govern-
ment is also responsible for regulating private health insurance, pharmaceu-
ticals, and therapeutic goods; however, it has a limited role in direct service 
delivery.

States own and manage service delivery for public hospitals, ambulances, 
public dental care, community health (primary and preventive care), and 
mental health care. They contribute their own funding in addition to that 
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provided by federal government. States are also responsible for regulating 
private hospitals, the location of pharmacies, and the healthcare 
workforce.

Local governments play a role in the delivery of community health and 
preventive health programs, such as immunizations and the regulation of 
food standards (Tikkanen et al., 2020, para. 6–8).

Much can be said about Australian health inequities and their relation 
to disease care delivery. Of particular note, there is a persistent failure of 
Australian governments at every tier to “Close the Gap” in relation to the 
unfair and avoidable health chasms between the First Nations’ populations 
and other Australians (Bond and Singh, 2020; Pholi et  al., 2009). The 
track record in health promotion, disease prevention, and what is generally 
called — in a rhetorical perversity — “preventative health” is of greater 
interest. A new federal “National Preventive Health Strategy 2021–2030” 
(Department of Health (DoH), 2021) claims to present a systems-based 
approach to betterment of health, but who or what will be the delivery 
agent of, for instance, the “equity lens” on health remains unclear (is pre-
vention implementation actually about creating health or preventing dis-
ease?). Institutionally, it is hard to determine how good “preventatatative” 
(not a typo) intentions will be evidence-based, developed, implemented 
and financed, coordinated, and monitored for quality, effectiveness, effi-
ciencies, and equity.

While quarantine is the only specific public health activity the 
Australian Constitution grants exclusively to the Commonwealth over the 
states, there are a number of other areas from which many other aspects 
of public health can be (and are) administered. The Commonwealth’s pow-
ers in relation to external affairs, corporations, taxation, and financial 
arrangements can shape and wield laws and powers which directly and 
indirectly, conditional on funding, could tie the states to specific public 
health policies (Reynolds, 1995). And while historically (prior to federa-
tion) and, continuing to this present day, public health functions have been 
seen as a primary domain of the states, the ability to exercise these consti-
tutional powers together with accumulating High Court interpretations of 
these powers enables the federal government to exert broader and more 
centralized public health legislation (Baker et al., 2022).
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However, we observe the lack of central coordination (both locally, at 
state and territory level, and federally) for public health and health promo-
tion. The nation does not have a central public health agency and only very 
recently — as of May 2023 — allocated funds for the establishment of a 
center for disease control, such as the US-based Centers for Disease 
Control and Prevention (CDC), the European Centre for Disease Prevention 
and Control (ECDC), Public Health Agency of Canada (PHAC), or the 
province-based Institut National de Santé Publique du Québec (INSPQ). 
In fact, the Australian Labor Party won the 2022 federal election commit-
ting to such a national center (its title being Australian Centre for Disease 
Control), the purpose being “to improve Australia’s response and pre-
paredness for public health emergencies” (DHAC, 2023a), although the 
architecture of this new institution at the time of writing remains unclear.

What we do have, though, is an absolute smorgasbord of committees, 
departments, and regulatory bodies that at the federal level, in relation to 
COVID-19, include, for example, (not exhaustive):

•	 Commonwealth Department of Health,
•	 Health Emergency Management Branch,
•	 Office of Health Protection,
•	 Australian Health Minister’s Advisory Council (AHMAC),
•	 Numerous other Australian Government non-health Departments and 

agencies,
•	 Australian Health Protection Principal Committee (AHPPC),
•	 Communicable Diseases Network Australia (CDNA),
•	 Public Health Laboratory Network (PHLN),
•	 Australian Technical Advisory Group on Immunisation (ATAGI),
•	 National Immunisation Committee (NIC),
•	 Therapeutic Goods Administration (TGA),
•	 Advisory Committee on the Safety of Vaccines (ASCOV),
•	 National Health and Medical Research Council (NHMRC),
•	 Infection Prevention and Control Expert Group (IPCEG).

Beyond these functions, the federal government has taken on a variety 
of other public health roles and activities that include regulatory frame-
works, nuclear safety, HIV programs, cancer screening, national health 
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programs (e.g. diabetes and mental health), food standards, workplace 
safety, health and medical research funding, and aboriginal health (Baum, 
2015). This leaves the states and territories to undertake the heavy lift-
ing  of epidemiological surveillance (identification, intervention, and 
monitoring of public health issues), policy development and statutory 
responsibility for communicable diseases, environmental health, emer-
gency responses, prevention and early detection programs for cancer, 
maternal and child health, dental screening, and health promotion (Baum, 
2015). Additionally, the states regulate local government public health 
functions that include food safety monitoring, environmental hazards, 
land use planning, and community services (Baum, 2015). In this way, the 
responsibilities for public health are thereby opaquely shared among the 
three tiers of government.

The one significant organizational change in relation to public health 
governance, significantly inspired by the pandemic, was the establishment 
of the National Cabinet on 13 March 2020 replacing the former Council 
of Australian Governments (COAG). Its first priority “…was to respond 
to the urgent health and economic impacts of the COVID-19 pandemic” 
(Department of the Prime Minister and Cabinet, 2023).

The Australian public health infrastructure can thus be characterized 
as a trifle-covered-in-custard. The foundation consists of a delightful 
diversity of fruits, cakes, jellies, and condiments. The custard topping 
appears solid and allows for light pressing with a finger or spoon but 
pressing hard or sharp onto a custard surface is potentially lethal 
(Waitukaitis and Jaeger, 2012). Running on custard is possible, but stand-
ing still leads to sinking. In other words, when the elements of the public 
health system of Australia’s jurisdictions came under hard and sharp 
pressure during the pandemic, the response was panicked and haphazard  
(de Leeuw et al., 2022). The fact that during the first year of COVID-19 
the nation performed relatively well in comparison with other jurisdictions 
around the world has been deemed a triumph of the Australian people, not 
of the Australian government (Duckett, 2022).

In the remainder of this chapter, we first outline the ways in which the 
Australian governments and associated institutions may have anticipated 
a respiratory pandemic, such as the COVID-19 event. We then account for 
the existing architecture of the Australian public health system and 
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pandemic response patterns. We end with a political appraisal of the 
antipodean response thus far.

5.3 � Preparedness

Australia was not totally unprepared for a pandemic. Following historical 
precedent (McCracken and Curson, 2003), global guidance outlining the 
parameters of an appropriate response in the region of the Asia-Pacific 
(World Health Organization (WHO) Regional Office for the Western 
Pacific, 2017), consistent high scores across the International Health 
Regulations’ Capacities on managing public health risks (WHO, 2023), a 
detailed “Emergency Response Plan for Communicable Disease Incidents 
of National Significance” (Communicable Diseases Network Australia, 
2016), and scholarly warnings (Kamradt-Scott, 2018), in late 2019 the 
Commonwealth Department of Health issued an “Australian Health 
Management Plan for Pandemic Influenza” (AHMPPI) (DoH, 2019). 
Astutely and timely, literally days before the eruption of the COVID-19 
emergency, the AHMPPI observed the following:

Pandemics are unpredictable. When the next pandemic will occur, how 
rapidly it will emerge and how severe the illness will be are all unknown. 
What we do know is that even when the clinical severity of the disease is 
low, such as experienced in 2009, a pandemic can cause significant morbid-
ity and mortality. It can overwhelm our health systems and in more severe 
scenarios, cause significant disruption to our economy and to society (DoH, 
2019, p. 13).

To situate this formally adopted policy, the authors ascertained the 
following:

This plan will sit under the Emergency Response Plan for Communicable 
Disease Incidents of National Significance (CDPLAN), one of the four 
plans under the Australian National Health Emergency Response 
Arrangements. It also supports the Emergency Response Plan for 
Communicable Disease Incidents of National Significance: National 
Arrangements (National CD Plan) (DoH, 2019, p. 16).
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It then continues to outline where it fits among the federation:

The AHMPPI acknowledges that the primary responsibility for managing 
the impact of a severe outbreak of influenza, or a pandemic, lies with the 
state and territory governments and that each jurisdiction will have its own 
plans and protocols. Therefore the majority of operational detail will be 
found in these plans (DoH, 2019, p. 16).

The various elements and dimensions of AHMPPI are represented in 
Table 5.1.

Three months after this roadmap was presented, the pandemic in fact 
happened. A coronavirus jumped species, either in a market in Wuhan or 
as a gain-of-function experiment in a virological lab in the same town, and 
rapidly continued its mutation journey across the world: COVID-19 and 
its variants were born. In its wake, health bureaucrats must have quickly 
realized that even “the best laid schemes o’ Mice an’ Men, Gang aft agley” 
(Burns, 1785).

The 230-page AHMPPI specifies a series of steps and recommenda-
tions that are driven by an assessment of a manageable infectious respira-
tory disease, from mild to severe. But the interventions that have become 
part of the common global repertoire during the pandemic seem under-
emphasized in the document. Quarantine, for instance, is mentioned a few 
dozen times, but only in illustrative manners, and “lockdown” does not 
feature at all. Mass masking outside health service delivery systems 
(which have their own protocols separate from AHMPPI) is not mentioned 
at all in the policy. An assumption of calm and reason in the response to a 
threat pervades the policy but also, perhaps, a naïve sense of “governabil-
ity” of the system.

The face-masking question is an interesting one. During the Spanish 
flu pandemic of the early 20th century, it had become clear, and often 
mandated, that reducing aerosol circulation prevented the transmission of 
disease (Harris et  al., 2022). Even then there were “mask slackers” 
(Navarro, 2020). After nearly a year of doubt and debate, by 2021 it was 
clear that the primary route of COVID-19 transmission was aerosols (air-
borne) and much less fomite (surfaces) (CDC, 2021). Better ventilation, 
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Table 5.1.    Dimensions and elements of the AHMPPI.

PPrreeppaarreeddnneessss
No novel strain detected
(or emerging strain 
under initial 
investigation)

• Establish pre-agreed arrangements by developing and 
maintaining plans;

• research pandemic specific influenza management strategies;

• ensure resources are available and ready for rapid response;

• monitor the emergence of diseases with pandemic potential, and 
investigating outbreaks if they occur.

RReessppoonnssee SSttaannddbbyy
Sustained community 
person to person 
transmission overseas

• Prepare to commence enhanced arrangements;

• identify and characterize the nature of the disease 
(commenced in Preparedness); and

• communicate to raise awareness and confirm governance 
arrangements.

AAccttiioonn
Cases detected in 
Australia

Action is divided into two groups of activities:

Initial (when information about the disease is scarce)

• prepare and support health system needs;

• manage initial cases;

• identify and characterize the nature of the disease within the 
Australian context;

• provide information to support best practice health care and to 
empower the community and responders to manage their own risk 
of exposure; and

• support effective governance.

Targeted (when enough is known about the disease to tailor measures to 
specific needs.)

• support and maintain quality care;

• ensure a proportionate response;

• communicate to engage, empower and build confidence in the 
community; and

• provide a coordinated and consistent approach.

SSttaannddddoowwnn
The public health 
threat can be managed 
within normal
arrangements and 
monitoring for change 
is in place

• Support and maintain quality care;

• cease activities that are no longer needed, and transitioning 
activities to seasonal or interim arrangements;

• monitor for a second wave of the outbreak;

• monitor for the development of antiviral resistance;

• communicate to support the return from pandemic to normal 
business services; and

• evaluate systems and revise plans and procedures.

Source: Key activities in each stage of the AHMPPI. Department of Health, 2019, Australian Health 
Management Plan for Pandemic Influenza, p. 15. (https://www.health.gov.au/sites/default/files/ 
documents/2022/05/australian-health-management-plan-for-pandemic-influenza-ahmppi.pdf). 
Copyright 2019 Commonwealth of Australia.

https://www.health.gov.au/sites/default/files/documents/2022/05/australian-health-management-plan-for-pandemic-influenza-ahmppi.pdf
https://www.health.gov.au/sites/default/files/documents/2022/05/australian-health-management-plan-for-pandemic-influenza-ahmppi.pdf
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introduction of high efficiency particulate air (HEPA) filters, social dis-
tancing, and mask-wearing were the keystones of the non-pharmaceutical 
intervention package. Oddly, none of these feature as recommended front-
line tools in the AHMPPI (which ironically was designed to address transmis-
sion of a potentially airborne respiratory virus!).

The plan critically also contains a series of recommended interven-
tions labeled “Menu of Actions” to manage a respiratory pandemic. These 
are summarized in Table 5.2.

The developers and health bureaucrats that put together AHMPPI 
were also aware of the particularities of actually implementing the mea-
sures: there is a “Guide to Implementation” buried in the “Support 
Documents” (DoH, 2019, pp. 164–169). The (third) worst-case scenario is 
described as follows:

Widespread severe illness will cause concern and challenge the capacity of 
the health sector. Areas such as primary care, acute care, pharmacies, nurse 
practitioners and aged care facilities will be fully-stretched to support 
essential care requirements. Heavy prioritisation will be essential within 
hospitals in order to maintain essential services and mortuary services will 
be under pressure. The demand for specialist equipment and personnel is 
likely to challenge capacity. Staff absenteeism will compound these diffi-
culties. Pressure on health services will be more intense, rise more quickly 
and peak earlier as the transmissibility of the disease increases. Secondary 
care services, such as blood services will be challenged to maintain capaci-
ties and the community focus will be on maintaining essential services. 
Pandemic emergency legislation may be needed to support pandemic spe-
cific activities. The level of impact may be similar to the 1918 Spanish flu 
(DoH, 2019 p. 164).

What follows in the plan, as implementation suggestions, is a series of 
almost clinically determined stacked boxes. Larger social disruption, and 
its management, is not considered in spite of lessons that might (or should) 
have been learned from earlier pandemics with a Spanish flu-type impact. 
It seems that this reference to the 1918–1919 pandemic is more a rhetorical 
incantation than a real call to full-scale preparedness. As podcaster Michael 
Adams has observed, and contrary to popular wisdom, history teaches us 
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Table 5.2.    A menu of actions in pandemic response.

Measure Effectiveness assessment Apply?

Infection Control Measures

Communication strategies hand 

hygiene and cough/sneeze 

etiquette

Minor to moderate Recommended

Personal Protective Equipment in 

healthcare

Moderate Based on risk assessment

Mask wearing by symptomatic 

individuals

No evidence May be considered by 

individuals

Border Measures

Communication

Pandemic specific inflight 

announcements

Little direct evidence Recommended

Communication materials high risk Minor effect Recommended

Travel advice Minor Recommended

Information for border staff No direct evidence Strongly recommended

Identification

Entry screening — negative 

pratique

Minor Recommended only when 

asymptomatic carriage is 

unlikely. Not recom-

mended once community 

transmission is 

established

Entry screening — passenger 

locator documents

For detection of case: minor

For awareness raising: no 

evidence

Recommended only when 

asymptomatic carriage is 

unlikely. Not recom-

mended once community 

transmission is 

established.

Entry screening — thermal 

scanners

Minor Not recommended

Entry screening — border nurses Depends on the effectiveness 

of identification measures, 

which is likely to be low

Not recommended

Entry screening — passengers on 

cruise ships

Minor Not recommended (unless 

there is evidence of 

clinical severity)

Entry screening — voluntary 

isolation

Minor May be considered
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Table 5.2.    (Continued )

Measure Effectiveness assessment Apply?

Entry screening — voluntary 

quarantine

Minor Not recommended

Exit screening Minor Not recommended

Internal travel restrictions Minor to none Not recommended

Social Distancing Measures

Proactive school closure Moderate Not generally recommended

Reactive school closure Variable to minor Not recommended

Workplace closure Moderate Not generally recommended

Working from home Minor May be considered

Cancellation of mass gatherings Some evidence Not generally recommended

Voluntary isolation Minor Recommended

Voluntary quarantine Moderate Recommended in the Initial 

Action stage, and 

consider in the Targeted 

Action stage,

Contact tracing Minor Important part of initial 

enhanced surveillance 

activities

Pharmaceutical Measures Minor Antivirals for treatment of 

cases

Dependent on severity and 

timeliness of delivery

Antivirals for post-exposure 

prophylaxis for contacts

Moderate, initially, but 

generally protective 

against death.

Antivirals for post-exposure 

prophylaxis for contacts 

in at-risk groups

Minor Antivirals for post-exposure 

prophylaxis for contact 

healthcare workers

Moderate Candidate pandemic vaccine

Moderate Customized pandemic 

vaccine

Moderate Seasonal influenza vaccine

Source: Adapted from Department of Health, 2019, AHMPPI, pp. 115–162. (https://www.health.gov.
au/sites/default/f iles/documents/2022/05/australian-health-management-plan-for-pandemic- 
influenza-ahmppi.pdf). Copyright 2019 Commonwealth of Australia.

https://www.health.gov.au/sites/default/files/documents/2022/05/australian-health-management-plan-for-pandemic-influenza-ahmppi.pdf
https://www.health.gov.au/sites/default/files/documents/2022/05/australian-health-management-plan-for-pandemic-influenza-ahmppi.pdf
https://www.health.gov.au/sites/default/files/documents/2022/05/australian-health-management-plan-for-pandemic-influenza-ahmppi.pdf
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nothing (Adams, 2022). Admittedly, the vast volumes of scholarly work 
inspired by, and unleashed on, the pandemic may prove us wrong, though. 
The “paperdemic” (Yang et al., 2023) may still change complacency.

Similarly, the federal bureaucrats recognized that good communica-
tion of the plan, its management, and consequences would be pivotal to 
successful implementation and general responses of authorities at all lev-
els and of the population. Another flowchart was developed (Figure 5.2) 
outlining, in a cascading avalanche of acronyms, who was to be guided by 
what and whom at what level.

The federal government was aware, as Tables 5.1, 5.2, and Figures 5.2, 
5.3 show, of the complex governance and accountability arrangements a 
federated nation-state has to put in place for a coordinated and strong 
response. Laudably, the intent of the management plan was to have a 
Whole-of-Government approach (see also de Leeuw (2022), but a flow-
chart is much easier designed than implemented, as real-world events a 
few months later demonstrated. Also, an examination of other pandemic 
preparedness plans across the various Australian constituencies (in the 
Australian Disaster Resilience Hub (Australian Institute for Disaster 
Resilience, n.d.)) shows divergent levels of awareness and coordination 
between them. The reliance then, on the states’ operational capacity for 
public health emergency management as proposed in the AHMPPI, was 
perhaps overly optimistic, if not mislaid.

5.4 � COVID-19 Hits the Turbofan

The story of COVID-19 has been told innumerable times now — and in 
Australian lore, March 15, 2020 was the day that turbofan (and jet) pow-
ered aircraft stopped disgorging potentially COVID-19-carrying humans 
freely on the shores of the sunburnt country. Incoming travelers were to be 
subject to mandatory a 14-day quarantine, whether symptomatic or tested 
positive for COVID-19 or not.

5.4.1 � Quarantine

Quarantine stations as had been used a century earlier were closed 
(Longhurst, 2018), and their use (or use of other facilities for that 
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Figure 5.2.    Whole-of-government response: The ideal.

Source: Whole of government, health sector, health advisory, and consultative committees involved in 
decision-making for an influenza pandemic in Department of Health, 2019, AHMPPI, p. 34. (https://
www.health.gov.au/sites/default/files/documents/2022/05/australian-health-management-plan-for-
pandemic-influenza-ahmppi.pdf). Copyright 2019 Commonwealth of Australia.

https://www.health.gov.au/sites/default/files/documents/2022/05/australian-health-management-plan-for-pandemic-influenza-ahmppi.pdf
https://www.health.gov.au/sites/default/files/documents/2022/05/australian-health-management-plan-for-pandemic-influenza-ahmppi.pdf
https://www.health.gov.au/sites/default/files/documents/2022/05/australian-health-management-plan-for-pandemic-influenza-ahmppi.pdf
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purpose) was not anticipated in the preparedness plans. In fact, the plan 
specifically noted that “No quarantine premises are currently available, 
and use of hotels is problematic” (DoH, 2019, p. 140). States and territo-
ries had to improvise and were offered very little, if any, guidance from 
any authority (despite seemingly the responsibility of the federal govern-
ment, according to the Australian constitution). In an improvised strategy, 
incoming air passengers across Australia were collected at airports and 
transported to hotels and hotel-like serviced apartments (Haire et  al., 
2022) — all converted to makeshift quarantine stations. Monitoring and 
surveillance of this process, as well as compliance with quarantine proto-
col, were put in the hands of impromptu developed institutions, often a 
mix between public (police) officers and private (security) personnel. 
Training, briefing, and debriefing of these officials were assessed as of 
variable quality, leading to dramatic incidents.

For instance, lack of job security and the generally precarious nature 
of the labor market in Australia mean that increasing number of people are 

Figure 5.3.    Pandemic communication: The ideal.

Source: Pandemic Preparedness and Response Communication Channels. Department of Health, 
2019, AHMPPI, p.  65. (https://www.health.gov.au/sites/default/files/documents/2022/05/australian-
health-management-plan-for-pandemic-influenza-ahmppi.pdf). Copyright 2019 Commonwealth of 
Australia. This figure was in the original documentation (both Word and PDF versions) available for 
download. It was removed from the Word version in 2019 and the PDF version in 2023. It is uncertain 
if these channels were considered in Australia’s response to COVID-19.

https://www.health.gov.au/sites/default/files/documents/2022/05/australian-health-management-plan-for-pandemic-influenza-ahmppi.pdf
https://www.health.gov.au/sites/default/files/documents/2022/05/australian-health-management-plan-for-pandemic-influenza-ahmppi.pdf
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part of the gig economy, having to work two or more jobs to stay above 
the poverty line. For hastily recruited private security staff, this often 
meant a second job as a food deliverer (in popular demand during lock-
downs), a third job as an Uber driver, and a fourth job as handyman in an 
aged care institution. Paired with inconsistent public health guidance for 
infection control (to the extent that, reportedly, security guards in 
Melbourne quarantine hotels engaged in sexual exchanges with quaran-
tined guests), the lackluster development and operation of the quarantine 
system may have created more, rather than less, spread of the pandemic 
(Thiessen, 2020). Initially, only one place in Australia could be used for 
“proper” quarantine: a former housing estate for mining employees in the 
Northern Territory (Trewin et  al., 2022). Following the — relative —  
success of this facility and a review of hotel quarantine (Halton et  al., 
2021), the Commonwealth commissioned the building of more of such 
facilities, benignly called “Centres of National Resilience” (Department 
of Finance, 2021). The first came online at the very moment restrictions 
had been lifted and quarantine was no longer considered necessary.

The chaotic development of quarantine processes at international air-
ports was also caused by a realization that there was a conundrum of 
accountability and governance in a federated nation between national 
border control and the actual place where people and goods enter the 
country: locally. Although quarantine (and border control and defense) is 
nationally framed, local street-level bureaucrats are to implement the 
operational dimensions of the policy. Nowhere more dramatically was the 
inconsistency and impotence of governance demonstrated than at Circular 
Quay (in Sydney), NSW, with the arrival of the cruise ship the Ruby 
Princess (Ito et al., 2020). In spite of what many believed were clear pro-
tocols, over 900 COVID-19-positive passengers were freely released 
(against Public Health Orders) into the community (Walker, 2020), caus-
ing a significant spike in infections across Australia and indeed, the world. 
Contrastingly, two weeks later, the MS Artania cruise ship docked in 
Freemantle, WA, with 58 positive and suspected COVID-19 cases, the 
better management of which led to no infections spreading to the Western 
Australia community (Codreanu et al., 2021).

As COVID-19 arrived on Australian shores and international borders 
were closed, the states and territories also embarked upon border closures 
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between themselves. With their own constitutional independence, the states 
enacted a variety of public health emergency laws that included closing or 
restricting borders and access to those with permits (McCann et al., 2022). 
Non-residents traveling to other states (without exemptions, which were 
very hard to come by) were generally required to self-isolate for 14 days.

From March 19–24, 2020, Tasmania, Northern Territory, South 
Australia, Western Australia, and Queensland announced a variety of bor-
der closures. The Queensland/New South Wales border had last closed to 
contain the Spanish flu over 100 years ago (Palaszczuk, 2020). Queensland 
Premier Palaszczuk was quite adamant at the time, stating, “Let me make 
it very clear, Queenslanders should stay in Queensland, people in New 
South Wales should stay in New South Wales and people in Victoria 
should stay in Victoria” (Ludlow, 2020). Western Australia remained 
closed for 697 days and was the last to reopen, with its premier claiming 
them to be “… an island within an island” (Hondros, 2020). It was a rapid, 
haphazard, and far from cohesive approach that the states undertook in a 
fervor of political and state parochialism in an effort to be seen to be act-
ing in some meaningful and measurable manner on the pandemic.

Among the obvious challenges that these border restrictions placed on 
commerce, travel, social, financial, emotional, and medical needs, some 
communities were harder hit. A number of heated flashpoints erupted, par-
ticularly in border towns which, in some instances, were literally split down 
the middle, isolating families and preventing access to employment or 
schooling. Tweed Heads–Coolangatta, on the New South Wales/Queensland 
border, became a regular lightning rod for those protesting anything 
COVID-19 related, from border closures to vaccine mandates. Additionally, 
a number of states concurrently applied further internal border closures 
along local government areas during lockdown periods, with NSW conten-
tiously restricting the access and movement of people living in (already 
socio-economically disadvantaged) western Sydney and not those in the 
(predominantly very affluent) east and northern suburbs to the same degree.

5.4.2 � Public health expertise and legitimacy

Cool-headed biosecurity experts have repeatedly scratched their heads as 
to why nearly two centuries of accumulated public health evidence on 
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infectious disease control could not be mobilized into policy interven-
tions. Our earlier description of the Australian pandemic preparedness 
shows part of the cause underlying this concern. The public health com-
munity is often too beholden to a “clinical gaze” which dictates a focus on 
particular pathogens, clinical characteristics of disease, and a preference 
for quantifications of aetiologies. In Table 5.2, “evidence” almost exclu-
sively is biomedical, not social science evidence. Biostatistical and epide-
miological data, while absolutely critical and necessary to pandemic 
management, appear to drive the policy framework. Societal context, local 
conditions, mass behavioral sentiment, social practices, emotion, and live-
lihoods are absent from the gauging of evidence and feasibility of 
interventions.

This was no better reinforced than through the daily media briefings 
provided by the various state premiers, health ministers, and chief medical 
office (CMO) or chief health officers (CHO) where barrages of numbers 
and statistics (on cases, deaths, and hospitalizations) were provided in the 
attempt to demonstrate understanding and the appearance of management 
and, to a certain extent, control of the pandemic. In the existing public 
health structures, it is certainly much easier to capture this epidemiologi-
cal data than to measure emotional, psychological, and social well-being 
of those impacted by the policies. The catch-all phrase wheeled out at 
every opportunity by politicians and bureaucrats to demonstrate authority 
was “we’re following the medical advice.” A major point of public conten-
tion that arose, however, was that, given the same medical advice, why 
were there such varying degrees of differences between policies on border 
restrictions and non-pharmaceutical interventions (NPIs).

And yet, this is precisely the anticipated role of public health leader-
ship, in both senses: the public’s health and public sector health leadership. 
There is no one organizational or statutory definition of this role: in 
Australia, the legalities of public health leadership vary significantly 
across states, territories, the Commonwealth, and in some case, localities. 
The Queensland CMO has the legal potential to declare draconian social 
and policy measures and in effect, shut down the state. In Victoria, how-
ever, the CHO is a senior leader within the Department of Health but 
otherwise merely an advisor of the Premier and political executive. The 
CMO at the federal level has arguably the least formal power of all — their 
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influence mainly came through chairing the national committee of state 
and territory CMOs and CHOs.

These CMOs and CHOs are all under significant pressure, between 
the rock of evidence and the hard place of politics neither the Scylla of 
fact nor the Charybdis of belief are coherent and predictable. In spite of 
the best intentions of the preparedness plan, the scientific advice support-
ing actions to address COVID-19 was uncontained, chaotic, incoherent, 
and unpredictable. The neoliberal lack of a national institute coordinating 
(or dominating?) the public health response created opportunities for the 
emergence of new centers of trust and excellence, competition for confi-
dence of politics and population, and ammunition for conspiracists (Bruns 
et  al., 2020). Interestingly, for many Australians, the most trustworthy 
assessment of the COVID-19 state of play did not come from public 
authorities but from physician-journalist Norman Swan’s “Coronacast” 
(Nee & Santana, 2022).

Admittedly, the CMOs and CHOs did not necessarily wield their 
authoritative power as well as they might have. Research into the role of 
the CMOs during the early COVID-19 period has revealed as much. The 
reality of the CHO/CMO role is one that juggles an evidence-based author-
itative persona with behind-the-scenes political acumen to influence politi-
cal masters (MacAuley et al., 2022). That juggling has been well described 
in the political science literature (Cairney et  al., 2016). Evidence, that 
body of work explains, is but one of a great number of issues to battle out 
(or wield) in the political arena. The battle is most important, not the evi-
dence. For instance, the right-leaning, neoliberal coalition in power at the 
federal level as the pandemic arrived had very little interest in public 
health measures that would negatively impact the economy. The CHOs, 
therefore, designed an elaborate strategy to force the hand of the federal 
health minister and — as it turns out, very much under the power of the 
Prime Minister — to accept these measures, including lockdowns.

CHOs at the same time became beholden to the difficult realities of 
what previous UK Prime Minister Harold McMillan famously explained 
as “Events” outside their control. Quarantine, for instance, was histori-
cally the preserve of federal legislation. During COVID-19 however, 
quarantine decisions were directed to the states. Governance of quarantine 
was not generally under the power or experience of the CHOs and 
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routinely became the source of infections (Davey, 2020). This risk mani-
fested across the country. Following success in suppressing infections 
through strict public health orders across 2020 and 2021, a third wave of 
COVID-19 hit the population because of a single infected driver taking 
passengers from the airport into quarantine (Franks, 2021). That single 
infection necessitated another round of measures, stretching the patience 
of the public and political support for continued interventions.

In a retrospective analysis, three CHOs addressed the 2022 Australian 
Population Conference. Rather than facilitate a generation of “political 
nous” (Harris et al., 2021) however, the presenting CHOs surprised the 
public health community not with deep insight into the social and political 
dimensions of the course of the pandemic but rather with colloquial obser-
vations that Asia has a different tradition in the use of face masks, of 
which Australians might well learn something (Dow, 2022).

5.4.3 � Vaccines

As outlined in the introduction, Australia is a large country; and yet, it is 
situated on the periphery of the more populated continents. With our 
neighbor antipodeans “across the ditch” (in Aotearoa/New Zealand), this 
may have initially presented the insular opportunity to close international 
borders and contain the pandemic. But this peripheral spatial position also 
means a distance to centers of power in terms of geopolitics and commer-
cial wherewithal. With a relatively small population and a “backyard” of 
sparsely populated Pacific Islands, Australia is not necessarily in an 
advantageous position for high-end manufacturing. For instance, the auto-
mobile industry has withdrawn from the nation (Beer, 2018), despite the 
fact that a successful innovative mobility sector (in electro-voltaic or 
hydrogen futures) has been supported by past governments.

A similar pattern can be observed for pharmaceuticals’ development 
and innovation. Australia is not the home of any major global pharma 
player, with the possible exception of CSL (formerly known as 
Commonwealth Serum Laboratory, privatized in 1994). The country does 
not have a sovereign pharmaceutical production capability and relies on 
imports from Europe and North America and, increasingly, India. In spite 
of rhetoric to the contrary, Australia does not “punch above its weight” 
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(de Leeuw et al., 2022). In the corridors of power in Canberra, someone 
must have been aware of this reality — and when Pfizer and AstraZeneca 
announced they might have a viable vaccine, the country started ordering 
doses excessively. In total, the federal government ordered 280.8 million 
vaccine doses, but because of a lack of effective international geopolitical 
engagement missed out on the timely delivery of many of these. In what 
appeared a coming tsunami of vaccines, Australia in fact experienced short-
ages, compromised supply lines, and failures in distribution and prioritization 
(for instance, into aged care facilities and First Nations communities). On 
top of this, the more than a quarter billion doses did not benefit the UN-led 
and global solidarity-inspired COVID-19 Vaccines Global Access (COVAX) 
mechanism as well as they might or should have (Gleeson et al., 2022).

Criticism of the bungling of vaccine ordering and early distribution 
shortages was dismissed by the Prime Minister in his now (in)famous 
comment — “It’s not a race” — about the speed of the vaccine rollout 
(dubbed by many a “stroll out”) (Taylor, 2022). The lackadaisical speed 
left much to be desired, and a number of states expedited the process 
through the establishment of their own pop-up clinics and vaccination hubs 
(Cormack et al., 2021). In fact, the vaccine delivery schedule was falling 
behind so much that the Australian Defence Force was called in to assist in 
its delivery (Reuters, 2021). In the best of Australian traditions, an inquiry 
was announced, led by Jane Halton (the consultant who, at one point in her 
career, was responsible for the very vaccine procurement policy she now 
assessed) (Halton, 2022). Its recommendations were as follows:

Recommendation 1: Public health campaigns designed to encourage 
sustained booster uptake for those that will benefit should be developed 
and delivered during 2023 and 2024 to improve coverage.

Recommendation 2: A clear, updated, policy framework including objec-
tives for the management of COVID-19 should be developed to inform 
decision-making, purchasing, clinical decision-making, and resource 
allocation. A statement of risk appetite should form a part of this 
framework.

Recommendation 3: Advisory structures should be streamlined, and 
advice should be integrated to enable decision-makers to undertake their 
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role. The role of decision-makers and advisors should be clarified. 
Reasons for decisions should be evidenced including indicating where 
they are based on judgment. Care should be taken to prevent confusion at 
the clinical level about who is eligible to receive vaccines/treatments and 
recommendations for use including in respect of target populations.

Recommendation 4: Procurement decisions should be made in the con-
text of agreed policy objectives, risk appetite (the acceptability of failure 
to supply), knowledge/predictions in respect of the evolution of the virus, 
and supply constraints, including knowledge of market behavior.

Recommendation 5: Vaccine distribution arrangements should be 
reviewed in order to test value for money and reduce wastage while ensur-
ing timely access.

Recommendation 6: New mechanisms to manage stock held by the NMS 
for use in an ongoing pandemic or epidemic should be developed as a mat-
ter of urgency to enable greater transparency about and access to stock held.

Recommendation 7: The Department of Health and Aged Care should 
work with sponsors to ensure that adequate supplies of therapeutics are 
available to meet reasonably anticipated demand for the next 2 years. 
Mechanisms such as guarantees for minimum supply should be explored 
to ensure availability and access.

Recommendation 8: Steps should be taken, consistent with an agreed 
policy and risk appetite, to ensure adequate supplies of vaccines and treat-
ments are available across 2023 and 2024 including in the event of spikes 
in demand. This should include additional Moderna vaccines in 2023 and, 
as a minimum and based on an assessment of “COVID-19 stability,” doses 
necessary to meet baseline demand in 2024.

Apart from number 6, these recommendations appear to be basic and 
fundamental. That they had to be spelt out in a review of this nature dem-
onstrates the poor foresight, lack of planning, and policy impotence which 
was in place at the beginning and during the pandemic in relation to 
vaccines.
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5.5 � Conclusion

Like the surface of the custard-covered trifle, international observers 
would have had the impression that Australia’s management of the 
COVID-19 pandemic was equally smooth and stable. Yet, underneath this 
surface façade, and in the face of innumerable pandemic management 
plans, was a wholesale debacle of panic, confusion, and politicking.

It is difficult to determine what meaningful lessons have been learnt 
from the Australian experience. There have certainly been innumerable 
failures and consequently a lot to learn. Have the recommendations of the 
vaccine review been implemented? Will the National Cabinet continue to 
take a lead role in a future pandemic or will the soon-to-be-established 
Australian Centre for Disease Control (ACDC) take ownership (perhaps 
unlikely, given early announcements that it will initially be situated within 
the federal Department of Health)? Have the social aspects of public 
health been considered in future planning and management?

The challenge perhaps for Australia is in incorporating into future 
pandemic preparedness and management the lessons of the various fail-
ures that took place. In doing so, being able to navigate the neoliberal 
institutions and loud anti-science voices and broadening beyond the purely 
clinical and data-driven approaches will be challenging. These two aspects 
are essentially embedded within the fragmented public health structures.

When provided with the resources, the Australian community demon-
strated a capacity and solidarity of action that served to overcome the short-
falls of the government’s planning (or lack thereof). It was the “public” in 
public health that actually carried the COVID-19 pandemic response.
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Chapter 6

France

Thibaud Deruelle

6.1 � Introduction

France was severely affected by the COVID-19 pandemic, with 36 mil-
lion recorded cases and more than 160,000 deaths between 2020 and 
2022 (Santé Publique France Website, 2022). When the pandemic first hit 
the European continent, in January 2020, the French executive scrambled 
to come to terms with the scope of the crisis (Wheaton, 2020), as did 
many of its neighbors (Clemens & Brand, 2020; Pacces & Weimer, 2020; 
Renda & Castro, 2020). Data were scarce, and the virus unknown. The 
French government, as well as other European decision-makers and 
experts, was inclined to a normalcy bias, the heuristic that leads people 
to minimize threat warnings. This bias would only entirely dissipate once 
Italian authorities started to enforce localized lockdowns, at the end of 
February 2020 (European Centre for Disease Prevention and Control 
(ECDC), 2020). It took the months of January and February 2020 for the 
French government to seize the breadth of the crisis to come and for pub-
lic health experts to successfully play their role of fire alarm (McCubbins 
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& Schwartz, 1984). From then on, France confronted a series of chal-
lenges: lack of personal protective equipment, hospital capacity, crisis 
management challenges (including the French executive approach to 
evidence-based policy), and ultimately growing public mistrust. These 
difficulties were alarming as, 20 years prior, the French healthcare sys-
tem had been hailed by the World Health Organization (WHO) as the best 
in the world in terms of quality and provision (WHO, 2000).

The responsibility lies in the hands of the French executive. Because 
it operates within a centralized political system, as shown in Figure 6.1, 
the French executive has control over all levers available in managing the 
health crisis (Freeman, 2000). The French public health system is charac-
terized by centralized structures of policymaking (Hornung, 2022a). At 
the level of the Ministry of Health, this includes the General Directorate 
of Health (French acronym, DGS) and the General Directorate of Health 
Care Services (French acronym, DGOS) which are responsible for ensur-
ing monitoring, forecasting, regulation, and health security missions 
(Tabuteau, 2016). Experts are particularly institutionalized in the French 
public health arena (Rozenblum, 2021b), with three scientific agencies:  
the High Authority for Health (French acronym, HAS) for medicines, the 
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Figure 6.1.    Public health governance in France.
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High Council for Public Health (French acronym, HCSP) for environmen-
tal hazard, and the Public Health France (Santé Publique France, SPF) for 
communicable diseases and which can all inform decision-making and 
crisis management. This governance system was nevertheless completely 
subverted amid the crisis.

The COVID-19 pandemic has created premium conditions in France to 
learn from the crisis (Deverell, 2009; Lee et al., 2020; Stern, 1997; Vagionaki 
& Trein, 2019). But, despite a context that should be propitious to reforming 
health, the scope of reforms is limited. Two reforms were initiated in 2020: 
new investments in healthcare and a revamped strategy for preparedness, 
based on increased coordination with its neighbors, but, beyond fast-paced 
reforms amid crisis, there is no defined strategy to further reform public 
health and healthcare. Moreover, despite the temporary reconfiguration of 
crisis management institutions amid crisis, there is an apparent lack of self-
reflection on the matter, with no institutional reform on the agenda.

This chapter discusses the limited successes as well as the hindrances 
to reforming the French health system in the (post-)COVID era. It analy-
ses reforms kicked off by the French government since the beginning of 
the pandemic as well as the context of public health and healthcare pre-
COVID-19. Strategic choices made in the 2010s and reforms made in the 
early days of the crisis shed an illuminating light on the lack of enthusiasm 
for engaging in in-depth reforms. Section 6.2 paints the context of public 
health reforms in France prior to COVID-19 through two key points: the 
recent reform of public hospitals and strategic choices made in terms of 
preparedness. Section 6.3 discusses fast-paced reforms kicked off in 2020 
regarding the financing of healthcare and procurement of medical devices. 
Section 6.4 shifts the focus to the reconfiguration of the crisis manage-
ment system and its effect on trust and evidence-based policymaking.

6.2 � The Challenges of a Depleted Health System

From the early days of the pandemic, fundamental criticisms were made 
regarding the French government’s lack of readiness for the crisis, espe-
cially with regard to protective personal equipment (PPE) and testing sup-
plies as well as insufficient intensive care beds (Hassenteufel, 2020; Davet 
& Lhomme, 2020). The lack of capacity of the French response system, 
both in terms of preparedness and the provision of healthcare, was the 
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result of health policies which had focused on cutting costs. But this  
late “New Public Management” turn occurs through different processes 
depending on whether we examine public health or healthcare. Regarding 
the lack of hospital beds, it can be traced back to the 2009 territorial 
reform of healthcare. Turning to preparedness, there are complex learning 
processes at play in which lessons learned from the 2009 H1N1 pandemic 
have — ironically — led to a depletion of PPE and testing supply.

6.2.1 � Healthcare access and the territorial reforms of 
healthcare pre-COVID-19

Between 2000 and 2020, the number of hospital beds had decreased by 
25%, with some regions showing a staggering 50% decrease (Ministère 
des solidarités et de la santé, 2022). On the eve of the COVID-19 pan-
demic, the number of intensive care beds was only 1 per 100,000 inhabit-
ants. For comparison, on the same date, there were 35 per 100,000 in 
Germany (Naumann et al., 2020).

When COVID-19 hit, Regional Health Agencies (French acronym, 
ARS) became easy scapegoats, especially for local civil servants having 
to deal with citizens’ frustration regarding the lack of healthcare access. 
The ARS, created in 2009, carry out prevention and health planning 
missions at the regional level. They played a critical role during the 
COVID-19 crisis (Rozenblum, 2021b). In effect, ARS were in charge of 
reorganizing beds, canceling non-emergency medical interventions, sup-
plying health personnel with PPE (by controlling the purchase of masks 
by local authorities), and organizing patient transportation (Hassenteufel, 
2020). Local and regional authorities have no competences in health, 
therefore ARSs reported directly to the national health ministry.

The territorial reform that created ARS aimed at increasing access to 
healthcare and reducing disparities between French regions (see the 2009 
law (LOI N° 2009-879) “On hospital reform, regarding patients, health and 
territories,” also called “Hospital, patients, health, territories”). Territorial 
reforms are an important leitmotiv of French public policymaking. They 
usually aim to reduce inequalities between different portions of the French 
territory. Despite a long tradition of French centralization, the governance 
of healthcare provision was historically characterized by localist and 
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centrifugal dynamics (Pasquier, 2016; Reiter & Kuhlmann, 2016). The 
2009 reform tied hospital directors to regional agencies, which prima facie 
would mean a reinforcement of the regional governance level. But, in 
effect, the creation of ARS amounted to a process of centralization. The 
regional agencies were given little room to maneuver and were mandated 
to implement policy goals defined at national level in the DGOS (Hornung, 
2022b). Budget-wise, the reform tied ARS to the Interministerial 
Committee for the Performance and Modernization of Hospital Care 
(Pierru, 2020) meant to create a leaner and less expensive management of 
healthcare, at the implementation level, i.e. across the French territory 
(Duchesne, 2018). Overall, the 2009 territorial reform, despite creating 
regional agencies, was actually an effort in centralizing the governance of 
healthcare, by reducing the discretion of ARS whether at policy or budget-
ary level, as illustrated in Figure 6.2.
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Figure 6.2.    Centralization of hospital care in France prior to the COVID-19 pandemic.
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Once ARS were up and running, budgetary constraints as well as 
centralized objectives defined by Paris had a profound effect on access 
to healthcare. A big emphasis was put on hospitalization from home as 
well as the medicalization of retirement homes (acronym in French, 
EPHAD). ARS were particularly focused on profit margins to evaluate 
hospitals. This led to the drastic drop in number of hospital beds pre-
sented earlier. If the responsibility ultimately lies with the central state, 
it is worth noting that ARS are administrations that were always dedi-
cated to imprint a New Public Management approach to healthcare man-
agement. Overall, while the territorial reform led to institutional change, 
it was mostly the vehicle of a budgetary-centered approach to healthcare 
which had a detrimental effect on access to life-saving care at the begin-
ning of the pandemic. Ultimately, it inflicted an unmanageable burden 
on hospital services and patients. Budgetary constraints are thus a key 
element to understand the depletion of access to intensive care. Such 
constraints also play a role in the depletion of strategic stocks for 
preparedness.

6.2.2 � Lessons in preparedness from the 2009 H1N1 crisis

In terms of preparedness, and across the European continent, lessons 
learned from the 2009 H1N1 pandemic were forgotten too soon, as the 
Director of the European Centre for Disease Prevention and Control 
Andrea Ammon mentioned in a podcast interview: “we have always had 
done lessons learned after the 2009 influenza pandemic, after Ebola. We 
have done really thorough ‘Lessons Learned’ exercises, but we haven’t 
learned the lessons” (Gottlieb, 2021). Indeed, on the eve of the crisis, the 
French strategic stock of PPE and test kits was particularly low among EU 
member states (Bayer, 2020; Guarascio, 2020; Michalopoulos, 2020).

In contrast, prior to the 2009 H1N1 pandemic, the French executive 
was invested in enhancing preparedness. In 2007, France had adopted a 
protection mechanism for large-scale pandemics in the implementation of 
the law on the preparation of the health system for large-scale health 
threats (“loi relative à la préparation du système de santé à des menaces 
sanitaires de grande ampleur”) and had created the office for the 
preparation and response to health emergencies (French acronym, 
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EPRUS), during the 2005 H5N1 influenza epidemic (Rozenblum, 2021b). 
Between 2005 and 2006, EPRUS created a strategic stock of 616 million 
masks.

The stock of masks did not end up being necessary to face the 2009 
H1N1 pandemic. The H1N1 flu had a more moderate effect on mortality 
than initially feared (Nicoll & McKee, 2010) and the response of the 
French executive to the 2009 H1N1 pandemic appeared excessive at 
the  time (Davet & Lhomme, 2020). Indeed, the then-Health Minister 
Roselyne Bachelot had promoted the generalized vaccination of the 
population and €195 million for masks, although H1N1 flu directly 
caused only 342 deaths. Ultimately, this explains why, after a few years, 
and in stark contrast with the lead-up to the H1N1 influenza outbreak, 
“lesson-learning” gave way to a form of relaxation vis-à-vis preparedness. 
Crucially, the budget of EPRUS was divided by 10 between 2007 and 
2015 (Hassenteufel, 2020) and only an additional 98 million masks were 
purchased between 2015 and 2016. Public health literature underlines the 
emergence of the financial and budgetary crisis in Europe a few months 
after the outbreak as a determinant in understanding the shift in priorities 
(Brusaferro & Tricarico, 2017; Crosier et al., 2015; Droogers et al., 2019; 
Ekdahl, 2016).

However, a more important turn occurred in 2016 with the election of 
Emmanuel Macron as the President of the French Republic. At that date, 
there were 714 million masks in the strategic stock, however, in March 
2020, only 117 million of them were left. Between 2016 and 2020 strate-
gic decisions led to stock depletion (Davet & Lhomme, 2020). Here again, 
as in the case of ARS, there is an institutional reform leading to the cre-
ation of Public Health France (acronym in French, SPF) with the 2016 
fusion of the National Institute for Public Health Surveillance, the 
National Institute for Health Prevention and Education, and EPRUS. The 
new organization, SPF, had a limited budget and was unable to fulfill its 
mission inherited from EPRUS to maintain a strategic stock of masks 
(Assembléee Nationale, 2020) without an intervention of the Ministry of 
Health to provide for extra financial resources.

The question of strategic stocks was, most likely, disregarded by the 
Ministry of Health, and specifically the DGS. Not only was there no 
new  purchase from 2016 onward, but aging stocks were discarded 
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(Rozenblum, 2021b). Most of the 616 million masks purchased in  
2005–2006 were destroyed between 2016 and 2020. When COVID-19 hit, 
only 117 million masks remained. Attributing blame remains difficult to 
this day. A recent Senate inquiry points out that the SPF was in charge of 
the masks and their destruction (Assembléee Nationale, 2020; Milon, 
2020) and should have done more to alert on stock depletion. However, at 
the ministry level, an oversight could hardly be possible: masks were 
destroyed because they were deemed to have expired after an audit 
requested by the DGS.

Ultimately, the question of depleted strategic stocks appears to be the 
result of budget rationalizing. Low on the list of priorities, strategic stocks 
easily became depleted. This situation, coupled with the lack of bed avail-
ability, shook the French healthcare system.

6.3 � Fast-paced Reforms’ Intracrisis

When the COVID-19 pandemic hit, France was ill-prepared. The first year 
of the pandemic in France was thus characterized by important insuffi-
ciencies which led to two fast-paced reforms. First, the lack of intensive 
care beds led to a financial reform of the healthcare system. Second, on 
the problem of strategic stocks, after a strategy of avoidance, the French 
government turned to coordinated solutions with its European partners, 
thus reforming its own approach to procurement.

6.3.1 � Financial reform of healthcare

The first wave of COVID-19 infections inflicted an important stress on 
the French hospital system. At its peak, more than 3,500 new patients 
would be admitted every day (Santé publique France Website, 2022). 
With the enormous risk that the hospital system could be overwhelmed, 
French patients were flown to Germany to avoid a saturation of hospital 
beds (Tidey, 2020). In the summer 2020, as the first wave ended, the 
Ministry held consultations known as Ségur de la Santé1 with the goal of 

1 The origin of the name “Ségur” is the address of the Ministry of Health, Avenue de Ségur 
in Paris. This custom in naming large consultations takes its origin in another consultation, 
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reforming the financing of healthcare institutions. The consultation con-
vened medical professional organizations which focused the attention on 
careers and remuneration. The consultation also included territory-
specific feedback (Stromboni, 2022). The conclusions of the consultation 
were presented by the Ministry of Health on July 20, 2020, with the 
announcement that €19 billion will be spent over the next 5 years to 
improve the working conditions of doctors and nurses in French public 
hospitals and nursing homes.

This includes the financing of 4,000 beds “on demand” with an enve-
lope of €50 million from winter 2020 to 2021 as well as €6 billion invest-
ments in medicalized homes for the elderly (acronym in French, EHPAD), 
one of the most affected population categories. Beyond the urgent access 
to intensive healthcare and hospital beds, a crucial question was salary 
increases for hospital personnel. Unions and the executive ultimately 
agreed on a base increase of €180 net per month for all non-doctor hospi-
tal staff in the public and private non-profit sectors (nurses, orderlies, 
technicians, stretcher-bearers, etc.). The agreement also provided for an 
increase of €160 for private sector personnel. Finally, unions of hospital 
practitioners (i.e. medical doctors) signed an agreement which provided 
for an envelope of €450 million to be distributed. Self-employed physi-
cians who experienced a significant loss of income because of reduced 
activity during the lockdown also received financial aid (Gandre & Or, 
2020).

But beyond a budgetary bump, stakeholders argued that the reform 
did not address the core issues (Stromboni, 2022), such as understaffed 
hospitals, that were causing poor working conditions for healthcare work-
ers and patients. In the same vein, the issue of access to healthcare — to 
which the 2009 territorial reform was supposed to be the answer — was 
specifically addressed here by developing teleconsultations, rather than 
increasing a direct access to healthcare facilities through infrastructure 
development.

Finally, as described in Figure 6.3, stakeholders unsuccessfully advo-
cated for “decentralizing” the French healthcare system, as ARS still 

the 1968 “Grenelle” consultation organized by the Ministry of Labour situated Rue de 
Grenelle.
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implement centralized policy goals (Greer et  al., 2022). However, the 
reform created a National Investment Council for Health, made up 
of  stakeholders and without the Ministry of Finance, replacing the 
Interministerial Committee for the Performance and Modernization of 
Hospital, which seemed to indicate that the focus had shifted away from 
budget rationalizing. Therefore, it will be necessary to reassess in the 
future if ARS are still the vehicle for a New Management approach to 
healthcare.

6.3.2 � Coping with insufficient preparedness: Between 
avoidance and reforms

The use of masks was widely accepted as an efficient measure to reduce 
viral transmission of the COVID-19 virus, among other respiratory patho-
gens (Asscher, 2020). In the early weeks of the pandemic in France, this 
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Figure 6.3.    Centralization of hospital care in France post Ségur.
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was nevertheless subject to debate. There was initially no mask mandate, 
and on April 9, 2020, the spokesperson for the French government even 
declared masks to be unhelpful in reducing infections (Fauvelle, 2020). 
This was in stark contrast with reports from the experience of Asian coun-
tries at the time which provided evidence of the benefits of implementing 
mask mandates. This communication was perceived as a clear strategy of 
avoidance to be held accountable regarding the depleted stock of PPE, 
especially because the executive’s communication strategy changed 
as  masks became increasingly more available (Hassenteufel, 2020). 
Ultimately, along with social distancing, masks became the heart of the 
prevention strategy. From May 2020 onward, i.e. at the end of first the 
lockdown, masks became mandatory in closed public places (workplaces, 
schools and universities, shops, etc.). This was followed on July 20, 2020 
by a mask mandate for open public places, in a move that could be 
described as an overcompensation of the initial approach of the French 
government.

In the same vein, access to test kits was scarce, causing a consequent 
underdetection of cases (Pullano et al., 2021). In a similar fashion to the 
mask issue, systematized territorialized screening was only implemented 
at the end of summer 2020 (Albouy-Llaty et al., 2021). This testing strat-
egy was nevertheless particularly criticized (Hassenteufel, 2020): labora-
tories were saturated, and results were delayed. Moreover, most of the tests 
were done at the hospital, adding to the pressure hospitals were experienc-
ing at the time with intensive care. This partially explains why the triptych 
“testing, tracing and isolation” was never properly implemented in France 
(Greer et al., 2022).

Since then, two parliamentary inquiry commissions (in the National 
Assembly and in the Senate, respectively) have pointed out the responsi-
bility of the executive for the lack of preparedness, specifically the lack of 
strategic stocks of masks (Assembléee Nationale, 2020; Milon, 2020), as 
well as test kits. And blame attribution is not over: former Prime Minister 
Edouard Philippe was heard by Court of Justice of the Republic on 
charges of “manslaughter” and of “endangering the lives of others” on 
October 10, 2022 (Paun, 2020), and future rulings will be crucial in attrib-
uting blame. Unsurprisingly, the public health and health policy literature 
as well as news media (Davet & Lhomme, 2020; Fauvelle, 2020) have 
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focused on holding the executive branch accountable for the lack of sin-
cerity in attempting to mitigate the effects of a blatant lack of prepared-
ness. Yet, it is worth analyzing the strategy to which the French executive 
resorted to cope with the situation. Indeed, the French case is not isolated, 
and many countries, including those on the European continent, were 
struggling with similar issues with purchasing masks in the early days of 
the crisis.

From early in the pandemic, EU member states were particularly 
interdependent in the face of the virus, due to freedom of movement. 
While EU treaties only allow for coordination of response measures, they 
had nevertheless allowed for the development of a mechanism for pro-
curement of medical devices in the aftermath of the 2009 H1N1 crisis 
(Deruelle & Engeli, 2021). The mechanism had been overlooked in the 
years prior to the pandemic but became a key instrument in the arsenal 
against the pandemic particularly for France and its depleted stocks. EU 
member states activated the mechanism of joint procurement of medical 
equipment on February 28, 2020 for PPE and on March 17, 2020 for ven-
tilators (European Commission, 2020). European coordination for pro-
curement thus became a lifeline for France in the early months of the 
pandemic.

Coordination with other EU member states prevailed when the ques-
tion of purchasing vaccines was raised. French representatives, among a 
few others, expressed their support for a coordinated vaccination plan and 
their interest in the joint procurement of COVID-19 vaccines. But it was 
not the only way through which France attempted to coordinate with its 
neighbors as, with Germany, Italy, and the Netherlands, they had reached 
a deal with AstraZeneca on the supply of up to 400 million doses of its 
vaccine. Taking place outside the EU framework (Deutsch, 2021a), the 
negotiations did not include some smaller member states which would 
have benefited the most from joint procurement. Ultimately, a form of 
“solidarity” (Deruelle & Greer, 2022) prevailed and, overall, from August 
2020 until January 2021 the Commission signed so-called “advance pur-
chase agreements” with six different companies, for a total of 2.3 billion 
doses. The first deal signed was with AstraZeneca in August for 400 mil-
lion doses, largely converting the agreement initially sealed by Germany, 
France, Italy, and the Netherlands (Sánchez Nicolás & Zalan, 2021).
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Moreover, early on in the crisis, the French executive was committed 
to developing a coordinated approach to procurement. On May 18, 2020, 
France and Germany jointly proposed setting up an EU “Health Task 
Force” (Ministère de l’Europe et des Affaires étrangères, 2020). This pro-
posal ultimately took the form of the Health European Response Authority 
(HERA) (Deruelle & Cairó, 2021). The role of HERA, created on 
September 16, 2021, is to assist member states in purchasing medical 
equipment jointly, assist in the deployment of medicines and vaccines, as 
well as the development of new medicines and medical equipment by 
covering the whole value chain from conception to R&D and distribution. 
For instance, it launched the €75 million VACCELERATE project, a 
COVID-19 clinical research network involving scientific institutions from 
16 EU member states including French partners.

Ultimately, the French executive’s strategy vis-à-vis coordination with 
its neighbors proved successful in correcting its lack of preparedness. It 
led to a reconfiguration of the French response and crisis management 
system and, specifically, the institutionalization of a robust way to access 
medical devices via the joint purchasing mechanism. But European coor-
dination is not the only force at play in this reconfiguration: the crisis has 
also given way to a reinforcement of the role of the executive, in which its 
ambiguous relationship with scientific advice plays a key role.

6.4 � Reconfiguration of the Crisis Management System

Amid the crisis, the French executive initiated a fast-paced reconfigura-
tion of the crisis management institutional system. Special measures for 
the management of the pandemic have given way to a reinforcement of the 
role of the executive (Presidency and Ministry of Health). This institu-
tional reconfiguration was not permanent, but it bears some effect on the 
credibility of scientific advice and ultimately future reforms.

6.4.1 � The reinforcement of the executive in crisis 
management

In France, the national executive often trumps all. As discussed in 
Section 6.1, the executive has a great deal of control in territorial terms, 
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i.e. centralization, but this also holds true in institutional terms. As such 
the role of the executive in France is often analyzed with reference to the 
weakness and sidelining of other institutions, such as the French 
Parliament regarding presidentialization. The COVID-19 crisis created a 
context propitious to concentrating crisis management powers in the 
hands of the executive (Bergeron & Borraz, 2020; Pedrot, 2020). 
Ultimately, this institutional reconfiguration of the crisis management 
system has led to the sidelining of expert’s agencies.

The concentration of powers within the hands of the executive is a 
formal process. The adoption of a Health Emergency Law on March 23, 
2020 gave the executive broad powers, including the possibility of adopt-
ing many measures by decree, i.e. without parliamentary oversight. 
Despite legal limits on its length and possibility for extension, the state of 
emergency lasted from March 24, 2020 to November 10, 2021. The 
French executive was very creative in its strategy to maintain the state of 
emergency, using decrees to ensure continuity. The state of emergency 
was initially declared on March 24, 2020 for 2 months and then renewed 
up to July 9, 2020. This was followed by a “transition” period which ended 
on October 17, 2020 — only for a new state of emergency to be declared 
on the same day. It then was extended twice. The executive was able to 
take decrees and avoid parliamentary oversight, a matter particularly criti-
cized in both chambers.

This amounted to a concentration of power in the hands of the 
President. During the state of emergency, decisions were taken by the 
“Defence Council,” convened and chaired by the French President and 
composed of the Prime Minister and Ministers selected by the President. 
Decisions were made public by President Macron himself, especially 
regarding the details of the introduction of lockdowns or their lifting. It 
was as if the French President had taken the concept of health “security” 
quite literally, in stark contrast with the pre-COVID period. This approach 
has clear advantages: it legitimizes public health as high politics 
(Rozenblum, 2021a) and its inherent verticality allows for a reactive 
response. But it may also be perceived as arbitrary by the population. 
COVID-19 altered living conditions in a substantial manner, as a total of 
three “lockdowns” were declared over the years 2020–2021. It is worth 
noting that the enforcement of the lockdowns was particularly severe and 
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required having to fill, date, and sign forms each time one would step 
out  in the public space. Police repression was particularly brutal in 
some  portions of the territory, as denounced by human rights NGOs 
(Willsher, 2020).

As described in Figure 6.4, this reconfiguration of the crisis manage-
ment system also altered the role of scientific advice in decision-making: 
the President and its Security Council sidelined institutionalized scientific 
bodies to the benefit of ad hoc advisory committees. The first was the 
Scientific Council advising on strategic decision-making set up on March 
12, 2020, and the second was the Research Analysis and Expertise 
Committee advising on innovative, scientific, technological, and thera-
peutic approaches and set up on March 24, 2020 (Assemblée Nationale, 
2020). The creation of the ad hoc committees may seem superfluous in a 
system described as one of the densest public health networks in Europe. 
But in the context of French politics, it shows commitment to solving the 
crisis, especially since scientific bodies and agencies usually have a low 
profile in France.

The creation of the ad hoc committees with a direct line to the 
Security Council led to the marginalization of the High Council of Public 
Health (HCSP), Public Health France (SPF), and the HAS (Gergeron & 
Borraz, 2020; Pedrot, 2020). This marginalization was clear as SPF and 
the HCSP were invited by the Scientific Council to attend meetings as 

Parliamentary
oversight

French Executive 
(Presidency)

Other Ministries

Ministry of Health

Health promotion, prevention, risk 
management and care 

General Directorate 
of Health Care 

Services

General Directorate 
of Health

High Authority
for Health

Medicines

Public Health
France

Communicable 
diseases

High Council for 
Public Health

Environmental
hazards

Expert 
advice

French
Assembly

Defense Council

(No parliamentary 
oversight)

Convene in 

Ad hoc Scientific 
Council

Advising on mitigation 

Ad hoc  Research
Analysis and Expertise 

Committee
Advising on therapeutic

approaches

Expert advice
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“permanent observers,” without actually participating (Delfraissy, 2020). 
On top of that, there was a proper epistemic divide with the new ad hoc 
council being mostly made of medical doctors, while institutionalized 
scientific bodies were hosting public health experts (Rozenblum, 2021a). 
Throughout the pandemic, the snub was most evident for SPF. Its core 
missions are to prepare and respond to health threats, alerts, and crises by 
developing and implementing strategies to contain health crises (Article 
L.1413-1 of the Code of Public Health). SPF had already absorbed at least 
part of the blame for the lack of strategic stocks. Ultimately, it was rele-
gated to risk assessment and surveillance and was sidelined from risk 
management.

But even on the matter of risk assessment and surveillance, the sys-
temic understaffing of SPF made it difficult to produce reliable data, 
especially finer data, which is crucial information for Regional Public 
Health Agencies (Greer et al., 2022). On top of that, SPF data had been 
discredited by the French executive, with the Prime Minister pointing out 
the “shallowness” of data reports (Hecketsweiler & de Royer, 2020).

Ultimately, this institutional “distortion” was only temporary: it ended 
with the withdrawal of the Health Emergency Law on July 31, 2022. 
However, it has reinforced centrifugal forces that concentrate powers in 
the hands of the executive with profound effects on the credibility of 
health agencies. Moreover, as the executive concentrates crisis manage-
ment prerogatives in its hands, it also concentrates blame from both medi-
cal professionals and public opinion. This presents new challenges to 
reforming the health system.

6.4.2 � The legacy of the crisis on trust

Because of early problems with masks and scientific advice, the French 
executive was the focus of the majority of the blame. According to the 
CEVIPOF’s European opinion survey from May 2020, 62% of French 
respondents said they were dissatisfied with the government’s action 
(Sciences Po CEVIPO, 2018). SPF shared some of the blame on strategy 
stocks (Assemblée Nationale, 2020) but many were dissatisfied with the 
severity of lockdowns. This was unsurprising as the pre-COVID context 
was already characterized by a growing discontent, with the yellow vest 
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(“gilets jaunes”) movement from autumn 2018 to spring 2019 and the 
strikes against pension reform from December 2019 to February 2020, 
ending days before the first lockdown.

Later on in the pandemic, an important point of defiance was the 
introduction of “health passes” in June 2021, which means only individu-
als who either had a proof of full vaccination, a negative virological test, 
or a certificate of recovery could access closed public spaces: cafes, res-
taurants, hospitals (except emergencies), retirement homes, airplanes, 
trains and buses for long-distance travel, and so on. The health pass has 
been criticized by a number of politicians, notably from La France 
Insoumise (far left) and the Rassemblement National (far right), who 
denounced a significant reduction in public freedoms and a vaccine man-
date in disguise (Willsher, 2021). This was exacerbated over the question 
of mandatory vaccination for healthcare workers and caregivers — 
paradoxically, this measure came at a time of great tension in hospital 
services due to the lack of healthcare personnel. Nevertheless, this measure 
most likely supported and incited vaccination. An analysis by the Economic 
Analysis Council estimates that the introduction of the pass resulted in 
13% more people being vaccinated, which would have prevented about 
4,000 additional deaths (Conseil d’Analyse Economique et al., 2022).

It seems likely that the ambiguous use of evidence-based policymak-
ing and scientific advice contributed to eroding trust in the executive 
(Coste et al., 2020). The French executive’s communication regarding the 
stock of masks showed that it was not shy from adopting a head-in-the-
sand approach when scientific advice was inconvenient. In a similar vein, 
the institutional reconfiguration of the crisis management system has led 
to the sidelining of public health experts in institutionalized bodies, in 
favor of medical doctors in ad hoc groups, which allowed for the executive 
to cherrypick between different advice. For instance, despite a negative 
opinion of SPF on maintaining the date of the 2020 local elections, the 
Security Council publicly invoked the ad hoc committees’ decisions to 
justify their controversial decisions to maintain elections “on site.” This 
demonstrates that the French executive has exploited the divide between 
ad hoc and institutionalized experts. Ultimately, the French executive 
engaged in a compartmentalization of risk assessment and risk manage-
ment: while SPF had the data, other forms of scientific credibility were 
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invoked to assert choices in terms of management. This strategy offers a 
great deal of freedom for the French executive from scientific advice — 
and data — in making choices regarding crisis management, but it 
contributes to maintaining a high level of ambiguity and ultimately under-
mining scientific advice.

6.5 � Conclusion: A Not-So-Disruptive Pandemic?

The COVID-19 crisis was a profoundly disruptive event which affected 
French people. Yet its effect on health reforms remains limited. Two fast-
paced reforms initiated in the early months of the crisis must nevertheless 
be noted: the financial reform of healthcare as well as the reform of pro-
curement by way of European coordination. These reforms were a direct 
consequence of the lack of preparedness to face serious health threats 
(Jugl, 2022) and ultimately, a form of learning from the crisis. But while 
the pandemic has delivered lessons, some may have yet to be learned, as 
exemplified by the lack of reform of the crisis management system despite 
its overhaul amid crisis. Overall, the pandemic appears to have been less 
disruptive than one could expect.

The financial reform of healthcare, prepared on a time crunch, was 
both a social reform for hospital personnel and a reform of investment in 
healthcare; it has yet to be fully implemented, with many fearing budget 
cuts. The reform of procurement, a joint effort with France’s European 
partners, has already changed the way preparedness is done at national 
level. This reform does not revolutionize crisis management but rather 
partially mutualizes the issue of procurement: the EU’s action is still lim-
ited to coordination, albeit supported by much more sophisticated institu-
tions than pre-pandemic (see Greer, this volume). However, a substantial 
leap would require a treaty change, and EU member states have shown 
little interest in proposals on the matter, such as the one formulated by the 
Conference on the Future of Europe (Deruelle & Engeli, 2021; Deruelle 
& Greer, 2022; Deruelle, 2021).

Future health reforms seem unlikely in the short or medium term. For 
instance, despite the fact that there was a complete overhaul of scientific 
bodies, there is an apparent lack of self-reflection on the matter. Moreover, 
other issues have taken front stage. On the internal front, the executive 
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agenda is set on the reform of the pension system rather than of the health 
system, a reform that the French President has been preparing since 2017. 
On the external front, inflation and the crisis in Ukraine have steered 
attention away from health reforms. Beyond reforms of crisis management 
itself, the challenge ahead will be to avoid letting lessons learned about 
public health to be cannibalized by economic or defense affairs.

Ultimately, the legacy of the crisis is beyond reforms, in the practice 
of concentrating authority in the hands of the French executive. The pan-
demic confirmed the rationale for centralization of hospital care, albeit 
alleviated by the imperative of “modernization.” It also led to a centraliza-
tion of crisis management prerogatives in the hands of the executive, 
sideling not only the French Assembly but also institutionalized public 
health experts. Beyond the effects on trust documented in this chapter, the 
question remains to what extent such a lengthy centralized management in 
times of crisis may foreshadow the post-COVID era.
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Chapter 7

The United Kingdom

Ollie Bartlett

7.1 � Introduction

This volume explores the capacity of states to reform their public health 
policy following the upheaval of the COVID-19 pandemic. This upheaval 
reveals opportunities to reform laws and practices, or entrench positive 
developments that flowed from the shattering and remolding of social 
norms. There will, of course, always be factors that will impede such 
reform (Marsden & Docherty, 2021). The United Kingdom (UK) has 
grappled simultaneously with the COVID-19 pandemic and Brexit. 
Efforts to leave the European Union had been destabilizing the UK’s 
politics, economy, and society for several years before the COVID-19 
pandemic struck and, although COVID-19 became the immediate focus of 
the government and the public, the problems caused by Brexit did not 
disappear. In fact, Brexit has directly and indirectly had a negative influ-
ence on COVID-19 policies in the UK.

After the emergency phase of the COVID-19 pandemic passed, Brexit 
reasserted itself as a crisis still in need of a resolution. Although progress 
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has been made in stabilizing the UK’s relationship with the EU after its 
official withdrawal in January 2020, much remains uncertain. Not only 
is a great deal of government time and resources still required to address 
the ongoing practical consequences of Brexit, but the approach to gover-
nance in the UK has also been fundamentally affected by Brexit. Both of 
these factors will exert a chilling effect on future public health work and, 
when combined with the legacy of disastrous COVID-19 policymaking, 
have likely created a public health landscape that will make implementing 
the lessons of the COVID-19 pandemic a challenge.

This chapter illustrates this in three parts. It first outlines the institu-
tional structure of public health in the UK both before and after COVID-19  
and discusses how drastic reforms to these institutions made during 
COVID-19 will create challenges for future public health work. Second, it 
provides a thematic overview of the shortcomings of UK COVID-19 
policy and focuses in particular on the legacy of the 2020 Coronavirus Act 
for future public health work. Third, it explores the mechanisms through 
which Brexit affected (and will affect) public health work during and after 
the pandemic. It considers in particular the options for public health 
reform that face the UK post-COVID-19 and post-Brexit.

7.2 � Public Health Institutions in the UK

7.2.1 � The institutional structure of UK public health  
pre- and post-COVID

The UK has a devolved constitutional structure: certain policy competen-
cies are exercised by the central government, whereas other competencies 
are exercised by devolved governments in Scotland, Wales, and Northern 
Ireland, with the central government exercising those devolved competen-
cies for England. Heath, and within that, public health, is a devolved 
policy area, and England, Scotland, Wales, and Northern Ireland all have 
their own agencies to carry out public health work for their respective 
populations. The work carried out by these agencies includes vaccine pro-
vision, non-communicable disease prevention, substance use work, men-
tal health work, community interventions and screening, and public health 
literacy work. Examples of powers exercised by the central government 
which could be used to promote and protect public health include the 
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power to raise taxes and the power to control UK borders. Figure 7.1 iden-
tifies the pre-COVID devolved public health agencies and their relation-
ship with the devolved and central governments.

As can be seen, the agencies responsible for public health work in 
each of the four UK nations have totally different accountability struc-
tures. In Scotland and England, public health agencies operate as separate 
bodies but with accountability to government. In Wales, public health is 
run as part of the National Health Service in Wales, which itself is 
accountable to government. In Northern Ireland, the public health agency 
is part of the government. However, following the COVID-19 pandemic, 
it seems that differences in public health organizations are a minor issue 
compared to the much more serious impact of the UK’s asymmetrical 
devolution settlement itself upon the adoption of coordinated and effective 
public health policies. When the COVID-19 pandemic struck, the 
devolved governments had numerous powers to impose lockdown, orga-
nize testing, close businesses, and offer economic support. Some of these 

Figure 7.1.    Public health organization across all UK nations.
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powers were exercised similarly across the UK, but in some respects, the 
devolved governments took markedly different approaches to each other 
and the UK central government which exercised such powers for England 
(Cameron-Blake et  al., 2020). These differences arose because of the 
political choices made by the devolved administrations. Much commen-
tary has since examined the breakdown in political coordination between 
the UK central government and the devolved governments, and the influ-
ence of the tensions of asymmetric devolution upon the UK’s ability to 
plan a coordinated state-wide pandemic response to the aspects of the 
pandemic that required it (Diamond & Laffin, 2022).

These existing tensions may be further exacerbated by the much-
criticized decision of the UK central government to abolish Public Health 
England and establish in its place the UK Health Security Agency 
(UKSHA) and the Office for Health Improvement and Disparities 
(OHID), as illustrated in Figure 7.2.

The UKHSA is a separate body with accountability to government, 
similar to Public Health England (PHE), while the OHID is fully part of 
government. The UKHSA will continue to exercise health protection 
functions for England, but importantly it seems that it also now exercises 
some health protection functions for the whole of the UK in a way that 
PHE did not. The relationship between these functions of the UKHSA and 
the functions of the public health agencies in Scotland, Wales, and 
Northern Ireland, which have remained intact after the pandemic, is yet to 
be clarified, and it is uncertain what the political response would be if the 
exercise of these powers were to conflict with the policies of the devolved 
administrations.

Before the COVID-19 pandemic, the direction of authority in public 
health work was toward greater local control of, and accountability for, 

Figure 7.2.    Public health organization for England after COVID-19.
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public health work. Public health functions were moved out of the National 
Health Service (NHS) by the Health and Social Care Act 2012, and many 
were placed under the control of local authorities and their directors of pub-
lic health, who were supported by the newly created PHE (Middleton, 
2017). The creation of Public Health Scotland also placed more emphasis 
on local exercise of public health powers (Scottish Government, 2020).

When the COVID-19 pandemic struck, this progress was almost 
entirely ignored by the UK central government when designing policies for 
England. Local authorities in England in particular attempted at various 
points of the pandemic to persuade the UK central government to give them 
greater control over COVID-19 responses — the standoff between 
Manchester Metro Mayor Andy Burnham and Prime Minister Boris 
Johnson over localized lockdown rules and increased local pandemic fund-
ing was the most public and embarrassing example for the central govern-
ment (Kenny & Kelsey, 2020). Ultimately, however, the UK central 
government largely ignored the calls for a more localized approach and pro-
ceeded with centrally designing and implementing COVID-19 response.

7.2.2 � Future challenges created by the reform of the UK’s 
public health institutions

Perhaps the most significant challenge will be how to ensure that the UK’s 
new public health institutions work in a positive and productive way. 
Undoubtedly their rapid creation, without any significant consultation, 
was influenced both by the desire to shift the blame for poor government 
policy and by the desire to recentralize public health functions. It appears 
to have been an unwise move from several perspectives.

Splitting responsibility for health protection and health promotion 
across two separate agencies, especially when one — the OHID — is fully 
part of a government department, will clearly reduce the connectedness of 
public health policymaking and is a development that the public health 
sector has responded to cautiously (Association of Directors of Public 
Health, 2021; Royal Society for Public Health, 2021). Health inequalities, 
for example, persist in both the communicable and non-communicable 
disease contexts, and the complex job of closing such inequalities requires 
a whole-of-government response (Ortenzi et  al., 2022). Evidence from 
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other jurisdictions demonstrates that strong leadership for this whole-of-
government response is required if actions on health inequalities and the 
social determinants of health are to be effective (Dean et  al., 2013). 
Indeed, evidence from the UK concludes the same thing but finds such 
leadership lacking (Marmot et al., 2020). Given that PHE struggled with 
priorities such as the proper funding of non-communicable disease (NCD) 
prevention activities and connected policy implementation (Hunter et al., 
2022), artificially confining responsibility for so-called health “dispari-
ties” to one agency which does not appear to have a mandate to reach 
across the UK government, and which certainly is not empowered to coor-
dinate policy across the devolved governments and their public health 
agencies, will make it very difficult to achieve this much-needed leader-
ship (Wilkinson, 2021). The rapidity and lack of consultation with which 
this “distraction” was implemented will likely mean that the failings of 
PHE regarding policy connectivity will only be reproduced by the UK’s 
new public health agencies (Littlejohns et al., 2022).

Moreover, the use of the term “health disparities”, rather than the 
accepted public health term “health inequalities” (Scally, 2021b), seems to 
be the latest indication that the current Conservative government (despite 
recent headline grabbing pledges such as that to create a smoke-free gen-
eration and more tightly regulate e-cigarettes) is not entirely committed to 
the hard work required to eliminate persistent health inequalities within 
the UK, and may well dilute the ability of the OHID to have a meaningful 
impact on the UK’s widening health inequalities. This lack of commitment 
became evident in the White Paper on Levelling Up that was published in 
February 2022, as a much-delayed response to one of Boris Johnson’s 
major campaign pledges. The White Paper was silent on many factors that 
drive health inequality and contained measures which are unlikely to be 
effective in addressing health inequality (Ralston et al., 2022). The estab-
lishment of the OHID seems to continue in the same vein, since it has 
initially been tasked with working on neoliberal interventions to promote 
behavior change rather than interventions that will address the social 
determinants of health (Oliver, 2021). Moreover, some of those initial 
priorities have already been changed or canceled (Buck, 2022). This illus-
trates the dangers of the national agency responsible for addressing health 
inequalities being wholly accountable to government ministers, whose 
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preferences on health policy are inevitably politically oriented and 
changeable. In particular, the health policy preferences of the current gov-
ernment seem to be driven not by the evidence but by what the political 
right of the Conservative party would approve of, as well as by the desire 
to demonstrate that the UK can come up with innovative health policy as 
a non-EU state. This has led some commentators to brand the new public 
health organizations an “ideologically driven distraction” (Scally, 2021a).

Moreover, it seems unwise to create an agency — the UKHSA — that 
will not only carry out health protection functions for England but will 
also exercise certain health protection functions for the whole of the UK, 
in particular functions related to knowledge generation. The devolved 
agencies in Scotland, Wales, and Northern Ireland were not formally 
altered following the COVID-19 pandemic, and so it is unclear whether 
any of their knowledge generation functions have been co-opted by the 
UKHSA. More likely is that an entirely new remit of knowledge genera-
tion for communicable diseases has been created, but this then raises the 
question of the extent the devolved agencies are entitled to feed into the 
exercise of these knowledge generation powers. The evidence base 
strongly suggests a key role for local authorities in improving public 
health outcomes (Bonner, 2020; Riches et al., 2015). If the findings of the 
devolved agencies on particular issues conflict with those of the UKHSA, 
it is unclear whether the devolved agencies would be obliged to follow the 
evidence generated by the UKHSA. In any event, what is certainly clear 
is that the OHID was not invested with any such UK-wide powers with 
respect to its non-communicable disease remit, which raises the question 
of whether there should be a public authority that is responsible for knowl-
edge generation and coordination on non-communicable disease. This 
certainly seems like an oversight in this institutional restructuring.

The idea to make knowledge production and dissemination a key 
aspect of a public health agency’s work is a good one; however, the way 
this has been operationalized in the UK post-COVID-19 leaves much to 
be desired, and this owes much to the Brexit influence. It is obvious that 
the UK central government was eager to use the dismantling of PHE to 
create an institution that contributes to the image of the self-sufficient, 
global-facing Britain that was promised during the Brexit campaign. The 
UKHSA was set up as an agency that would produce “world-leading” 
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knowledge and best practices for the whole of the UK, conveniently on a 
topic that was particularly salient for the public at the time. However, the 
rhetoric has now collided with reality: a short while after the creation of 
the UKHSA, the UK government announced that in fact its funding was 
to be drastically cut, something that apparently was long in the planning 
(Hill, 2022). At best, this further demonstrates the superficiality of the 
institutional restructuring exercise. At worst, it is evidence of the cynical 
use of a major and unnecessary institutional restructuring to advance the 
political objectives of the government, in full knowledge of the fact that 
such world-leading work was not possible within the constraints of the 
resources that the government were willing to allocate. Either way, the 
UKHSA is now left with a daunting new remit to fulfill, seemingly with-
out the proper resources to achieve this.

It also seems very unwise to unwind, through the establishment of 
both UKHSA and OHID, the gains achieved through the prior establish-
ment of PHE and the Directors of Public Health. This, largely, was a 
greater focus on supporting local public health functions (Buck, 2021). 
Maintaining and strengthening local control over public health is agreed 
to be a key feature of future public health work (Buck et  al., 2018). 
However, the establishment of the UKHSA and OHID have recentralized 
public health functions, a move which reflected the government’s populist 
agenda. Keeping health policy functions close to central government and 
linking them with the private sector (clearly not learning from the disas-
trous impact of privatizing COVID-19 response policies (Monbiot, 2020)) 
ensures that central government can control the public health policy 
narrative if it risks becoming unpopular and especially can steer it in 
directions that are perceived to avoid paternalism. Unfortunately, this neo-
liberal approach to public health is clearly not the best strategy not just in 
light of existing evidence but also of the UK’s particular COVID-19 expe-
rience (Jones & Hameiri, 2022). Avoiding the perceived unpopular deci-
sions in long-term public health strategy, especially when the UK’s high 
level of health inequality was so starkly revealed during the COVID-19 
pandemic, is a profound mistake. Moreover, centralization will risk delo-
calizing public health work in the UK, something which those working at 
this level point out must be avoided to prevent distinctly negative impacts 
upon the protection of community health (Ogden, 2021).
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7.3 � The Response of the UK Government to COVID-19

It is now well documented that the COVID-19 policies adopted by the UK 
central government spectacularly failed to contain the spread of the virus. 
At the time of writing, over 220,000 people have died from COVID-19 in 
the UK, which is the largest death toll in Europe and the 6th largest in the 
world (Statistia, 2023). To put this in context, this is greater than the 
entire population of the city of Newcastle. UK COVID-19 policies have 
breached fundamental rights, bred mistrust, and created difficulties for 
public health work in the future. The reasons for this failure can be sum-
marized under three themes: policy responses were slow and hypocritical, 
policy responses were disorganized and lacked transparency, and policy 
responses were overly politicized. The following subsections expand upon 
these themes.

7.3.1 � Policy responses were slow and hypocritical

At the start of the pandemic, the UK government decided not to impose a 
national lockdown, based on the justification that building “herd immu-
nity” was a superior strategy. Although the government claimed the back-
ing of scientific evidence, the evidence collected was largely based on 
mathematical models and did not reflect how the disease was actually 
progressing, thus providing a misleading picture of the necessity of a 
national lockdown (Bowsher et  al., 2020). Moreover, the government’s 
claim that a lockdown would be ineffective because people would get tired 
of adhering to it — so-called behavioral fatigue — lacked a basis in 
behavioral science (Sibony, 2020; Mahase, 2020). When a lockdown was 
eventually imposed, nearly two weeks after most European countries, the 
level of social contact that had already occurred was the seed for an enor-
mous first wave of disease. Even then, the government was reluctant to 
clearly communicate the obligatory nature of the lockdown, and the police 
were reluctant to use their enforcement powers (Cairney & Wellstead, 
2021). The UK government was also slow to respond to high-profile 
breaches of the lockdown. Dominic Cummings, the then-senior advisor to 
Prime Minister Boris Johnson, drove several hundred kilometers to meet 
with family, yet was neither punished nor publicly rebuked by the 
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government. Research subsequently showed that this undermined trust in 
the government and contributed to non-adherence to the lockdown 
(Fancourt, 2020). Boris Johnson also refused to remove Health Minister 
Matt Hancock from office after he admitted to kissing his aide in his  
parliamentary office during lockdown, judging his apology to be suffi-
cient accountability. Scotland’s Chief Medical Officer Dr. Catherine 
Calderwood was defended by Scottish First Minister Nicola Sturgeon, 
after she also traveled extensively during lockdown. Both were eventu-
ally pressured into resignation. Housing Minister Robert Jenrick was 
allowed to publicly defend his 150 mile round trip to deliver supplies to 
relatives and did not resign. The most damaging example of rule break-
ing was, however, the “Partygate” scandal. Parties were held within 10 
Downing Street and attended by officials and ministers across govern-
ment, including the Prime Minister and Chancellor. Both apologized, 
made excuses, and were eventually fined by the Metropolitan Police 
alongside over 100 others but only after the extent and nature of the par-
ties had been kept secret for several months. Research now demonstrates 
that the series of poor judgments by UK politicians surrounding rule-
breaking seriously eroded trust in government and undermined public 
health measures in later phases of the pandemic (Weinberg, 2022; 
Samuel et al., 2022).

7.3.2 � Policy responses were disorganized and 
lacking in transparency

Exercise Cygnus, conducted in 2016 to simulate government response to 
an influenza outbreak, concluded that the UK was not prepared to deal 
with a major pandemic (Pegg, 2020). However, the lessons of this exercise 
were not implemented. The reasons included the following: the culture of 
political decision-making in the UK, where a small number of decision-
makers in central government are quite disconnected from the public 
health frontline; the lack of agility resulting from the devolution of health 
policy responsibility to individual UK nations (more on devolution in the 
following in relation to government communication) resulting in an 
inability to agree consistent plans across the UK; a neglect to invest suf-
ficient resources and write concrete contingency plans with a resulting 
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lack of capacity to exercise public health functions on a large scale; and a 
tendency toward overreliance on private providers and cronyism in public 
procurement (Pollock & Coles, 2021; Jones & Hameiri, 2022). Two of the 
most notable policy failings occurred in contact tracing and the procure-
ment of personal protective equipment (PPE). These were failures gener-
ated by a lack of preparedness but also exacerbated by decisions made 
once that lack of preparedness had been revealed.

After scrapping the initial program of contact tracing very early in the 
pandemic without any published explanation, and without considering the 
role of local authorities (Pollock & Coles, 2021), the UK government cre-
ated NHS Test and Trace (which was run by private companies and not the 
NHS) to organize COVID-19 testing and contact tracing. This system was 
an expensive failure, which did not test an adequate number of people or 
adequately trace their close contacts, the details of which were starkly 
revealed by the investigation performed by the House of Commons 
Committee of Public Accounts (2021). Moreover, the government scrapped 
their initial contact tracing program very early on. In fact, after the 
replacement central program — NHS Test and Trace — also failed to 
noticeably reduce disease levels, the UK’s devolved administrations began 
operating their own contact tracing systems with far greater success, while 
the leaders of local authorities in England pressed unsuccessfully for 
greater contact tracing powers (Diamond & Laffin, 2022). The contact 
tracing debacle was fueled by the subcontracting of component services 
to private firms with connections to government but little expertise in 
public health service delivery. Despite the courts holding that the govern-
ment’s procurement of these services was unlawful (Dyer, 2021), the 
government was never truly held accountable for poor service delivery in 
several other aspects of its pandemic response (Diamond & Laffin, 2022) 
that stemmed from extensive cronyism in the procurement of these ser-
vices (Sian & Smyth, 2022).

Another major organizational failure was the inability to procure suf-
ficient PPE. In 2020, the UK was still in a transitional phase in the Brexit 
process — it was no longer a Member State but continued to be part of the 
EU single market and customs union, and to follow EU rules. As a result, 
the UK had the opportunity to take part in the EU’s joint PPE procurement 
scheme. The government refused, in the belief that it could independently 
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achieve the same purchasing goals (Glencross, 2020). While the EU 
scheme was far from perfect (for instance, in relation to the time delays 
involved), it afforded Member States the purchasing power to secure suf-
ficient PPE stock at a lower cost than could be achieved through indepen-
dent purchasing (McEvoy & Ferri, 2020). The UK by contrast had to 
engage its own extremely underprepared health procurement system — 
NHS Supply Chain — which predictably could not cope with the demand 
for PPE (Sanchez-Graells, 2021). This meant that a number of frontline 
public servants confronted the COVID-19 pandemic without appropriate 
PPE — not only NHS staff (Hoernke, 2021) but also the police force 
(de  Camargo, 2022) and social care workers (Rajan et  al., 2020), for 
example.

The way in which the UK government sought scientific advice to 
guide its COVID-19 policies was also disorganized and lacking in trans-
parency and, in particular, the way in which the government relied upon 
the Scientific Advisory Group for Emergencies (SAGE). A core group of 
SAGE insiders were usually consulted on pandemic policies, to the exclu-
sion of other sources of scientific advice (Cairney, 2021b). It is now 
widely known that SAGE did not offer independent advice but answered 
the questions that the government sent them (Thacker, 2020). Moreover, 
some SAGE members both produced the science and were responsible for 
communicating it to the government within the political frame in which it 
was requested (Pearce, 2020). As a result, SAGE’s policy advice was not 
always scientifically objective, a situation that prompted the creation of 
several expert groups, such as “Independent SAGE”, which published 
alternative public health advice. The perception of a lack of independence 
was not helped by the fact that some SAGE members potentially had 
financial conflicts of interest over the awarding of public health services 
contracts to private companies (Thacker, 2020). Nor was it helped by the 
decision to keep the membership and meeting minutes secret for a long 
time (Freedman, 2020). Of course, the UK was far from unique in conflat-
ing science with politics during the pandemic. However, unlike in most 
other countries, UK government ministers began to publicly downplay the 
seriousness of the scientific advice they received from SAGE as the pan-
demic wore on, when they started disliking the answers to the questions 
they asked (Hodges et al., 2022). This had the effect of both shattering the 
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previous rhetoric of “following the science” and further undermining trust 
in both SAGE and the government.

7.3.3 � Communication of policy was overly politicized

The UK government’s public communication strategy during the  
COVID-19 pandemic was orchestrated and delivered by politicians who 
were preoccupied with the perception of their policies. Boris Johnson’s 
government never escaped “campaign mode” after the Brexit referendum 
and general election and has relied upon rhetoric to persuade the popula-
tion to buy into its approach to COVID-19 policy (Lilleker & Stoeckle, 
2021). Indeed, the wartime rhetorical theme has consistently characterized 
government communication, partly to justify authoritarian leadership and 
partly to divert attention away from government ineptitude (Spyridonidis, 
2022). The public were usually informed of rules and policies by the 
Prime Minister or Secretary of State for Health in a press briefing, with 
core members of SAGE in attendance to add scientific credibility. This 
contrasts sharply with the approach in other countries. In Ireland, for 
example, rules were usually communicated by the government’s scientific 
advisors, who appeared alone in press briefings, with government minis-
ters only stepping in to communicate key changes in policy direction 
(Colfer, 2020).

The substance of government communications demonstrated a lack of 
appreciation for how people behaviorally react to information, was under-
mined by deteriorating credibility of the source of information (i.e. the 
government or its advisors), and was inconsistent or vague in terms of its 
substance (Dagnall et al., 2020). However, not only was communication 
poorly executed, but it was also deliberately misleading. The government 
never publicly admitted to any mistakes, either in terms of its policy sub-
stance or policy communication (Sanders, 2020). Communications were 
commonly employed to construct a “truth” about the spread of the virus 
that diverted attention away from policy mistakes (Sim & Tombs, 2022), 
and sometimes the government even communicated false information 
when it was faced with particularly embarrassing mistakes (Newton, 
2020). A majority of the UK population unsurprisingly perceived govern-
ment communications to be low in honesty, credibility, and empathy 
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(Abrams et al., 2021). This lack of trust may well have translated into a 
certain level of non-adherence to the rules. It certainly meant that the 
population sourced much of their information on COVID-19 from the 
media (Newton, 2020), who added detail and critical commentary to 
the vagueness of many government messages, particularly in relation to 
pandemic statistics (Lawson & Lugo-Ocando, 2022).

Communication of COVID-19 policies in the UK was also complicated 
by devolution. The UK devolves many government functions to administra-
tions in Scotland, Wales, and Northern Ireland. Health policy is devolved, 
but other powers relevant to tackling COVID-19, such as those concerning 
economic policy and border policy, are reserved to the central government. 
Moreover, since there is no devolved administration in England, the central 
government makes health policy for England. Differences in policy choices 
between the devolved administrations and the central government caused 
some confusion for people in Scotland, Wales, and Northern Ireland as to 
their exact obligations, worsened by media reporting that was not sensitive 
to the nature of the devolved governments and which government had made 
which announcement (Cushion et al., 2020).

7.3.4 � Future challenges created by the legislative 
approach to COVID-19

Some of the criticism leveled at the UK government’s COVID-19 policy 
response was naïve and perhaps unfair in light of the difficulties inherent 
in policymaking under conditions of uncertainty (Cairney, 2021a). Some 
interventions — particularly the economic supports for those who lost 
their jobs (Brewer & Gardiner, 2020; Brewer & Tasseva, 2021) and the 
roll-out of the vaccine (Baraniuk, 2021) — achieved their objectives well. 
In particular, the UK’s organization of vaccine trials exceeded that of the 
EU in terms of the reach and efficiency (Tani, 2022). It is entirely possible 
that these successes gave the UK government an inflated sense of their 
overall success in handling the pandemic. They certainly provided rhetori-
cal ammunition that has been employed at every opportunity to defend the 
government’s COVID-19 record.

The great majority of commentary on the UK government’s  
COVID-19 policy has, however, fairly and accurately pointed out a 
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startling lack of competence, which some have claimed amounts to 
human rights failings (Montel, 2020; Frowde et  al., 2020). The next 
major communicable disease outbreak must be handled radically differ-
ently. Heavy investment should be made in public health institutions and 
the health care system generally, and public health officials must be 
instructed to design concrete protocols for how public health services 
will be delivered under pressure. A clear and independent scientific 
advisory structure should be created, with clear protocols for how gov-
ernment ministers will seek policy advice. Policy communication must 
be detailed and transparent. Ministers should seek to collaborate with 
other states and international organizations as much as possible. Many 
of these failings and lessons are now being articulated in the wide-
ranging public enquiry, led by Baroness Hallett, into the UK govern-
ment’s COVID-19 response.

Above all else, however, the legislative approach to the next public 
health emergency must be different. The doctrine of parliamentary sover-
eignty means that any element of the UK’s public health legal framework 
can be altered by Parliament at any time. Moreover, this power is uncon-
strained by judicial review, which is limited to checking that procedures 
set out in legislation have been properly followed by public bodies. More 
recent developments in UK law will further reduce the possible scrutiny 
of changes to how public health is organized. The proposed Bill of Rights 
aims to substantially limit the influence of the European Court of Human 
Rights on UK law and has the effect of making it harder for individuals to 
bring rights-based claims to court (Law Society, 2022). Currently, the 
application of the European Convention of Human Rights is the only way 
to exercise a measure of judicial scrutiny over the adoption of public 
health legislation, such as through the application of Article 5 on liberty 
of the person to the Coronavirus Act 2020 (Pugh, 2020). Driven by the 
desire to remove all vestiges of Europe (whether related to the EU or not) 
from UK law, if the government is successful in getting the Bill of Rights 
bill enacted, legislation such as the Coronavirus Act 2020 will be all but 
untouchable. This manner of legislative power can of course be a powerful 
tool for public health — the ability to adopt effective public health law 
free from concern of legal challenge would certainly be useful where 
strong vested interests attempt to prevent such laws. However, such power 
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could also be used to adopt ineffective, unethical, or rights-restrictive 
public health laws.

The Coronavirus Act 2020 (henceforth “the Act”) is a good example 
of the latter use of power. The Act has been broadly criticized in the aca-
demic literature, which generally agrees that the use of a large government 
majority to quickly and without consultation adopt a piece of legislation 
that made sweeping and sometimes ineffective restrictions made a coun-
terproductive contribution to the UK’s COVID-19 response (Grez Hidalgo 
et al., 2020; Hickman et al., 2020). The Act did not only have implications 
in the short term but may have impacts that extend beyond the COVID-19 
pandemic. Researchers have already explored the fact that the Act was 
problematic largely because of the mindset of legislators (Grez Hidalgo 
et  al., 2020). The risk for UK public health is that this mindset will 
become entrenched through the influence of Brexit upon governance and 
that the Act sets a precedent for future public health legislating.

The lack of consultation is a particularly worrying precedent to set, as 
is the lack of any suitable monitoring or accountability mechanisms. 
Every piece of public health legislation should be built upon a foundation 
of stakeholder consultation and legislative monitoring, not only to ensure 
it is effective but also to ensure it meets ethical standards of transparency. 
The review mechanism added to the Act well after its adoption as a con-
cession to critics was far from acceptable (Lock et al., 2021) and stood 
more as an illustration of the distain of the current government for 
accepted or “establishment” governance norms.

Moreover, the precedent of making certain public health rules through 
delegated legislation is also worrying. Delegated (or “secondary”) legisla-
tion is made by government ministers through powers granted by Acts of 
Parliament (“primary” legislation). Delegated legislation is not debated or 
voted on in the same way that primary legislation is and is usually 
employed for articulating details of policies which have been democrati-
cally debated and enacted through primary legislation. In principle, the 
use of delegated legislation in public health policy is a useful way of flex-
ibly adding details to a general legal framework, especially to accommo-
date changes in the evidence base. However, such delegated legislation 
should not create new restrictions or offenses, as the Act provided powers 
to do. It is arguable that an extraordinary public health situation demands 
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an extraordinary response — however, since it is difficult to define when 
a public health threat becomes an emergency, emergency public health 
legislation should be designed with caution to guard against the imposi-
tion of unwarranted strong restrictions. Such design might include the 
circumspect allocation of delegated powers that would allow government 
ministers to impose restrictions with limited oversight. The fact that the 
UK government retained the delegated emergency public health powers 
given by the Act long after the plausible existence of a state of public 
health emergency was therefore highly concerning (Grogan, 2020). 
Parliament should in the future take note that there are ways of enacting 
emergency public health legislation which limit the potential abuse of 
emergency powers (Cormacain, 2020).

7.4 � Post-COVID Public Health Reform in the UK in 
the Context of Brexit

Pandemics open a policy window (Kingdon, 1984): weaknesses inherent 
in public health and health care services crystallize clearly and stakehold-
ers are mobilized, while policymakers have both the political opportunity 
to address these weaknesses as well as an understanding of possible solu-
tions (Amri & Logan, 2021; Auener et al., 2020; Mintrom & True, 2022; 
Harris & McCue, 2022). Policy windows opened by pandemics ideally 
facilitate great leaps in public health policy and will be seized when stake-
holders are willing to engage in multilevel, multisectoral collaboration 
while paying close attention to the scientific evidence base. Most public 
health issues are too complex in both their causes and their impact for one 
actor to solve alone. While not resulting from a pandemic, the adoption of 
the Framework Convention on Tobacco Control is a good example of a 
public health policy window being seized. A new Director General of the 
World Health Organization, for whom tobacco control was a priority, 
drove a highly motivated international coalition of stakeholders, who 
together mobilized the accumulating evidence on both smoking harm and 
the practices of the tobacco industry to achieve global political consensus 
on strengthened tobacco control. At the national level, the adoption of the 
Public Health (Alcohol) Act 2018 in Ireland is another example of a policy 
window being seized. This major piece of public health legislation was 
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possibly due to the convergence of increased public attention on the prob-
lem of alcohol-related harm in Ireland, institutional developments, and 
increasing political pressure, which opened a policy window that was 
capitalized upon by political leaders who were personally committed to 
reducing alcohol-related harm (Lesch & McCambridge, 2021).

The ongoing Brexit project will largely prevent the UK from capital-
izing on the policy window opened by the COVID-19 pandemic. Now that 
the emergency phase of the pandemic is over, Brexit-related issues have 
reasserted themselves. The UK is no longer an EU Member State, but the 
work to replace or change the policies and institutions that the UK partici-
pated in or benefited from during its membership will continue for some 
time, as will the efforts to plug the gaps left by the hastily negotiated Trade 
and Cooperation Agreement. With respect to health policy in particular, 
the agreement does not come close to replicating the benefits of EU mem-
bership. Moreover, it is clear that the changes to the UK’s approach to 
governance brought about by the Brexit project will persist. Governance 
in the UK has become more nationalist, more centralized, and more popu-
list, which will make it harder to engage in the multilevel, multisectoral 
collaboration and evidence-based policymaking that is necessary for 
meaningful public health reform.

7.4.1 � Brexit has caused practical distractions for 
health policymakers

Some have argued that the pandemic will shock the UK out of the turbu-
lent and tribal politics of Brexit (Leonard, 2020). Two changes in Prime 
Minister and three changes in Chancellor within a few months of Boris 
Johnson being ousted as Prime Minister by his own MPs suggests that UK 
politics is still turbulent. The substance of Liz Truss’ successful campaign 
to replace Boris Johnson as Prime Minister — radical conservatism, reas-
sertion of nationalist and isolationist ideas, and the not-so-subtle sugges-
tion that Boris Johnson had been “stabbed in the back” — suggests that 
UK politics is also still tribal. So too do the multiple threatened rebellions 
by a group of MPs on the Conservative right against Rishi Sunak’s flag-
ship policy to send migrants crossing the English Channel in small boats 
to Rwanda, on the basis that the implementing legislation was not extreme 
enough. Experiences from elsewhere demonstrate that political instability 
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will not provide the conditions in which effective public health reform can 
be easily achieved (Hamdan et al., 2003; Edwards et al., 2022; Wise & 
Darmstadt, 2016). While the political instability prevailing in the UK is 
not the result of conflict or deep corruption, it is similarly a departure 
from a state of predictable and reliable governance. In such circumstances, 
it is difficult to generate the political will to engage in reform projects that 
are complex, multisector, and long-term (Cohen, 2022), which is certainly 
true for the reforms that UK healthcare and public health structures 
require after COVID-19.

The obsession with “taking advantage of the freedoms of Brexit” has 
distracted policymakers from thinking about public health reform issues 
logically. Indeed, it was reported that the goals which the government set 
for PHE in spring 2019 were topped by Brexit and did not even include 
pandemic preparedness (Vize, 2020). It has also created the unnecessary 
task of reinventing public health protections that were provided by EU 
membership. In early 2022, the government published a report called The 
Benefits of Brexit, which alleges that the government can now do more in 
tobacco, alcohol, and obesity policy than it could while an EU Member 
State. On the contrary, EU tobacco policy is already very advanced, and 
Member States can adopt strong alcohol control and obesity prevention 
policies under EU law, even though the EU’s own alcohol and obesity 
policy is not extensive. In some respects the UK was already going beyond 
the EU’s efforts on alcohol and obesity while a Member State. The report 
also discusses the UK’s Global Health Insurance Card (GHIC), a new 
initiative to replace the protections once offered by the European Health 
Insurance Card (EHIC). Since most UK citizens obtaining healthcare 
abroad would do so within the EU, the GHIC seems to be a lesser replace-
ment for the EHIC, something which is underlined by the fact that the UK 
has felt the need to trademark and “market” the GHIC, which is not yet 
accepted in many countries outside the EU. The efforts to better or replace 
public health policies that already existed while an EU Member State are 
diverting the UK government’s health policy capacity away from improv-
ing the UK’s deficient communicable disease preparedness. The report 
says nothing about the fact that the UK government must also now 
develop regulatory functions once performed by EU agencies, such as the 
European Centre for Disease Control, European Medicines Agency, and 
European Food Safety Authority.
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The pursuit of Brexit has also resulted in the removal of established 
health protections in a number of areas. Food safety standards have been 
relaxed to facilitate trade deals with other countries that have weaker stan-
dards. Occupational health and safety standards in the haulage industry 
have been relaxed in an effort to reverse the workforce losses caused by 
Brexit. There will likely be more regression in the health protection 
enjoyed by UK citizens in the coming years, including in the area of com-
municable disease protection. At a time when the UK government should 
be thinking of how to improve communicable disease policy, the pressures 
of Brexit may well force a reversal of some of these protections.

Finally, it is now evident that Brexit has directly contributed to the cost-
of-living and economic crises (Middleton, 2022), which cannot be a positive 
development for health policy. Research conducted by the Centre for 
European Reform has found that the UK’s Gross Domestic Product at the 
end of 2021 was 5.2% smaller than a modeled UK that never left the EU, 
which equates to £31bn in lost GDP (Springford, 2022). Of course it is 
impossible to say with certainty how much of this, if any, would or could 
have been spent on improving healthcare and public health services. 
However, if the proportion of UK GDP that was spent on health in 2021 —  
11.9% — is applied to the figure of £31bn, then it is at least plausible to 
suggest that £3.7bn could have been spent on health but now cannot.

7.4.2 � Brexit has caused a governance ideology not 
conducive to public health reform

As Jarman and colleagues explain, the absence of a written constitution 
and a dominant executive permits “constitutional casualism” in the UK 
(Jarman et  al., 2020). To enable the pursuit of a hard Brexit, Boris 
Johnson’s government altered several of the prevailing characteristics of 
UK governance. These alterations will be difficult to undo while British 
politics remains tribal and turbulent.

Power was consolidated within the central government and in particu-
lar in the Prime Minister’s Office. This facilitated several policy decisions 
on COVID-19 that were not only bad COVID-19 policy but which may 
have lasting implications upon the capacity for public health reform in the 
UK. The response to the failed contact tracing program was to unilaterally 



	 b5349    Public Policy Challenges in Rethinking Public Health6"×9"�

	 The United Kingdom	   189

abolish PHE, which was responsible for public health delivery in England, 
and replace it with two other bodies. These — the UKHSA and the 
OHID — are less independent than PHE and were designed in haste with-
out adequate consultation. It is clear to all observers that the abolition of 
PHE was an uninformed scapegoating exercise that would have been 
unimaginable before the Brexit-driven centralization of power. The new 
institutions will need time to establish their identities and methods of 
working. This will evidently prevent them from focusing as fully  
as possible on efforts to improve the UK’s communicable disease 
preparedness.

Government decision-making also became populist. Several COVID-19  
policy decisions were taken because they appealed to the sentiments of 
many within the population but were simply contrary to the weight of 
evidence. An excellent example is the Eat Out to Help Out scheme, spear-
headed by Chancellor Rishi Sunak. This scheme subsidized restaurant 
bills as part of a strategy to move quickly away from the unpopular lock-
down when COVID-19 cases declined in the summer of 2020, using poli-
cies that boosted public mood and injected cash into the hospitality sector 
(Bale, 2023). However, the scheme predictably led to a significant number 
of new COVID-19 cases (Fetzer, 2022). Its economic impact was marginal 
and short lived (González-Pampillón et  al., 2022), and it also had the 
effect of widening social inequality (Power et al., 2020).

The greater impact though of Brexit-inspired populism will be the 
weakening of public health reform capacity. To counter the market- 
crashing impact of Liz Truss’s 2022 mini-budget of unfunded tax cuts and 
energy subsidies, as well as the larger deficit in public finances exacer-
bated by the impact of Brexit, Chancellor Jeremy Hunt declared that all 
government departments would have to find significant cost savings. This 
inevitably means a reduction in health spending, at a time when govern-
ments should be increasing health spending to increase the resilience and 
capacity of the public health and healthcare systems.

The UK government’s shift toward populism has also shifted it away 
from evidence-based policymaking. While an exclusive focus on science 
will lead to public health policy that is insensitive to often equally impor-
tant competing policy imperatives (Bylund & Packard, 2021), public 
health policy should be firmly based in scientific evidence, especially 
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during a public health emergency. While Boris Johnson’s government 
declared (at least initially) that they were “following the science”, in real-
ity they often ignored expert advice, especially if the advice was perceived 
to come from “the establishment”. During the pandemic, this resulted in 
some poor policy choices. At the start of the pandemic, the government 
ignored the early evidence from other jurisdictions about the spread of the 
virus, and the resulting delay in introducing lockdown led to an enormous 
first wave of disease. The government also ignored advice from SAGE in 
September 2020 to impose a short lockdown and revise the existing tiered 
system of restrictions. The justification was that “science was divided” 
and a “balanced judgement” was required — a thinly veiled statement that 
“following the science” was now less important than keeping the popula-
tion on side (Wardman, 2020). The result was a heavy second wave of 
disease. The government’s public distain for expert advice could be even 
more harmful though in the long term. Research has found that areas of 
the UK that voted most heavily for Brexit tended to suffer the heaviest 
death rates from COVID-19, suggesting that embracing the populist nar-
rative of Brexit encouraged a rejection of advice from the public health 
authorities (Phalippou & Wu, 2023). This is particularly concerning 
because these areas of heaviest death rates also tended to be the more 
socioeconomically deprived parts of the UK. The implication from this 
research is that promoting a rejection of “establishment” advice will have 
the effect of widening health inequities, which are already wide in the UK.

The UK government has also turned toward isolationist policies and 
was particularly keen to avoid the perception that it relied upon external 
powers in its COVID-19 response. This led to the government ignoring the 
data from other countries that experienced high rates of infection before 
the UK, ignoring WHO advice to implement a solid test and trace system, 
and refusing to join the EU’s PPE procurement scheme. It also led to 
rushed regulatory approval for the Oxford-AstraZenica COVID-19 vac-
cine, a decision that provided a short-lived opportunity to proclaim a 
British-made success story, but ultimately resulted in a series of medical 
and political controversies that led to the vaccine being used far less in the 
UK than was intended (Walsh, 2022). The greatest impact of Brexit-
induced isolationism will be felt in the longer term. The overriding lesson 
of the COVID-19 pandemic was that international collaboration is 



	 b5349    Public Policy Challenges in Rethinking Public Health6"×9"�

	 The United Kingdom	   191

essential to managing a disease spreading freely across national borders. 
Of course, the UK government was part of a group of nations which spear-
headed the initiation of discussions for a new global pandemic prepared-
ness treaty (WHO, 2023). However, the UK’s new isolationist approach 
will work against efforts to learn that collaborative lesson. The declining 
attractiveness of the UK as a destination for non-British health care pro-
fessionals, who do not feel welcome within the country (Milner et  al., 
2021), will prevent the UK from attracting the best overseas talent. Taking 
an even wider view, the UK is now disconnected from EU research institu-
tions and organizations, and the increased difficulty in accessing UK 
research in health will weaken the overall ability of Europe to respond to 
public health threats in the future (Hervey et al., 2021). Given the cross-
border nature of communicable disease threats, this will also put the UK 
in a weaker position.

7.4.3 � Post-Brexit options for public health reform

It is clear that uncertainties created by the upheaval to legal frameworks 
following Brexit were detrimental to the UK’s COVID-19 response spe-
cifically (Dayan, 2020) and will be detrimental to future public health 
work in general (Dayan et al., 2020). It is furthermore clear that leaving 
the EU single market will reduce the government’s economic power, 
which will make it even harder to take the (expensive) action necessary to 
reduce the UK’s widening health inequalities (McCarey, 2021). Moreover, 
it is clear that Brexit will not just affect UK public health policy directly 
but will have indirect impacts through weakening public health capacity 
outside the UK (Hervey et al., 2021).

What is now crucial for the public health community, including 
researchers of public health law, to address, is how the development of 
public health policy in the UK as a non-EU Member State can best 
improve the protection of public health. The public health community in 
the UK began considering these issues immediately after the Brexit refer-
endum (Middleton & Weiss, 2016), and leading figures in UK public 
health called then for Brexit to represent an opportunity to evolve and 
improve the UK’s public health work (Crisp et al., 2016). In particular, 
attention focused on headline policies that the UK would have to 
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redevelop post-Brexit, such as its trade policy: the Faculty of Public 
Health released its own vision of a “healthy” trade policy for the UK 
(Faculty of Public Health, 2019), as have various researchers (Freund & 
Springmann, 2021; van Schalkwyk et al., 2021).

However, nobody who is experienced in the public health field has 
called for a wholesale reinvention of the public health protections that 
have developed in the UK throughout its decades as an EU Member State. 
As explored in the section earlier, this is precisely what the UK govern-
ment seems determined to do. Some of the options proposed as necessi-
tated by Brexit, such as the UK Global Health Insurance Card, are a waste 
of time and resource that could have been spent advancing public health 
protections rather than replacing ones that UK nationals already enjoyed 
when they were EU citizens. Some of the proposed options, such as 
changes to food safety standards (Merrick, 2022), may lower the levels of 
public health protection that the UK population enjoyed while the UK 
was a Member State and obliged to implement EU food safety standards. 
This is all the more concerning given reports that the UK Food Safety 
Authority are not close to being ready to replace EU law with UK alterna-
tives that will protect health to the same level (Gonçalves, 2023). 
Moreover, it is clear that the much touted regulatory agility that Brexit 
would allegedly bring has largely not resulted in better public health out-
comes for the UK, and indeed the withdrawal of the UK from EU regula-
tory bodies may leave the UK dangerously exposed in some respects. For 
example, the UKHSA has not replicated the capacity of the European 
Centre for Disease Control to provide early warning of further novel 
infectious diseases and likely never will (Solomon, 2019; Topping, 2020). 
Moreover, the Medicines and Healthcare products Regulatory Agency 
has not been able to approve as many new medicines as the European 
Medicines Agency (McCarey, 2022). On the other hand, some of the 
options proposed, such as stronger legislation to tackle obesity, will 
increase levels of public health protection. However, strong non- 
communicable disease policies have always been possible within the lim-
its of EU law (Alemanno & Garde, 2015) — leaving the EU will not 
change this. Another such proposal is the extension of alcohol minimum 
unit pricing to the rest of the UK, following its adoption in Scotland 
(Middleton & Weiss, 2016). However, this is something that was 
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prevented in England by intensive alcohol industry lobbying, not the 
application of EU law.

Brexit does not completely wreck the prospects for public health 
development in the UK. Although it will be very difficult to conceive of a 
novel UK institution or process that could improve upon the protections 
enjoyed as an EU Member State, there are several options open to the UK 
government to maintain cooperation with EU institutions and agencies, thus 
preserving an existing level of health protection. One of the most important 
is the deal to secure access for UK researchers to the EU’s Horizon research 
funding program. The importance of properly funding public health research 
was starkly illustrated during the COVID-19 pandemic — the development 
of safe and effective vaccines would have been impossible without signifi-
cant investment in research. The UK has thankfully taken the opportunity to 
maintain access to the multibillion euro Horizon funding program. This is 
welcome, after the protracted and destabilizing brinkmanship the UK 
employed during negotiations (Sample, 2023). It would be impossible for 
the UK to replicate the hugely significant level of funding which UK-based 
researchers have traditionally won from the Horizon program, and the loss 
of this funding would undoubtedly damage the ability of UK researchers to 
advance the frontiers of public health knowledge in the manner for which 
they have until now been renowned. Even now the deal is closed, the dam-
age may already have been done (Sample, 2023), with the collapse in 
research funding from Europe to the UK in the aftermath of Brexit driving 
many leading researchers from the UK and eroding trust in the govern-
ment’s ability to secure the future of the UK research industry. Indeed, com-
ments by the UK’s Secretary of State for Science to the effect that the UK 
can do without EU research funding have been rightly called out as short-
sighted and dangerous (Nature Editors, 2023).

Whatever proposals are taken forward, the post-Brexit public health 
landscape in the UK will present challenges for their successful imple-
mentation. For example, the proliferation of bodies, organizations, and 
stakeholders that have claimed input into post-Brexit public health  
decision-making, such as the Brexit Health Alliance and the UK Alliance 
for International Health Policy (NHS Confederation, 2023), will risk mak-
ing the decision-making process more convoluted. Stakeholder input into 
decision-making is of course essential for effective and legitimate public 
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health work, and certainly a plurality of suggestions for post-Brexit public 
health development should be seen as positive. However, a greater range 
of visions inevitably means that deciding upon the most appropriate will 
become a more complex and even more politicized task. Moreover, the 
politics of the Brexit campaign has more generally eroded trust in UK 
institutions and in the politicians which design and run them. Any signifi-
cant institutional or system reform requires buy-in not just from stake-
holders but also from the general public.

7.5 � Conclusion

It is somewhat difficult to draw useful conclusions for the future of public 
health in the UK when the political landscape is still quite volatile. The 
latest Prime Minister at the time of writing, Rishi Sunak, appears to have 
brought some stability to the top of UK politics, although this has not 
necessarily watered down the shift toward populist governance. With a 
change in government to the Labour Party, many of the concerns relating 
to populist policymaking may diminish, although the practical legacy of 
both Brexit and the disastrous pandemic response will remain. It is diffi-
cult to draw inspiration from elsewhere — the context of the UK’s entry 
and exit from the COVID-19 pandemic was uniquely conditioned by 
Brexit, and the UK government has for a while been in the position of 
having to make unprecedented decision after unprecedented decision. 
However, there are some reasons for optimism. The UK public health 
community of practitioners, academics, and political leaders is resilient 
and outward-looking — this community will continue to provide a critical 
appraisal of government policy and will continue to work to understand 
the implications of doing public health work in post-COVID-19 and post-
Brexit Britain.

References

Abrams, D., et  al. (2021). Public Perceptions of UK and Local Government 
Communication about COVID-19. Manchester: Belong Network. https://
www.belongnetwork.co.uk/wp-content/uploads/2021/08/Belong_Public 
Perceptions_paper_V5.pdf.

https://www.belongnetwork.co.uk/wp-content/uploads/2021/08/Belong_PublicPerceptions_paper_V5.pdf
https://www.belongnetwork.co.uk/wp-content/uploads/2021/08/Belong_PublicPerceptions_paper_V5.pdf
https://www.belongnetwork.co.uk/wp-content/uploads/2021/08/Belong_PublicPerceptions_paper_V5.pdf


	 b5349    Public Policy Challenges in Rethinking Public Health6"×9"�

	 The United Kingdom	   195

Alemanno, A. and Garde, A. (2015). Regulating Lifestyle Risks: The EU, 
Alcohol, Tobacco and Unhealthy Diets. Cambridge: Cambridge University 
Press.

Amri, M. and Logan, D. (2021). Policy responses to COVID-19 present a window 
of opportunity for a paradigm shift in global health policy: An application  
of the multiple streams framework as a heuristic. Global Public Health, 
16(8–9), 1187–1197.

Association of Directors of Public Health (2021). Statement: Responding to the 
launch of the Office for Health Promotion. London: Association of Directors 
of Public Health. https://www.adph.org.uk/2021/03/statement-responding- 
to-the-launch-of-the-office-for-health-promotion/.

Auener, S., et  al. (2020). COVID-19: A window of opportunity for positive 
healthcare reforms. International Journal of Health Policy and Management, 
9(10), 419–422.

Bale, T. (2023). Populists and the pandemic: How populists around the world 
responded to COVID-19. In N. Ringe and L. Rennó (Eds.), The United 
Kingdom: The Pandemic and the Tale of Two Populist Parties (pp. 68–78). 
Oxon: Routledge.

Baraniuk, C. (2021). Covid-19: How the UK vaccine rollout delivered success, so 
far. BMJ, 372, n421.

Bonner, A. (ed.). (2020). Local Authorities and the Social Determinants of 
Health. Oxford: Oxford University Press.

Bowsher, G., et  al. (2020). A health intelligence framework for pandemic 
response: Lessons from the UK experience of COVID-19. Health Security, 
435, 435–443.

Brewer, M. and Gardiner, L. (2020). The initial impact of COVID-19 and policy 
responses on household incomes. Oxford Review of Economic Policy, 36(S1), 
187–199.

Brewer, M. and Tasseva, I. (2021). Did the UK policy response to Covid-19 pro-
tect household incomes? Journal Econ Inequal, 19, 433–458.

Buck, D., et  al., (2018). A Vision for Population Health: Towards a Healthier 
Future London: Kings Fund.

Buck, D. (2021). A qualified success: A personal reflection on the passing of 
Public Health England. kingsfund.org.uk, 5 August.

Buck, D. (2022). The office for health improvement and disparities: One year on. 
kingsfund.org.uk. 13 October.

Bylund, P. and Packard, M. (2021). Separation of power and expertise: Evidence 
of the tyranny of experts in Sweden’s COVID-19 responses. Southern 
Economic Journal, 87(4), 1300–1319.

https://www.adph.org.uk/2021/03/statement-responding-to-the-launch-of-the-office-for-health-promotion/
https://www.adph.org.uk/2021/03/statement-responding-to-the-launch-of-the-office-for-health-promotion/
http://kingsfund.org.uk
http://kingsfund.org.uk


	 b5349    Public Policy Challenges in Rethinking Public Health� 6"×9"

196 	  O. Bartlett

Cairney, P. (2021a). The UK government’s COVID-19 policy: Assessing  
evidence-informed policy analysis in real time. British Politics, 16, 90–116.

Cairney, P. (2021b). The UK government’s COVID-19 policy: What does “guided 
by the science” mean in practice? Frontiers in Political Science, 3. doi.org/ 
10.3389/fpos.2021.624068.

Cairney, P. and Wellstead, A. (2021). COVID-19: Effective policymaking depends 
on trust in experts, politicians, and the public. PDP, 4(1). doi.org/10.1080/ 
25741292.2020.1837466.

Cameron-Blake, E., et al. (2020). Variation in the response to COVID-19 across 
the four nations of the United Kingdom. BSG Working Paper Series, No. 35.

Cohen, N. (2022). Public administration reform and political will in cases of 
political instability: Insights from the Israeli experience. Public Policy 
Administration, doi.org/10.1177/09520767221076059.

Colfer, B. (2020). Herd-immunity across intangible borders: Public policy 
responses to COVID-19 in Ireland and the UK. European Policy Analysis, 6, 
203–225.

Cormacain, R. (2020). Keeping Covid-19 emergency legislation socially distant 
from ordinary legislation: Principles for the structure of emergency legisla-
tion. Theory and Practice of Legislation, 8(3), 245–265.

Crisp, N. et  al. (2016). Manifesto for a healthy and health-creating society. 
Lancet, 388(10062), E24–E27.

Cushion, S., et al. (2020). Different lockdown dules in the four nations are con-
fusing the public. LSE COVID 19 Blog, 22 May.

Dagnall, N., et al. (2020). Bridging the gap between UK government strategic 
narratives and public opinion/behavior: Lessons from COVID-19. Frontiers 
in Communication, 5, doi.org/10.3389/fcomm.2020.00071.

Dayan, M. (2020). How Will Brexit Affect the UK’s Response to Coronavirus? 
London: Nuffield Trust.

Dayan, M., et al. (2020). Understanding the Impact of Brexit on Health in the UK. 
London: Nuffield Trust.

Dean, H., et al. (2013). From theory to action: Applying social determinants of 
health to public health practice. Public Health Reports, 128(Suppl 3), 1–4.

de Camargo, C. (2022). The postcode lottery of safety: COVID-19 guidance and 
shortages of personal protective equipment (PPE) for UK police officers. 
Police Journal, 95(3), 537–561.

Diamond, P. and Laffin, M. (2022). The United Kingdom and the pandemic: 
Problems of central control and coordination. Local Government Studies, 
48(2), 211–231.

http://doi.org/10.3389/fpos.2021.624068
http://doi.org/10.3389/fpos.2021.624068
http://doi.org/10.1080/25741292.2020.1837466
http://doi.org/10.1080/25741292.2020.1837466
http://doi.org/10.1177/09520767221076059
http://doi.org/10.3389/fcomm.2020.00071


	 b5349    Public Policy Challenges in Rethinking Public Health6"×9"�

	 The United Kingdom	   197

Dyer, C. (2021). Covid-19: Hancock’s failure to publish contracts was unlawful. 
BMJ, 372(n511). DOI: 10.1136/bmj.n511.

Edwards, L., et  al. (2022). An assessment of the Libyan baccalaureate  
nursing education during political turmoil. Public Health Nursing, 39(4), 
831–838.

Faculty of Public Health (2019). Negotiating a ‘Healthy’ Trade Policy for the UK. 
London: Faculty of Public Health.

Fancourt, D. (2020). The Cummings effect: Politics, trust, and behaviours during 
the COVID-19 pandemic. Lancet, 396(10249), 464–465.

Fetzer, T. (2022). Subsidising the spread of COVID-19: Evidence from the  
UK’S eat-out-to-help-out scheme. The Economic Journal, 132(643), 
1200–1217.

Freedman, L. (2020). Scientific advice at a time of emergency. SAGE and  
Covid-19. The Political Quarterly, 91(3), 514–522.

Freund, F. and Springmann, M. (2021). Policy analysis indicates health-sensitive 
trade and subsidy reforms are needed in the UK to avoid adverse dietary 
health impacts post-Brexit. Nature Food, 2(7), 502–508.

Frowde, R., et al. (2020). Fail to prepare and you prepare to fail: The human rights 
consequences of the UK government’s inaction during the COVID-19 pan-
demic. Asian Bioethics Review, 12(4), 459–480.

Glencross, A. (2020). The importance of health security in post-Brexit EU-UK 
relations. European View, 19(2), 172–179.

Gonçalves, M. (2023). Food safety at ‘huge risk’ as EU laws set to expire. thegro-
cer.co.uk, 3 February.
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Chapter 8

The European Union

Scott L. Greer

8.1 � Introduction

The European Union is fundamentally unlike the other polities discussed 
in this book, and its surprising public health response to the COVID-19 
virus reflects this difference in its advances and its limitations. Specifying 
the nature of the EU is a theoretical challenge, since while it is clearly not 
a nation-state, there are various theoretically productive and unproductive 
ways to frame it, i.e. to ask what it is a case of (Ragin, 1992). Accordingly, 
there are endless debates, some productive, some pettifogging, about 
whether it should be called supranational, international, federal, confed-
eral, unique, or something else. These decisions about framing can have 
consequences. For example, viewing the EU as a federation and compar-
ing it to Canada or Australia makes it look like an unusual federation with 
strong legal and weak fiscal and execution powers (Greer, 2020), while 
viewing it as a regional international organization and comparing it to 
ASEAN or the African Union make it a strikingly successful case of inte-
gration (Greer et al., 2022a). Whatever else it resembles, it is not like its 
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member states, for what it does is not what a state does, and many states 
do not do what it does (Dehousse, 1994). Whether that changes is a long-
term question.

The confusion grows from the fact that the EU combines features of 
different regimes in a manner that is probably unique. It is a voluntary 
arrangement that pools the sovereignty of 27 member states to a varying 
degree in various policy areas. As Brexit showed, departure is possible but 
not a good idea for the departing country. The EU has an extraordinarily 
strong legal system, with member state courts not just enforcing but 
actively developing EU law in a dialog across legal systems of the conti-
nent (Kelemen, 2019). Notably, this legal system is often far harder on 
barriers to trade within the EU than the legal system of established federa-
tions, such as Australia, Canada, or the US (Matthijs et al., 2019; Parsons 
& Springer, 2018). It has strong policy capacity across its institutions, 
including the European Parliament, but very little implementing capacity. 
Even some of its most powerful policy tools such as the medicines autho-
rization regime or agricultural policy turn out to work primarily through 
member state agencies and ministries (Hauray, 2013). Its workforce is, by 
the standards of member states or even their larger local governments, 
trivial (and much of its total head count are translators).

Furthermore, and perhaps in contradiction to the impression one might 
have that political activity on the continent revolves around seeking EU 
grants or European Investment Bank loans, its budget (around 1% of EU 
GDP) is far from the share of GDP member states spend on healthcare, let 
alone the public sector in general. As discussed in the following, it had very 
limited debt-raising powers. The result is that it cannot and does not redis-
tribute effectively or even provide effective insurance to its member states. 
That would take far more money, and debt issuance powers, than it has in 
2023. It should not be surprising, therefore, that the EU has wider eco-
nomic disparities between its states than any rich federation, or that there 
has been little evidence of economic convergence for nearly two decades.

On the other hand, it is deeply involved in the financial and fiscal 
architecture of the continent through its powerful and (by design) demo-
cratically unaccountable central bank, the ECB, which has, in concert with 
member central banks, overturned governments and effectively forced 
entire countries into receivership. It has a remarkably intrusive and 
ambitious fiscal surveillance regime that tries to compensate for the 
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EU’s trivial fiscal stabilization abilities by forcing member states to avoid 
deficits and bubbles (Greer & Jarman, 2016, 2018). Finally, it has large 
investment bank resources which can support investments outside the 
obvious decisions in the EU budget.

This makes the EU an intriguing combination of clear formal  
strength, clear formal weakness, and informal strength. Clear formal 
strength: its legal system above all, but also specific powers in areas such 
as trade and animal health. Clear formal weakness: its lack of a serious 
budget, territorial redistribution, or implementation capacity, but also the 
endless challenges of implementing any policy in a coherent way across 
27 countries and legal systems. Informal strength: in many areas the EU 
and its agencies such as the European Food Safety Authority or the 
European Medicines Agency provide a default technical standard for deci-
sions and structure regulatory networks that are often influential world-
wide. Countries such as Norway or Switzerland, which are very clearly not 
member states, implement EU policy and explicitly work to shape it; a 
putatively non-coercive EU is a major actor in coordinating border secu-
rity, notably through its Frontex agency and even military expeditions, and 
EU policy advice which seems to have no teeth at all can have more 
impact than EU policy that is supposedly obligatory.

Public health contains all these contradictions and perhaps showcases 
them particularly well. The EU has many powers which clearly contribute 
to avoidable morbidity and mortality, notably in animal health and food 
safety, environmental health, occupational health and safety, and con-
sumer protection. It has fewer powers with any clear identification as 
public health; the treaty section called “Public health” has one article, 168 
TFEU, and that article is an omnium gatherum of ways treaty language can 
limit EU action. It had, in 2019, one public health agency as such, the 
European Centre for Disease Prevention and Control (ECDC), primarily 
focused on dissemination of data and capacity-building. The EU has next 
to no formal powers over healthcare systems, though its extensive market-
making powers have erected a legal edifice that regulates access to health-
care services and important elements of healthcare policy, such as the 
regulation of medicines, devices, and professionals. It is therefore possible 
to look at the EU from a strictly institutional perspective and see almost 
no public health powers since Article 168 and an agency or two make up 
a very small quota of power. It is also possible to look at the EU from a 
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broader regulatory perspective and see an enormous contribution to public 
health improvement from its environmental, labor, occupational health 
and safety, and consumer protection regimes. And it is possible to focus 
more on its contribution to healthcare, via courts’ application of internal 
market law and endless attempts to institutionalize austerity, and see a 
force that is hostile to health.

The EU, in spring 2020, did not look like a polity likely to become a 
major health policy actor. The phrase “European Health Union” seemed 
so ambitious as to be naive. By September 2020, a European Health Union 
was an explicit goal of the institutions, one backed up by policies that 
would have been hard to imagine a year earlier. This chapter is about why 
that happened and what lessons we might draw.

8.2 � Public Health Responses

The EU’s response to COVID-19 can perhaps be best understood in light 
of its multiple faces (Greer, 2014). Its first face, explicit public health 
policy, was its least important. Article 168 is tightly constraining, the 
Health Program’ was being eliminated (“mainstreamed”) in 2020, and the 
only statutory agency grounded in Article 168, the ECDC, was small and 
had limited and largely soft power. The real sources of power over health 
policies and outcomes in the EU had been elsewhere, particularly in the 
second face of EU health policies: the policies by which the EU can affect 
health but whose politics and legal bases are elsewhere. These second-face 
policies include pharmaceutical regulation, healthcare workforce regula-
tion (framed as a question of professional regulation), investment in 
healthcare systems through loans and regional aid, environmental regula-
tion, food safety regulation, and workplace health and safety regulation. 
The third face is fiscal governance: the fiscal surveillance regime that the 
EU operates, vetting member state budgets and budgetary priorities and 
often making very detailed recommendations to member states that in 
some cases are theoretically backed by a fine. This regime, justified by the 
argument that member state profligacy endangered the Eurozone in 2010, 
attempts to institutionalize austerity and is accordingly under constant and 
often effective attack from opponents of austerity.
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In other words, the EU had three faces but none were ideally posi-
tioned to face COVID-19. The first face was relevant but, by design, not 
very important. Despite ECDC’s work during the pandemic, it had 
extremely limited technical resources and guidance for member states, 
which often looked elsewhere for international and scientific advice. The 
second face, the management and regulation of the internal market, has 
easily been the source of the EU’s biggest effects on health policies and 
outcomes, but again it was not immediately relevant to combatting the 
pandemic. It was, rather, important in fending off or legalizing member 
state actions taken in the pandemic that endangered the unity and consis-
tency of the EU internal market. This meant everything from working 
against blockages on transfer of personal protective equipment (PPE) to 
ensuring quick evaluation of vaccines and therapeutics to relaxing rules on 
state aid as member states bailed out companies, such as airlines. In par-
ticular, the Council adopted Recommendations to limit border controls 
(partly in response to ECDC arguments that they did no good) and, even 
more clearly, developing the European Digital Certificate which, from 
July 2021, allowed member states to issue widely accepted digital certifi-
cates that the holder was unlikely to spread the disease (Deruelle, 2022). 
This system was adopted, and recognized, by countries outside the EU and 
provided an especially stark contrast to the impractical US alternative of 
small pieces of cardboard. Preserving the internal market and its law in a 
2020 wave of national egotism and panic was no easy task, but it did not 
directly address the pandemic or its economic consequences.

Finally, the third face of austerity and fiscal surveillance was irrele-
vant, though it is almost certain that the austerity agenda of which it was 
part had weakened southern and central European health systems that 
were about to be overwhelmed by illness. Member states recognized its 
irrelevance by invoking the “general escape clause,” which effectively 
suspended the surveillance process; when the fiscal surveillance system 
returned to the health politics agenda, it was in a very different context 
(described as follows).

The EU’s response was substantially in the first face, explicit health 
policies, and it was big. Perhaps the most important element of its 
response in terms of health outcomes was the decision to adopt joint 
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advance purchase agreements for vaccines. By early 2021, the EU had 
signed agreements with six vaccine manufacturers. The advance purchase 
agreements and their results produced some controversies. The UK, which 
had opted out of the EU arrangements, and other rich non-EU countries, 
such as the United States and Australia, had signed agreements which 
gave them earlier access to vaccines. The European approach focused, 
more than those countries, on price and liability. That focus slowed nego-
tiations and meant countries willing to pay more and write weaker liability 
rules into contracts with the pharmaceutical companies were ahead of it in 
the companies’ priorities. Notably, the EU ended up in legal action with 
AstraZeneca after the company did not deliver the promised number of 
doses in time.

The vaccine acquisition program can be seen as a major success, espe-
cially from the point of view of the smaller and poorer member states, 
which would have had difficulties in securing either a good price or prior-
ity from the companies. The large European market meant that it was pos-
sible to negotiate both rapid delivery and a relatively low price. The public 
image of the EU’s vaccine purchasing approach was not so positive, how-
ever. This is in part because of a correct public understanding that the EU 
member states were not receiving vaccines as quickly as a few other coun-
tries, for all that the AstraZeneca problem was eventually solved by a huge 
purchase of mRNA vaccines from Pfizer that were probably better vac-
cines as well. It is also in part because of the well-known blame avoidance 
strategy of member state governments, which tried to shift blame for local 
problems onto “Europe.” Slow vaccine distribution was a problem in a 
number of member states, and blaming Europe was an attractive political 
strategy. The result, however, is that what looks like a broadly successful 
European action is not universally perceived as such. This gap between 
qualified but real policy success and a memory of bad headlines means 
that the shape of future EU vaccines production and acquisition policies is 
unclear and will depend on whether its benefits (particularly to smaller 
countries) and the expertise that the Commission acquired in the procure-
ment balance out the vague bad taste it left many voters and political elites.

The key movement in EU broader health politics, especially by the 
standards of EU health politics to date, came at the European Council 
meeting on June 17–21, 2020. Formally, the European Council, which 
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unites heads of government, has long had a weak position. The EU’s for-
mal structures attribute the Council’s decision-making powers to the par-
ticular ministers who meet in particular formations (such as health and 
social policy or economic and financial affairs). Informally, European 
Council meetings are crucial because they are the venues in which 
national heads of government decide what issues they prioritize and what 
policies they want. Given that heads of government tend to also speak for 
governments and legislative majorities in their member states, their meet-
ings tend to predict (and influence) political decisions further down the 
line and their communiques are taken as decisions that the Commission 
and other institutions will implement.

The highlight of the June 2020 Council meeting, later turned into 
Commission proposals and legislation, was the decision to substantially 
increase the resources dedicated to health, in particular health emergen-
cies preparation and response. The Commission would later dub the whole 
package the “European Health Union.” The Health Programme, a small 
funding vehicle run by DG SANTE, had been performing the time- 
honored role of developing a constituency for EU health policy action and 
evidence to inform it. The Juncker Commission, backed by a Council with 
a majority of governments of the right, had successfully zeroed it out in 
proposals for the next 7-year budget (MFF), instead “mainstreaming” it 
into larger funding programs. June 2020 reversed that, renaming it 
Europe4Health and massively increasing its budget. The policy and politi-
cal impact of any grant-making program will take time to emerge, as they 
cumulate out of individual decisions which reveal the sustainable priori-
ties of the Commission in its implementation, but it could be an epochal 
change in the composition, resources, and focus of the European Union 
health policy community.

The EU’s quantitative change in its public health policies was so dra-
matic as to be effectively qualitative. The tiny Health Programme budget 
increased by almost 20 times as it was transformed into the EU4Health 
Program. It is never clear when a quantitative, parametric, change 
becomes a qualitative, policy, change, but a nearly twentyfold increase in 
budget seems like it might be above the threshold.

Member states also agreed to improve European capacity in public 
health surveillance and response, building resources such as expertise, 
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networks, and data systems to complement money. The ECDC, which was 
regarded as performing well, received additional powers and resources. 
The Council also agreed to create a new “agency,” Health Emergency and 
Response Agency (HERA) charged with pandemic preparedness and 
preparedness for more general health threats. HERA’s birth and develop-
ment were more confused, with expectations ranging from a European 
equivalent to the US Biomedical Advanced Research and Development 
Authority (BARDA) through to a division of the Commission used pri-
marily as a purchasing vehicle (a good guide to the debate is Anderson 
et  al., 2021). HERA’s legal status, activities, and budget all remained 
uncertain years after the decision to create it, and as the pandemic receded 
in policymakers’ minds the likelihood that it would become anything like 
BARDA also receded.

RescEU, finally, is not part of EU health policy. It is legally and orga-
nizationally part of civil protection, an oddly configured area that substan-
tially grew from the outside in as externally focused disaster response 
organizations began to acquire roles within the EU. RescEU, which is the 
key element of implementation of the civil protection system, began in 
2019 and is essentially a co-financing scheme with member states designed 
to expand Europe-wide access to key resources for disasters as well as 
deploy surge capacity, such as medical experts or firefighting equipment. 
Member states were slow to activate it in the egotism of spring 2020, and 
it did not have much relevant material at that time anyway, but the June 
2020 Council meeting supported a vast expansion of its budget. The EU 
will have substantially better stockpiles of equipment for health emergency 
response through the end of the 2020s. It is a different question whether its 
budgeting and policy process, and member state partners, will remain 
committed to the upkeep and maintenance of the stockpiles as the time 
comes for their renewal and COVID-19 fades from political memory.

Externally, the EU took what was probably the obvious, if somewhat 
cynical, approach for a rich major power and chose to participate in the 
WHO’s COVID-19 Vaccines Global Access (COVAX) scheme as a donor 
rather than purchasing through COVAX. COVAX had launched with what 
might have been excessive optimism as a global platform for vaccine 
research support, acquisition, and development, but it rapidly turned into 
a more conventional example of global health politics in which richer 
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countries, especially the EU, donated money as much as they chose while 
looking after themselves and total COVAX resources came in at far less 
than was necessary to achieve its goals, let alone global vaccination. The 
EU was more generous and far more committed to multilateral action than 
most other rich powers or its member states, but that is a very low com-
parative standard.

8.3 � Shortcomings and Weaknesses

There are two major kinds of shortcomings that differ in the measuring-
stick that we use. One is about the shortcomings of the EU response, 
measured by the kinds of policy instruments that are available to it or that 
it could quickly develop in the pandemic. The EU response was recogniz-
ably focused, based on key instruments it uses to act in many areas: money 
(EU4Health, the Pharmaceuticals Strategy, and RescEU); resources, 
meaning expertise grounded in agencies and their networks of member 
state agencies (ECDC and HERA); and, a relative novelty, joint purchas-
ing of vaccines. The EU can provide (co-)funding to promote certain 
goals, strengthen experts and their advice, and, it turns out, negotiate com-
mercial agreements on behalf of its member states.

In each case, it is possible to identify clear shortcomings by the stan-
dards of European Union legal and real competence as of the start of 2020. 
In particular, HERA, much heralded, was established within the 
Commission, without its own statute, and proceeded to drift as principals 
argued about what it should actually do. The advance purchasing of vac-
cines did not just absorb blame for member state failures. It did show 
some signs that the EU’s expertise in strategy for such purchases was 
flawed. In particular, the focus on company liability and price made some 
political sense in a political system suspicious of pharmaceutical compa-
nies but slowed the purchases and might have contributed to bad relations 
with companies and supply problems. The EU is formidably good at its 
processes, but high-level purchasing negotiations with big companies, 
under pressure, at the behest of more than two dozen governments, went 
beyond what its processes could do and produced unsurprising problems.

Finally, it is possible that from the perspective of the 2030s, the EU and 
its leaders will deserve criticism for failure to commit. Personal protective 
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equipment such as masks was in some cases purchased in 2009 as a panic 
response to pandemic influenza, expired in 2019, and was destroyed with-
out being replaced just as people started to fall ill in Wuhan. Public health 
preparedness decisions have a strong element of a panic-neglect cycle in 
any political system, and while the EU’s 7-year budget window creates 
more certainty about public health expenditures than in most countries, it 
also means that there is a chance that public health expenditures, and the 
resources they enabled, will be slashed in the 2028–2035 MFF.

The other is about the shortcomings of the EU as it is currently con-
stituted. If we regard the EU as a regional international organization and 
compare it to ASEAN or the African Union, it entered the pandemic as a 
tremendously effective organization and left it still stronger (Greer et al., 
2022a). No regional international organization comes close to its combi-
nation of breadth and effectiveness (Panke & Stapel, 2020). If we regard 
the EU as a federation comparable to Canada, Germany, or the US, then 
it looks dangerously imbalanced, with a powerful law-state that enables 
particular kinds of capitalism and public policy but nowhere near the 
resources to compensate people and member states which lose in the mar-
kets and policy environments configured by the EU (Matthijs et al., 2019; 
Greer, 2020; Höpner & Schäfer, 2010; Scharpf, 2010).

This reluctance to redistribute seems obvious when we consider that 
the EU, by the standards of federations, is both extravagantly multina-
tional and faced with enormous territorial inequalities. The gap between 
GDP in rich and poor member states of the EU is larger than the gap in 
GDP between, for example, U.S. states, Canadian provinces, or even the 
states in highly unequal countries, such as Argentina and Brazil. It is hard 
to imagine just how much money would have to be redistributed within 
the Union if it were to attain the goals of equalization instituted in rich 
federations, even ones with major interregional inequalities. It is also 
probably pointless, given the difficulty the EU has faced in far smaller 
redistributive measures (many of which are better conceptualized as side 
payments than as real attempts to equalize). While internal heterogeneity 
within countries limits the usefulness of country-level comparative data 
on territorial inequality, it is clear that convergence has been real, though 
huge disparities remain, and since around 2008 the evidence for ongoing 
convergence is very unclear (Makszin, 2020; Makszin et  al., 2020). 



	 b5349    Public Policy Challenges in Rethinking Public Health6"×9"�

	 The European Union	   213

The COVID-19 pandemic and policy responses have exacerbated inequal-
ities (Dauderstädt, 2022; Ladi & Tsarouhas, 2020; Ceron & Palermo, 
2022). In the absence of the hoped-for convergence in the size and com-
position of its economies, the EU continues to have internal strains that its 
fiscal policies can by no means correct.

What the EU can do, and what has happened in other federations, is 
some mutualization of debt (Ladi & Tsarouhas, 2020). One of the weak-
est elements of the whole EU system is the extent to which it does not 
fulfill the insurance function that most established federations do. If a 
member state falls into trouble, there is no reliable mechanism to cushion 
blows to it or its citizens. Ad hoc and very expensive responses to debt 
crises after 2008 were not institutionalized, with member states and 
European institutions preferring to take the perspective of creditor states 
and tighten ex ante rules on governments. This is not a very credible 
policy for a variety of reasons, notably that the relationship between fiscal 
policy and deficits tends to be overshadowed by economic cycles (Ladi & 
Tsarouhas, 2014), that the economic theories embedded in the fiscal gov-
ernance system might not have been very robust, and implementation of 
the process was predictably undermined by people whose interests were 
opposed to austerity or simply wished to use the momentum of fiscal 
governance to pursue their own goals (Greer & Brooks, 2020; Verdun & 
Vanhercke, 2022).

8.4 � External Shocks and Policy Change

COVID-19 was in many respects a crisis foretold, whether in policy plans, 
a best-selling board game, or blockbuster movies. Experts and policy 
entrepreneurs in communicable disease control had long been arguing that 
the EU, with its abilities to pool resources and its large, disease-prone 
common market, should have a stronger ability to influence and coordi-
nate member states in a crisis, though other experts had insisted that the 
WHO and member state agencies should be the key actors.

Crises, often crises foretold, are nonetheless a big part of the history 
and characteristic explanation of European integration. Most scholars 
rightly explain these odd combinations by examining the politics of 
the  EU — the way its institutions and characteristic agenda — setting 
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mechanisms put some issues on different planes than others, and the way 
the apparatus of EU law, including member state as well as EU courts, 
creates issues and diffuses policies. But the EU and its relatively unusual 
pattern of self-sustaining integration also come about because the EU is 
necessary to so many key policymakers, a scholarly thesis called “neo-
functionalism” in the EU studies literature. In part, the global geopolitical 
environment is one in which smaller countries have cause to band together 
if their voices are to be heard and their economies strong. In part, as well, 
integration has its own self-sustaining momentum; once an area is inte-
grated, it is costly to disintegrate it, as the EU showed in the first months 
of the pandemic, and it has a way of spreading into over other areas and 
creating pressure for further integration. In short, the EU becomes more 
and more needed.

That is why, with almost absurd regularity, crises hitting the EU lead 
to opinion pieces in English-language media about the threats of EU dis-
sension and breakup and then so often lead to further integration. The 
2008 financial crisis and the 2010–2012 debt crisis both led to further 
integration and in fact a new treaty (Jones et al., 2015). The 2015 migra-
tion “crisis” led to strong EU borders policy and an executive border 
guard/coast guard agency with more than twenty thousand staff, whose 
existence suggests some rethinking of the characterization of the EU as a 
civilian power might be useful (Micinski, 2022). And the COVID-19 cri-
sis, also initially framed by many as a carnival of national egotism and 
conflict, also led to more integration. The EU has become more politically 
contested across Europe, but that dissensus can be quite permissive of 
further integration (Greer & Löblovà, 2016).

These arguments, more or less explicitly, and with a wide variety of 
empirical supports from different policy areas and case studies, argue that 
integration in the EU tends to advance when member states are suddenly 
faced with an inescapably large problem for most or all of them; can see 
no other way out; and face costs of inaction or regression that are unset-
tlingly large. A commonsensical neofunctionalist perspective suggests 
that this is when they realize the scale of their integration and shared 
problems and, forced to end their denial, update their governance to match 
their problems. Two decades of argument about whether the integration of 
the EU was best characterized by intergovernmentalism (the EU as the 
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tool of member states) and neofunctionalism (which made integration at 
least partially endogenous) sputtered out as scholars realized that member 
states are powerful but also trapped by a logic of endogenous integration, 
often visible in exogenous shocks, that is unacceptably costly to exit. The 
EU is, frequently, the mechanism for the “rescue of the nation-state” when 
it faces problems it cannot manage alone (Milward, 1999). The experience 
of Greece, whose government stayed in the Eurozone despite a ruinous 
price, showed how greatly policymakers can estimate the costs of disinte-
gration. The experience of Brexit then showed just how immense those 
costs can indeed be (Greer & Laible, 2020).

Perhaps the best current take on these issues is the “failing forward” 
thesis (Jones et al., 2015). In this analysis, the EU does have endogenous 
pressures toward integration, e.g. a common currency creates pressure for 
common fiscal policies of some sort, or shared borders create pressure for 
shared border rules and enforcement. But member states, eager to main-
tain both their sovereignty and their preference for consensus in the 
Council, respond with the least possible integration relative to the size of 
this crisis. These half-measures are both integrative, moving the EU for-
ward, and responsive to failure while also creating the conditions for new 
failures and crises.

The EU and health literature is no exception to the crisis-driven nar-
rative, in which crises make salient the problems of integration that will 
often be answered with further integration (Greer et al., 2021). There is a 
longstanding trope of writing about the European Union, and in particular 
the development of its public health policies, which frames them as crisis 
response. Thus, the development of EU public health policy in any narra-
tive will feature the variant Creutzfeldt-Jakob disease (vCJD) (“mad 
cow”) crisis of the 1990s, and perhaps the French tainted blood scandal, 
the 2001 anthrax attacks in the US, 2003, SARS outbreak, the 2009 swine 
flu pandemic, and, of course, COVID-19. This can be a usefully simplify-
ing way to write, and done with a great deal of sophistication and knowl-
edge, it can be productive (Riddervold et  al., 2021), but it has some 
serious theoretical challenges. The definition of a crisis is far from fixed 
or easy to apply even in mid-crisis (were all of these perceived as crises at 
the time or afterwards, and by whom?). “Crisis” is, in fact, one of the 
many elements of politics that are socially constructed by political and 
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media actors that might be very strategic. It is also a problem to argue that 
crises produce action, since some do not, or to argue that the action takes 
a particular direction, such as further European integration (Lefkofridi & 
Schmitter, 2015; Brooks et al., 2023). Member states might buy into (or 
once again think of and accept) the logic of integration and opt to fail 
forward, but they also might not, or they might come up with integrative 
but counterproductive policies. They also might fail to fail forward 
enough, in a sense — not do enough to even address their current crisis 
(Cox & Kurzer, 2024). To sum up, the existence of a crisis can be hard to 
determine, responses might not result, and the fact or nature of the crisis 
might not point to a particular resolution.

Perhaps the way out is simply to accept the probabilistic nature of 
policy. Member state governments are powerful and jealous of their sov-
ereignty, but they also have a long-established consciousness of their 
shared fate, and so they will often take an integrative step forward when 
confronted with clear evidence that their existing level of shared gover-
nance is not adequate to manage their shared problems. Their step might 
be integrative but wrong-headed in the eyes of policy analysts, and almost 
certainly viewed as inadequate, but that sets up the conditions to fail for-
ward again. If this is the case, and it is the failing-forward hypothesis, 
then it might be fruitful to use Kingdon’s multiple-streams theory more 
often in order to understand how and why items get on the agenda, par-
ticularly the European Council agenda, and how problems come to be 
matched with solutions (Kingdon, 2003; Page, 2006; Princen, 2009; 
Greer, 2015).

8.5 � Futures of European Union Public Health Policy

The EU’s window of opportunity for major public health policy change 
closed in 2020, and the window for smaller changes (e.g. in the debates 
over exactly how HERA would work and what it would do) was largely 
closed by the end of 2022. As any good theory of agenda-setting would 
predict, the opportunity to make big changes in response to a crisis does 
not last long and in this case it is reasonable to argue that the big decisions 
were past, and the agenda moving on, by autumn 2020.
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But the EU’s institutional rhythm also locks in the effects of those 
changes for a predictable period of time. Much of what we have discussed 
by way of public health policy is changes in budgets and spending pro-
grams, and even capacities for e.g. ECDC or HERA are substantially 
driven by their budgetary support. In the EU, the key budget document is 
the Multiannual Financial Framework (MFF) for 2021–2028. The EU has 
what amounts to a 7-year budget cycle, setting the priorities and sums out 
for 7 years instead of setting annual budgets; these 7-year budgets, which 
are generally fulfilled, are the MFFs. The current MFF sets the EU budget 
for effectively that whole time frame and is the source for the numbers 
reported here; eventual spending will almost certainly match the MFF 
well.

This means that the EU faces a new, wholly endogenous, window of 
opportunity for policy change in about 2026–2027. The MFF structure 
means that it will be hard to cut back public health budgets or ambition in 
the EU over that time but also that there will come a defined moment of 
intense intergovernmental and interinstitutional bargaining during which 
public health budgets will be under close scrutiny. There is a well-known 
panic-neglect cycle of public health politics, a phenomenon well known 
for a long time but named by journalist Ed Yong before being adopted by 
everybody from scholars to think tanks to McKinsey (Yong, 2022). The 
regularity of the panic-neglect cycle suggests that, barring another major 
emergency, member states could be deep into the neglect phase of the 
cycle and the next MFF could endanger the EU public health commitment 
as well as enhance it. The result is that advocates of any particular EU 
public health have a defined period of time to build their supporting coali-
tions, prove their value, and convince the member states of the value of 
specific public health investments. The window of opportunity for big 
change has been closed for years, but the next MFF could be a reckoning 
for the whole project that was agreed in 2020.

8.6 � Conclusion

In 2019, I was part of a group that published the second edition of a guide 
to EU health policy at the end of the Juncker Commission (Greer et al., 
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2019). That Commission, dominated by politicians of the right, was broadly 
hostile to health policy as such and deemphasized consideration of health 
problems or health consequences of other policies. DG SANTE (the 
directorate-general for health within the Commission) itself was lucky to 
have survived into the new von der Leyen Commission, rescued mainly 
because an increasingly fragmented European Parliament had parties on the 
left which supported an EU public health role. But the Health Programme 
was being eliminated (“mainstreamed”), there was only one open legisla-
tive dossier and it was going nowhere (health technology assessment), civil 
society and policy forums were being abandoned, and Juncker’s Commission 
had openly entertained the idea of ceasing to have any positive health policy. 
We accordingly emphasized the second face of health policy, such as envi-
ronmental, consumer protection, and workplace law, because there had been 
so little new action on the first face of EU health policy and the third face 
was losing its ambition. Suggesting ways health advocates could make 
headway in consumer protection or workplace safety was a way to find 
health impact in the absence of an overt health policy.

In 2022, we had to publish a substantially revised edition (Greer et al., 
2022b). The quantitative changes to existing EU health policies, notably 
budgets, were so great as to look like a qualitative change in the nature of 
EU health policy. Quantity has a quality of its own, and increasing the 
health program budget, due to be zeroed out, or RescEU, by more than an 
order of magnitude makes each a different kind of a program. It is instruc-
tive, perhaps, to see what we had to do. A section on explicit EU public 
health, the core of the first face, expanded into its own section, not just 
because of the pandemic response but also because of, for example, a 
more explicit health policy role in medical devices regulation and food 
safety (Jarman et al., 2021). The other change, driven by practical edito-
rial considerations of chapter length but also EU political movements, was 
an increasing attention to EU global health policy, and the extent to which 
the pandemic, decisions about vaccine development and distribution 
worldwide, and other issues such as the Russian invasion of Ukraine and 
various migration “crises” had made clear the scale of the EU’s health 
impact; the EU was apparently thinking along the same lines and pub-
lished a global health strategy of its own in early 2023.
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Authors reflecting on the ever-increasing page counts of their books 
might not seem so interesting, but our practical problem of updating a 
primer reflected real changes. The EU is failing forward in health. It is 
therefore unsatisfying to many, but from the perspective of integration, it 
has taken a big step forward. It also has taken this step in a direction that 
many in public health institutions can approve, which is not the case for 
other major integrative steps, such as fiscal governance and migration pol-
icy. It has, in not just public health but also the creation of mutualized debt, 
potentially taken a baby step toward the kind of interregional insurance that 
every sustainable federation operates. It was, after all, impossible to pretend 
that profligacy was the cause of the pandemic or austerity the cure. Our 
local problem is perhaps an index of a real change in the EU, a quantitative 
change in some areas that is so big as to be qualitative and, maybe, prefigure 
an even bigger change in the direction of resembling a viable federation. 
The next key data point will probably be the budget negotiations in 2027.
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Chapter 9

Croatia and Slovenia

Tomislav Sokol

9.1 � Introduction

The COVID-19 pandemic has severely influenced public health systems 
across the entire world. The enormous strain it has placed on healthcare 
systems globally is obvious,1 including testing capacity; functioning of 
supply chains for personal protective equipment; specimen-collection 
swabs; supplies and equipment, including ventilators, for patients requir-
ing hospital care; and organization of vaccines and vaccinations (Guest 
et al., 2020, p. 1). The same holds true for Croatia and Slovenia, as is the 
case for other EU member states. This has resulted in a very complex set 
of public policy responses by the state authorities, influencing the organi-
zation and management of public health protection, but also all other 
aspects of peoples’ lives. In Croatia, more than 16,000 people died from 
COVID-19 by 2022 with more than one million cases reported (Government 
of the Republic of Croatia, 2022a), while in Slovenia, the number of 

1 On the impact of COVID-19 on healthcare systems in general, see, for example, (Chang 
et al., 2020, p. 1; Frawley et al., 2021; Haldane et al., 2021).
This is an open access book chapter published by World Scientific Publishing. It is 
distributed under the terms of the Creative Commons Attribution-NonCommercial 4.0  
(CC BY-NC) License. https://creativecommons.org/licenses/by-nc/4.0/
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deaths stands at more than 7,000, with the number of reported cases also 
exceeding one million (World Health Organisation (WHO), 2022).

This chapter analyzes the impact COVID-19 pandemic has had on the 
public health systems of these two countries and the lessons which can be 
learned from this development in terms of opportunities and obstacles to 
the reform of healthcare systems. It is divided into three parts. First, it 
presents a short description of the national healthcare systems in Croatia 
and Slovenia, with a special emphasis on organization, regulation (includ-
ing the special rules on public health crises), and coverage of the popula-
tion, followed by a description of policy and regulatory responses to the 
pandemic which were undertaken. The second part revolves around the 
identified shortcomings and points of contention related to the (public) 
response to COVID-19, especially in the regulation of decision-making 
powers and the role of healthcare providers (with a focus on primary care) 
and vaccination. Finally, the third part evaluates the opportunities and 
impediments to public health reform highlighted by COVID-19 and the 
measures undertaken to fight the pandemic.

9.2 � Public Health Responses to COVID-19

The Croatian healthcare system is regulated through acts enacted by the 
Croatian Parliament (Hrvatski Sabor) and statutory instruments enacted by 
the minister in charge of health (who also conducts supervision and moni-
toring), Health Insurance Institute of Croatia (HIIC), and other designated 
institutions. The protection of public health in Croatia is organized via a 
network of public health institutes, with the Croatian Institute of Public 
Health (CIPH) and 21 county institutes which are supervised and coordi-
nated by the CIPH. CIPH is responsible, inter alia, for the collection, 
analysis, and publication of epidemiological data and public health statis-
tics; health education; maintenance of health registers; and disease preven-
tion and control (Health Care Act, Official Gazette 100/18 to 147/20, art. 
130, 221). Every resident of Croatia is under a duty to acquire social 
insurance with the HIIC on one of the prescribed grounds (Compulsory 
Health Insurance Act, Official Gazette 80/13 to 98/19, art. 4, 7), which 
cover essentially 99% of the population (Džakula et  al., 2021, p.  119).  
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Healthcare delivery is organized through primary, secondary, and tertiary 
providers (Health Care Act, art. 29).

Primary healthcare is the first point of contact between an individual 
and the public healthcare system. Importantly, it fulfills a gate-keeping 
role for the secondary providers since access to secondary care is condi-
tional upon obtaining a referral from a primary healthcare provider. 
Primary healthcare consists predominantly of private providers who enter 
into contracts with the HIIC (Džakula et al., 2021, p. 25, 89). Secondary 
care providers in Croatia include primarily public providers like polyclin-
ics and general county hospitals who enter into contracts with the HIIC. 
More complex tertiary health treatments are provided by a small number 
of clinics, clinical hospitals, and clinical hospital centers owned by the 
state (Health Care Act, arts. 32–35; Džakula et al., 2021, p. 94). Finally, it 
is important to mention that a special body entitled Civil Protection 
Headquarters of the Republic of Croatia (Civil Protection Headquarters) 
is provided by the Civil Protection System Act (see Figure 9.1). It is estab-
lished by the Government which also determines its composition (Civil 
Protection System Act, Official Gazette 82/15 to 20/21, arts. 22–22a). It is 
composed of representatives of several ministries and state institutions 
and is headed by the minister in charge of interior (Ordinance on the 
Composition, Mode of Operation and Requirements for the Nomination 
of the Head, Deputy and Members of the Civil Protection Headquarters, 
Official Gazette 126/19, art. 2).2 During the pandemic, its mandate has 
been expanded to include adoption of compulsory decisions in response 
to the said public health threat, including those which limit fundamental 
rights like freedom of movement and assembly (Act on the Protection of 
the Population from Infectious Diseases, Official Gazette 79/07 to 143/21, 
art. 47).

The Slovenian healthcare system is regulated through acts enacted 
by  the Slovenian Parliament (Državni zbor Slovenije) and statutory 

2 According to the Ordinance, art. 4–5, local and regional headquarters are established by 
the local self-government and are subordinated to the national Headquarters in cases of 
emergencies, as prescribed by the Civil Protection System Act, art. 22a. On the legal nature 
of the Headquarters and its measures, see also Ofak (2021, pp. 465–467).
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instruments enacted by the minister in charge of health (who also con-
ducts supervision and monitoring), Health Insurance Institute of Slovenia 
(HIIS), and other designated institutions. Protection of public health in 
Slovenia is organized via a network of public health institutes, with the 
National Institute of Public Health of Slovenia (NIPH) and its nine 
regional units (see Figure 9.2). NIPH is responsible, inter alia, for surveil-
lance of communicable diseases, maintaining important health statistics 
databases, health education and disease prevention and control (Health 
Services Act, Official Gazette 9/92 to 196/21, art. 23a; Albreht et  al., 
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Figure 9.1.    Organization of public health in Croatia.
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2021, pp.  90–93). Prescribed categories of persons are socially insured  
ex lege, resulting in 99% of the population being covered (Health Care 
and Health Insurance Act, Official Gazette 9/92 to 43/22, art. 15; Albreht 
et  al., 2021, p.  147). Healthcare delivery is organized through primary, 
secondary, and tertiary providers (Health Services Act, art. 2). Primary 
healthcare is the first point of contact between an individual and the public 
healthcare system. As in Croatia, it fulfills a gate-keeping role for the 
secondary providers since access to secondary care is conditional upon 
obtaining a referral from a primary healthcare provider. Unlike in Croatia, 
the majority of primary care is provided by health centers owned by local 
communities (Albreht et al., 2021, p. xxiii, 19). Secondary care providers 
in Slovenia include primarily state-owned providers like hospitals who 
enter into contracts with the HIIS and more complex tertiary health 

SLOVENIA 

Government of the 
Republic of 

Slovenia

Ministry of Health 
(management of health 

system)

Ministry of Interior 
Affairs

(enforcement of 
government’s measures and 

policies)

Ministry of Foreign 
and European Affairs

(international 
agreements) 

Expert Group on 
COVID-19

(advisory role) 
until 2022

Regional units of 
National Institute 
of Public Health  

(disease prevention and 
control)

National Institute of 
Public Health

(disease prevention and 
control)

Expert Group on 
COVID-19 

(advisory role) 
from June 2022

Figure 9.2.    Organization of public health in Slovenia.
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treatments are provided by a small number of state-owned clinics and 
specialized institutions (Health Services Act, arts. 13–18; Albreht et al., 
2021, p. 16). The power to adopt compulsory decisions under pandemics, 
including the ones limiting fundamental rights and freedoms, has rested 
with the government since the beginning of the pandemic in 2020; before 
that it rested with the minister in charge of health (Communicable 
Diseases Act, Official Gazette 69/95 to 178/21, art. 39).

The Croatian Minister of Health declared the epidemic on the basis of 
the Act on the Protection of the Population from Infectious Diseases, 
art.  2., on March 11, 2020 (Decision on Declaring the Epidemic of 
Disease COVID-19 caused by virus SARS-CoV-2, March 11, 2020).3 
After that, a number of measures were adopted aimed at preventing and 
supressing the spread of COVID-19 by the Minister of Health (for exam-
ple, Decision on the Introduction of Quarantine, February 21, 2020) and 
(mainly) the Civil Protection Headquarters. In case of epidemics, the 
Headquarters is entitled, on the basis of the Act on the Protection of the 
Population from Infectious Diseases, art. 47 (as amended after the start of 
the epidemic in 2020), to adopt measures including, for example, estab-
lishment of quarantine; the ban on travel to countries in which there is an 
epidemic of a disease; the ban on the movement of persons or the restric-
tion of such movement in infected or directly endangered areas; the pro-
hibition or restriction of certain types of products; the prohibition of the 
use of equipment, facilities, and means of transport; the isolation of per-
sons in their own home or other appropriate spaces (self-isolation); com-
pulsory use of face-masks; and the prohibition or restriction of public 
gatherings as well as other special measures.

The said provision and the Civil Protection System Act, art. 22a were 
used to adopt, inter alia, the Decision on Limiting Social Gatherings, 
Retail, Services, Sporting and Cultural Events (Official Gazette 32/20), 
the Decision on the Ban on Leaving One’s Permanent Residence 
in  the  Republic of Croatia (Official Gazette 35/20), the Decision on 

3 This power has since, by the subsequent amendment of the Act on the Protection of the 
Population from Infectious Diseases, been transferred to the government (Act Amending 
the Act on the Protection of the Population from Infectious Diseases, Official Gazette 
47/20, art. 1).
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the  Necessary Measure of Compulsory Use of Face-masks or Medical 
Face-masks During the COVID-19 Epidemic (Official Gazette 80/20), the 
Decision on the Organization of Public Transport During the COVID-19 
Epidemic (Official Gazette 143/20), the Decision on the Temporary Ban 
on Crossing the Borders of the Republic of Croatia (Official Gazette 
32/20), and the Decision on the Working Hours and the Organization of 
Retail During the COVID-19 Epidemic (Official Gazette 51/20). The 
strongest restrictions were in force during spring of 2020, including the 
prohibition of public gatherings, limitation of freedom of movement, limi-
tation of the right to work, property rights, closure of bars and restaurants, 
and the like. After that, there were several new cycles of strengthening and 
relaxing restrictions, but these restrictions never reached the level of the 
ones imposed during the first wave. Additionally, compulsory use of the 
EU COVID Certificate was prescribed for certain sectors when admitting 
service recipients, including healthcare (Decision on the Introduction of 
Special Safety Measure of Compulsory Testing for Health Institutions, 
Companies Providing Health Services and Private Health Workers When 
Admitting Patients, Official Gazette 105/21). All restrictions, apart from 
the compulsory use of face-masks in healthcare and social welfare sectors, 
were revoked in spring of 2022 (Government of the Republic of Croatia, 
2022b). Some of the measures were challenged in front of the Constitutional 
Court, which is further analyzed in the following section.

In addition to restrictions, an important measure in the area of public 
health was obviously vaccination. The government did not opt for compul-
sory vaccination but left the decision on whether to get vaccinated or not 
to the citizens. The pressure which was exerted was related to the use of 
the EU COVID Certificate for certain categories of people, namely for 
those employed in state, public, and local administration (Decision on the 
Introduction of Special Safety Measure of Compulsory Testing for State, 
Local and Regional Officials, Persons Employed in Public Services, 
Companies and Institutions, Official Gazette 121/21) in November 
of  2021, meaning that people employed in public sector who had not 
received a vaccination or survived the disease needed to get tested two 
times a week when arriving at work. This measure was also revoked in the 
spring of 2022. As of July 23, 2022, 2,246,105 people were fully vacci-
nated (Government of the Republic of Croatia, 2022a).
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In terms of the organization of the healthcare system, COVID-19 
resulted in important temporary measures. Certain facilities were desig-
nated as COVID-19 facilities and special isolation units were created in 
several hospitals. At the same time, many elective procedures and tests 
were canceled, especially during periods when the inflow of new  
COVID-19 patients was the highest and access to all services apart from 
emergency treatments was severely reduced. The work of health profes-
sionals was also reorganized in a way that a large disparity arose between 
the workload of healthcare professionals treating COVID-19 patients and 
those who did not treat COVID-19 patients (Džakula et  al., 2022, 
pp. 459–461).

The government of Slovenia declared the pandemic and the end of 
the  pandemic several times. The first time was on the basis of the 
Communicable Diseases Act (art. 7), on March 12, 2020 (Order on the 
Declaration of the COVID-19 Epidemic in the Territory of the Republic of 
Slovenia, Official Gazette 19/20).4 It then adopted in the spring of 2020 
several measures to prevent and suppress the spread of COVID-19. This 
included the adoption, in March 2020, of the first Decision on the 
Temporary General Prohibition of Movement and Public Gathering in 
Public Places and Areas in the Republic of Slovenia (Official Gazette 
30/20), replaced by the Decision on the Temporary Prohibition of the 
Gathering of People at Public Meetings at Public Events and Other Events 
in Public Places in the Republic of Slovenia and Prohibition of Movement 
Outside the Municipalities (Official Gazette 38/20) and subsequent mea-
sures. Other measures like the Decision on the Temporary Prohibition of 
Offering and Selling Goods and Services to Consumers in the Republic of 
Slovenia (Official Gazette 25/20) were also adopted. The strongest restric-
tions were in force during spring of 2020, including the prohibition of 
public gatherings, limitation of freedom of movement, limitation of the 
right to work, property rights, closure of bars and restaurants, and so on. 
After that, there were several new cycles on strengthening and relaxing 
restrictions, but these restrictions never reached the level of the 
ones imposed during the first wave. All restrictions were revoked in the 
beginning of 2022 (Government of the Republic of Slovenia, 2022a) with 

4 The end of epidemic was, for the first time, declared in May 2020 (Decision on the 
Revocation of the COVID-19 Epidemic, Official Gazette 68/20).



	 b5349    Public Policy Challenges in Rethinking Public Health6"×9"�

	 Croatia and Slovenia	   231

an exception of use of face-masks in healthcare and social welfare sectors 
(Decision on the Temporary Measures for the Prevention and Control of 
Infectious Disease COVID-19, Official Gazette 68/22). Several of 
the  measures adopted were also deemed unconstitutional by the 
Constitutional Court of Slovenia, which are analyzed in more detail in the 
following section.

Another important measure in the area of public health was vaccina-
tion. The government did not opt for compulsory vaccination, similarly to 
Croatia, but left the decision on whether to get vaccinated or not to the citi-
zens. The pressure which was exerted concerned the use of the EU COVID 
Certificate for employed and self-employed persons. An additional pres-
sure was imposed on persons employed in state administration since it was 
prescribed that employees in the bodies of the state administration had to 
fulfill the recovered-vaccinated requirement to perform tasks at their 
workplace on the premises of the employer or on the premises of another 
body of the state administration (Decision on the Manners of Complying 
with the Recovered-Vaccinated-Tested Requirement to Contain the Spread 
of Infection with the SARS-CoV-2 Virus Official Gazette 147/21). This 
was also revoked in the first half of 2022. The provision of the said deci-
sion related to persons employed in state administration was also deemed 
unconstitutional, which is further analyzed in the following section. As of 
July 23, 2022, 1,205,608 people were fully vaccinated (WHO, 2022).

Relating to the organization of the healthcare system, the pandemic 
has resulted in the focus of the healthcare system on COVID-19 treatment, 
resulting in the suspension of many elective health services (Albreht et al., 
2021, p. 148). In the area of oncology, for instance, significant drops in 
first oncological referrals, first outpatient visits, mammograms, x-rays, 
and ultra-sounds during the beginning of the crisis in 2020 were reported, 
pointing to a delay in treatment and diagnosis of cancer for some patients 
during the COVID-19 epidemic in Slovenia (Zadnik et al., 2020, p. 334).

9.3 � Problems Related to the Public Health Responses 
to COVID-19

There has been substantial criticism (as well as legal challenges) regarding 
how the Croatian authorities have handled the COVID-19 epidemic. It has 
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been stated in the literature, for example, that “(A)lmost all decisions 
became politically influenced, and the interventions proposed by the 
experts were also considered political choices” and “information provided 
by national authorities became vague, unclear, and ambiguous, and more 
and more concerns were raised about the accuracy of official information 
and the accountability of national authorities. The resulting politicization 
of COVID-19, as well as politicians not being up to the task and putting 
their interests first, undermined public trust in public health advice and 
interventions” (Džakula et al., 2022, p. 461). The decision to relax mea-
sures in the summer of 2020 was stated to be the result of “the increasing 
public tensions arising from the restrictive measures and their negative 
effects on the economy, along with the upcoming tourist season” (Džakula 
et al., 2022, p. 459). It is true that measures in Croatia were relaxed in both 
summers of 2020 and 2021 which can be explained by declining numbers 
of infected persons but also the need to maintain the tourist season as a 
major source of state income. The explanation given by Prime Minister 
Plenković on several occasions has been that the government needs to bal-
ance public health considerations with economic and broader societal 
ones (Government of the Republic of Croatia, 2020a, 2020b). It is also 
important to note that the ruling majority decided to hold general elections 
at the beginning of July 2020 when the measures were relaxed, a few 
months before the constitutional end of the mandate. The ruling Croatian 
Democratic Union (HDZ) won 66 out of 151 seats and quickly formed a 
new ruling majority with the same center partners as before. The way it 
handled the epidemic in its initial stage (especially the relaxation of mea-
sures) definitely influenced the outcome, which can be seen from the fact 
that Minister of Health Vili Beroš, not well known to the public before the 
COVID-19 outbreak, won more preferential votes (35.678) than Prime 
Minister Plenković who is also the head of HDZ (State Electoral 
Commission of the Republic of Croatia, 2020).

There were several legal challenges against government measures in 
front of the Constitutional Court, primarily focused on the authority of the 
Civil Protection Headquarters to adopt measures restricting fundamental 
rights (to free movement, assembly, and so on) and the scope of these 
measures. The main question was whether the measures aimed at tackling 
COVID-19 should be based on art. 16 or art. 17 of the Constitution. 
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According to art. 16, freedoms and rights may only be restricted by law in 
order to protect the freedoms and rights of others, public morals, the legal 
order, and health with such restrictions having to be proportionate to the 
nature of the need for such restriction in each individual case. According 
to art. 17, individual constitutionally guaranteed rights and freedoms may 
be restricted, inter alia, in the event of a natural disaster, with the decision 
having to be made by a two-thirds majority of all Members of Parliament 
or, if the Parliament is unable to convene, at the proposal of the govern-
ment, by the President of the Republic. Hence, the application of art. 17 
would have meant that consent of the main opposition parties (dominated 
by the center-left) would have been required for adopting legislation relat-
ing to COVID-19. Since the President of the Republic also comes from a 
center-left political background, the potential inability to convene the 
Parliament would have also made opposition unavoidable in case of appli-
cation of art. 17.

Since the amendments to the relevant Civil Protection System Act and 
Act on the Protection of the Population from Infectious Diseases, 
giving  the Headquarters the power to make binding decisions related to 
COVID-19, were enacted on the basis of art. 16, these amendments were 
challenged and ultimately settled by the Constitutional Court. The Court 
stated that the Parliament may, in exercising its legislative power when 
restricting certain human rights and freedoms, act on the basis of two 
constitutional grounds, art. 16 and art. 17. The Court held that the decision 
on whether the public health measures to combat the COVID-19 epidemic 
will be taken either by the application of art. 16 or art. 17 is in the exclu-
sive domain of Parliament since the Constitution itself gave this alterna-
tive to Parliament as a legislative body. The Court thus stated that it is not 
authorized to order Parliament which of the two constitutional options to 
choose. Therefore, the fact that the impugned laws (and measures) were 
not enacted on the basis of art.17 did not in itself make those laws uncon-
stitutional. Furthermore, the Court held that decisions enacted by the 
Headquarters can be subject to Constitutional Court review because they 
represent “other regulations” prescribed by art. 125 of the Constitutions 
which are capable of being subject to that review (U-I-1372/2020, 
Constitutional Court of the Republic of Croatia, September 14, 2020). 
Several decisions made by the Headquarters were indeed challenged in 
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front of the Court, but the Court was generally reluctant to deem 
them  unconstitutional, with very few exceptions.5 The approach of the 
Constitutional Court was severely criticized by the President of the 
Republic who stated that the Court got scared and that it is a political body 
making political decisions (President of the Republic of Croatia, 2020).

Another problem visible in Croatia relating to COVID-19 concerns 
vaccination. As noted in the previous section, less than 60% of the entire 
population was vaccinated: one of the lowest percentages in the European 
Union (European Centre for Disease Prevention and Control, 2022). Even 
though there is a need for additional studies, some of the reasons high-
lighted by the studies already carried out show that the strongest reason 
for hesitation was perceived low danger of COVID-19 infection. It has 
been suggested in the literature that previous public communication about 
the dangers and the course of the pandemic has failed since a significant 
part of the population refused to accept the severity of the disease. Some 
of the reasons mentioned include “dissonant tones between different 
actors in the media and in the public about the suitability of epidemiologi-
cal measures and the need for vaccination. Public discourse also primarily 
emphasized certain groups as being vulnerable (older people and persons 
with existing health conditions). This may have contributed to the failure 
of previous public communication by constructing a low risk perception 
in certain social groups.” It has been stated that the narrative of emphasiz-
ing social solidarity (namely, toward the elderly) was not successful within 
certain social groups. Finally, distrust toward institutions and, to a large 
extent, scientists has also been mentioned as an important factor to be 
considered (Bagić et al., 2022, pp. 95–96).

5 For example, the Constitutional Court upheld the decision to prescribe compulsory use of 
EU COVID Certificate for persons employed in state, public, and local administration, 
with the exception of the provision which gave the higher education institutions the pos-
sibility to decide the opposite (U-II-7149/2021, Constitutional Court of the Republic of 
Croatia, February 15, 2022). Also, the Court found, post festum, the restriction of Sunday 
trading to be unconstitutional. See U-II-2379/2020, Constitutional Court of the Republic 
of Croatia, September 14, 2020. It was stated in the literature that the latter represents the 
“single significant finding of unconstitutionality” in the jurisprudence by the Court (Barić 
and Miloš, 2022, p. 444).
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Strong opposition to some of the public health measures was also vis-
ible within the healthcare system. That opposition was not necessarily 
caused by the measures themselves but had more to do with the role the 
authorities (Ministry of Health) envisaged for some of the actors within 
the system for implementation of the measures. This mainly applies to 
primary healthcare providers. A concrete example here is what arose at the 
beginning of 2022, when the Ministry of Health decided that rapid antigen 
tests would be accepted as proof of infection with SARS-CoV-2 virus and 
that the tests would be administered by all primary healthcare providers 
contracted by HIIC (Ministry of Health of the Republic of Croatia, 2022). 
This decision caused a strong backlash among the primary healthcare 
providers, whose representatives stated that they are overstretched, lacking 
resources to carry out such a task and that they have not received any 
instructions or organizational support from the Ministry (Croatian 
Television, 2022). When the testing began, there was a lot of organiza-
tional and technical problems with its implementation (NOVA TV, 2022). 
Also, it should be mentioned that a decision by the Ministry that primary 
care providers should promote and carry out vaccination among the 
elderly was challenged in front of the Constitutional Court. The decision 
by the Court is important since it clearly stated that private primary health-
care providers contracted by HIIC are under a duty to carry out tasks 
related to protection of public health in case of emergencies, like epidemics. 
The Court’s reasoning was based on art. 197 of the Health Care Act, which 
empowers the minister in charge of health to adopt extraordinary mea-
sures, including the ones relating to the organization of work of private 
primary healthcare providers who are contracted by HIIC. The decision of 
the Minister was finally upheld (U-II-6278/2021, Constitutional Court of 
the Republic of Croatia, April 12, 2022).

When one speaks of the scientific basis of the relevant decision-making, 
it should be noted that the decisions made during the pandemic were essen-
tially policy decisions which took into account various factors, including not 
just epidemiology and virology but also economy (addressed by Croatian 
Prime Minister Plenković in a statement cited above), public security, men-
tal health of the population, etc. Hence, there is no overwhelming authority 
of one scientific field or authority which has to be respected but different 
points of view which needed to be taken into account.



	 b5349    Public Policy Challenges in Rethinking Public Health� 6"×9"

236 	  T. Sokol

In Croatia, the crucial body within the system, the Civil Protection 
Headquarters, as noted earlier, consists of representatives of a wide array 
of state institutions, including the CIPH and the Croatian Institute of 
Emergency Medicine (Decision on the Nomination of a Member of the 
Civil Protection Headquarters, Official Gazette 37/20), which should rep-
resent the point of view of medical science within the process. All the 
decisions of the Headquarters have been published in the Official Gazette 
and the official website and regular press conferences were held. It is 
important to note that, at first, these decisions generally did not contain 
reasoning or explanation, which made it very hard to determine which 
scientific evidence was used by the Headquarters, especially when chang-
ing its practice by reversing previous decisions. However, this did change, 
as the Constitutional Court declared in December 2021 that the Civil 
Protection Headquarters decisions should contain reasoning, for the sake 
of transparency and especially to make sure that the principle of propor-
tionality is respected (U-I-5781/2021, Constitutional Court of the Republic 
of Croatia, December 21, 2021). Therefore, the decisions made since the 
start of 2022 contained reasoning, making the system much clearer and 
more transparent in terms of rationale used by the Headquarters. 
Importantly, the decisions now often contain references to the situation 
and practices in other European countries making it easier to make the 
relevant comparisons. A good example of a rather elaborate reasoning is 
the Decision on the Necessary Epidemiological Measure of Use of Face-
masks or Medical Face-masks (Official Gazette 44/22) which limited the 
categories of persons required to wear face-masks, by making references 
to the decisions already made in other EU member states (Belgium, 
Germany, and Scandinavian countries) and third countries (Israel and the 
UK), but also to the concrete numbers of vaccinated and newly infected 
persons. The evolving situation with the Omicron variant made it possible 
to change the practice and revoke many restrictions which were previously 
in force.

Another body created because of the pandemic is the Scientific 
Council of the Government, chaired by the Prime Minister. The Council, 
consisting of 15 members, was established in March 2020 on the basis of 
the Government of the Republic of Croatia Act (Official Gazette 150/11 to 
80/22, art. 23) to provide a forum for exchanging opinions between the 
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renowned scientists and the policymakers on the fight against COVID-19 
(Government of the Republic of Croatia, 2020c; Net, 2020). This body 
does not have power to adopt decisions or recommendations but has con-
tracted much public attention due to public statements by individual mem-
bers reflecting their different positions on the measures adopted against 
COVID-19. One member was removed from the Council after public 
speculations about his statements downplaying the benefits of vaccination 
and other disagreements with the majority of the Council members 
(Jutarnji list, 2021) and calling for public demonstration against the use of 
EU COVID Certificates (Index, 2021). Thus, it can be stated that the plu-
rality of opinions was allowed to a large degree but not to an extent which 
was considered to jeopardize public health and security.

As in Croatia, there has been considerable criticism of (and legal chal-
lenges to) the way in which Slovenian authorities have handled the 
COVID-19 epidemic. Those criticizing the center-right government, 
which took office in the beginning of the pandemic, were saying the gov-
ernment was tackling the epidemic wrongly and unsuccessfully by, for 
example, forcing people to receive vaccination and discriminating against 
persons who had not been vaccinated, as well as by introducing measures 
that, according to these persons, unduly restricted their fundamental 
rights. They particularly accused the government of “destroying democ-
racy and the rule of law and attacking independent journalism” (Flander, 
2022, p. 28). Additionally, they accused the government of “hate policies 
against ideological and political opponents, xenophobia and discrimina-
tion against refugees, corruption” (Flander, 2022, p. 28) and similar senti-
ments. The overall public pressure on the government relating to the 
direction in which the country was going was argued to have been a major 
factor in the ruling coalition’s electoral loss in 2022 (Washington Post, 
2022), where a newly formed Freedom Movement (GS) won and easily 
formed a new government (State Election Commission of the Republic of 
Slovenia, 2022).

One of the political battlegrounds was the jurisprudence of the 
Constitutional Court. The first important decision concerned the prohibi-
tion of movement outside the municipality of one’s permanent or tempo-
rary residence introduced in early 2020. In this early case, the Court 
upheld the measure, since it deemed it appropriate for achieving the 
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pursued objective because there existed the requisite probability that — 
according to the data available at the time of the adoption of the chal-
lenged measure — it could have contributed toward slowing down or 
reducing the spread of COVID-19, primarily by reducing the number of 
contacts between those persons living in areas with a higher number of 
infections and those persons living in areas with a lower number of infec-
tions. The Court also deemed it necessary for achieving its objective since 
previously adopted measures (like suspension of public transport and 
general prohibition of public gatherings) were not considered enough to 
prevent the spread of infection to such an extent that adequate healthcare 
could be provided to every COVID-19 patient. Finally, the Court con-
ducted a proportionality test stricto sensu and concluded that “the demon-
strated level of probability of a positive impact of the measure on the 
protection of human health and life outweighed the interference with 
the freedom of movement”. The fact that several exceptions to the prohibi-
tion were prescribed played an important role in the Court’s assessment 
(U-I-83/20, Constitutional Court of the Republic of Slovenia, August 
27, 2020).

After this initial period,6 the Constitutional Court has proven to be less 
supportive of the government’s legal arguments, especially related to the 
power of the government itself to adopt measures limiting fundamental 
rights in Slovenia, quite the opposite to the Croatian situation. The crucial 
decision was made in relation to the Communicable Diseases Act (art. 39 
par. 2 and 3) which empowered the government to restrict or prohibit the 
movement in infected or directly endangered areas and prohibit gathering 
of people in public places in order to prevent the introduction and spread 
of a communicable disease if the said objective cannot be accomplished 
by other measures prescribed by the Communicable Diseases Act. Several 
public health measures adopted by the government on the basis of the said 
provisions were also challenged (U-I-79/20, Constitutional Court of the 
Republic of Slovenia, May 13, 2021).

6 The Court also refused to suspend the implementation of a decision imposing a curfew 
(U-I-426/20, Constitutional Court of the Republic of Slovenia, December 21, 2020) until 
the final judgment was made.
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The Court first explained the main principles which needed to be 
taken into account when assessing the possibilities to empower govern-
ment to make decisions limiting fundamental rights. It stated that, when-
ever the legislature empowers the executive to adopt a statutory instrument 
implementing legislation, it must first by itself clearly prescribe the con-
tent that is to be the subject of the statutory instrument and determine the 
guidelines and framework for regulating the content in more detail by way 
of a statutory instrument. There can be no blanket empowerment of the 
executive, especially in cases dealing with fundamental rights. Thus, a 
general act which directly interferes with fundamental rights of an inde-
terminate number of individuals can only be enacted in a form of a law. In 
case of restrictions on free movement and the right of association and 
assembly of people in order to prevent the spread of a communicable dis-
ease, the legislature may exceptionally leave it to the executive to pre-
scribe measures by which these rights and freedoms are directly curtailed. 
However, the law must precisely determine the purpose of these measures 
(or the purpose must be clearly evident therefrom), the scope, admissible 
types and conditions concerning the restriction of the freedom of move-
ment and of the right of association and assembly and association, as well 
as contain other appropriate safeguards against the arbitrary restriction of 
fundamental human rights (U-I-79/20, Constitutional Court of the 
Republic of Slovenia, May 13, 2021).

According to the Court, the challenged provisions of the Communicable 
Diseases Act did not fulfill the aforementioned constitutional require-
ments, since they allowed the government to choose, in a discretionary 
manner, the scope, types, and duration of restrictions, which curtailed the 
freedom of movement of (possibly all) residents in the territory of 
Slovenia. The legislature also gives autonomy to the government

to freely assess, throughout the entire period while the threat of the spread 
of the communicable disease lasts, in which instances, for how long, and 
in how extensive an area in the state it will prohibit the gathering of people 
in those public places where, according to the Government’s assessment, 
there exists a heightened risk of spreading the communicable disease. The 
regulation also lacks safeguards that could limit the discretion of the 
Government, such as the duty to consult or cooperate with the expert com-
munity and to inform the public of the circumstances and opinions of 



	 b5349    Public Policy Challenges in Rethinking Public Health� 6"×9"

240 	  T. Sokol

experts that are important for deciding on such measures (U-I-79/20, 
Constitutional Court of the Republic of Slovenia, May 13, 2021).

On basis of these findings, the Court decided that the Communicable 
Diseases Act (art. 39 par. 2 and 3) was contrary to the constitution (arts. 
34 and 42) which prescribes that freedom of movement and the right of 
assembly and association may be limited by law and ordered that the leg-
islator prescribe new relevant rules within 2 months from the publication 
of its decision in the Official Gazette. At the same time, it decided that the 
unconstitutional provisions of the Communicable Diseases Act will con-
tinue to apply until the new provisions were adopted. The challenged 
government decisions were also deemed to be unconstitutional, but the 
government order declaring the epidemic was upheld (U-I-79/20, 
Constitutional Court of the Republic of Slovenia, May 13, 2021).7

As in Croatia, another problem visible in Slovenia relating to COVID-19 
concerned vaccination. As noted in the previous section, less than 60% of 
the entire population is vaccinated, one of the lowest percentages in the 
European Union and just a fraction (two percentage points) above the 
Croatian result (European Centre for Disease Prevention and Control, 
2022). Even though there is a necessity for additional studies, some of the 
reasons highlighted by the studies already carried out show that important 
factors of hesitation related to the unstable political situation, trust in 
alternative sources, and distrust in government while, obviously, people 
having more trust in official sources of information, such as public health 
institutions and experts, are more likely to get vaccinated. Additionally, 
open-ended question responses which were part of the relevant studies 
revealed that vaccine hesitancy was clearly related to the rapid vaccine 
development and scepticism about its efficiency (Petravić et  al., 2021, 
pp. 12–13).

7 The Court made a similar decision relating to Communicable Diseases Act, art. 39 par. 4 
(U-I-155/20, Constitutional Court of the Republic of Slovenia, October 7, 2021) where it 
held that the legislature granted the government a very wide margin of discretion to deter-
mine the scope and duration of the measures by which business activities and the right to 
work of all natural persons and legal entities on the territory of the Slovenia can be cur-
tailed. Thus, Communicable Diseases Act, art. 39 par. 4 was contrary to the freedom of 
work determined by Constitution art. 49 and free economic initiative prescribed by 
Constitution art. 74.
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It should be noted that the Constitutional Court held that a decision on 
the use of EU COVID Certificates related to persons employed in state 
administration was not adopted in conformity with the statutory require-
ments prescribed by the Communicable Diseases Act art. 22 (in conjunc-
tion with art. 25) for the determination of the vaccination of employees. 
Thus, it decided that the said provisions of the decision were inconsistent 
with the Constitution (art. 120) which prescribes that the executive per-
forms its activities on the basis of the Constitution and laws. The Court 
did not decide whether the assessed measure — had it been adopted on the 
correct statutory basis — would have been constitutionally admissible 
from the viewpoint of the principle of proportionality and the principle of 
equality before the law (U-I-210/21, Constitutional Court of the Republic 
of Slovenia, November 29, 2021), for some patients during the COVID-19 
epidemic in Slovenia (Zadnik et al., 2020, p. 334).

As far as the use of scientific evidence goes, it should be emphasized 
that decisions on fighting COVID-19 were made by the government itself 
and published in the Official Gazette. These decisions generally did not 
contain reasoning, which made it very hard to determine which scientific 
evidence was used by the government, especially when changing its prac-
tice by reversing previous decisions. According to the Government of the 
Republic of Slovenia Act (Official Gazette 24/05 to 163/22, art. 20), the 
National Security Council is the government’s body responsible for mak-
ing recommendations and proposals to the government in times of crises 
but also for coordination. However, at the start of the pandemic, coordina-
tion and decision-making were completely taken over by the government 
itself. Additionally, to advise the government, the Expert Group on 
COVID-19 was created, consisting of scientific and medical experts  
providing advice to the relevant institutions on issues related to the 
COVID-19 pandemic; “their task was to prepare opinions and proposals for 
measures, verify their justification, and propose their application, amend-
ment or abolition, and monitor the epidemiological situation” (Government 
of the Republic of Slovenia, 2020a; Ferlin et al., 2021, pp. 640–641).8

After revocation of the restrictions in 2022, the Expert Group was 
dissolved and its roles taken over by NIPH, which created its own expert 

8 Before that, the Crisis Management Headquarters was created but abolished just a few 
days later (Government of the Republic of Slovenia, 2020b; Ferlin et al., 2021, p. 647).
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group in June 2022 (Government of the Republic of Slovenia, 2022b; 
NIPH, 2022). Interestingly enough, the NIPH expert group is now led by 
an  epidemiologist who left the government’s Expert Group two times 
because its decisions were, in his opinion, contrary to NIPH opinion and 
standard epidemiological protocols (Dnevnik, 2022). It can be stated that 
the system in Slovenia during the pandemic tried to achieve clarity and 
transparency in terms of scientific evidence used and the rationale behind 
the decisions made by the government mostly by communicating with the 
general public through press conferences and other channels such as Twitter 
(Ferlin et al., 2021, pp. 642–643) and the official website. It has been stated 
in the literature, however, that the restrictive measures have been communi-
cated in an authoritarian way, supported with little research to prove their 
effectiveness (Ferlin et  al., 2021, p.  645). Centralization of the decision-
making within the government itself and lack of publicly transparent rea-
soning also made it hard to challenge the decisions in a public debate.

9.4 � Barriers and Opportunities for Public  
Health Reform

COVID-19 has highlighted the need to conduct public healthcare system 
reforms in several areas in Croatia and Slovenia, as demonstrated in the 
previous section. Organization and management of the system are particu-
larly important, especially in the need to better utilize capacities in the 
hospital sector; increase the number of healthcare professionals (espe-
cially in the primary sector), better balance their workload, improve the 
salary system and other working conditions; tackle long waiting times in 
certain areas (Albreht et  al., 2021, pp.  127–142; Džakula et  al., 2021, 
pp. 107–116; U-I-25/22, Constitutional Court of the Republic of Slovenia, 
March 17, 2022) which have increased during the pandemic due to the 
focus of the healthcare systems on COVID-19; and strengthen digitaliza-
tion. In areas like digitalization, the pandemic has resulted in strong 
improvements (even though the processes started before COVID-19; see, 
for example, Albreht et  al., 2021, pp.  78–80; Džakula et  al., 2021, 
pp.  136), but there are many other problems which remain in need of 
improvement. Problems of defining the role of primary care professionals 
(especially private) during public health crisis, coupled with their overall 
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deficit (Ombudsman of the Republic of Croatia, 2022) and the general 
fragmentation and underutilization of primary care services (Džakula 
et al., 2021, p. 135), have been particularly visible in Croatia.

COVID-19 has highlighted important obstacles to healthcare system 
reform. One of those is the tendency to maintain the status quo within the 
system. This was clearly visible during the confrontation between the 
Croatian Minister of Health and associations of primary care providers 
over their duties within the overall effort of fighting the epidemic. It can 
be argued that this conflict was exacerbated by the fact that most primary 
care providers in Croatia are private ones contracted by the HIIC, which 
makes them less answerable to orders from the government and more 
inclined to resist additional workload caused by public health crisis. The 
opposition to reform was even more clearly manifested by the fact that the 
representatives of the primary care providers’ association left (in June 
2022) the working group established by the Minister of Health to prepare 
healthcare reform. The reason they stated for such behavior was that they 
opposed the proposal of the Ministry to impose additional obligations on 
primary care providers of working in emergency medicine (Index, 2022).

The overall political situation in both Croatia and Slovenia can be 
seen also as not contributing to the reform potential. First, both countries 
employ a proportional system of electing members of national parliaments 
(Act on the Election of Members of Croatian Parliament, Official Gazette 
116/99 to 98/19, art. 38; National Assembly Election Act, Official Gazette 
44/92 to 29/21, art. 92), and such system tends to lead to broad and frag-
mented coalitions (like in Slovenia during the previous center-right gov-
ernment), which may be less able to change existing policies and initiate 
reforms than single-party governments (Carey & Hix, 2011, p. 384).

Additionally, the opposition parties especially in Croatia failed to 
come up with concrete systematic proposals of overall healthcare reform 
but were almost completely focused on criticizing the government’s public 
health responses to COVID-19, trying to gain political points by advocat-
ing more freedom and less restrictive measures. For example, the most 
important public health initiative of the opposition in Croatia was the sup-
port of some opposition parties for conducting a referendum on the public 
health responses to COVID-19. It should be mentioned here that the 
Croatian Parliament may call a referendum on any proposal to amend the 
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Constitution of the Republic of Croatia, act, or any other issue falling 
within its purview. The Croatian Parliament must call a referendum when 
so requested by 10% of the total electorate of the Republic of Croatia 
(Constitution of the Republic of Croatia, Official Gazette 56/90 to 5/14, 
art. 87). An initiative was organized in 2021 to gather support to obtain 
two objectives. The first initiative aimed at amending art. 17 of the 
Constitution so that the pandemic was added to the list of emergencies 
during which the Parliament, by a two-thirds majority of all Members, 
could restrict constitutionally guaranteed rights and freedoms. The second 
initiative aimed at amending the Act on the Protection of the Population 
from Infectious Diseases (art. 47) in a way that the decisions on limiting 
fundamental rights would have to be made only by the Parliament, instead 
of the Civil Protection Headquarters. It can be seen here that the main goal 
of the opposition was to take away the power to make policy decisions 
from the government (and ruling coalition). The Constitutional Court 
declared both initiatives to be unconstitutional. Relating to the first one, 
the Court concluded that the proposed referendum question itself was not 
in line with the objective of always requiring a two-thirds majority of all 
Members of Parliament for restricting constitutionally guaranteed rights 
and freedoms since the way in which it was phrased would still allow the 
ruling majority to choose whether art. 16 or art. 17 would be used. Thus, 
the question was contrary to the rule of law prescribed by art. 3. of the 
Constitution (U-VIIR-2180/2022, Constitutional Court of the Republic of 
Croatia, May 16, 2022). Relating to the second initiative, the Court held 
that it aimed at transferring inherently executive powers to the legislature, 
thereby violating the division of powers prescribed by the Constitution 
and the principle of the rule of law (U-VIIR-2181/2022, Constitutional 
Court of the Republic of Croatia, May 16, 2022).

If one looks at the reform proposals from the main opposition parties 
in Croatia and in Slovenia (now in power in Slovenia after the 2022 elec-
tions), it can be seen that they more or less correctly identified certain 
problems within the healthcare system. Social Democratic Party of 
Croatia (SDP) produced an 11-page document on the key principles for 
future reform. These include better access to healthcare, stronger incen-
tives for better performance of the workforce, more efficient organization 
and management of the system, better equipment and infrastructure 
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(including investments into the omnipresent digitalization), and financial 
sustainability (Social Democratic Party of the Republic of Croatia, 2022). 
The electoral program of the new main ruling party in the Slovenia 
Freedom Movement (GS) headed by Prime Minister Golob, which domi-
nates the coalition in power, is even less detailed on healthcare than the 
Croatian SDP. The healthcare part is placed at the very end of the overall 
24-page program and mentions, inter alia, better organization of working 
time for healthcare workers, better accessibility and reduction of waiting 
times, better organization of the system, and digitalization (Freedom 
Movement, 2022). It has also published a more detailed program covering 
the period until 2030 which contains around 20 pages on healthcare, cru-
cially setting a target of 10% of GDP spending for public health system 
by 2030 (Freedom Movement 2022b). It can be argued here that the oppo-
sition especially in Croatia has not shown capacity for preparing serious 
reforms of the national healthcare systems and engaging the national 
governments on this but only for limiting (with more or less success) the 
activities of the national governments.

Closely intertwined with the political situation, constitutional juris-
prudence should also be mentioned as an important factor relating to 
potential reforms. Here it should be noted that a major role in curtailing 
the government’s power to adopt concrete measures in Slovenia was 
played by the Constitutional Court, while in Croatia the Constitutional 
Court was more benevolent toward the government’s power to act in the 
area of public health. This in itself could be seen as an obstacle to the 
government’s possibilities for reforming Slovenian healthcare system, but 
it is hard to conclude whether such a restrictive approach by the Court was 
a product of specific circumstances (a ruling coalition heavily criticized 
from all directions about its fundamental rights track-record) or a more 
general approach of limiting the power of the executive in the future.

In any case, the analysis has shown that two important legislative 
changes in Croatia and Slovenia would be required if one wanted to have 
more clarity and legal certainty within the system. First, a much clearer 
set of statutory rules regarding the public health obligations of private 
primary care providers than the ones prescribed by Health Care Act 
(art. 197) is necessary so that potential future disputes are avoided. The 
same held true for amending the Communicable Diseases Act (art. 39)  
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in Slovenia as a consequence of the jurisprudence of the Slovenian 
Constitutional Court. The new provisions should have been formulated in 
a way which adheres to the principles set by the Slovenian Constitutional 
Court: the law must precisely determine the purpose of these measures, 
the admissible scope, types, and conditions concerning the restriction of 
the fundamental freedoms in question, and must also contain other neces-
sary safeguards against the arbitrary restriction of the said rights. This was 
finally accomplished in October 2022 when the amending act enacted 
by  the new ruling majority entered into force (Act Amending the 
Communicable Diseases Act, Official Gazette 125/22, art. 1).

If one looks at opportunities for public health reform in Croatia and 
Slovenia, one can observe that the list is rather shorter than the list of 
obstacles. Politically, the main positive thing is that in both countries the 
elections in 2020 and 2022 resulted in a more overwhelming victory for 
one party than at any time in the last 20 years. Even though they require 
coalition partners, the political support and the mandate they received 
provide them with a much stronger opportunity to make important 
changes in the healthcare systems than the previous leading parties in 
power had. This is particularly important since some of the reforms, like 
better organization of the system, could entail unpopular moves like clos-
ing of certain unsustainable local hospital wards and, to do that, a strong 
electoral mandate is required. In Croatia, after 2 years having passed since 
the elections, comprehensive reform documents were revealed to the pub-
lic in the end of 2022 which are described in the following. Since 2024 
will be a year of elections, it seems that the autumn and winter of 
2022/2023 represent the last opportunity in Croatia to enact a concrete 
reform that could actually get implemented before the electoral populism 
takes over.

Finally, the influence of the European Union, through its provision of 
funding via the Recovery and Resilience Facility, conditioned by carrying 
out national structural reforms, should also be mentioned. Both Croatian 
and Slovenian plans for spending the money provided by the EU have 
been approved by the European Commission (European Commission, 
2022). In the area of healthcare, Croatia has dedicated an allocation of 
around 340 million EUR to improving its healthcare system with a general 
aim of enabling sustainability, efficiency, quality, and availability  
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of healthcare. When one speaks of reforms, strengthening the long-term 
financial sustainability of the healthcare system, by assuring joint pro-
curement purchasing for national health facilities, should be mentioned. 
Next, it is provided that the long-term sustainability of health services and 
the efficient use of existing human resources will be addressed through 
the reorganization and restructuring of essential health services via, for 
example, the functional integration of hospitals and the strengthening of 
day hospitals at both secondary and tertiary levels, and the development 
of regional centers of excellence. Also, a new care model for patients 
concerning crucial health challenges like cancer will be developed. 
Investments to ensure quality and access to healthcare will focus on devel-
oping harmonized standards and fostering the uptake of modern health-
care treatments through such strategies as purchasing modern medical 
equipment and investing into overall infrastructure. It is also envisaged to 
promote full territorial availability of primary healthcare, thus improving 
the resilience and preparedness of the healthcare system while also 
increasing the quality of life in remote, rural, and insular areas. 
Furthermore, the introduction of strategic management of the health 
workforce shows the emphasis placed on the human capital aspect of 
healthcare by providing specialized medical staff training and increasing 
number of healthcare professionals. Of course, investments in digitaliza-
tion are provided to enable remote healthcare services and better utiliza-
tion of limited resources and treatment capacity (Government of the 
Republic of Croatia, 2021, pp. 983–1090).

This influence of these EU funding possibilities has significantly con-
tributed to the actual reform proposed by the government and to the pass-
ing of the first reading in the Parliament at the end of 2022. It consists of 
the amendments to two basic laws regulating healthcare in Croatia: the 
Health Care Act and the Compulsory Health Insurance Act. One of the 
main reforms consists of transferring the ownership of the secondary care 
providers from counties to the state (Bill Amending the Health Care Act, 
art. 19) the purpose of which is to strengthen the long-term financial sus-
tainability of the healthcare system, by assuring joint procurement pur-
chasing, as stated in the national recovery and resilience plan. Financial 
sustainability is addressed also by doubling the maximum amount of co-
payment (the percentage of the treatment cost the patients have to pay out 
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of their own pocket) prescribed by law (Bill Amending the Compulsory 
Health Insurance Act, art. 8). Also, principles of integration and quality 
are defined (Bill Amending the Health Care Act, arts. 4–6) in order to 
facilitate functional integration of hospitals and more efficient use of lim-
ited resources and to increase the quality of healthcare provision. The 
possibility of creating centers of excellence is expanded to all hospitals 
(Bill Amending the Health Care Act, art. 36). Availability is addressed by 
establishing a legal basis for the creation of mobile pharmacies (Bill 
Amending the Health Care Act, art. 10) in less developed parts of the 
country (like remote and rural areas) where access to medicines represents 
a problem. Availability of primary care is tackled by prescribing that there 
can be one primary healthcare center per county and defining health ser-
vices provided by primary healthcare centers in a bit more detail (Bill 
Amending the Health Care Act, arts. 30–31).

Furthermore, the problem of accessibility due to waiting lists is 
addressed by enabling private providers to be contracted by HIIC (Bill 
Amending the Compulsory Health Insurance Act, art. 35) and by empow-
ering the minister in charge of health to determine maximum waiting 
times (Bill Amending the Health Care Act, art. 7). On basis of the lesson 
learned from COVID-19, the power of CIPH to coordinate county public 
health institutes in emergency situations is explicitly prescribed (Bill 
Amending the Health Care Act, art. 42). Finally, the issue of health work-
force is addressed in several provisions, including the ones enabling health 
workers to work up until the age of 68 and even beyond that (Bill 
Amending the Health Care Act, art. 48), enabling counties to provide 
incentives for healthcare professionals to work in their territory (Bill 
Amending the Health Care Act, art. 2) and the new program of including 
medical doctors without (yet) specialization into the healthcare system 
(Bill Amending the Health Care Act, art. 52).

In Slovenia, an allocation of EU resources for healthcare in the 
amount of around 225 million EUR is provided, with an overarching aim 
of ensuring financial sustainability as well as accessibility and quality of 
the healthcare system. Structural reforms include a clearer definition of 
statutory health insurance rights and restructuring of the complementary 
health insurance, improving the system of incentives (including salaries 
and general working conditions) for healthcare professionals, and better 
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organization of the system. Concrete investments will focus on training of 
healthcare workers to address shortages (especially in the area of primary 
care) by modernizing the secondary professional education in the area of 
health services and allowing more enrollments in the medical faculties. 
Also, investments related to improving the healthcare infrastructure (espe-
cially concerning the more efficient treatment of communicable diseases) 
are provided along with those aimed at further promoting digitalization of 
the system and better organization aimed at improving the accessibility of 
healthcare services (Government of the Republic of Slovenia, 2021, 
pp. 395–418). How the implementation of all this will work in practice, 
especially taking into account the results of recent elections in Slovenia, 
remains to be seen.

Several legal acts have been adopted adhering to the parts of the 
national recovery and resilience plan. The main emphasis has been placed 
on strengthening accessibility by reducing waiting lists and providing 
additional incentives for healthcare professionals. Relating to workforce, 
healthcare professionals working directly with COVID-19 patients within 
the public health system are now entitled to a salary supplement in the 
maximum gross amount of 900 EUR a month (Act on the Emergency 
Measures to Contain the Spread and Mitigate the Consequences of the 
Infectious COVID-19 Disease in the Field of Health Care, Official 
Gazette 141/22, art. 36). Furthermore, a salary supplement for medical 
doctors starting with a specialization in family medicine (primary care) in 
2023 has been prescribed in the gross amount of 1,000 EUR a month (Act 
on the Emergency Measures to Contain the Spread and Mitigate the 
Consequences of the Infectious COVID-19 Disease in the Field of Health 
Care, art. 35). It has also been declared that 70 additional specializations 
in clinical psychology will be funded from the state budget in 2023 and 
2024 (Act on the Emergency Measures to Contain the Spread and Mitigate 
the Consequences of the Infectious COVID-19 Disease in the Field of 
Health Care, art. 34). Additional rules have also been enacted by the 
government, determining the amounts of supplements for primary health-
care professionals in less developed municipalities and for healthcare 
professionals with an increased workload in primary care (Regulation 
Determining the Amount of Supplement for Special Working Conditions 
in the Territory of Less Developed Municipalities, Official Gazette 132/22 
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and Regulation Determining the Amount of Supplement for Increased 
Workload for Hazardous Work and the Number of Additional Health Care 
Staff, Official Gazette 132/22).

Concerning access to healthcare, outpatient clinics for patients with-
out a selected personal general practitioner will be established in order to 
enable accessibility to health service to all insured persons (Act on 
the  Emergency Measures to Contain the Spread and Mitigate the 
Consequences of the Infectious COVID-19 Disease in the Field of Health 
Care, art. 18). Special measures to reduce waiting times have also been 
prescribed, including easier and faster conducting of payments for health-
care delivered, enabling private providers to be contracted by HIIS, and 
additional payments for healthcare professionals who are prepared to 
provide more services, including outside their regular hours (Act on 
the  Emergency Measures to Contain the Spread and Mitigate the 
Consequences of the Infectious COVID-19 Disease in the Field of Health 
Care, art. 14). According to Prime Minister Golob, the real structural 
reform should be enacted in 2023 and fully implemented in 2024, while 
the current actions of the government can be described as “extinguishing 
fires” (24ur, 2022).

It can be seen that the strong political mandate coupled with incen-
tives provided by EU recovery and resilience funding are capable of bring-
ing about healthcare reforms. This is especially visible in Croatia which 
has come up with a rather comprehensive set of reform measures that are 
strongly reflecting the national recovery and resilience plan. Measures 
enacted by the new Slovenian Government are not considered a deep 
reform, which should start in the coming years, but still the priority objec-
tives stated in the national recovery and resilience plan are visible in the 
measures which have been enacted so far.

9.5 � Conclusion

The COVID-19 pandemic has severely influenced public health systems 
across the entire world. It has placed enormous strain on healthcare sys-
tems globally, including Croatia and Slovenia, as in other EU member 
states. This has resulted in a very complex set of public policy responses 
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by the state authorities, influencing the organization and management of 
public health protection, but also of many other aspects of people’s lives. 
The measures were challenged in different ways, highlighting problems in 
defining the powers of the relevant authorities, different approaches to 
review of the constitutionality of the said measures, but also the lack of 
trust by one segment of the public in the national governments and institu-
tions in general.

Problems in adopting and implementing public health measures in 
response to COVID-19 have also highlighted the obstacles and opportuni-
ties for conducting healthcare reforms in these countries in general. When 
one speaks of obstacles, it is possible to mention resistance to reforms 
within the healthcare sector, lack of political will to carry out unpopular 
reforms on the part of the governments, lack of political power by the 
governments to actually carry out reforms due to the limitations imposed 
by the overall public perception, but also due to constitutional jurispru-
dence, and lack of capacity of the opposition to constructively engage the 
government on important healthcare topics. On the other hand, a strong 
electoral mandate given to the two main ruling parties in Croatia and 
Slovenia represents an opportunity to make necessary changes within the 
healthcare system, but that window of opportunity will close quickly, 
meaning there is no time to lose if one wants to have better national 
healthcare systems than before COVID-19.

The influence of the European Union, through its provision of funding 
via the Recovery and Resilience Facility, conditioned by carrying out of 
national structural reforms, has proven to be promisingly significant so 
far. Both countries’ national plans have been approved by the European 
Commission as a necessary prerequisite for being able to spend the money 
provided by the EU. In the area of healthcare, Croatia and Slovenia have 
defined the overarching objectives of the stated reforms in the same way: 
sustainability, quality, and availability of healthcare. Concrete investments 
are mostly focused on health workforce, medical infrastructure, and 
equipment. Croatia has already come up with a rather comprehensive set 
of reform measures that strongly reflect the national recovery and resil-
ience plan. Slovenian structural reform is still pending, but the measures 
enacted so far are already aligned with the plan.
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Finally, the public health crisis has shown that two important legisla-
tive changes in Croatia and Slovenia were required if one wants to have 
more clarity and legal certainty within the healthcare system. First, a 
much clearer set of statutory rules on the public health obligations of pri-
vate primary care providers than that prescribed by the Health Care Act 
(art. 197) is necessary so that potential future disputes are avoided. The 
same held true for amending the Communicable Diseases Act (art. 39) in 
Slovenia. The new provisions should have been formulated in a way which 
adheres to the principles set by Slovenian Constitutional Court: the law 
must precisely determine the purpose of these measures, the admissible 
scope, types, and conditions concerning the restriction of the fundamental 
freedoms in question, and also contain other necessary safeguards against 
the arbitrary restriction of these rights. This was finally accomplished in 
October 2022 when the amending act enacted by the new ruling majority 
entered into force.
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Chapter 10

The Russian Federation

Pavitra Paul

10.1 � Introduction

Given the extensive size of the Russian Federation, it is unsurprising that 
the governance structures within which public health is embedded are 
rather complex. The Russian Federation itself (Figure 10.1) is comprised of 
six different categories of regional jurisdictions. These include 22 ethnic 
enclaves with the status of republics (including Crimea since 2014), three 
cities of federal importance (Moscow, Saint Petersburg, and Sevastopol), 
four autonomous okrugs (regions), nine krais (territories), and 46 oblasts 
(provinces). The governors of all these regions have, since 2010, been 
appointed by the central government, and they represent the Russian 
President in their respective jurisdictions.

Within the legislative structure of the Russian Federation, local gov-
ernment is determined through elected and other bodies of local self-
government. These bodies address matters of local importance, including 
the ownership, use, and disposal of municipal property. They indepen-
dently manage municipal property; form, approve, and execute the local 
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budget; establish local taxes and fees; maintain public order; and resolve 
other issues of local importance. The relations between the federal center 
and regional governments have always been an integral part of the politi-
cal process in Russia and an important factor in its outcomes. However, 
the existence of a formal structure of responsibility for regional authori-
ties does not necessarily mean autonomy in political and policy decision-
making. Local self-government bodies are not included in the system of 
state authorities: they are, however, independent within the parameters of 
their formal jurisdiction, and the Russian Federation (at least formally) 
recognizes and guarantees local self-government.

The Russian legislation regulating the healthcare sector is character-
ized by a high degree of interconnectedness between regulatory levers. 
The levers used to regulate healthcare at the federal and municipal levels 
are both administrative and financial (Nadskakuła-Kaczmarczyk, 2017; 
Sharafutdinova, 2009). Administrative measures are generally coordinated 
through the Federal Service for Surveillance in Health Care while finan-
cial mechanisms address the allocation of funding for state and municipal 
bodies. This highly centralized political power greatly contributed to the 
coordination of measures governing the health system during COVID-19: 
nonetheless, as discussed in the following, ubiquitous corruption within 
the healthcare system (and more widely) meant that policy decisions were 
based on rent-seeking behavior rather than on responses to regional need.

The Federal Service for Surveillance in Health Care maintains its 
regional presence through Territorial Directorates located in all regions 

Figure 10.1.    Contemporary Russia.

Source: Michel Kazatchkine, United Nations Secretary-General’s Special Envoy for HIV/AIDS in 
Eastern Europe and Central Asia (2012–2017).
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and funded from the federal budget (Healthcare Development Concept, 
2020). The Territorial Directorates have local offices at the municipal 
level, and representatives in hospitals report through the vertical organiza-
tional structure (via line departments). The Federal Service for Surveillance 
in Health Care is also responsible for public health issues like infectious 
disease control, registration of diseases, food and drinking water safety, 
and all matters that have an obvious effect on population health. The 
guidelines and recommendations of the Federal Service for Surveillance 
in Health care act as “soft law” (quasi-legal instruments) for all activities 
and functions within the domain of Russian health.

According to WHO rankings, Russia’s population exhibits average 
life expectancy (WHO, 2020). Insufficient funding constrains the appro-
priateness of medical care, especially in the level of medical technology 
employed. The availability of modern medicines is also very low, as are 
healthcare sector wages (Ivanov & Suvorov, 2021). One of the main prob-
lems of economic development is the widening of the income gap with an 
increasing concentration of income within the top 1% of the population 
(Davos Agenda, 2021).

Russia was not spared from the impact of COVID-19. 162,000 deaths 
were associated with coronavirus infection in 2020 alone (Rosstat, 2022), 
with around 400,000 reported COVID-19 deaths as of August 2023 (Our 
World in Data, 2023). As a result of this increase in mortality, the average 
life expectancy has decreased by more than 2 years (to 71.1 years in 
2020), returning to 2014 levels (Ivanov & Suvorov, 2022). Excess mortal-
ity caused by the coronavirus pandemic in Russia amounted to 350,900 
deaths (240 cases per 100,000 people) while deaths from COVID-19 were 
more than two times higher in Russia than in Austria, the Netherlands, and 
France during the period between April 2020 and February 2021(ibid.).

The relatively high mortality in Russia not only reflects the ineffi-
ciency of the Russian healthcare system but also the inadequacy of its 
policy response to the pandemic. For example, entry to Russia from coun-
tries where the epidemic began was not restricted in a timely manner. 
Despite the fact that in February 2020 cases of infection with COVID-19 
were officially registered in many European countries, and quarantine was 
introduced in 11 regions of Italy, the Russian authorities stopped air traffic 
with European countries only on March 27, 2020. In the first quarter of 
2020, more than a million Russian tourists visited EU countries, including 
180,000 thousand visits to Italy (Outbound Tourist Trips, 2020). Neither 
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testing for coronavirus, nor quarantine measures for those arriving in 
Russia from countries where the epidemic began, was carried out in the 
Russian Federation. Furthermore, no measures were taken to prevent the 
spread of infection from Moscow, which is the country’s main gateway, to 
other regions. Not only were the majority of the population not provided 
with timely personal protective equipment but, alarmingly, neither were 
many medical workers who had direct contact with those infected with 
COVID-19.

A unified public system of pandemic measures was, in general, sim-
ply non-existent. The responsibility for introducing specific measures to 
combat COVID-19 remained with the heads of the regions (Ivanov & 
Suvorov, 2022). This meant that not only did Russia have the same orga-
nizational challenges faced by other federal states during the pandemic 
but these were compounded by limited healthcare resources, poorer popu-
lation health indicators, and a pervasive culture of rent-seeking.

10.2 � The Structure of Healthcare and Public Health 
Governance in Russia

10.2.1 � The Russian healthcare system

The Federal Law of 11/21/2011 N 323-F3, Health of citizens in the 
Russian Federation (with amendments subsequently on June 11, 2022, 
and on July 13, 2022), governs the health system of the country. The 
healthcare in the Russian Federation is a three-tiered system, involving 
federal, regional, and municipal levels (Figure 10.2). At the federal level, 
the Ministry of Health (Minzdrav) is the federal executive body, which 
implements and develops state policy governing healthcare. It also acts as 
a legal regulator in healthcare. In addition to the provision of medical care, 
the Ministry regulates such areas as pharmaceuticals, quality control, drug 
safety and effectiveness, medical devices, health resort services, and sani-
tary and epidemiological conditions. A key function of the Ministry is 
to   coordinate and monitor the activities of the Federal Service for 
Surveillance in Healthcare (Roszdravnadzor) as well as activities of the 
Federal Mandatory Health Insurance Fund.

At the regional level, health system management is performed by 
regional departments and ministries (Figure 10.2), which are responsible 
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for the development and realization of regional health programs, the 
implementation of preventive measures, medical care and expertise, orga-
nization of labor protection and social guarantees for medical personnel, 
and management of medical care in emergency conditions. Regional 
executive authorities have the power to determine the budget and funding 
for the provision of specialized medical care. Regional health authorities 
are subordinate to the regional governments, which in turn are answerable 
to the regional health ministers. Regional healthcare facilities usually 
include a hospital with around 1,000 beds as well as a pediatric hospital 
with about 400 beds. Both include outpatient services. There are also 
regional specialized healthcare facilities for infectious diseases, tubercu-
losis, and psychiatric illness.

At the municipal level, local government bodies manage many aspects 
of the healthcare system. Their functions include monitoring and analyz-
ing citizens’ well-being and medical care provision, organizing and 
coordinating healthcare activities, and developing and implementing 
municipal healthcare programs. Municipal executive authorities have the 
power to plan the costs for emergency care, primary medical care in out-
patient and inpatient facilities, and medical care for women during preg-
nancy, delivery, and after childbirth.

Figure 10.2.    Health system organization.
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Urban rayons (cities) typically have a multifunctional city hospital for 
adults (about 250 beds) and city hospital for children (about 200 beds). 
Most primary care facilities, independent polyclinics, and a few diagnos-
tic centers are municipal. In rural rayons, institutions typically include a 
central hospital with approximately 250 beds, which may also serve as a 
polyclinic. Some rayons also have a smaller hospital with about 100 beds. 
There are independent polyclinics (not part of any hospital), small poly-
clinics or “ambulatory care facilities,” and health posts staffed by feldsh-
ers (auxiliary health workers, such as physician assistants). Medical care 
in the Russian health system has three tiers:

•	 primary medical care, including general medical services (including 
emergency care) and specialized medical care (except for the services 
provided within the framework of secondary and tertiary medical care),

•	 secondary medical care, focusing on general medical services 
(including emergency care) and specialized medical care (except 
highly technologically specialized services) provided by health 
facilities having designated departments and clinics,

•	 tertiary medical care, comprised of general medical services (including 
emergency care) and specialized medical care (including advanced care) 
provided by health facilities that offer high-tech medical services.

In practice, many regions and rayons function in a coordinated manner 
where local governance remains within the regional Ministry of Health.

Despite a well-developed network of the out-patient-polyclinic facili-
ties, the existing system of primary care remains overloaded and often 
ineffective. The ineffectiveness of the polyclinics is partly attributable to 
the mechanism allocating excessive numbers of patients to the polyclinics. 
The restricted opening hours of the polyclinics also leads to issues of 
accessibility for the working population.

10.2.2 � Public health governance

In Russia, as in other states, public health functions incorporate both ill-
ness prevention and disease surveillance. The institutional organization of 
public health in Russia is set out in Figure 10.3.
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10.2.2.1 � Disease prevention and health promotion

The framework of illness prevention has three components. The first 
includes measures aimed at preventing diseases (including immunization 
and the promotion of healthy lifestyles), while the second focuses on the 
early detection of diseases, the mitigation of disease exacerbation and 
complications, physical capacity decline, and premature mortality. The 
third element emphasizes rehabilitation and focuses on actions to elimi-
nate, minimize, or compensate disability in order to restore limited func-
tions as much as possible. All preventive actions are performed in both 

Figure 10.3.    Organization of public health.
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inpatient and outpatient facilities, as well as specialized public health 
centers (created for this purpose under the Order of the Ministry of Health 
of the Russian Federation No. 748n dated July 28, 2020).

Among the most successful areas where the Russian Federation has 
made progress toward the realization of Sustainable Development Goals 
are in the focus on healthy balanced diets across the population and in the 
promotion of healthy lifestyles and overall well-being. The focus here has 
been to reduce all forms of malnutrition in the population, as well as to 
strengthen the agricultural sector (which is politically important as the 
source of economic growth, increased employment rates, and sustainable 
development for the country). Measures to overcome excessive food price 
volatility include a mechanism based on state procurement and commod-
ity interventions. To ensure that children in Russia are well nourished, 
measures are being implemented to provide free hot meals to schoolchil-
dren, with a particular emphasis on quality and safety indicators. Under 
the Federal Improvement of Public Health Project, the Federal Service for 
Surveillance on Consumer Rights Protection and Human Well-being 
together with the Nutrition and Biotechnology Institute have been working 
extensively to prevent unhealthy diets in the population and reduce the 
number of obese and overweight people. The Federal Science and 
Technology Programme for Agriculture Development (2017–2025) is 
establishing such policy priorities in this area as the transition to highly 
productive and environmentally friendly agriculture and aquaculture, the 
storage and effective processing of agricultural products, as well as the 
production of safe and quality food. However, integrating the state, the 
business sector, and wider societal actors to this end remains politically 
challenging.

To combat the sale of counterfeit or substandard products capable of 
harming human health, in January 2021, the voluntary labeling of dairy 
products has begun in order to test the effectiveness of the mechanism of 
food labeling (which tracks products from the manufacturer to the con-
sumer (WTO, 2021)). Russia has introduced a “State Programme” (Order 
No. 207-r of February 13, 2019 of the Government of the Russian 
Federation) for the Comprehensive Development of Rural Areas for the 
period 2020–2025: this is intended to promote the comprehensive, all-
round development of agricultural production and rural infrastructure and, 
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importantly, to bring the quality of life of the rural population closer to 
urban standards. Russia has adopted the Health in All Policies (HiAP) 
approach emphasizing societal factors and actions that shape everyday 
living environments, integrating the “health and well-being” of the citi-
zens into the development trajectory of the Russian Federation.

10.2.2.2 � Disease surveillance

Russia’s sanitary and epidemiological surveillance system is represented 
by both medical authorities (sanitary and epidemiological agencies and 
health facilities) and non-medical ones. The surveillance system is man-
dated to collect data and determine trends in epidemic progression, to 
identify of the root causes and conditions enabling epidemic spread across 
certain territories, to carry out pre-epidemic diagnostics, and to make 
epidemiological diagnoses. It forecasts the epidemiological situation 
based on information flows and takes management decisions and esti-
mates their effectiveness and efficiency. Interestingly, the strategic docu-
ment describing the development of Russian healthcare (Decree of the 
President of the Russian Federation of June 6, 2019 No. 254) did outline 
risks similar to the COVID-19 pandemic 6 months prior to the official 
recognition of the new coronavirus infection. This document is candid 
about both the emergence of new infections caused by unknown patho-
gens, requiring continuously maintaining a high level of anti-epidemic 
preparedness, and the biosecurity needed to carry out a set of prophylactic 
and anti-epidemic measures to prevent the introduction and spread of 
infectious diseases with natural foci and zoonotic infections (as well as 
preparations to respond to natural and intentional biological threats).

The federal Ministry of Health has also developed a concept for the 
modernization of its infectious disease service that includes creating a 
multilevel system for laboratory diagnostics of infectious diseases, mod-
ernizing the infrastructure of clinics and hospitals, building an applied 
research center for infectious diseases at the federal level, and improving 
the infectious disease management system. Russia is now evaluating the 
establishment of an integrated system for preventing risks and epidemio-
logical threats (Decree of the President of the Russian Federation  
“On Strategy for Development of Health care in the Russian Federation 
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until 2025”) within the BRICS (the association of five major emerging 
economies: Brazil, Russia, India, China and South Africa).

To fight against anti-microbial resistance and against the use of antibi-
otics to promote animal growth, the Russian Federation has embraced a 
“One Health” approach, a comprehensive concept to address threats to the 
health of human beings, animals, plants, and environment. The Federal 
Service for Surveillance on Consumer Rights Protection and Human Well-
being (Rospotrebnadzor) in Moscow remains responsible for good hygienic 
practices in farming activities throughout the whole “farm to fork” process. 
It also fights against falsified products emerging as a result of a developed 
trans-border trading activities (Food and Agriculture Organization, 2022).

10.3 � The Response to COVID-19

Once the potential threat of COVID-19 was acknowledged, the relatively 
weak level of parliamentary influence on the political and policy processes 
in Russia, the President’s control of the government, and formal and infor-
mal rules governing the mass media facilitated a focused, top-down 
response to the pandemic. To a large extent, this strategy focused on 
repurposing medical facilities and reorganizing medical care. Interlevel 
and interagency cooperation, supported by interconnected regulatory 
levers, facilitated command-and-control decision-making for combating 
the crisis. Since regional governors are directly under the authority of the 
federal government, compliance with the directives of the federal govern-
ment (i.e. of the President) by the regional (subnational) governments was 
consistently uniform and free from any institutional constraints across all 
regions. Nonetheless, the appointment-based system of gubernatorial 
selection did create a problem of moral hazard, giving some regional lead-
ers unconstrained power in the respective territories (Sharafutdinova, 
2009). Because governors are not elected but appointed by the President, 
loyalty to the President overrides representation of the respective elector-
ates. There exists a “principal–agent” relationship that does not recognize 
either competence or political autonomy but operates through a form of 
“delegated power”. In consequence, there is an “information asymmetry” 
between the principal and the agents, which leads to different forms of 
rent seeking behaviors within the system of governance.
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One major impediment to the state’s strategy of pandemic manage-
ment was the low degree of public compliance with restrictive measures. 
This was further complicated in situations where patients remained 
responsible for their own referrals and coordination of care pathway 
between different types and levels of care. The local authorities had intro-
duced a number of punitive measures (e.g. fines for not using personal 
protective equipment in public places or using it improperly), but these 
measures were often implemented inconsistently and without any coher-
ent approach across different levels of governance. In some cases, these 
measures even exceeded the boundaries of legitimate power (Kravchenko 
& Ivanova, 2021).

10.3.1 � The structural changes triggered by COVID-19

The federal portion of the basic mandatory health insurance (OMC) 
program was, through amendments of the OMC law (Federal Law 
dated  08.12.2020 No. 430 “On Amendments to the Federal Law ‘On 
Compulsory Health Insurance in the Russian Federation’”), introduced to 
provide additional funding for medical services provided by federal health 
facilities. Under these amendments, the Federal Mandatory Health 
Insurance Fund (FOMC) was enabled to distribute and monitor spend-
ing  directly. In this way, the FOMC became both a fund manager as 
well as the controller responsible for spending outlays. Because of this, 
competition between health facilities became restricted and a sub-health 
system comprising health facilities of federal government developed, 
making it difficult to coordinate the activities of federal and regional 
health facilities operating in the same territory. It also meant that patients 
lost the opportunity to choose between federal and regional health facili-
ties when seeking medical care. Furthermore, the amendment of the OMC 
law1 excludes medical insurance organizations (MIOs) from servicing 

1 Order of RF Ministry of Health No. 1024n of September 25, 2020 “On Amendments  
to Rules of Compulsory Medical Insurance, approved by Order of RF Ministry of Health 
No. 108n of February 28, 2019, and a Standard Form of Contract on Financial Support of 
Compulsory Medical Insurance, approved by Order of the Ministry of Health and Social 
Development dated 09.09.2011 No. 1030n.
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programs of FOMC fund and debars MIOs’ rights to receive the income 
from savings of the OMC funds. The amendment of the OMC law also 
limits the volume of activities in private healthcare facilities while guarantee-
ing medical care for public facilities (including recruiting doctors of pri-
vate healthcare facilities in public institutions) in an emergency (Galayants, 
2020).

Toward the end of November 2019, a bill was submitted to the State 
Duma mandating approval for the Ministry of Health to appoint heads of 
health authorities at all levels of governance in the Russian Federation. 
This established a unified system of remuneration supporting a unified 
salary system effective from January 1, 2022 for healthcare workers 
across the country.

10.3.2 � Expanded social support specific to COVID-19

In general, due to the pandemic, the minimum and maximum amounts of 
unemployment benefits were increased, and additional payments for the 
children of unemployed parents were introduced. The specific initiatives 
included the following:

·	 eliminating the need for certification of payment toward benefits,
·	 widening and intensifying the social security net in the form of (1) 

payment for children from 3 to 7 years to families with low incomes, 
(2) extension of child benefit, (3) lowering the threshold of sick leave 
benefit, (4) payment for children between 6 and 18 years old, (5) 
remote examination for disability confirmation, (6) extension of 
temporary disability benefits, (7) lump sum payment for pensioners, 
(8) extension of time periods for fare reimbursement (for the residents 
of far north) and subsidies for housing and commune services, (9) 
extension of child care allowance up to 1.5 years, and (10) sick days 
allowance not below the minimum wage,

·	 special measures for care workers, including (1) payments to doctors 
who fell ill with COVID-19, (2) social security guarantees for doctors, 
middle and junior medical staff, and ambulance drivers, and (3) 
additional payment to health workers,
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·	 examination of the loss of professional ability to work, retraining 
of  unemployed caused by the pandemics, remote registration for 
enrollment in the labor market and payments to employees of social 
institutions, and

·	 measures targeting non-citizens (disputed residency status): this focused 
on the amendment of migration legislation (extending the validity of 
documents for foreigners in the territory of the Russian Federation).

Other measures included extended renewal of licenses and business 
permits, introduction of distance education (schools and higher educa-
tion), selective or total closures of public space including business enter-
prises (except those for emergency services) by the respective regional 
governments based on the prevailing epidemiological situation, a special 
procedure for accessing the provision of public services remotely; penal-
ties for violation of quarantine measures, financial support for scientific, 
educational, and medical institution, and the creation of temporary jobs.

There was also a program of COVID-19 support for trade, industry, 
and commerce. This included (1) remote provision of financial services, 
(2) preferential mortgage rates reduced by 70%, (3) extension of the lease 
of state and commercial real estate for affected industries, (4) expansion 
of concessional lending programs and microcredit for small and medium 
enterprises (SMEs), (5) relaxation of eligibility criteria and documenta-
tion requirements for agricultural producers to receive loans at 5% per 
annum, (6) subsidies for loans at the Central Bank rate to maintain work-
ing capital and save jobs, (7) special grants to SMEs and non-governmental 
organization (NGOs) to compensate suspension of work caused by anti-
epidemic measures in the regions, (8) preferential loans for the production 
of critical medical products, (9) cancellation of fines and penalties when 
postponing the deadline for the execution of a state contract, (10) the pro-
vision for receiving up to 50% of the state contract amount in advance, 
(11) relaxation of conditions for granting subsidies to enterprises of folk 
art crafts, (12) extension of repayment schedules including introduction of 
deferment of payments on loans to farmers (including collective investments), 
(13) restructuring preferential investment and preferential short-term loans 
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to farmers, (14) payroll subsidy (three minimum wages per new employee) 
to the business for the employment of the unemployed, (15) subsidies for 
certified exporters’ goods and employment support loans, (16) state sup-
port with simplified process for electronics industry enterprises, (17) 
subsidies for measures to prevent COVID-19, (18) subsidies to the air-
ports, (19) special financial support for self-employed citizens, employ-
ment support loans for wage payments, and interest-free daily settlement 
loans, (20) credit payment holidays for up to 6 months for a mortgage or 
consumer loan, (21) remote account opening for individuals, individual 
entrepreneurs, and legal entities, (22) a bankruptcy moratorium (for 
affected industries) and a moratorium on payments of penalties for gov-
ernment contracts, (23) restrictions on the payment of dividends, (24) 
financial support for cooperatives, Russian car manufacturers, private 
circuses, and zoos, and (25) reducing the compliance burden on joint-
stock companies and for government contracts.

Further, the import taxes (duties) on medical supplies were reviewed, 
and an extensive list of exemptions including substantial reduction of such 
taxes on various goods was established. Registration of medicines and 
medical products were also simplified with faster approval processes for 
distribution. Medicines used for heart and circulatory diseases were put 
into a high priority procurement and supply category. Free supply of medi-
cines was provided to the victims of COVID-19 even for ambulatory (out-
patient) treatment.

Regulatory provisions for credit institutions and non-banking finan-
cial institutions were relaxed, and provision of extra liquidity to banks as 
part of support for organizations of national importance was taken at the 
macro level for ensuring the availability of ready money in the system. 
Further, in this context, disposal of capital items through electronic trans-
actions were allowed in order to facilitate the crediting of the funds. 
Specific measures for affected industries were also enacted, especially for 
the tourist and transport industries.

10.4 � Discussion

The three-tier architecture of the Russian health system follows a 2-year 
planning period for different expenditures at all levels of governance. 
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The distribution is driven by the goals and the objectives of the state pol-
icy, as well as special decisions of the President of the Russian Federation 
and the government of the Russian Federation. The present top-down 
approach often ignores local needs which can, in turn, lead to inequalities 
in outcome.

In order to eliminate regional and territorial inequalities, federal 
authorities have created two state programs: “Zemsky Doctor” (local doc-
tor) and “Zemsky Feldsher” (local paramedic), aimed at attracting quali-
fied medical personnel to rural areas through financial incentives. 
However, the differences in state health expenditure across different 
Russian regions are the major impediments to these programs: Central 
Russia and the Far North regions are traditionally characterized by higher 
funding. The country’s 10 wealthiest regions receive almost double the 
healthcare funding compared to the 10 poorest regions (Ulumbekova, 2019).

While Russia’s strong centralized control has contributed to the coor-
dination of COVID-19 responses across the country, the institutional 
frameworks, set up by countless laws, decrees, and instructions, have also 
contributed to the phenomenon of an “over-regulated state” (Paneyakh, 
2013), combining a very high density of poor-quality state regulations 
with the sweeping discretion of regulatory agencies and state watchdogs. 
This has created increasing dysfunctionality in courts, police, and other 
state organizations (Volkov et al., 2013; Paneyakh, 2014). Although the 
constitution confers the rights of regions to govern independently within 
a policy field, the position of the Governors has been turned into an office 
of the President for executing the federal policies, ignoring the specific 
needs of the local geography and undermining the preferences of the 
population groups within these regions.

The appointed governors face few constraints and little accountability 
for their actions. This, in turn, encourages blatant corruption and the mis-
management of resources (Sharafutdinova, 2009). Governors in the 
Russian Federation more often lose their jobs due to a failure to deliver 
votes and secure political support than for poor economic performance or 
for failing to secure the welfare of their respective populations. The cause 
of exacerbated inequity in health outcomes during COVID-19 is clearly 
a consequence of the governance process. The present system of gover-
nance through presidential decrees does facilitate the harmonization of 
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processes for the execution of public policies, but it does so with 
clear  costs at that impede the availability of resource efficiency at the 
regional level.

The effective implementation of priority projects and programs in the 
Russian Federation has been driven more by top-level political patronage 
than by a process of policy entrepreneurship effected through ministers, 
governors, and mayors or through academic leadership. Although political 
demand for success stories provides certain incentives for policy entrepre-
neurs, the system of political patronage often undermines incentives for 
them. While this rigid hierarchy did permit a focused top-down response 
to the pandemic, the ubiquitous corruption endemic in the system meant 
that policy decisions were based on rent-seeking behavior rather than 
responses to regional need. The rigid top-down mode of governance also 
meant that the ability of the public health system to respond nimbly to the 
shifting manifestation of COVID-19 (and to a changing understanding of 
the pathogen itself) was severely constrained.

“Policy entrepreneurship” is an important mechanism that facilitates 
systemic changes that better meet the demands of a policy system. Policy 
entrepreneurs are individuals who have a deep understanding of how sys-
tems work, what constraints they face, and novel ways of meeting the 
system demands. However, the combination of high density and low qual-
ity in the regulation of various sectors and policy fields on the one hand, 
and its arbitrary and selective enforcement by the state apparatus on the 
other, is clearly not conducive to policy entrepreneurship. In Russia, 
“pockets of efficiency” are found in some priority projects with the 
patronage of political leaders. However, as the political leadership is inter-
ested in success stories primarily to legitimize the political status quo and, 
secondarily, to facilitate rent-seeking goals (Muller, 2014; Orttung & 
Zhemukhov, 2014), the effect and reach of policy entrepreneurs in health-
care is generally limited.

Informal deals between political leaders and policy entrepreneurs 
require priority resource endowment and a high level of freedom for pol-
icy entrepreneurs on virtually all initiatives in their respective fields in 
exchange for quick and highly visible successes. However, the number of 
top priorities in Russia is limited, forcing policy entrepreneurs to compete 
with each other for scarce resources and meaningful attention from 
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political leaders. Any change in the leaders’ policy priorities (let alone a 
change of leaders themselves) can quickly put an end to projects and 
programs.

There is a common belief in Russian culture that without top-down 
pressure, the lower layers of the governance hierarchy (understood as the 
“power vertical”) do not invest enough effort for the effective implementa-
tion of state policies. This has conferred wide-ranging and sweeping pow-
ers on regulatory agencies responsible for monitoring and auditing every 
organization in various sectors, including severe sanctions for non- 
compliance at all levels of governance (Gel’man, 2016). This, in turn, 
induces managers at all layers of the power vertical not to focus on policy 
entrepreneurship and improved performance in the respective domains but 
to be risk averse and to avoid possible punishment for any formal or infor-
mal violation of the rules.

COVID-19 loosened up this rigid vertical governance structure to a 
small degree. The Federal Service for Surveillance on Consumer Rights 
Protection and Human Well-being (Rospotrebnadzor), with its representa-
tive offices at the regions, has the authority to integrate health with other 
sectors like agriculture, pharmaceuticals, and environment actions. It has 
done so through mechanisms, such as the “Coordination Council” (for 
combating the new coronavirus infections), a “Crisis Centre” for coordi-
nating measures preventing the introduction and further spread of the 
infection, another “Crisis Centre” for economic issues, which was respon-
sible for the development of measures to support local businesses and 
organizations affected by the pandemic, and an “Information Centre” (for 
monitoring the coronavirus situation). This structure did ensure multilevel 
and interagency communication across the country, establishing synergy 
with the websites of all federal, regional, and municipal healthcare author-
ities and with the broadcasting channels of TV and radio, print media, 
social networks, and hotlines.

To the extent that these pandemic agencies effected a slight “decon-
centration” of federal power, it was able to present a coordinated action to 
the immediate threats posed by COVID-19. However, this approach has 
not resulted in a robust system of pandemic management over a longer 
period of time. The top-level political patronage, the immediate priori-
ties  of political leaders, and some very limited policy entrepreneurship 
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(under special regulatory conditions and with positive incentives) have 
contributed, in a limited and inconsistent way across regions, to the man-
agement of the pandemic. However, these positive outcomes are limited in 
both time and space (Gel’man, 2021): as DiMaggio and Powell (1983) 
suggest, “pockets of efficiency” under these conditions will become full 
of holes quickly without any dissemination of best practices of policy 
diffusion.

The Russian healthcare system has not been resilient to the demands 
placed on it by COVID-19. Due to the shortage of hospitals in neighbor-
hood locations, patients with COVID-19 could only be hospitalized in 
repurposed hospitals located in large cities, mainly in regional centers. 
The obvious need to transport patients often over a distance of more than 
100 km led to the denial of needed emergency medical care for the popu-
lation of rural settlements and small towns. Also, the waiting time for the 
arrival of an ambulance for many COVID-19 victims amounted to hours 
or even days. Random and unplanned (without competence mapping) 
deployment of healthcare workers (often without substantive medical 
training) in COVID care facilities led to both a decrease in the effective-
ness (often with avoidable uncertainty) of treatment of patients with 
COVID-19 and a significant reduction in the possibility of needed medi-
cal care for patients of other diseases. Furthermore, a shortage of many 
drugs in most regions did lead to both the growth of self-medication and 
the media advertisement of certain “miraculous” drugs without any 
proven scientific merit (Ivanov & Suvorov, 2022).

The overall funds for pandemic management allocated by the federal 
government and the regional governments could not compensate for the 
loss of income from provision of services for other specialties at the health 
facility level. The allocation measures aimed to ensure the prioritized pro-
vision of medical care for patients with COVID-19 (through the repurpos-
ing of treatment facilities designed for other ailments) resulted in a 
substantial decrease of earnings from the payments at the point-of-service 
for the health facilities. This caused an additional strain on the investment 
capacity of health facilities.

Most of the additional pandemic funding was for a relatively narrow 
list of tasks for organizing the treatment of patients with new coronavirus 
infections (i.e. deploying and equipping a dedicated bed, purchasing 
personal protective equipment, running diagnostic testing systems, and 
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providing incentive payments to healthcare workers). The allocation for 
long-term investments in permanent intensive care beds, equipment for 
laboratory testing, and radiological diagnostics facilitating the improve-
ment of the quality and availability of medical care in the overall health 
system was small in this additional flow of funds.

COVID-19-induced crisis has redefined resilience. There is, in theory, 
now more potential to initiate reforms aimed at protecting and diversify-
ing health system revenue generation and financing mechanism for differ-
ent levels of health facilities, to build a high level of “social capital” 
(institutional trust, cooperation capacity, and public awareness of health 
risks), and to design and institutionalize a well-functioning health system 
performance monitoring practice. And the public financing of healthcare, 
in theory, not only ensures universal access to healthcare but also allows 
more efficient use of health resources. But the present model of financing 
in the Russian health system does not provide greater efficiency of medi-
cal care in the Russian Federation. Also, despite the declared transition to 
universal compulsory health insurance, the main source of public funding 
for healthcare is still the state budget rather than individual insurance 
premiums for each insured person. Private funding of healthcare expenses, 
including contribution to voluntary health insurance, is about 35% of total 
health expenditure in the Russian Federation and is consistent over the last 
one decade. This is substantially high compared to the OECD country 
average (21% in 2022). Inequity in public financing is obvious: the 10 
wealthiest regions receive almost double the public funding in healthcare 
compared to the 10 poorest regions. Intraregional inequality is primarily 
attributable to the macroeconomy of the region exacerbated by the strong 
federal approach of policy uniformity across the country.

Social capital includes trust and solidarity, collective action and coop-
eration, and civic responsibility and community responsiveness. In com-
munities with a higher level of social capital, the degree of compliance 
affecting individual choice is generally higher and confers a positive 
impact on mitigating the risk of infection. The vulnerability of a region 
significantly depends on population density, air quality, the proportion of 
elderly people, and the level of education of the population. People less 
burdened by morbidity are better protected from and less likely to spread 
infection, while longer life expectancy entails an increased number of 
older people most vulnerable to disease. Therefore, an appropriate health 
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system that is dynamically responsive has a long-term bearing on the well-
being of the population. This responsiveness could be developed with an 
institutionalized system of monitoring and review that both established 
synergies among different interventions and clarified the tradeoffs and 
negative externalities resulting from policy initiatives.

10.5 � Conclusion

Health governance in the Russian Federation does not recognize the limits 
of the state. The Soviet-style bureaucratic control that remains at the level 
of regional elites created a cohort of regional officials manifestly loyal to 
the President at the expense of good governance and the efficient imple-
mentation of federal and regional policies. The authoritarian and paternal-
istic mode of governance in Russia challenges policymaking in key areas 
like healthcare. Administrative domination (the hierarchical logic of rule 
for securing obedience and loyalty from the population) is not limited to 
any routine enforcement practices. Non-compliance is often criminalized, 
and the politics of threat operate through the “shadow of hierarchy,” where 
the implicit threat of government action underlies ostensible freedom on 
the part of regional authorities. Policy entrepreneurs do not aim to estab-
lish new pockets of efficiency without strong support and patronage from 
the political leadership. The problem is that the availability of patronage 
is inherently limited, and the pool of potentially successful policy entre-
preneurs is shrinking over time.

In this way, Russia has exhausted the potential of its infrastructural 
and personnel resources for creating success stories that are resilient over 
time and across geography. The key analytical question is thus the extent 
to which the Russian political leadership are amenable to changing the 
very paradigm of development, i.e. away from an orientation focusing a 
small number of extraordinary and highly visible achievements that 
impedes the overall development of better health policy. The common 
denominator across Russia, and across policy fields, is that power is of a 
personified nature where administration is organized vertically. For this 
reason it is impossible to change the Russian authorities through elections 
even as control on the part of the political elite is increasing. The gover-
nors ensure social stability, economic development, and law and order in 
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the regions, but they perform these functions without a robust basis of 
political legitimacy.

The federal pandemic measures, supported by legislation and accom-
panied by expanded social support and sector specific measures, did have 
some effect on reducing the overall impact of COVID-19 in general, but 
the potential full effect of such measures specific to the population groups 
in their respective regions could not be realized primarily due to the focus 
on the regional harmonization of actions, the political hegemony of the 
regional governors, and, ultimately, the alienation of common people from 
state initiatives.

The subjects of the Russian Federation are extremely heterogeneous 
in regard to socioeconomic development, population need, and healthcare 
provisions (including accessibility and affordability). Because of this, a 
rigid top-down approach limits the efficacy of state action. The high mor-
tality rate during the pandemic was due not so much to COVID-19 itself 
but rather to the imperfection of the entire healthcare system coupled with 
the governance deficit. The ideological basis of the Russian regime is a 
form of conservatism that ensures the stability of the regime. For ordinary 
Russians, conservatism is presented as a set of rules requiring them to 
conform to the authorities and to societal norms. At the same time, 
Russian conservatism is synonymous with ostentatious patriotism. Social 
stability is necessary for delivering correct voting results. ‘‘Managing’’ 
democracy and ‘‘engineering’’ elections define gubernatorial selection, 
and so any potential reform of the public health system may only emerge 
from a strong network of regional leaders with a proven ability to maintain 
socioeconomic stability and to use administrative resources effectively for 
delivering high levels of electoral support to the President. Because the 
public health system is so embedded in this larger system of governance, 
changes to the way in which public health is conceived or exercised will 
otherwise remain highly constricted.

References

Davos Agenda (2021). Online forum organized by the World Economic Forum, 
January 27, 2021, Moscow, Kremlin. http://www.kremlin.ru/events/ 
president/transcripts (Accessed on April 27, 2023).

http://www.kremlin.ru/events/president/transcripts
http://www.kremlin.ru/events/president/transcripts


	 b5349    Public Policy Challenges in Rethinking Public Health� 6"×9"

280 	  P. Paul

Di Maggio, P. and Powell, W. (1983). The “Iron Cage” revisited: Institutional 
isomorphism and collective rationality in organizational analysis. American 
Sociological Review, 48(2), 147–160.

Food and Agriculture Organization (FAO) (2022). Regional conference for Europe, 
ERC/22/INF/18. https://www.fao.org/3/nj054en/nj054en.pdf (Accessed on 
April 27, 2023).

Galayants, S. (2020). Doctors of private clinics can be recruited to work in state 
medical institutions during epidemics. Vademecum, June 18. https://vademec.
ru/news/2020/06/18/vracheychastnykh-kliniki-mogut-privlech-k-rabote-v-
gosmeduchrezhdeniyakh-v-period-epidemiy/ (Accessed on September 9, 
2022).

Gel’man, V. (2016). The vicious circle of post-Soviet neopatrimonialism in 
Russia. Post-Soviet Affairs, 32(5), 455–473.

Gel’man, V. (2021). Exceptions and rules: Success stories and bad governance in 
Russia. Europe-Asia Studies, 73(6), 1080–1101.

Healthcare Development Concept (2020). http://www.zdravo2020.ru/concept  
(in Russian) (Accessed on September 9, 2022).

Ivanov, V. N. and Suvorov, A. V. (2021). Modern development problems of 
Russian healthcare (Part 1). Studies on Russian Economic Development, 
32(6), 631–639.

Ivanov, V. N. and Suvorov, A. V. (2022). Modern development problems of 
Russian healthcare (Part 2). Studies on Russian Economic Development, 
33(1), 29–35.

Kravchenko, N. A. and Ivanova, A. I. (2021). Spread of the COVID-19 in Russia: 
Regional peculiarities. Regional Research of Russia, 11(4), 428–434.

Muller, M. (2014). Higher, larger, costlier: Sochi and the 2014 Winter Olympics. 
Russian Analytical Digest, 143, 2–4.

Nadskakuła-Kaczmarczyk, O. (2017). Sources of the legitimacy of Vladimir 
Putin’s power in today’s Russia. Politeja, 4(49), 335–349.

Orttung, R. and Zhemukhov, S. (2014). The 2014 Sochi Olympic mega-project 
and Russia’s political economy. East European Politics, 30(2), 175–191.

Our World in Data (2023). COVID-19 deaths. https://ourworldindata.org/
covid-deaths.

Outbound tourist trips of Russian citizens to foreign countries in the 1st quarter 
of 2020. https://www.gks.ru/free_doc/new_site/business/torg/tur/tab-tur1-2.
htm (Accessed on May 4, 2023).

Paneyakh, E. (2013). Zaregulirovannoe gosudarstvo. Pro et Contra, 13, 1–2.
Paneyakh, E. (2014). Faking performances together: Systems of performance 

evaluation in Russian enforcement agencies and production of Bias and 
privilege. Post-Soviet Affairs, 30, 2–3.

https://www.fao.org/3/nj054en/nj054en.pdf
https://vademec.ru/news/2020/06/18/vracheychastnykh-kliniki-mogut-privlech-k-rabote-v-gosmeduchrezhdeniyakh-v-period-epidemiy/
https://vademec.ru/news/2020/06/18/vracheychastnykh-kliniki-mogut-privlech-k-rabote-v-gosmeduchrezhdeniyakh-v-period-epidemiy/
https://vademec.ru/news/2020/06/18/vracheychastnykh-kliniki-mogut-privlech-k-rabote-v-gosmeduchrezhdeniyakh-v-period-epidemiy/
http://www.zdravo2020.ru/concept
https://ourworldindata.org/covid-deaths
https://ourworldindata.org/covid-deaths
https://www.gks.ru/free_doc/new_site/business/torg/tur/tab-tur1-2.htm
https://www.gks.ru/free_doc/new_site/business/torg/tur/tab-tur1-2.htm


	 b5349    Public Policy Challenges in Rethinking Public Health6"×9"�

	 The Russian Federation	   281

Rosstat. (2022). https://rosstat.gov.ru/ (Accessed on September 9, 2022).
Sharafutdinova, G. (2009). Subnational governance in Russia: How Putin 

changed the contract with his agents and the problems it created for 
Medvedev. The Journal of Federalism, 40(4), 672–696.

Ulumbekova, G. E., Ginoyan, A. B., Kalashnikova, A. V., and Alvianskaya, N. V. 
(2019). Health care financing in Russia (2021–2024). Facts and suggestions. 
Vestnik VSHOUZ (HEALTH CARE MANAGEMENT: News, Views, 
Education. Bulletin of VSHOUZ). 5(4), 4–19 (in Russian). https://cyber 
leninka.ru/article/n/finansirovanie-zdravoohraneniya-v-rossii-2021-2024- 
gg-fakty-ipredlozheniya (Accessed on September 9, 2022).

Volkov, V., Grigoriev, I., Dmitrieva, A., Moiseeva, E., Paneyakh, E., Pozdnyakov, 
M., Titaev, K., Chetverikova, I., and Shklyaruk, M. (2013). Kontseptsiya 
kompleksnoi organizatsionno-upravlencheskoi reformy pravookhranitel’nykh 
organov RF (St. Petersburg, Institute for the Rule of Law, European 
University at St. Petersburg). http://www.enforce.spb.ru/images/Issledovanya/
IRL_KGI_Reform_final_11.13.pdf (Accessed on May 6, 2023).

World Health Organization (2020). Life expectancy and healthy life expectancy. 
https://www.who.int/data/gho/data/themes/mortality-and-global-health- 
estimates/ghe-life-expectancy-and-healthy-life-expectancy#:~:text-
Globally%2C%20life%20expectancy%-20has%20increased,reduced%20
years%20lived%20with%20disability (Accessed on September 9, 2022).

WTO (2021). Trade policy review, WT/TPR/G/416. https://www.wto.org/english/
tratop_e/tpr_e/g416_e.pdf (Accessed on February 12, 2022).

https://rosstat.gov.ru/
https://cyberleninka.ru/article/n/finansirovanie-zdravoohraneniya-v-rossii-2021-2024-gg-fakty-ipredlozheniya
https://cyberleninka.ru/article/n/finansirovanie-zdravoohraneniya-v-rossii-2021-2024-gg-fakty-ipredlozheniya
https://cyberleninka.ru/article/n/finansirovanie-zdravoohraneniya-v-rossii-2021-2024-gg-fakty-ipredlozheniya
http://www.enforce.spb.ru/images/Issledovanya/IRL_KGI_Reform_final_11.13.pdf
http://www.enforce.spb.ru/images/Issledovanya/IRL_KGI_Reform_final_11.13.pdf
https://www.who.int/data/gho/data/themes/mortality-and-global-health-estimates/ghe-life-expectancy-and-healthy-life-expectancy#:~:text-Globally%2C%20life%20expectancy%-20has%20increased,reduced%20years%20lived%20with%20disability
https://www.who.int/data/gho/data/themes/mortality-and-global-health-estimates/ghe-life-expectancy-and-healthy-life-expectancy#:~:text-Globally%2C%20life%20expectancy%-20has%20increased,reduced%20years%20lived%20with%20disability
https://www.who.int/data/gho/data/themes/mortality-and-global-health-estimates/ghe-life-expectancy-and-healthy-life-expectancy#:~:text-Globally%2C%20life%20expectancy%-20has%20increased,reduced%20years%20lived%20with%20disability
https://www.who.int/data/gho/data/themes/mortality-and-global-health-estimates/ghe-life-expectancy-and-healthy-life-expectancy#:~:text-Globally%2C%20life%20expectancy%-20has%20increased,reduced%20years%20lived%20with%20disability
https://www.wto.org/english/tratop_e/tpr_e/g416_e.pdf
https://www.wto.org/english/tratop_e/tpr_e/g416_e.pdf


This page intentionally left blankThis page intentionally left blankThis page intentionally left blankThis page intentionally left blank



283

	 b5349    Public Policy Challenges in Rethinking Public Health6"×9"�

© 2025 The Author(s)

https://doi.org/10.1142/9789811296307_bmatter

Index

A
Academia, 73
accountability, 3, 128
active action, 72
active debate, 68
activist, 30
Act on the Emergency Measures to 

Contain the Spread and Mitigate 
the Consequences of the Infectious 
COVID-19 Disease in the Field of 
Health Care, 249–250

Act on the Protection of the 
Population from Infectious 
Diseases, 225, 228, 233, 244

ad hoc basis, 62
administrative domination, 278
adverse events, 18
aged care facilities, 136
age distribution, 52
airports, 130
alcohol, 185–187, 192–193
alienation of common people, 279
antivirals, 18
anxiety increased, 71

appointment-based system, 268
appropriateness of medical care, 261
arrived from abroad, 61
AstraZeneca, 208
Atlantic Bubble, 101
Australia, 6, 11, 204
Australian Constitution, 119
Austria, 6

B
behavioral science, 177
Belgium, 6
Bill Amending the Compulsory 

Health Insurance Act, 248
Bill Amending the Health Care Act, 

247–248
biomedical advanced research and 

development authority (BARDA), 
210

Böhm, 5
border control, 131
born abroad, 53
Brexit, 169–170, 175, 179, 181, 184, 

186–194, 204

https://doi.org/10.1142/9789811296307_bmatter


	 b5349    Public Policy Challenges in Rethinking Public Health� 6"×9"

284 	  Index

Brexit distraction, 20
British Columbia, 96
British Columbia, which has a 

provincial centre for disease 
control (BCCDC), 96

budget and funding, 263

C
Canada, 6, 204
Canada Health Act, 90
capitated payment, 6
centers for disease control and 

prevention (CDC), 27
central coordination, 120
central government, 170, 172–173, 

175–178, 182, 188
centralization, 148–149, 154, 158, 

163
central public health agency, 120
chief health officers (CHO), 133
chief medical office (CMO), 133
Civil Protection Headquarters of the 

Republic of Croatia, 225, 228, 232, 
236, 244

Civil Protection System Act, 225, 
228, 233

clarify the division of responsibilities 
and roles, 66

clinical evidence, 15
clinical gaze, 133
clinical outcomes, 14
command-and-control decision-

making, 268
command-and-control structure, 13
Commonwealth Department of 

Health, 120
Communicable Disease Protection 

Act, 50

Communicable Diseases Act, 76,  
121, 228, 230, 238–241, 245–246, 
252

communicable disease surveillance, 
50

communication, 100, 102
community health (primary and 

preventive care), 118
comparative public health policy, 5, 

9, 12
comparison, 76
competence or political autonomy, 

268
compliance was high, 64
Compulsory Health Insurance Act, 

224, 247
conservative, 174–175
Constitutional Court of the Republic 

of Croatia, 233, 235–236, 244
Constitutional Court of the Republic 

of Slovenia, 238–242
contact tracing, 14, 179, 188
contract out, 49
control measures, 55
coordination, 49
Corona Commission, 68
Coronavirus Act 2020, 183–184
council of Australian governments 

(COAG), 121
countless laws, decrees, and 

instructions, 273
courts, 21
COVAX, 210
COVID-19 pandemic, 30, 51, 206
crises, 214
crisis management, 145, 147, 

157–163
Croatia, 12



	 b5349    Public Policy Challenges in Rethinking Public Health6"×9"�

	 Index	   285

Croatian institute of public health 
(CIPH), 224, 236, 248

Croatia’s Constitutional Court, 18

D
data, 4, 15, 133
deaths occurred in nursing homes 

(44.7% of all), 53
debt, 204
decentralized systems, 13, 75
decision-making, 73
delegated legislation, 184
Department of Health and Aged Care, 

137
development trajectory, 267
devolution, 171–172, 178, 182
devolved government, 170–172, 174, 

182
died in hospital, 53
different strategy, 75
Directors of Public Health, 176
domestic travel, 60
dynamically responsive, 278
dysfunctionality in courts, police, and 

other state organizations, 273

E
ECB, 204
economic aspects, 75
economic consequences, 3
economic issues, 275
economic style of reasoning, 33
economy, 71–72
educational outcomes, 3
efficacy of state action, 279
elderly, 69
election, 99
Emergencies Act, 104–105

emergency authorization, 21
emergency infectious threat to 

society, 56
emergency preparedness plan, 51
Emergency Response Plan for 

Communicable Disease Incidents 
of National Significance, 122

England, 13, 170–173, 175, 182, 189
environmental health, 121
epidemiology, 26
Essential Public Health Functions, 27
Essential Public Health Operations, 

28
EU COVID Certificate, 229, 231, 

237, 241
EU law, 187, 192–193
European Centre for Disease Control, 

187, 192
European centre for disease 

prevention and control (ECDC), 
34, 205

European Convention of Human 
Rights, 183

European coordination, 156–157,  
162

European Court of Human Rights, 
183

European Food Safety Authority,  
187

European Food Safety Authority or 
the European Medicines Agency, 
205

European Health Insurance Card,  
187

European Medicines Agency, 187, 
192

European Union (EU), 12, 33, 203
evidence, 1–2, 133



	 b5349    Public Policy Challenges in Rethinking Public Health� 6"×9"

286 	  Index

evidence-based policymaking, 66, 
147, 161, 186, 189

exacerbated inequity in health 
outcomes, 273

exercise Cygnus, 178

F
federal jurisdictions, 6
federation, 203
fee-for-service, 6
First Nations, 119
five areas that need to be 

strengthened, 78
food safety, 188, 192
Framework Convention on Tobacco 

Control, 185
France, 6, 12
freedom convoy, 105
functionalist reasoning, 34
fundamental rights, 177

G
general practitioners, 20
Germany, 6
Global Health Insurance Card, 187, 

192
Global Health Security Index, 10
governance, 89, 106
government agencies, 45
government interventions, 72
guideline, 66

H
Hallett inquiry, 13
harmonization of processes, 273
Health Care Act, 224–225, 235, 245, 

247, 252
Health Care and Health Insurance 

Act, 227

healthcare system, 146, 152–153
Health Emergency Management 

Branch, 120
health equity, 4
health in all policies, 13, 267
health inequalities, 173–174, 176, 

191
Health Insurance Institute of  

Croatia (HIIC), 224–225, 235,  
243, 248

Health Insurance Institute of Slovenia 
(HIIS), 226–227, 250

health promotion, 43, 119
Health Services Act, 226–228
health system, 146–147, 150, 160, 

163
health system management, 262
healthy balanced diets, 266
Health Emergency and Response 

Agency (HERA), 210
High Court, 119
Horizon, 193
hospital beds, 148, 150, 152–153
hospital care, 149, 154, 163
hospitalization, 14
hospitals, 117
human rights, 183

I
ICU cases peaked, 52–53
impact of pandemic control, 68
inequality, 30, 117
inequity in public financing, 277
institutional, 88, 99, 106
institutionalist approaches, 34
institutions, 106
Institutions, Politics, the Organization 

of Public Health Systems, and 
Governance (IPOG), 88–89, 92



	 b5349    Public Policy Challenges in Rethinking Public Health6"×9"�

	 Index	   287

interconnectedness between 
regulatory levers, 260

international health regulations, 18
investment capacity, 276
investments, 147, 153
Ireland, 181, 185–186
Italy, 14

J
Johnson, Boris, 173–174, 177–178, 

181, 186, 188, 190
joint procurement, 156
Juncker Commission, 217

L
lack of testing facilities, 53
learning, 148, 151, 162
legal and administrative systems, 78
legal frameworks, 73
legal system, 204
legislative structure, 259
lessons can be learned, 72
lessons learned, 79
lessons were learnt, 78
less physically active, 70
life expectancy, 67
limited testing, 61
local authorities, 173, 175, 179
local governance, 264
local government areas, 117, 119
lockdown, 19, 123, 171, 173, 

177–178, 189–190
long-term care, 15
lowest excess mortality, 70
Luxembourg, 6

M
Marchildon, G. P., 6
marginalized populations, 15

mask mandates, 14–15
masks, 3, 15, 19, 123, 148, 151–152, 

154–156, 160–161
measures, 73
media, 133
Medicare Benefits Schedule (MBS), 

117
Medicare Benefits Scheme (MBS), 

118
Medicines and Healthcare products 

Regulatory Agency, 192
mental health, 118
Ministry of Health and Social Affairs, 

45
misplaced concreteness, 26
mistrust, 146
monitoring and analyzing, 263
morbidity, 9
mortality gradually stabilized, 9, 69
mortality rates, 52
move around freely, 74
multiannual financial framework, 

217
multilevel and interagency 

communication, 275
multiple-streams theory, 216
municipalities, 47

N
National Board of Health and 

Welfare, 51
National Cabinet, 121
National Health Service, 171
National Institute of Public Health of 

Slovenia (NIPH), 17, 226, 241–242
National Public Health Institute 

(NPHI), 91–92
national public health policy, 43
needs of the local geography, 273



	 b5349    Public Policy Challenges in Rethinking Public Health� 6"×9"

288 	  Index

negative externalities, 11
neoliberal, 174, 176
New Zealand, 6
NHS Supply Chain, 180
NHS Test and Trace, 179
nominative determinism, 9
non-communicable disease,  

170, 175
non-medical determinants of health, 

4, 8
Northern Ireland, 13, 170–172, 175, 

182
nursing homes, 48, 69

O
obesity, 187, 192
observer status, 13
Office for Health Improvement and 

Disparities, 172
office of health protection, 120
official recognition, 267
Omicron, 18
organization, 89, 106
organizational structure, 9, 107
organization of public health services, 

107
organogram, 9
outdoor activity, 14, 77
overall well-being, 266
over-regulated state, 273
own referrals and coordination of 

care, 269
Oxford-AstraZenica, 190

P
pandemic control actions, 77
pandemic preparedness treaty, 191
pandemic readiness plans, 19

pandemic treaty, 20
Pandemilagen, 76
panic-neglect cycle, 217
paradigm of development, 278
particularly affected, 69
personal protective equipment, 61, 

179
pharmaceutical benefits scheme 

(PBS), 117
pharmaceuticals, 117, 211
pharmacies, 119
physicians, 6, 20, 34, 61, 48, 278
policy entrepreneurship, 274
political, 89, 99–101, 106–107
political and policy processes, 268
political culture, 21
political legitimacy, 279
politics, 93, 106
populism, 189
populist, 176, 189–190, 194
positive assessment, 77
post-COVID syndrome, 71
postponing clinical interventions, 4
power, 10
preparedness, 10, 147–148, 150–151, 

154–157, 162
prevention, 148, 155
primary care, 20
primary medical care, 264
private market-based funding, 5
procurement, 147, 152, 156–157,  

162
profession, 29
protective personal equipment (PPE), 

147–148, 150, 155
public discourse, 9
public distrust, 18
public funding, 5



	 b5349    Public Policy Challenges in Rethinking Public Health6"×9"�

	 Index	   289

public gatherings, 61
public health, 93–94, 107–108
Public Health Agency 

Folkhälsomyndigheten (FoHM), 42
public health agency of Canada 

(PHAC), 11, 73, 91–95, 103, 107
public health approach, 32
public health crisis plan, 18
Public Health England, 172
public health experts, 145, 160–161, 

163
public health governance in Canada, 

91
public health system, 97, 106
public transport, 14

Q
quarantine, 14, 119

R
racism, 30
recommendations on vaccinations, 64
redefined resilience, 277
reform, 147, 149, 152, 154, 157, 

162–163
regional international organization, 

203
regulation of public spaces, 3
remote work, 14
rent seeking behaviors, 268
RescEU, 210, 218
resource efficiency, 274
restrictions and non-pharmaceutical 

interventions (NPIs), 133
restrictions on eating places, 61
restrictions on indoor gatherings, 60
risk assessment, 57, 160–161
risk management, 160–161

risks and epidemiological threats, 267
Ruby Princess, 131
Russia, 11–12

S
sanitary and epidemiological 

surveillance, 267
school closing, 74
schools, 14, 60–61
science, 30
scientific advice, 157, 159–162
scientific advisory group for 

emergencies (SAGE), 17, 180
scientific council, 17
scientific debate, 4
scientific discourse, 16
Scotland, 13, 170–173, 175, 178, 182, 

192
secondary medical care, 264
single market, 179, 191
Slovenia, 12
slow start, 73
social capital, 277
social distancing, 61
social elderly care, 48
social insurance, 6
social isolation, 3
Social Services Act, 48
societal factors and actions, 267
socio-economically vulnerable 

groups, 66
Spain, 14, 28, 69
spread of a virus, 72
state of emergency, 158
sudden acute respiratory syndrome 

(SARS), 11
support workers, 16
surveillance, 121, 160



	 b5349    Public Policy Challenges in Rethinking Public Health� 6"×9"

290 	  Index

Sweden, 12, 41
Swedish mortality rates, 74

T
territorial reform, 148–150, 153
tertiary care, 117
tertiary medical care, 264
testing, 3
testing patients from early on, 61
three-tier architecture, 272
tobacco, 185, 187
tolerance, 18
transparency, 4, 13
travel, 14
truckers, 105
trust, 21, 75, 147, 160–161, 163
turnover of staff, 48

U
UK Health Security Agency, 172
Ukraine, 35
unconstrained power, 268
unhealthy eating, 70
unified public system, 262
United Kingdom (UK), 6, 169
United Nations, 20
universal healthcare, 15
universal health coverage, 4, 117

upstream factors, 22
United States (US), 204

V
vaccination, 3, 63, 102–103, 151, 

156, 161
vaccine, 18, 170, 182, 190, 193, 208
vaccine-hesitant individuals,  

64
vaccine mandates, 132
vaccine passport, 104
vaccine rollout, 136
ventilation, 15, 19, 123
vulnerable groups, 4, 15
vulnerable populations, 4

W
Wales, 13, 170–172, 175, 182
welfare state, 26
Wendt, 5
widening and intensifying the social 

security, 270
work from home, 57, 60
World Health Organization (WHO), 

18, 27, 185, 210

Y
Yong, Ed, 217



Vol. 3	 World Scientific Handbook of Global Health Economics and Public Policy
	 edited by Richard M Scheffler

Vol. 2	 The Economics of Social Capital and Health:
	 A Conceptual and Empirical Roadmap
	 edited by Sherman Folland and Lorenzo Rocco

Vol. 1	 Accountability and Responsibility in Health Care:
	 Issues in Addressing an Emerging Global Challenge
	 edited by Bruce Rosen, Avi Israeli and Stephen Shortell

Forthcoming:
 
Social Capital and Health
	 Dov Chernichovsky (Ben Gurion University of the Negev, Israel) and 
	 Chen Sharony (Ben Gurion University of the Negev, Israel)

Aging and Long Term Care: Global Policy and Organization
	 Audrey Laporte (University of Toronto, Canada)

Healthcare Financing
	 Winnie Chi-man Yip (Harvard)

The World Scientific Casebook Reference on Healthcare Reforms
	 Peter Berman (The University of British Columbia, Canada & 
	 Harvard University, USA)

International Oral Healthcare Systems: Policy, Organization, Financing, Delivery
	 Carlos Quinonez (University of Toronto, Canada)

Global Health Expenditures: Growth and Evolution
	 Thomas Getzen (Temple University, USA)

Cancer Health Services Research: Improving Health Outcomes and Innovation
	 Maarten J Ijzerman (University of Twente, The Netherlands)

Lectures in Financing and Delivery of Healthcare in Developing Countries
	 Peter Berman (The University of British Columbia, Canada & 
	 Harvard University, USA)

World Scientific Series in Global Health Economics and 
Public Policy
(Continued from page ii)



World Scientific Series in Global Health Economics and 
Public Policy
(Continued from page ii)

Pandemics: Organizations, Governance, and Politics in National Response — 
A World Scientific Reference
	 Peter Berman (The University of British Columbia, Canada & 
	 Harvard University, USA)

Multi-criterion Decision Analysis
	 Craig Mitton (The University of British Columbia, Canada)

People-centered Integrated Primary Healthcare System: The Cases of System 
Development in Asia/China
	 Hong Wang (Bill & Melinda Gates Foundation, Canada)

Resilient Health Systems: A Case of the Abu Dhabi Experience
	 Rifat Atun (Harvard University, USA)

Health Planning
	 Birger Forsberg (Karolinska Institute, Sweden)


	Contents
	About the Editor
	About the Contributors
	Chapter 1 Introduction: Themes and Choices
	1.1 Stepping Back
	1.2 Framing the Discussion: About “Comparative Public Health”
	1.3 What Do Comparative COVID-19 Case Studies Tell Us About the State and Nature of Public Health?
	1.3.1 Temporal tensions
	1.3.2 The tension between narrow clinical outcomes and wider sociopolitical outcomes
	1.3.3 Tensions between equity and universality
	1.3.4 Crisis management and open scientific discourse

	1.4 Conclusion
	References

	Chapter 2 What is Public Health? Problems of Definition and Conceptualization
	2.1 Introduction: The Swear Jar
	2.2 Misplaced Concreteness in Public Health
	2.3 Conceptualizations of Public Health
	2.3.1 Activities
	2.3.2 Actors
	2.3.3 Perspectives
	2.3.4 Institutions
	2.3.5 Functions

	2.4 Conclusion: From Lamentation and Misplaced Concreteness to Political Science
	Acknowledgment
	References

	Chapter 3 Sweden
	3.1 Introduction
	3.1.1 Public health organization
	3.1.2 National-level organization
	3.1.3 Regional organization
	3.1.4 Municipal organization

	3.2 The Legal Framework for Health and Social Care Provision
	3.2.1 Healthcare
	3.2.2 Social elderly care in Sweden
	3.2.3 Coordination between healthcare and social care
	3.2.4 Communicable disease control and emergency preparedness

	3.3 Epidemiology and Control Measures
	3.3.1 Epidemiology of the disease
	3.3.2 Control measures
	3.3.3 Vaccinations
	3.3.4 Consensus and critique

	3.4 Impact of the Pandemic and the Control Measures
	3.4.1 Mortality impact
	3.4.2 Life and mental health impact
	3.4.3 Impact on the economy

	3.5 Lessons Learned
	References

	Chapter 4 Canada
	4.1 Introduction: Upstream Factors Shaping Authority and Decision-Making in a Public Health Crisis
	4.2 Structure of the Canadian Medical Care and Public Health Systems
	4.2.1 Public health changes prompted by SARS
	4.2.2 Public Health Agency of Canada (PHAC)

	4.3 Canada’s Medical Care and Public Health Systems at the Outset of the Pandemic
	4.3.1 Initial response (Spring–Summer 2020)

	4.4 Responses During Subsequent Waves of Infection: Fall/Winter 2020–Fall 2021
	4.4.1 Federal travel restrictions
	4.4.2 Provincial travel restrictions
	4.4.3 Vaccinations: Procurement, distribution, and mandates

	4.5 Early 2022
	4.6 How Could Understanding IPOG Factors Improve Canada’s Future Crisis Response?
	4.7 Conclusion
	References

	Chapter 5 Australia
	5.1 Introduction
	5.2 Trifle, Custard, and COVID-19
	5.3 Preparedness
	5.4 COVID-19 Hits the Turbofan
	5.4.1 Quarantine
	5.4.2 Public health expertise and legitimacy
	5.4.3 Vaccines

	5.5 Conclusion
	References

	Chapter 6 France
	6.1 Introduction
	6.2 The Challenges of a Depleted Health System
	6.2.1 Healthcare access and the territorial reforms of healthcare pre-COVID-19
	6.2.2 Lessons in preparedness from the 2009 H1N1 crisis

	6.3 Fast-paced Reforms’ Intracrisis
	6.3.1 Financial reform of healthcare
	6.3.2 Coping with insufficient preparedness: Between avoidance and reforms

	6.4 Reconfiguration of the Crisis Management System
	6.4.1 The reinforcement of the executive in crisis management
	6.4.2 The legacy of the crisis on trust

	6.5 Conclusion: A Not-So-Disruptive Pandemic?
	References

	Chapter 7 The United Kingdom
	7.1 Introduction
	7.2 Public Health Institutions in the UK
	7.2.1 The institutional structure of UK public health pre- and post-COVID
	7.2.2 Future challenges created by the reform of the UK’s public health institutions

	7.3 The Response of the UK Government to COVID-19
	7.3.1 Policy responses were slow and hypocritical
	7.3.2 Policy responses were disorganized and lacking in transparency
	7.3.3 Communication of policy was overly politicized
	7.3.4 Future challenges created by the legislative approach to COVID-19

	7.4 Post-COVID Public Health Reform in the UK in the Context of Brexit
	7.4.1 Brexit has caused practical distractions for health policymakers
	7.4.2 Brexit has caused a governance ideology not conducive to public health reform
	7.4.3 Post-Brexit options for public health reform

	7.5 Conclusion
	References

	Chapter 8 The European Union
	8.1 Introduction
	8.2 Public Health Responses
	8.3 Shortcomings and Weaknesses
	8.4 External Shocks and Policy Change
	8.5 Futures of European Union Public Health Policy
	8.6 Conclusion
	References

	Chapter 9 Croatia and Slovenia
	9.1 Introduction
	9.2 Public Health Responses to COVID-19
	9.3 Problems Related to the Public Health Responses to COVID-19
	9.4 Barriers and Opportunities for Public Health Reform
	9.5 Conclusion
	References

	Chapter 10 The Russian Federation
	10.1 Introduction
	10.2 The Structure of Healthcare and Public Health Governance in Russia
	10.2.1 The Russian healthcare system
	10.2.2 Public health governance
	10.2.2.1 Disease prevention and health promotion
	10.2.2.2 Disease surveillance


	10.3 The Response to COVID-19
	10.3.1 The structural changes triggered by COVID-19
	10.3.2 Expanded social support specific to COVID-19

	10.4 Discussion
	10.5 Conclusion
	References

	Index



